

**Bid2022-270A Original Equipment Manufacturers' Parts for Various Vehicles**

- 4 bids received

CODE:	65-214 Automotive/Anti-Freeze & Coolant	\$ 10,000.00
	65-215 Automotive/Hardware	\$ 14,000.00
	65-239 Automotive/Supplies-Miscellaneous	\$ 50,600.00
	65-250 Automotive/Mechanical Parts	\$700,000.00
	65-285 Automotive/Small Tools	\$ 7,500.00

MANNER OF AWARD: \$782,100.00 (Inclusive of Bid2022-270B & 2022-255A/B)  
February 18, 2022-February 17, 2023

RECOMMEND: Sanitary Equipment Co., Inc, CN Wood Enviro LLC, Factory Motor Parts,  
Lacal Equipment Inc

---

Sanitary Equipment Co., Inc  
25 Industry Drive  
West Haven, CT 06516

CN Wood Enviro LLC  
200 Merrimac Street  
Woburn, MA 01801

Factory Motor Parts  
45 John Diestch Blvd  
North Attleboro. MA 02760

Lacal Equipment Inc  
901 West Pike Street  
Jackson Center, OH 45334

**Pricing as Follows**

**Bid2022-270 Original Equipment Manufacturers' Parts for Various Vehicles**

**Bid Results**

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Sanitary Equip</b>	<b>Factory Motor Parts</b>	<b>Lacal Equipment</b>	<b>CN Wood</b>
		<b>% off List Price</b>	<b>% off List Price</b>	<b>% off List Price</b>	<b>% off List Price</b>
1	Ford	No Bid	<i>Note 1</i> 45%	No Bid	No Bid
2	Peterbilt	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Sterling Trucks	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Freightliner	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Elgin Sweeper Parts	No Bid	No Bid	30%	10%
6	Heil Parts	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Caterpillar Parts	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	American LaFrance Parts	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Ford Tractor Parts	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	JCB Heavy Equipment Parts	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	New Holland Parts	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Mack Truck Parts	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	LaBrie Parts	0%	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Chevrolet parts	No Bid	<i>Note 1</i> 50%	No Bid	No Bid
15	Detroit Allison	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	John Deere	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Cummings	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	International	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**Note 1:** Ford- Motorcraft parts less batteries/parity  
Chevrolet- Acdelco parts less batteries/parity

SANITARY EQUIPMENT

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

(SAMPLE SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL)

Item	Description - LaBrie parts sampling	List Price	% off List Price	Net Price
1	5203 HANDLE ASM	\$205.57	0%	\$205.57
2	10054 TAILGATE HINGE	\$288.82		NET
3	11563 GUIDE RAIL	\$554.52		=
4	14861 ROLLER ASM	\$151.35		LIST PRICE
5	19166 SEAL KIT	\$203.53		
6	25180 HYD TUBING	\$183.39		
7	25962 HOPPER DOOR ASM	\$1,507.84		
8	30012 WORM GEAR	\$1,627.31		
9	39367 SWITCH BRACKET	\$19.45		
10	43660 HYD TANK ASM	\$3,839.27		
11	50143 DRIVE SHAFT	\$279.50		
12	56233 ELECTRICAL CABLE	\$131.59		
13	64539 SLIDE BOTTOM	\$284.35		
14	67846 HYD TUBING ASM	\$196.23		
15	69084 PACKER CYL BRACE	\$697.44		
16	69398 BUSHING	\$19.28		
17	74132 ECU WIRE ADAPTOR	\$102.50		
18	76112 DEFLECTOR	\$236.48		
19	77812 STRAP	\$75.52		
20	82022 COVER	\$394.66		

equals

Continued next page

FACTORY MOTOR PARTS

**PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID**

(SAMPLE SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL)

Item	Description - Ford parts sampling	List Price	% off List Price	Net Price
1	8C4Z-17757-AA BUMPER	NO BID		
2	5C4Z-8200-A GRILLE	NO BID		
3	F81Z-16005-BA FENDER	NO BID		
4	F5HZ-8023201-AA REGULATOR	NO BID		
5	8C3Z-1015-B WHEEL ASM.	NO BID		
6	7C3Z-8005-G RADIATOR	NO BID		
7	8C3Z-17508-D WIPER MOTOR MOTORCRAFT WM701	558.18	45%	307.00
8	8L3Z-9943400-AC HANDLE	NO BID		
9	3C3Z-2523200-AA REGULATOR	NO BID		
10	3C2Z-68209-AA BELT TENSIONER MOTORCRAFT BT70	141.45	45%	77.80
11	5C3Z-6K682-CCRM TURBO	NO BID		
12	F81Z-12B533-AC GLOW PLUG RELAY MOTORCRAFT DY861	94.51	45%	51.98
13	4C3Z-9F452-A EGR VALVE MOTORCRAFT CX2467RM	285.27	45%	156.90
14	7C3Z-8A616-E FAN CLUTCH	NO BID		
15	5C3Z-9J460-B PRESSURE SENSOR MOTORCRAFT DPFE6	132.44	45%	72.84
16	4C4Z-8575-AA THERMOSTAT MOTORCRAFT RT1173	44.45	45%	24.45
17	F81Z-9155-AC FUEL FILTER HOUSING MOTORCRAFT FG1057	514.38	45%	282.91
18	F4TZ-2A342-BA MODULE			
19	4C3Z-12B533-AA MODULE			
20	5C3Z-9C968-CA IPR MOTORCRAFT CM5126	303.62	45%	166.99

Continued next page

FACTORY MOTOR PARTS

**PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID**

(SAMPLE SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL)

ACDELCO

Item	Description – Chevrolet parts sampling	List Price	% off List Price	Net Price
1	98094201 TENSIONER	121.76	30%	85.23
2	12627913 INTAKE MANIFOLD GASKET	8.22	30%	5.75
3	23172440 RADIATOR	499.84	30%	349.89
4	97241130 THERMOSTAT	59.78	50%	29.89
5	15052228 TRAN COOLING LINE	5.32	30%	3.72
6	12637105 WATER PUMP	374.03	50%	187.02
7	25814754 MOTOR MOUNT	121.05	30%	84.74
8	12665547 EGR	397.99	50%	199.00
9	12657323 AIR PIPE	NO BID		
10	22792253 BUMPER	NO BID		
11	22880826 WIND WASH CONTAINER	72.43	30%	50.70
12	22917497 WIPER ARM	60.98	30%	42.69
13	84056869 STEERING PUMP	167.46	30%	117.22
14	20768561 AXLE	287.55	30%	201.29
15	84068279 IDLER ARM	233.87	30%	163.71
16	22913602 TIE ROD	115.63	30%	80.94
17	12637647 MANIFOLD	108.04	30%	75.63
18	23359895 INTERCOOLER	NO BID		
19	23282450 CHARGE AIR HOSE ASM	363.03	30%	254.12
20	12639701 GLOW PLUG	38.50	50%	19.25

Continued next page

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID(SAMPLE SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL)

Item	Description – Elgin Sweeper parts sampling	List Price	% off List Price	Net Price
1	LS-0054362 SIDE BROOM TILT KIT	3375.55	30	2362.88
2	LS-0710150 CURTAIN SET	505.30	30	353.71
3	LS-1003444 BEARING	275.91	30	193.14
4	LS-1004934 GAUGE	214.37	30	150.06
5	LS-1007257 DRIVE HUB	178.35	30	124.85
6	LS-1008875 BUBBLE WINDOW	458.20	30	320.75
7	LS-1009573 PIVOT BUSHING	188.75	30	132.13
8	LS-1012127 ARM	398.77	30	279.14
9	LS-013759 SLIDES	203.12	30	142.19
10	LS-1015228 MASTER CYLINDER	395.81	30	277.07
11	LS-1016510 IDLER PULLEY	332.70	30	232.89
12	LS-1018120 TURNBUCKLE	71.40	30	49.98
13	LS-1023359 HYD MOTOR	1402.25	30	981.58
14	LS-1025992 FILTER	141.17	30	98.82
15	LS-1030404 DRAG LINK	165.02	30	115.52
16	LS-1030809 FLOW CONTROL VALVE	95.50	30	66.85
17	LS-1034133 FRAME	5804.14	30	4062.91
18	LS-1034508 UPPER ROLLER	624.00	30	436.80
19	LS-1034780 CABLE	422.38	30	259.67
20	LS-1036467 VALVE	233.92	30	163.75

Continued next page

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID(SAMPLE SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL)

Item	Description – Elgin Sweeper parts sampling	List Price	% off List Price	Net Price
1	LS-0054362 SIDE BROOM TILT KIT	1382.44	10	1244.20
2	LS-0710150 CURTAIN SET	232.79	10	209.51
3	LS-1003444 BEARING	89.97	10	80.97
4	LS-1004934 GAUGE	NA		
5	LS-1007257 DRIVE HUB	541.38	10	487.24
6	LS-1008875 BUBBLE WINDOW	NA		
7	LS-1009573 PIVOT BUSHING	73.56	10	66.20
8	LS-1012127 ARM	368.18	10	331.36
9	LS-013759 SLIDES	NA		
10	LS-1015228 MASTER CYLINDER	1142.28	10	1033.45
11	LS-1016510 IDLER PULLEY	355.67	10	320.10
12	LS-1018120 TURNBUCKLE	31.80	10	28.62
13	LS-1023359 HYD MOTOR	NA		
14	LS-1025992 FILTER	36.12	10	32.51
15	LS-1030404 DRAG LINK	NA		
16	LS-1030809 FLOW CONTROL VALVE	83.58	10	75.22
17	LS-1034133 FRAME	4185.03	10	3766.53
18	LS-1034508 UPPER ROLLER	414.32	10	372.89
19	LS-1034780 CABLE	91.39	10	82.25
20	LS-1036467 VALVE	127.88	10	115.09

Continued next page

Bid2022-XXX Original Equipment Manufacturer's Parts for Various Vehicles for the Department of Public Works							The following vendors were sent specifications.	
VENDOR	ADDRESS	CITY	STATE	ZIP	EMAIL1	EMAIL2		
Ballard Mack	280 Scituate Ave.	Johnston	RI	02919	jimr@ballardmack.com	tplante@ballardtrucks.com		
C.N. Wood	200 Merrimac St.	Woburn	MA	01801	pbenard@cn-wood.com	jsullivan@cn-wood.com		
Coastal International Trucks	17 O'Keefe Lane	Warwick	RI	02888	info@coastaltruck.com			
Ed & Matt Equipment	27 Commerce St.	Greenville	RI	02828	edandmatt@edandmatt.com	parts@edandmatt.com		
Five Star Fire	45 Brainard Rd.	Hartford	CT	06114	ggiaggio@atphartford.com			
FleetPride	1 Wholesale Way	Granston	RI	02920	promotions@fleetpride.com			
Flood Ford of EG	2545 So. County Trail	E. Greenwich	RI	02818	floodford@gmail.com			
Freightliner of Hartford, Inc.	199 Roberts St	E Hartford	CT	06108	bfortin@freightlinerct.com	bill@freightlinerct.com		
HEWS Company	4 Ryan Rd	Bow	NH	03304	info@hewsc.com			
High Ground Equipment	22 Whittier St.	Newton	NH	03852	Matt.Winslow@HighGroundEquipment.com			
Howard Johnson, Inc.	1978 Kingstown Rd.	South Kingstown	RI	02879	mark@howardjohnsoninc.com			
Hurd Auto Mall	1705 Hartford Avenue	Johnston	RI	02919	mail@hurdauto.com			
Interstate Truck Center	45 Brainard Rd.	Hartford	CT	06114	dave.damaschi@inter-statetruck.com	interstate@inter-statetruck.com		
Kahn Tractor & Equipment, Inc.	520 Pond Rd./PO Box 38	N. Franklin	CT	06254	jimb@kahntractor.com	dwightff@kahntractor.com		
Kaman Industrial Technologies	225 Metro Center Blvd/bldg 3	Warwick	RI	02886	kdgmarketing@kaman.com			
Lacal Equipment	901 W. Pike Street	Jackson Center	OH	45334	alan@lacal.com	sales@lacal.com		
Milton CAT, Inc.	100 Quarry Dr.	Milford	MA	01757	Rob_grant@miltoncat.com	Bill_griffin@miltoncat.com		
Minuteman Trucks, Inc.	2181 Providence Hwy.	Walpole	MA	02081	llecuyer@minutemantrucks.com	Gmoan@minutemantrucks.com		
NEFEA	10 Stillman Rd	North Haven	CT	06473	amcquesten@nefea.com			
Norfolk Power Equipment	846 Broncos Hwy	Burrville	RI	02830	info@norfolkpower.com			
Northland JCB	3 Chalet Rd	Middleboro	MA	02346	info@northlandjcb.com			
Power Products Systems, LLC d/b/a NE Detroit Diesel-Allison	90 Bay State Rd	Wakefield	MA	01880	tgemba@nedda.com	jmcnanna@nedda.com		
RI Truck Center	1100 Warren Ave	East Providence	RI	02915	itravers@itruckcenter.com			
Sanitary Equipment Co., Inc.	25 Industry Dr.	W. Haven	CT	06516	parts@sanitaryequipment.com	info@sanitaryequipment.com		
Southworth Milton	2158 Plainfield Pike, Ste. 10	Cranston	RI	02921	Steve_washburn@miltoncat.com	Tom_Benedetti@miltoncat.com		
Tasca Ford	1300 Pontiac Ave.	Cranston	RI	02920	msaroka@tasca.com	michael349@cox.net		
Tri-County Contractors Supply, Inc.	154 Wayside Ave.	W. Springfield	MA	01089	rclarkjr@tricontractors.com	a.clark@tricontractors.com		
Tri-State Truck Center	411 Hartford Turnpike Rt 40	Shrewsbury	MA	01545	mmcinerney@tristatetruckcenter.com	info@advantagetruckne.com		
Vermeer Northeast	224 South St	Hopkinton	MA	01748	info@vermeerallroads.com			
The Peterbilt Store	116 Washington St	Plainville	MA	02762	help@thepetstore.com			
Greenwood Emergency Vehicles	530 John L Dietsch Blvd	North Attleboro	MA	02763	service@greenwoodev.com			





CITY OF WARWICK  
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS  
925 SANDY LANE • WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02889  
TEL (401) 738-2003 • FAX (401) 732-5208

DEC 20 2021

FRANK J. PICOZZI  
MAYOR

ERIC J. EARLS, PE  
DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC WORKS

To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: Eric J. Earls, Public Works Director *EJE*

Date: December 13, 2021

Subj: Bid2022-270A Original Equipment Parts for Various Vehicles

We have reviewed the four bids received and recommend award to the following vendors in the best interest of the City: Factory Motor Parts, CN Wood, Sanitary Equipment and Local Equipment. This recommendation is requested in the amount of \$782,100 for the Public Works Department. The current bid expires on February 17, 2022. The new contract period will be February 18, 2022 to February 17, 2023. Please note that this bid, in conjunction with Bid 2022-255, Replacement Parts as well as the requested 56-6 will all use the same cap of \$782,100, if awarded.

(65-250 - \$700,000)

(65-239 - \$50,600)

(65-214 - \$10,000)

(65-215 - \$14,000)

(65-285 - \$7,500)