Bid 2021-189 Neptune Cold Water Meters

o 2 bids received

CODE: 84-363 Water Department/Water Main Maintenance

MANNER OF AWARD: $200,000.00
March 27, 2021 —March 26, 2022

RECOMMEND: Ti- Sales Inc

Ti- Sales Inc
36 Hudson Road
Sudbury, MA 01776

Stiles Company, Inc.
922 Pleasant Street
Norwood, MA 02062

Pricing as follows

Continued next page




2021-189 Neptune Cold Water Meters
Bid Results

Item

Size

Description

Ti Sales

Stiles

DISPLACEMENT TYPE GROUP ONE

1.1

5/8"

Cold Water Meter with encoder - and remote

register 1 cubic feet $

115.19

No Bid

1.2

3/ n

Cold Water Meter with encoder - and remote

register 1 cubic feet $

164.42

No Bid

1.3

lll

Cold Water Meter with encoder - and remote

register 10 cubic feet $

242.47

No Bid

1.4

1 ]/27’

Cold Water Meter with encoder - and remote

register 10 cubic feet $

556.25

No Bid

1.5

2“

Cold Water Meter with encoder - and remote

register 10 cubic feet $

698.44

No Bid

TURBINE TYPE GROUPTWO

2.1

Meters-Cold Water, direct reading register with low
flow indicator units of measure in cubic feet,
registration 10 Cu.Ft. per sweep hand revolution

without companion flanges $

784.47

No Bid

2.2

2"

strainers, cast bronze body, ductile iron, low head
loss, Stainless steel strainer plate and cover bolts,

pressure tested to 300psi, in-line serviceability $

238.57

No Bid

23

3”

strainers, cast bronze body, ductile iron, low head
loss, Stainless steel strainer plate and cover bolts,

pressure tested to 300psi, in-line serviceability $

424.29

No Bid

4||

strainers, cast bronze body, ductile iron, low head
loss, Stainless steel strainer plate and cover bolts,

pressure tested to 300psi, in-line serviceability $

507.14

No Bid




2021-189 Neptune Cold Water Meters

Bid Results
Item Size Description Ti Sales Stiles
COMPOUND TYPE GROUP THREE
31 o Meters-Cold Water, two registers, units of measure
' in cubic feet $ 1,718.93 | No Bid
19 g Meters-Cold Water, two registers, units of measure
' in cubic feet $ 2,576.90 | No Bid
33 4 Meters-Cold Water, two registers, units of measure
' in cubic feet $ 3,352.36 | No Bid
34 6" Meters-Cold Water, two registers, units of measure
) in cubic feet $ 5,660.77 | No Bid
35 8" x 6 Meters-Cold Water, two registers, units of measure
’ in cubic feet $ 9,394.13 | No Bid
FIRE SERVICE TYPE GROUP FOUR
41 g Meters-Cold Water, two registers, units of measure
' in cubic feet No Bid No Bid
40 A Meters-Cold Water, two registers, units of measure
’ in cubic feet $ 8,867.65 | No Bid
43 6" Meters-Cold Water, two registers, units of measure
' in cubic feet $ 14,489.42 | No Bid
" Meters-Cold Water, two registers, units of measure
4.4 8 in cubic feet $ 18,741.75 | No Bid
. |Meters-Cold Water, two registers, units of measure
4.5 10 in cubic feet $ 21,734.13 | No Bid
COMMUNICATION DEVICES GROUP FIVE
5.1 Reconditioned Neptune Advantage Probe for
reading ARB/Proread and R900 MIUs $ 800.00 | No Bid
5.1A Pocket Pro-Reader $ 891.89 | No Bid
59 Neptune R900 Radio Frequency MIU Pit Mount
' W/6’ of wire $ 114.29 | No Bid
>3 Neptune R900 Radio Frequency MIU Wall mount. | $ 91.00 | No Bid
54 Neptune 4 wheel integrated E-Coder Meter Heads
’ (10 cubic ft) $ 194.05 | No Bid
5/8” $ 194.05 | No Bid
3/4" $ 194.05 | No Bid
1” $ 194.05 | No Bid
1 %7 $ 194.05 | No Bid
2" $ 194.05 | No Bid
3" $ 194.05 | No Bid
4" $ 194,05 | No Bid
6" $ 194,05 | No Bid
8" $ 194.05 | No Bid




2021-189 Neptune Cold Water Meters

Bid Results
Item Size Description Ti Sales Stiles
COMMUNICATION DEVICES GROUP FIVE
Trimble Nomad 900B Neptune Handheld Data
5.5 Collector, Bluetooth Only with 1 stylus, 1 power
Adaptor, 2 antiglare screen protectors, 1 hand Strap,
and 1 SD card No Bid No Bid
56 Neptune Charging and Communications Cradle For
’ Trimble Nomad No Bid No Bid
5.7 Neptune R900 Belt Clip Transceiver including
Cables, batteries and accessories $ 2,714.29 | No Bid
5.8 3/4" $ 87.14 | No Bid
1” $ 87.14 | No Bid
11”7 $ 87.14 | No Bid
2" $ 87.14 | No Bid
3" $ 101.43 | No Bid
4" $ 101.43 | No Bid
6" $ 101.43 | No Bid
8" $ 101.43 | No Bid
PIT RECEPTICLES, REGISTER HEADS, TP’S, WIRE GROUP
SIX
6.1 Register Heads- T10, 2 Board, 2 Wire Cubic Ft, 6
' Digit, 4 Digit Read H 65 N #R62F11 5/8” $ 101.43 | No Bid
6.2 Register Heads — T10, 2 Board, Cubic Ft., 6 Digit,
' 4 Digit Read, H 65 N, #R62F21 3/4" $ 101.43 | No Bid
6.3 Register Heads- T10, 2 Board, 2 Wire Cubic Ft., 6
' Digit, 4 Digit Read, H 65 N, #R62F31 1~ $ 101.43 | No Bid
6.4 Register Heads — T'10, 2 Board, 2 Wire Cubic Ft., 6
Digit, 4 Digit Read, H 65 N, #R62F41 11/2” $ 101.43 | No Bid
6.5 Register Heads — T10, Cubic Ft, 6 Digit, H 65 N $ 101.43 { No Bid
6.6 Meter Wire, 3 Strand 22 Gauge 1,000 rolls $ 90.00 | No Bid




2021-189 Neptune Cold Water Meters

Bid Results
Item Size Description Ti Sales Stiles
METER PITS GROUP SEVEN
71A W/Angle Ball Valves — P.J. x CTS Ref. Ford
' #3A94 -323 W
5/8" $ 481.08 | $ 366.09
3/4" $ 501.08 | $ 366.09
1" $ 681.62 | $ 484.24
112" $ 2,562.00 1 $ 1,667.17
2" $ 2,975.00 | $ 1,807.98
7 1B W/Angle Cartridge Style Dual Check Valve Ref.
' Ford #HHCA91-323
5/8" $ 481.18 | No Bid
3/4" $ 501.08 | No Bid
1" $ 715.34 | No Bid
112" N/A No Bid
2" N/A No Bid
Meter Pit Cover — Includes: Frame, Frost Cover,
7.2 Cover w/Locking Electric Meter Reading Lid Ref.
Ford #W3T /11 1/2" x 20"
5/8" $ 18795 | § 137.45
3/4" $ 187.95 | % 137.45
1" $ 187.95 | $ 137.45
112" $ 963.00 | $ 599.26
2" $ 963.00 | $ 599.26
7.3 Meter Pit Poly Risers
20” x 37 $ 5425 | $§ 95.18
20”x 67 $ 59.50 [ $ 95.18
- BRASS FOR METERS
7.4
a Downsizing Adapter 3/4" x 1/2" x (5/8”) $ 19251 $ 14.36
b Street Elbow 1/2" Male x Female 90° $ 487 | $ 3.05
c Close Nipple 1/2" x Close $ 1.70 | $ 1.10
d Nipple 1/2" x 1 1/2" $ 29418 1.40
e Brass Ball Valve 3/4" TIPS w/Drain $ 1462 | 3 66.64
f Brass Ball Valve 1/2" IPS w/Drain $ 22.35
& Brass Coupling — 2 piece — Fit Adapter FL.xMIP. | § 16.85 | $ 11.74
L Brass Adapter 3/4" FLx M1P 90° Ref.# H-
16530 $ 17451 $ 12.58




2021-189 Neptune Cold Water Meters

Bid Results
Item Size Description Ti Sales Stiles
MEASURING CHAMBERS- T10
7.5 5/8" $ 18.40 | No Bid
3/4" $ 24.65 | No Bid
1" $ 47.14 | No Bid
112" $ 107.30 | No Bid
2" 3 138.00 | No Bid
Ref.# 5/8" x T-10 Measuring Chambers
- liner and gasket 5/8” through 2”
5/8" $ 1.30 | No Bid
3/4" $ 2.44 | No Bid
1" $ 2.35 | No Bid
112" $ 2.66 | No Bid
2" $ 5.22 | No Bid
- frost plate 5/8” through 1” No Bid
5/8" $ 4,04 | No Bid
3/4" $ 9.21 | No Bid
1" $ 15.54 | No Bid
- strainer 5/8” through 1”
5/8" $ 0.83 | No Bid
3/4" $ 0.93 | No Bid
1" $ 1.17 { No Bid
112" $ 2.66 | No Bid
2" $ 3.70 | No Bid
HIGH PERFORMANCE TURBINE REPLACEMENT
7.6 2" $ 624.98 | No Bid
3" $ 833.30 [ No Bid
4" $ 833.30 | No Bid
TRU/FLOW COMPOUND METERS UNITIZED MEASURIN
' ‘ 'ELEMENT '
7.7 2" $ 1,029.95 | No Bid
3" $ 1,827.03 | No Bid
4" $ 1,966.67 | No Bid
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TERRY DIPETRILLO
DIVISION CHIEF

JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
MAYOR

MICHAEL S. ST. PIERRE
BUSINESS MANAGER/
FINANCIAL ANALYST

CITY OF WARWICK
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

DIVISION OF WATER
935 SANDY LANE « WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02889
Tel (401) 738-2008 » Fax (401) 732-0616

To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: Terry DiPetrillo, Water Division Chief 72
Date: December 7, 2020

Subj: Bid2021-189 Neptune Cold Water Meters

Please be advised that we have reviewed the two bids submitted for the above and
recommend award to Ti Sales as the lowest responsible bidder for the purchase of meters.

The requested amount for award is $200,000. The current contract expires March 26,
2021. The new contract period will be March 27, 2021 to March 26, 2022.

(84-799 - $200,000)



