Patricia A. Peshka Joseph J. Solomon

Purchasing Agent Mayor

City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364

TO: Members of the Finance Committee
FROM: Patricia A. Peshka, Purchasing Agenﬂ??
DATE: October 25,2019

RE: Bids for the Finance Committee Monday, November 4, 2019




PCR-170-19

CITY OF WARWICK

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

APPROVED:

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of

NO:

MAYOR

DATE:

Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on
purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following

bid(s):

Bid

Name

Vendor(s)
Name/Address

Contract
Award

Contract
Period

Note

Code

2020

188

Repair Parts for Sand &
Salt Spreaders

JC Madigan, Inc.
450 Old Union Tpk.
Lancaster, MA 01523
Tri-County
Contractors Supply,
Inc.

154 Wayside Ave.
West Springfield, MA
01089
Tri-Power Sales &
Service Inc.

64 Minnesota Ave.
Warwick, RI 02888
HP Fairfield, LLC
9 Route 66 East
Columbia, CT 06237

$12,000.00

11/26/19

11/25/20

Continued next page




PCR-170-19

Bid Vendor(s) Contract | Contract
# Name Name/Address Award Period Note| Code
2020 Rllg”s’fzgv”of dSZ’f’y 12/12/19
- |Police Personnel Uniforms : ®  1$50,000.00 -
198 Suite 109 12/11/20
Johnston, RI1 02919
2020 1/31/20 56
- Ballistic Vests Various Vendors $50,000.00 - -
214 1/30/21 6
Constellation
2020 NewEnergy, Inc. 12/1/19 56
- Electricity Contract 116 Huntington $.0710/kwh - 1 -
219 Avenue 12/1/22 6
Boston, MA 02116

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest
responsible bidder.

1.

Request permission to piggyback Rhode Island League of Cities and Towns

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE




BID #

2020-188
2020-198
2020-214

2020-219

TABLE OF CONTENTS

CITY COUNCIL MEETING NOVEMBER 4, 2019

DESCRIPTION

Repair Parts for Sand & Salt Spreaders
Police Personnel Uniforms
Ballistic Vests (Sec. 56-6)

Electricity Contract (Sec. 56-6)

DEPT

1-17
18-34
35-36

37-40




Bid2020-188 Repair Parts for Sand & Salt Spreaders

e 4 bids submitted

CODE: 65-250 Automotive/Mechanical Parts
65-258 Automotive/Mechanical Parts/Plows

MANNER OF AWARD:  $12,000.00
November 26, 2019 — November 25, 2020

RECOMMEND: JC Madigan, Inc.
Tri-County Contractors Supply, Inc.

Tri-Power Sales & Service Inc.
HP Fairfield, LLC

$4,000.00
$8,000.00

JC Madigan, Inc.
450 Old Union Tpk.
Lancaster, MA 01523

Tri-County Contractors Supply, Inc.
154 Wayside Ave.
West Springfield, MA 01089

Tri-Power Sales & Service Inc.
64 Minnesota Ave.
Warwick, RI 02888
HP Fairfield, LLC

9 Route 66 East
Columbia, CT 06237

PRICING AS FOLLOWS

Continued next page




Bid2020-188 Repair Parts for Sand & Salt Spreaders

JC Madigan Tri-County Tri-Power Sales | HP Fairfield
Item Déscri tion Percentage off | Percentage off | Percentage off | Percentage off
# P List List List List
1 Tenco 10% No Bid +10% No Bid
2 Airflow 10% No Bid +10% 0%
3 Torwel 5% No Bid 0% No Bid
4 Buyers 5% 20% 20% 0%
5 Heil No Bid No Bid No Bid 0%
6 Downeaster No Bid 10% 5% No Bid
Delivery in
7 Calendar Days 5-7 Days 2-14 Days 1-7 Days 7 Days
ARO
. Tri- Tri-Power HP
JC Madigan County Sales Fairfield
Ttem Sample Sample Sample Sample
4 Description Prices Prices Prices Prices
Included Included Included Included
1 Tenco Yes No Yes No
2 Airflow Yes No Yes Yes
3. Torwel Yes No Yes No.
4 Buyers Yes Yes Yes Yes
5 Heil No No Yes
6 Downeaster Yes Yes No

Continued next page

All sample prices are attached




Airflow parts SZmpling ot thie:

T JE MADTGAN T

T ATTACHMENT #1771

_ dfipice | PR NetPrcs
1 40132 CHUTE Ge7-72 /8 §/6.72
2 40155 CHAIN SE-3.57 /0 Sp7-a/
3 06058 SPROCKET 2/.S7 10 24/
4 14002 SPINNER SHAFT ledt 8 yzi /R
5 05009 FLANGE BEARING S /2 5877
6 40197 IDLER SHAFT 21471 /O 197.22
7 05018 BEARING GO Se 70 S s
8 06026 SPROCKETS LEE. 57 /0 /SY.98
9 05016 BEARING s/ &) 2 73. <4,
| 10 06039 HUB Is. £ 4 /2 ¢ 7.4
¥ 11 01336 ROD Ci. 16 /2 Sgtf
12 06009 SPROCKET 3834 18 DA )
13 40186 IDLER SHAFT /&3 7¢ VY /LS 3€
14 14007 SPINNER SHAFT 14 .05 ) 1286 A,
15 | 04051 DRIVE CHAIN 53.55 )z “4£.20
16 401481 DRIVESHAFT 1791 /0 /66.3 3
17 04003 LINK 2.35» /2 3./5
18 07012 SOLENOID D706 /O 24 35
19 03001 GEARBOX Sbb e /0 So7 -t
20 70540 CONVEYOR CHAIN 66s 46 yr) S5TF85

FhoT Ho/334

& Dartoisza s ied BT w£259 3

)& adedd /ﬂfé—nﬂ‘ 7 j022C

10




memaing i

MADIGAN ~
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ATTACHMENT #1 |

WE 7511‘31/6- ZM:"T‘E?) S‘h—’uc_ 2al Jag_u)bz

G ons

DNelreTen WE el Mo Looge
K@» Aare /o Jaz"//-n'( ] o T

— opCE &7
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iy -

2 Smar 1<

A

D

Deteaphion Rkt price
1 T220101 SPINNER ADJUSTING
BRACKET 18565 K 17¢.37
2 T220102 DEFLECTOR PLATE Mo & o T —
3 1220103 MOTOR BRACKET T4 78 3 I3 35
4 T220105 SPINNER DISC A &b & S |
5 T220106 SPINNER VANES 7.9 < 7.3% ;
6 T220107 CHAR-LYN MOTOR A o Qo T —_— '
7 T220116 NO. 91 WOODRUFF KEY o Qoo 7 _
8 T130102-181 | DURST GEAR BOX 18"
CONVEYOR DSous S AN |
9 T130103 8 TOOTHSPROCKET | w894 = 7635/ |
10 | T130105181 | IDLER SHAFT 1X 22 (18" §
CONVEYOR) 3.5 < FE85K5 '
11 | T130106-181 | TAKEUPSHAFT1%X24 ‘ _
(18" CONVEYOR) Lo Qo TE
12 T130107 4-BOLT BEARING 7629 | < 466 78 ,
13 T130108 | IDLER BEARING 534& | & So0.2) :
14 T130109 TAKEUP BEARING e Sobn= L ——— |
15 T130111 TAKEUP PLATE _ -
: ASSEMBLY VO QuaTh - E
16 T130112 TAKEUP ANGLES VENEY < /1272
17 T130113 TAKEUP SPRINGS 240 & = o258
18 T130116 TAKEUP BOLT %-10 X 6
LG 2O oo TE —_—
19 7130117 KEY 3/85Q, X 3" LG 3975 3.35C.
20 T140100 CONVEYOR CHAIN 18" _
(10’ HOPPER) 70336 5 Le&£38
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[GAN MENT #1
?
DEscription Eistee NeiPacs f
1 | 1411001 BEARING 4. 20 < o2.55 .f
2 1401200 KEYWAY 2. Qo 2 23.94 :
3 | 1411000 BEARING 76 S /ST !i
! 1420101 PILLOW BLIOCK S3.80 = peTares il 5
5 1412300 LINK ROLLER CHAIN 7. 7L S F.de ;
6 1401300 MAIN PINTLE CHAIN 350.077 < EET A :
7 1410711 LINK SPINNER CHAIN /3.5 S /2. F3 :_
8 | 1401100RL | REPAIR LINK SPINNER :
CHAIN 7.93 S 7523 :
9 | 142005AS5 CHUTE 7S7. 25 < 719G - }8 )
10 | 1401150 CLUTCH ASSEMBLY 1 P SE e /S8~ !
11 | 1410701 CONTROLLER 222.3% &~ 2i0.53 :
12 | 3010389 CONTROLLER WIRE f
HARNESS [l‘ll‘.qﬁ ST /&‘?./é
13 3007301 CONTROLLER SWITCH =903 5 0767 §
14 | 1410706 GEARBOX COUPLER 3.7 S o271/ |
15 1411800 CLUTCH SPROCKET 2.0 B 22.L5
16 | 1410150 GEARBOX MOTOR L
ASSEMBLY Mo oo b:#~
17 | 1420150 SPINNER SHAFT (7. 80 S /6.9 /
18 | 142X150 SPINNER SHAFT YY) S 3.5 :
19 | 141055K SPINNER SHAFT KIT /33,62 5 ) i
20 | 1411907 THROTTLE CONTROL — !
MOTOR 1343 S 1326 j
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ATTACHMENT #2.

e -
TETTTRTY

Jun. L Lif

ListpntE Renbipeoly | NebPrce :
1 1411001 BEARING ¥ FYA/A 20 $§/, 73 1
2 | 1401200 KEYWAY TORLD  PART F [on PART iy
3 | 1411000 BEARING F/5.55 0% £ /5.0 i
4 TZ010L [ — PIIOW BLOCK CAATY,S P R A A7
5 | 1412300 LINK ROLLER CHAIN 2/8./7 [, 209 B 9.7/
6 1401300 MAINPINTIECHAIN | ¥ /. 446 "P" 20% | F233%9.17
7 1410711 LINK SPINNER CHAIN “[3.50 Aoy Flro &0 7
8 | 1401100RL| REPAIR LINKSPINNER 3
CHAIN * 7.7 20% 437
9 | 142005AS5 CHUTE £ $32.90 2°% | FLE5.70 -
10 | 1401150 CLUTCH ASSEMBLY *I9955 30 2o F /53 .6¢
11 | 1410701 CONTROLLER S222.3% 0%, ® /775
12 | 3010389 CONTROLLER WIRE
' HARNESS $//’/, 70 205 | #s/52
13 | 3007301 | CONTROLLER SWITCH L7,/ X L0 23.30
14 | 1410706 GEARBOX COUPLER 23.8% 2% | #/%.10
15 | 1411800 CLUTCH SPROCKET 35.1§ A0% | F30.5%
16 | 1410150 GEARBOX MOTOR ZwvAup | @ AR T4
ASSEMBLY
17 1420150 SPINNER SHAFT F]S. 60 2020 7’[///; 70
18 | 142X150 SPINNER SHAFT = 24,850 200 | #/7 57
19 | 141055K SPINNERSHAFTKT | ™ /13. 56 205 | Fo5.65
20 | 1411907 THROTILLOETCO(;NTROL Fs /43.72 203 S /30, 5%

12




TUATTACHMENT #2

" ORIGINAL

D&tEmmon
1 | SPV1408 | 14”X8' CONVEYOR CHAIN
2| spvitl | SINGLEMASTERLINK (62, | f g
INCLUDES 2 PINS W/ COTTERS, (2% 7,90
15/8" PIN TO PIN |
3 | SPGVi31 | IDLERSHAFT,1.125"X191/8" | #44 — 0%, 3760
4 | spy1al BEARING, IDIFR, 1125 | £ Con c o
SHAFT, TAKE UP SLIDE MOUNT ! (97 rE0.10
5 | SPVIIBA | CONVEYOR DRIVE/IDLER P )
SPROCKET, D6B2, 6TX 1.125, | #4/7 /63 zglf 230
WITH KEYWAY i -
6 | SCA104 | 14” DRIVESHAFTASSEMBLY |- 233 — /0% | P2CC. 70
BEARING, DRIVESHAFT, 1.125" L
7 | SPVI32 |BEAR Ve ¢77, /0% | #3900
» z ]
8 | HWF352 KEY, %" X 2%, CONVEYOR P 4= 102, 3,20
DRIVESHAFTORCLUTCH | =
9 | scA108 | DRIVESHAFT COUPLER, 2 BOLT |Z #5 - /07 40,50
10 | SKA410 | TRANSMISSION MOUNT, BOLT | # — A
ON, AFTER 2008, S 77 /0% 3 37.L0
11 | SPV121A GEARBOX-WORM GEAR | of
REDUCER 20:1 OUTPUT SHAFT | 4 7,1 ~ 10% |"532.80
11/8"X23/8"
12 | HWF766 | HARDWAREKITFORGAS |2 g - /0% £ s 0
GEARBOX MOUNTING ONLY .
13 | SPVI23A | SPROCKET, 40B-16 TOOTHX - — .
1° BORE, GERBOX INPUT ? g /02 |Ta7.70
SHAFT
14 | SKC201S | DEFLECTOR, FRONT, BOLTON | #£/ — /0% | £54. 9
15 | SKC2025 DEFLECTOR, CURB SIDE, _ ,
W/ADJUSTMENT ROD & ﬁﬁ/ - /0% | #3760
HARDWARE ,
16 | SKC2035 DEFLECTOR, REAR, _ _
W/ADJUSTMENT ROD & 7&[ 3 /6% | B56.p0
HARDWARE
17 | SKC204S DEFLECTOR, ROAD SIDE, _ £
W/ADJUSTMENT ROD & #47 /0% 3740
HARDWARE
18 | SPSIO7F | COMPLETESHORTSHAFT |# | @3 - I,
ASSM, 23" LONG /& /0% [67.70
19 | SPGS104D SPINNER DISC, 12” |
POLYPROPOLYNE, 6 FIN ? 1 45 y. 7 /30,60
W/SHAFT BOLT
20 | SPS109B | BEARING AND PILLOW BLOCK, |# 5, — 3
svetiod 34 102 |# 329
14




i

RTTAGHIENT T ¥

Bestription Net Price
1 212 220075 CHAIN BINDERASS'Y | ){zY.9.22 -+ 1%, 11y /
2 529200321 | RH ADJUSTING CARREE | . ]
PASSENGERSIDE | [p4-16 [ 1457
3 529200322 | LH ADJUSTING CARRIE
DRIVER SIDE |672.92 / IEDIA
4 212 28080 FLANGEBEARING 1 | Rj.2& | St5
5 529 19 0308 DRIVEN SHAFT G52 | 255G
6 212 270008 DRIVEN SPROCKET | £§¥.57/ | - WA
7 529 18 0001 DRIVING SHAFT 184 @) 2D 20
8 529270001 | DRIVING SPROCKET 1 %* ]
| 59-1¢ 567
9 212 19 0527 KEY 1/4-1/4 S &3
10 529 190930 SLIDING PLATE A
11 212 220357 TUBE NG el
12 3340 JOINT TYPE “B” 39-02 a9l
13 212 190843 SHAFT 32-00 /50 /0
%ﬁ:ﬁé 2= -
14 529 19 0568 10’ CONVEYORFLOOR | 5L &%-GD @sz ve
15 212 200118 SPINNERSUPPORT | HplusZ Yyco )
16 212 180036 SHAFT j]@ y 22
17 212 280007 BEARING &Y x-0F
18 212 180034 COUPLING Yt 2./
19 212 19 0097 KEY %”- % ) 9.28%
20 212 28 0004 HYDRUALIC MOTOR | L5zl &5 570U




1 40132 CHUTE 90276 | <+ /0 995-Y2
2 40155 CHAIN 929 G/
3 06058 SPROCKET Up o8 Us o~
4 14002 | SPINNER SHAET /A - L&L
5 05009 FLANGE BEARING i N 97
6 40197 IDLER SHAFT K2A4a.Y Y1045
7 05018 BEARING 7Y /D S/ 5~/
8 06026 SPROCKETS [b5§7 /85~
9 05016 BEARING gy 3/ /037>
10 | 05039 YP493  HuB 75 /6 2
11 01336 /|32 LRS  ROD (1. /L 227
12 06009 SPROCKET Y)75 Ys—<¢
13 40186 IDLER SHAFT /&A-7L, 2273
14 14007 SPINNER SHAFT 17422 /2
15 04051 DRIVE CHAIN S3- % 5&Fso
16 | 401481 DRIVESHAFT N&-5Y Y037
17 04003 LINK 2. &7 3-8
18 07012 SOLENOID <D L5
19 03001 GEARBOX 753.9) S 2y
20 70540 CONVEYOR CHAIN L5 Y4 233, o7,
10




"7 T TRT POWERTSALES "8 SERVITE

SKTTACHWENT 3 )

1 T220101 SPINNER ADJUSTING )
BRACKET 1956 [98-£2 ;
2 T220102 DEFLECTOR PLATE [3]-A0 /31+R0 i
3 7220103 | MOTOR BRACKET 13956 /39.35C l
4 T220105 SPINNER DISC ) 85~0 ) $~"70 ,
5 T220106 SPINNER VANES &5 &5/ ;
6 T220107 CHAR-LYN MOTORA | A7¢./0 S06- /0 :
7 T220116 NO.91 WOODRUFFKEY | Y. 0/ v.0) :
8 T130102-181 | DURST GEAR BOX 18" [
CONVEYOR 22473 D2 %3 |
9 T130103 8 TOOTHSPROCKET | 2¥/Qu Sl A |
10 | T130105-181 | IDLERSHAFT1X 22 (18" 2
CONVEYOR) 7137 9% 3)
11 | T130106181 | TAKEUP SHAFT1%X 24 :
(18" CONVEYOR) 2253 9283
12 T130107 4-BOLTBEARING | 7520 95310
13 T130108 IDLER BEARING 53 a3 553,22
14 T130109 TAKEUP BEARING DA-4) 325/
15 T130111 | TAKEUP PLATE
| ASSEMBLY XY, Go 3/
16 T130112 TAKEUP ANGLES ITETN JTAEY]
17 T130113 TAKEUP SPRINGS K56 A
18 T130116 TAKEUP BOLT %-10 X 6*
G 573 5%/3
19 T130117 KEY 3/85Q,X3" LG Yo Y.ob
20 T140100 CONVEYOR CHAIN 18*
(10’ HOPPER) 7527/ 757/

11
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e R [ POWER SALES 8 “SERVICE "™ ATt ACHMENT %3 i;

12

-11-

Listprice | PEcenfigenly | NebPrice

1 | 1411001 . BEARING 2. 1L 209, 2173 !
2| 1401200 [, kEvwav SYs=t) r Y3633 E
3 1411000 - BEARING - )&858 \ )5~ /)
4 | 1420101 PILLOW BLOCK DU SsD \ 1202
5 | 1412300 LINK ROLLER CHAIN 12-14] \ 9.7 :
6 1401300 MAIN PINTLECHAN | Y]]1-Y/ \ 324 /S
7 1410711 LINK SPINNER CHAIN 13 .50 [o-50 :
8 | 1401100RL| REPAIR LINK SPINNER

CHAIN 793 ¢35 ;
9 | 142005As5 CHUTE S33.93 CLr oS j
10 | 1401150 CLUTCH ASSEMBLY Jay. 5% | /s3> *
11 | 1410701 CONTROLLER 222.35 | /52 &8 ;
12 | 3010389 CONTROLLER WIRE / :

HARNESS XA 9452
13 | 3007301 CONTROLLER SWITCH 6. 13 | 23.3 ) :
14 | 1410706 GEARBOX COUPLER Y60 Ji 2 ' |
15 | 21411800 CLUTCH SPROCKET 2% /8 | 3 a.%‘
16 | 1410150 GEARBOX MOTOR /
ASSEMBLY yAa
17 | 1420150 SPINNER SHAFT |S¢. 2 1% 90
18 | 142150 SPINNER SHAFT KD )G v

19 | 141055K SPINNER SHAFT KIT 122 (A GE-§5
20 | 1411507 THROTTLE CONTROL !

MOTOR 163273 j [30.77 f




DESEton TS{price | BEESRGDEOT | Nepbmes |
1 | SPV1408 | 14”X8 CONVEYORCHAN | Y X0 L9, Us. o
2 | SPVI11l | SINGLE MASTER LINK (662), .
INCLUDES 2 PINS W/ COTTERS, //-6D f z/ 05"
15/8" PIN TO PIN Yotz e az e
3 | SPGVI31 | IDLERSHAFT, L.125°X191/8" | %Y. 60 /A7
| spy3z BEARINGADLER 1252
SHAFT, TAKE UP SLIDE MOUNT |  39. 6B Y43~
5 | SPVIIBA | CONVEYOR DRIVE/IDLER
SPROCKET, D662, 6TX 1.125, | B
WITH KEYWAY 17-0D bar T
6 | SCA104 | 14" DRIVESHAFTASSEMBLY | .233.4% 221 3¢
7 | SPVI32 | BEARING, DRIVESHAFT, 1.125"
SHAFT VY- b Y)-&
8 | HWRs2 KEY, %" X 2”, CONVEYOR -
DRIVESHAFTORCLUTCH | 7-¢© &
9 | SCA108 | DRIVESHAFT COUPLER, 2 BOLT | Y5 0D Y395
10 | SKA410 | TRANSMISSION MOUNT, BOLT |
ON, AFTER 2008, 55 Y4 o Y&
11 | SPVIZIA GEARBOX- WORM GEAR
REDUCER 20:1 OUTPUT SHAFT
11/8" X23/8" 5520 502-v¢
12 | HWFI66 HARDWARE KIT FOR GAS
GEARBOX MOUNTINGONLY | -0 &%
13 | SPVI23A | SPROCKET, 40B-16 TOOTHX . .
1" BORE, GERBOX INPUT
SHAET 2100 2Avs
14 | SKC201S | DEFLECTOR, FRONT, BOLTON | (,1.60 oS
15 | SKC202S DEFLECTOR, CURB SIDE,
W/ADJUSTMENT ROD & v ikt
HARDWARE 7700
16 | SKC203S DEFLECTOR, REAR,
W/ADJUSTMENT ROD & .
HARDWARE (3% 575
17 | SKC204s DEFLECTOR, ROAD SIDE,
W/ADJUSTMENT ROD & : t/,
HARDWARE 700 7} 80
18 | SPS107F | COMPLETE SHORT SHAFT
ASSM, 23" LONG /63 0B /73 &5
19 | SPGS104D SPINNER DISC, 14"
POLYPROPOLYNE, 6 FIN Lo 3%
W/SHAFT BOLT [ 74 / 2
20 | SPS1098 | BEARING AND PILLOW BLOCK,
7/8" BORE 3¢ 00 ! Rk Qo

14

-12-




= ATTACHMENT “#47

-13-

Airflow parts SE#phirg of-fiepany

BEsiption _Efiprice | Pece _NetPrice
1 | 40132 CHUTE 952 7° P07 <
2 | 40155 CHAIN (14g9 L14.97
3 06058 SPROCKET 40,98 o 78
4 14002 SPINNFR SHAFT 7A7) 71/, @,
5 05009 FLANGE BEARING S W
6 | - 40197 IDLER SHAFT i
7 05018 BEARING 7Y /0 190
8 06026 SPROCKETS 10537 /557
9 05016 BEARING gy 90 q4 76
10 06039 HUB IAAA CG.0LD
11 01336 ROD £ E
12 06009 SPROCKET 4199 ly:79
13 | 40186 IDLER SHAFT /82,70 )53,
14 14007 SPINNER SHAFT 1720, 2% )79 42
15 | 04051 DRIVE CHAIN LA 2,00
16 | 40148L DRIVESHAFT /905 /908
17 04003 LINK d1v 203 :
18 07012 SOLENOID 19,80 . 24.40
19 03001 GEARBOX Slen9 J%Zﬁ:l
20 70540 CONVEYOR CHAIN GCTgb i

10
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Ty :.Z.'_-....:::.HP,._.FH RFT_ELD ezl Sen el '—"""'."".""..'ATTACHM'E'.N.T‘-..T#_#:
i
B Geloi | Thior | Novhe
1 | 1411001 BEARING 5.0 253/ |
2| 1401200 KEYWAY 299.07 J1%.07 |
3 1411000 BEARING [(,of 1. Q7 !
4 1420101 PILLOW BLOCK 2F 1T a7 17
5 | 1412300 | LINK ROLLER CHAIN (049 (049 ?
6 | 1401300 | MAIN PINTLE CHAIN 349,60 74500
7 1410711 LINK SPINNER CHAIN e {492 :
8 | 1401100RL | REPAIR LINK SPINNER ;
CHAIN X1 Yl
9 | 142005ASS CHUTE (95,00 6 9C. 00 X
10 | 1401150 CLUTCH ASSEMBLY [1,9,00 /(5. 00 !
11 | 1410701 CONTROLLER 1949.9)] (9.9 ;
12 | 3010389 CONTROLLER WIRE . T :
HARNESS | ;99 [69.
13 | 3007301 | CONTROLLER SWITCH Q59 A8 .56 ;
14 | 1410708 GEARBOX COUPLER 25,18 25 I8 g
15 | 1411800 CLUTCH SPROCKET A, X JLd
16 | 1410150 GEARBOX MOTOR
- ASSEMBLY Hsg < N
17 | 1420150 SPINNER SHAFT 1814 LY
18 | 142X150 SPINNER SHAFT 2593 2690 ;
19 141055K SPINNER SHAFT KIT {'19.00 {14,060 |
20 | 1411907 | THROTTLE CONTROL i !
MOTOR [15.00 [(500 :




Yo eeredt mmee 08" HP . FA-TR.F:TE'[::D el

el parts SEFIRESEUiE pics

Description
1 055-1352 DISC SPINNER 47,00 &7 00
2 055-135 SPINNER )
3 | 094-1806 CHUTE — FRONT (0905 /69, 06
4 0942119 | _ CHUTE |
5 | 1346793 SPINNER VANE LH 47,00 7 oo
6 | 177-1937 |  SUPPORT- SPINNER 70,00 /0.69
7 | o01-6044 CYLINDER CHROME .
PLATED 42-98TM /65, 60 /6SD %
8 003-4088 BEARING — LOWER v
SPINNER /S 60 /§°°
9 | 003-4089 BEARING — UPPER 0
SPINNER /G¢°° /S ¢
10 | 008-8504 SHAFT SPINNER
11 | 0135102 | BELLCRANK-LEVER 7. 00 7. o0
12 | 022-3555 | SEAL-SPINNER SHAFT /D °¢ /S
13 | 045-1089 | COUPLING - SPINNER -
14 | 177-3079 | SUPPORT —SPINNER e incaall | 1/,° ™
15 | 219-1442 | HYDRAULCMOTOR | 4&A0L e47%
16 | 2375313 FRAME — SPINNER /077 o0 /079 %
17 | 2724776-1|  SPINNER BRACKET R
ASSEMBLY J/G 9 J(7°
18 | 272-4776-2| INNER TUBE SPINNER o
BRACKET 7y % 7¢°
19 | 272-4776- TUBE
201 Ly ©° yi%e
20 | 272-4776-3|  OUTER TUBE WELD 7/°° /A

13
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CITY OF WARWICK
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
925 SANDY LANE
WARWICK, RI 02889
TEL. 401-738-2003
FAX 401-732-5208

To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent
From: Mathew Solitro, Public Works Director M>
Date: October 17,2019

Subj:  Bid2020-188 Repair Parts for Sand & Salt Spreaders

0CT 2 1 2019

JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
MAYOR

MATHEW J. SOLITRO
DIRECTOR

We have reviewed the four bids received on the above and recommend award to Tri Power Sales and
Service, Inc., Tri County Contractors Supply, Inc., HP Fairfield, LLC, and JC Madigan, Inc. for the purchase
of parts for the sanders. This department is requesting to award all vendor due to the nature of this
commodity for the safety of those that travel over City roadways during inclement weather. The current
bid expires on November 25, 2019. The new contract period will be November 26, 2019 to November 25,

2020. The recommended cap is $12,000.00.

Please note that this bid is being presented nearing the current expiration, as this is the second
advertisement. The previous bid that was presented to the Finance Committee was voted unfavorable

for lack of vendor pricing.

(65-250 - $4,000)
(65-258 - $8,000)
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

e 2 bids submitted

CODE: 30-260 Police/Miscellaneous Police Gear-Uniforms

MANNER OF AWARD: $50,000.00
December 12, 2019 — December 11, 2020

RECOMMEND: RI Uniform & Supply

RI Uniform & Supply
1395 Atwood Ave Suite 109
Johnston, R102919
Body Armor Outlet
26 Ermer Road
Salem, NH 03079

PRICING AS FOLLOWS

Continued next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Pe

rsonnel Uniforms

| Item # Description RI Uniform & Body Armor Outlet
Supply
4 ‘ See note 1
STANDARD UNIFORM
1. |Long Sleeve Shirt
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style SU3152 No Bid
Lieutenant & Above $100.00 No Bid
Sergeant $110.00 No Bid
Officer $100.00 No Bid
2 Short Sleeve Shirt
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style SU3102 No Bid
Basic Design $85.00 No Bid
-3 Vest Carrier Shirts :
-Brand Spiewak - No Bid
Style SCRpp93 No Bid
Basic Design $125.00 No Bid
$135.00/Molle

4 |Jacket with zip-out liner S
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style| S3616/linerS327 No Bid
Lieutenant & Above $210.00 No Bid
Sergeant & Above $220.00 No Bid
Officer $210.00 No Bid

5 Optional Lightweight Coat o B
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style S3182 No Bid
Basic Design $105.00 No Bid
6 Optional Winter Leather Coat - :
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
7 {Raincoat e
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style S309VR No Bid
Basic Design $125.00 No Bid
continued next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Item # Description RI Uniform & Body Armor Outlet
Supply
8 |Optional 3/4 Length Raincoat S B
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style S317V No Bid
Basic Design $185.00 No Bid
-9 [Raincoat/Inclement Weather Coat ST
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style S578V No Bid
Basic Design $180.00 No Bid
©10  |Traffic Vest el
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style S912 No Bid
Basic Design $55.00 No Bid
11 [Snow Suit ' Sl
Brand Snapwear No Bid
Style 10001-1 No Bid
Basic Design $130.00 No Bid
- 12" |Sweater : R
Brand Cobmex No Bid
Style 8081 No Bid
Basic Design $55.00 No Bid
13- - [Turtleneck N
Brand Cobmex Blaur
Style TN100 8100
Basic Design $18.00 $24.75
14 |Footwear - o ,
(please designate shoe or combat boot) Danner Boot
Brand Rocky Danner Lookout
Style 2173 Lookout
Basic Design $80.00 $96.00
15 - |Optional All Weather Pants - :
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style S1785 No Bid
Basic Design $125.00 No Bid
continued next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Ttem #

Description

RI Uniform &

Body Armor Outlet
Supply
16  |Trousers :
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style SV320 No Bid
Basic Design $80.00 No Bid
17 - |Service Bars/Shirts -
Brand| Hero's Pride No Bid
Style 11414 No Bid
Basic Design| $3.00 per patch No Bid
Sergeants and Patrol | $3.00 per patch No Bid
Lieutenant and Above| $3.00 per patch No Bid
- 18 [Service Bars/Jackets .
Brand| Hero's Pride No Bid
Style 25014 No Bid
Basic Design| $5.00 per patch No Bid
Sergeants and Patrol | $5.00 per patch No Bid
Lieutenant and Above| $5.00 per patch No Bid
19 |Tie :
BrandHamburger Woolet] Rothco
Style Clip-1 Clip on tie
Basic Design $9.00 $4.00
20 |Optional Baseball Cap -~ .~ P
Brand| Port & Company No Bid
Style 6277 No Bid
Basic Design $25.00 No Bid
21  {Winter Hat Ry
Brand Keystone No Bid
Style R-13 No Bid
Sergeant & Above $70.00 No Bid
Officer $60.00 No Bid
© 22 |Summer Hat Vi R
Brand Keystone No Bid
Style R-13P No Bid
Sergeant & Above $65.00 No Bid
Officer $55.00 No Bid

continued next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Item # Description RI Uniform & Body Armor Outlet
Supply
23 . {Optional Winter Toke/Knit Cap ,
Brand Cobmex Blauer Skull cap
Style 1117 Skull Cap
Basic Design $35.00 $23.75
24 |Optional Detail Short Sleeve Shirt R
Brand Elbeco No Bid
Style K5216 No Bid
Basic Design $85.00 No Bid
25  |Optional Detail Long Sleeve Shirt: LA
Brand Elbeco No Bid
Style K5226 No Bid
Basic Design $110.00 No Bid
26  |Optional Detail Pants o TR RS o
Brand| 5.11 taclite pro No Bid
Style 74273 No Bid
Basic Design $44.00 No Bid

continued next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Item #

Description

RI Uniform &

Body Armor Outlet
Supply
DRESS UNIFORM/LTS. & ABOVE
27 |Long Sleeve Shirt 3
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style SV315Z No Bid
Basic Design $90.00 No Bid
TRAFFIC OFFICERS
Brand| Hope Uniform No Bid
Style 550B No Bid
Basic Design $200.00 No Bid
29 |Optional Cycle Jacket : ' L
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
30 Optional Winter 3/4 Length Leather Coat - | S
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
31 Motorcycle Helmet s , -
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
32 Motorcycle Officers Boots RS
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
33 |Rain Pants el
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style S1785 No Bid
Basic Design $125.00 No Bid
34 = |Gloves
Brand| Raber Glove No Bid
Style C1P No Bid
Basic Design $100.00 No Bid

continued next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Item # Description RI Uniform & Body Armor Outlet
Supply
35  |Sam Brown Shoulder Strap R
Brand Jaypee No Bid
Style 1435 No Bid
Basic Design $50.00 No Bid
36 |Commercial Enforcement Long Sleeve Shirt o
Brand 511 No Bid
Style 72175 No Bid
Basic Design $73.00 No Bid
37 - |Commercial Enforcement Short Sleeve Shirt :
Brand 511 No Bid
Style 71175 ‘No Bid
Basic Design $65.00 No Bid
- 38  |Commercial Enforcement Pants
Brand 511 No Bid
Style: BDU 74280 No Bid
Basic Design $45.00 No Bid
HONOR GUARD
39 |Hat o
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
- 40 .  |Trousers » Sy
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
- 41 |Long Sleeve Shirt : L
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
42  |Gloves -Dress White Cotton
Brand HWC No Bid
Style Slip100 No Bid
Basic Design $6.00 No Bid
continued next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Item # Description RI Uniform & Body Armor Outlet
Supply
43 |Gloves -Black Raber T
Brand Raber No Bid
Style CI1P No Bid
Basic Design|  $100.00 No Bid
44 “|Boots -
Brand Rocky Rocky
Style]  FQ00500-8 Chukka FQ00500-8
Basic Design $70.00 $60.00
45 Belt : :
Brand Jaypee No Bid
Style 400L No Bid
Basic Design $85.00 No Bid
46 - [Shoulder Cord : T
Brand| Priemier Emblem No Bid
Style P5400 No Bid
Basic Design $11.50 No Bid
47 - |Dress Coat | s
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
48 - |Mourning Badge :
BrandHamburger Wooler No Bid
Style MB-2 No Bid
Basic Design $4.00 No Bid
*Band
49 - |Trench Coat - 3
Brand| Anchor Uniform No Bid
Style 261-MT No Bid
Basic Design $246.00 No Bid

Continued next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Item # Description RI Uniform & Body Armor Outlet
Supply
POLICE RECRUITS
50 :|Long Sleeve Shirt :
Brand Tru-Spec Elbeco
Style 1367 El-314
Basic Design $49.00 $38.25
51 |Trousers A
Brand Tru-Spec Elbeco
Style 1996 El-E314
Basic Design $43.00 $54.00
52 |Hat L e
Brand Rothco No Bid
Style SPT No Bid
Basic Design $24.99 No Bid.
53 |Belt - 5 PR
Brand| Boston Leather Jay Pee
Style 6501-1 1001SS
Basic Design|  $22.00 $23.50
54 - [Boots R T
Brand Danner Danner
Style 43013 43003
Basic Design $190.00 $152.50

continued on next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Item #

Description

RI Uniform &

Supply Body Armor Outlet
DETECTIVES
55 “|Jacket - Lightweight L
Brand 511 No Bid
Style 48098 No Bid
Basic Design $145.00 No Bid
ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
DIVISION / PROFESSIONAL
DIVISION/ COMMUNITY SERVICES
DIVISION
56  |Optional Shirt S
Brand| Port Authority 511
Style CS412 51141060 -51172360
Basic Design $34.00 Short Sleve / Long Sleve
$42.25 / $48.25
- 57 . |Optional Pants
Brand 511 Tru-Spec
Style 74273 TR-106
Basic Design $44.00 $37.60
DIVE TEAM
58 |Shirt | i
Brand 511 Tru-Spec
Style 71049 TR-4413
Basic Design $57.00 $27.50
59 |Pants B L
Brand 511 511
Style 74273 511 74003
Basic Design $44.00 $40.25

Continued next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

| Item # Description RI Uniform & Body Armor Outlet
Supply
60 |Shorts
Brand 511 511
Style 732287 5117328
Basic Design $42.00 $38.50
61 Belt o
Brand| Blackhawk Uncle Mikes
Style| BH-41CQ01-DE UM-8908X
Basic Design $38.00 $12.00
62 |Optional Jacket L o
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
~ Basic Design No Bid No Bid
SWAT TEAM
~ 63 [Shirt o S
Brand 511 No Bid
Style 72054 No Bid
Basic Design $49.00 No Bid
64 |Pants o .
Brand 511 No Bid
Style 74003 No Bid
Basic Design $43.00 No Bid
65  |Nylon Belt o :
Brand] Blackhawk Uncle Mikes
Style| BH-41CQ02-BK UM-8908X
Basic Design $34.00 $12.00
66 |Jacket- 3 Season Coat S
Brand: 511 511
Style 48112 51148112
Basic Design $195.00 $198.00

Continued on next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Item # Description RI Uniform & Body Armor Outlet
Supply
ANIMAL CONTROL OFFICERS
67 |Long Sleeve Shirt - ‘
Brand 511 511
Style 72049 511 72360
Basic Design $59.99 $48.25
68 |[Short Sleeve Shirt o
Brand 511 511
Style 71049 511 41060
Basic Design $54.99 $42.25
69  [Trousers : ‘
Brand 511 Tru-Spec
Style 74273 Tr-106
Basic Design $44.00 $37.60
70 - |Rubber Boots R .
Brand Tingley No Bid
Style N1500 No Bid
Basic Design $35.00 No Bid
- 71 |Jacket S
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style| S3616/Liner S327 No Bid
Basic Design $210.00 No Bid
JAILERS
72 |Short Sleeve Shirt :
Brand 511 511
Style 71175 511 41060
Basic Design $56.00 $42.25
73 |Long Sleeve Shirt e
Brand 511 511
Style 72175 511 72360
Basic Design $60.00 $48.25

Continued on next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Item # Description RI Uniform & Body Armor Outlet
Supply
74 . | Trousers
Brand 511 Tru-Spec
Style 7473 Tr-106
Basic Design $44.00 $37.60
75 - |Tie - T
TypeHamburger Wooler Rothco-Clip on
Color Black
$9.00 $4.00
76  |Turtleneck
Brand Cobmex Blauer
Style 7N100
Basic Design $18.00 $24.75
77. . |Shoes
Type Rocky No Bid
Brand 2168 No Bid
$88.00
78 - |Boots :
Type Rocky Danner
Brand 2173 Lookout
$80.00 $96.00
COMMUNITY POLICE OFFICERS
79 .- |Shorts :
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
- 80 |Jacket :
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
- 81 |Pants :
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
- 82 |Shirts SR R
Brand No Bid No Bid
Style No Bid No Bid
Basic Design No Bid No Bid
Continued on next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Item # Description RI Uniform & Body Armor Outlet
Supply
83  |Optional Shirt P R
Brand 511 511
Style 71049 511 72360
Basic Design $55.00 $42.25
K9- OFFICERS
- 84 . |Long Sleeve Shirt i . j
Brand 511 511
Style 71332 511 72360
Basic Design $65.00 $42.25
* 85" {Short Sleeve Shirt ; ‘ -
Brand 511 511
Style 71322 511 41060
Basic Design $60.00 $42.25
. 86 |Pants
Brand 511 511
Style 74371 511 72360
Basic Design $55.00 $48.25
- 87 |VEST CARRIER S ; ‘ _
Brand] Survival Armor No Bid
Style FOT/OC No Bid
Basic Design $285.00 No Bid
Basic Design|  $15.00/Path No Bid
- 88 [Hat R e
Brand] Port Authority No Bid
Style 6277 No Bid
Basic Design $22.00 No Bid
89 |WINTER COAT S
Brand 511 No Bid
Style 48017 No Bid
Basic Design $225.00 No Bid

Continued on next page
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Bid2020-198 Police Personnel Uniforms

Item # Description RI Uniform & Body Armor Outlet
Supply
EXPLORERS/CADETS
+ 90 . |Winter Long Sleeve Shirt S el
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style SV315Z No Bid
Basic Design $59.99 No Bid
91  |Summer Short Sleeve Shirt } =
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style SV310 No Bid
Basic Design $54.99 No Bid
92  |Pants = o o
Brand Spiewak No Bid
Style SV320 No Bid
Basic Design $49.99 No Bid
93  |Belt ,
Brand| Boston Leather No Bid
Style 6505-1 No Bid
Basic Design $22.00 No Bid
- 94 |Hat T
Brand| Port Authority No Bid
Style 6277 No Bid
Basic Design $22.00 No Bid
Note 1: Sizes 2XL and over please add 15%
to Pricing
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CITY OF WARWICK

Colonel Rick J. Rathbun B Joseph J. Solomon
Chief of Police Mayor
0CT 2 1- 2019

Police Department
99 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617
Telephone: (401) 468-4200

October 21, 2019

Mrs. Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent

Warwick City Hall

3275 Post Road

Warwick, RI 02886

RE: Request for Awarding of Bid- Police Uniforms
BID 2020-198 Police Uniforms '
Funding Source: 30-260

Dear Mrs. Peshka:

The Police Department went out to bid (2020-198) for the purpose of purchasing police uniforms for officers assigned to
the department. Upon the closing of the bid period, we received bids from the following two vendors:

1. RIUniform & Supply: 1395 Atwood Avenue, Johnston, R, 02919
2. Body Armor Outlet: 26 Elmer Rd. Salem, NH 03079

The department is requesting that the bid be awarded to RI Uniform & Supply which is the lowest qualified bidder on the
majority of the products on the bid list.

The current bid expires on 12/11/19.

Funding for this request, if approved, will be from the Police Department’s Operating Budget code 30-260. The total
amount to be expended will not exceed $50,000.00 for a one year period beginning 12/12/19 thru 12/11/20.

Please feel free to contact this office should you require any further information.

4 | M/(M ((M (L;

pri Michailides
¥ajor
Administrative Bureau Commander
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CODE; 30-260 Police/Miscellaneous Police Gear-Uniforms

SECTION 56-6

2020-214 Ballistic Vests

Various Vendors

Contract Award: $ 50,000.00

Contract Period: January 31,2020 — January 30, 2021
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o CITY OF WARWICK
Colonel Rick J. Rathbun
Chief of Police

Joseph J. Solomon
Mayor

Police Department
99 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617
Telephone: (401) 468-4200

October 16, 2019

Mrs. Patricia A. Peshka, Purchasing Agent
Warwick City Hall

3275 Post Road

Warwick, Rl 02886

RE: Request for Spending Authorization; Ballistic Vests for Police Officers
C.0. 56-6; Exception to Notice Requirement; Various Vendors
Budget Code 30-260

Dear Mrs. Peshka:

The department is seeking authorization to purchase ballistic vests from various vendors for police officers
under the provisions of City Ordinance 56-6, “Exception to Notice Requirement” on an as needed basis.

The exception is requested in order to meet contractual requirements provided for in Section 31 of the current
CBA that allows officers to select a vest of their choice for which the department would pay the average cost of
the top three (3) brands for a level 2A vest or the top three (3) brands for level 3A vest. This cost is reviewed
each year and is currently set at $778.00 per vest for level 2A and $890.00 per vest for level 3A. Any costs
over that amount are incurred by the officer.

The vests are replaced at the department’s expense upon reaching the maximum life that is normally five (5)
years unless the vest is traumatized or otherwise impacted by other elements. |t is anticipated that up to 50
officers (including new hires) will require new vests during the next 1 year contract. It should be noted that
each vest purchased is specifically made for the individual officer. ‘The department is not in the practice of
purchasing vests in order to keep an inventory or stockpile body armor.

The department is requesting the amount of $ 50,000 to purchase vests on an as needed basis. If approved,

fundlng for this purchase would come from the Police Operating Budget Budget Code #30-260 “Ballistic
Vests.”

The current contract expires on January 30, 2020
The contract period would be valid from January 31, 2020 through January 30, 2021.

Please feel free to contact me should you require any further information.

Major Lori Michailides
Admihistrative Bureau Commander
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CODE:*Various Departments-224/Electricity
67-224 Engineering/Street Lighting

*Departments:
28,30,35,43,45,47,63,66,80,84

SECTION 56-6

2020-219 Electricity Contract

Constellation NewEnergy, Inc.
116 Huntington Avenue
Boston, MA 02116

Contract Award: $ .0710/kwh
Contract Period: December 1. 2019 — December 1, 2022
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Brian M. Silvia Joseph J. Solomon
Finance Director Mayor
CITY OF WARWICK
FINANCE DEPARTMENT
3275 POST ROAD

WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886

To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent
From: Brian M. Silvia, Finance Director/{/Lg
Date: 10/22/2019

Re: Electricity Supplier Contract (Section 56-6)

The Rhode Island League of Cities and Towns has competitively bid bulk pricing for electricity
supplier services on behalf of municipalities since 1999. The League solicited bids on an up to 4-
year cycle. Previously, this contract had been awarded by the League and piggybacked by Warwick
to Direct Energy, under bid# 2018-173. The League has once again gone out to bid for this contract,
with the eventual award to Constellation.

The City of Warwick has the option of entering into a one, two, three or four year contract term
with Constellation. Current pricing, as of October 21, 2019 associated with these term options are
as follows:

e December-19 through December-20: $0.0733 / kwh
e December-19 through December-21: $0.0720 / kwh
e December-19 through December-22: $0.0710 / kwh
e December-19 through December-23: $0.0721 / kwh

By comparison, the current National Grid standard offer approved by the RI PUC for the period of
October 1, 2019 through March 31, 2020 is $0.10248 / kwh. The City’s expiring energy supplier
contract with Direct Energy, had a contractual rate of $0.07598 / kwh for a period of December 1,
2017 through December 1, 2019. Based on the City’s historical annual usage of 14,257,708 kwh,
the City is estimating a saving associated with a decreased energy supply costs of $70,000 annually
or $210,000 over the term of this contract. Conversely, when comparing Constellation’s pricing
against National Grid’s current rate over the next year, the City anticipates savings of $447,000 on
its energy supply costs.

The City has awarded this contract to Direct Energy under the REAP program administered by the
Rhode Island League of Cities & Towns since 2012. This is contract is available to all cities & towns
due to RIGL 45-55-13.2 - Exclusion of multi-cities or towns energy aggregation programs.

Please note that rates on the electricity market vary daily, Constellation will provide updated fixed
pricing on November 4th, which will be communicated to the City Council at that time. This price
would then be “locked”, should the City Council elect to award this this contract on that date.

In an effort to maximize potential savings and provide budget stability, the administration is
recommending that the City Council authorize the City to enter into a three-year contract award
with Constellation for the City’s electric supply. _pggi_g




CITY OF WARWICK
ELECTRIC SUPPLIER ACCOUNTS

FISCAL YEAR 2020

ACCOUNT # DEPARTMENT ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION FY2020 BUDGET
28 224  ANIMAL SHELTER ELECTRICITY 12,000
30 224  POLICE DEPARTMENT ELECTRICITY 90,000
35 224  FIRE DEPARTMENT ELECTRICITY 115,000
43 224  LIBRARY ELECTRICITY 113,000
45 224  PARKS & RECREATION ELECTRICITY 429,000
47 224  SENIOR CITIZEN CENTER ELECTRICITY 40,000
63 224  DPW - HIGHWAY ELECTRICITY 65,000
66 224 DPW - BUILDING MAINTENANCE ELECTRICITY 130,000
67 224  DPW - ENGINEERING STREET LIGHTING 1,300,000

GENERAL FUND TOTAL 2,294,000
80 224  SEWER DEPARTMENT ELECTRICITY 798,000
84 224  WATER DEPARTMENT ELECTRICITY 23,000

GRAND TOTAL 3,115,000
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TITLE 45
Towns and Cities

CHAPTER 45-55
Award of Municipal Contracts

SECTION 45-55-13.2

§ 45-55-13.2. Exclusion of multi-cities or towns energy aggregation programs.
The provisions of this chapter do not apply to entities organized for the purpose of negotiating the purchase of electric
power pursuant to § 39-3-1.1, or energy or energy related services. Those entities are exempt from all provisions of this

chapter.

History of Section.
(P.L. 1998, ch. 19,8 1.)
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