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CODE: 35-340 Fire Department/Service Contracts

SECTION 6-12

Request permission to increase PCR-125-18 (Sub A)
from $16,000.00 to $24,000.00.
Bid2019-066 Repairs to Existing Plymovent Vehicle Exhaust Removal System
Murphy Specialty, Inc.

158 Arlington St.
Boston, MA 02136

LAST ACTION TAKEN

Original Award Bid: PCR-125-18 (Sub A) approved August 17, 2018 in the amount of $16,000.00.
Two years from date of award.

Contract Increase Requested $8,000.00

Current Contract Award $16,000.00

Contract Period Requested No change in term

Current Contract Period August 27, 2018 — August 26, 2020




JAN 0 6 2020

Office: (401) 468-4044
Fax: (401) 468-4043

S Jason Umbenhauer
‘ % Assistant Chief

Warwick Fire Department
111 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886

January 6, 2020

Patricia Peshka
Purchasing Agent
City of Warwick

Mrs. Peshka,

The Fire Department is seeking a 6-12 alteration to contact for Bid2019-066 Repairs to Existing
Plymovent Vehicle Exhaust Removal System. The Department seeking to increase the award in the
amount of $8,000. The department is not requesting an alteration to the effective dates of the contract.

The Fire Department has nearly exhausted the estimated cost of repairs of the Plymovent systems in all
our fire stations. Most of these systems are nearly 20 years old and the cost of repairs has been steadily
increasing. The Department also incurred a large number of repairs at the end of 2018 due to a nine
month lapse in the service contract.

As of today, there is $1,516.62 remaining in the spending authority granted by the City Council for a 2-
year contract that expires on August 26, 2020.

The Department has been working with the vendor to formulate a plan to make long-term improvements
to the systems that will mitigate the increased costs of repair. We anticipate a finalized plan prior to the

expiration date of the current bid, therefore having it included in the next bid request.

Please contact me should you have any questions.

Uy

Jason benhauer
Assistant Chief

Email: Jason. Un-zbeLz/éa_uer@warw’ickri. com




COoPY

PCR-125-18 (Sub A)

CITY OF WARWICK
STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS
RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

R-18-99

APPROVED: JZJ (7/ 5 ”’4”4"-\ MAYOR

DATE: __ [FU6457 |7 Q0 /5

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of
Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on
purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following bid(s):

Bid N Vendor(s) Contract Contract
ame

# ~Name/Address Award Period Note | Code

2011 | State of RI Commercial WW Grainger N , 7/1/18 6
- Industrial Equipment 78 Jefferson Blvd. 0 ”“"Z‘; -
289 " & Supplies Warwick, RI 02888 reques 9/30/18 12

Banner Systems of MA,
Inc.
135 Elliot St.
Brockton, MA 02302
Casey Engineered
State of RI Maintenance $10.000.00 718 6
Janitorial Supplies Eight Panas Rd. S
Foxboro, MA 02035
Eastern Bag &
Paper Co.
200 Research Dr.
Milford, CT 06460

2013

215 9/30/18 12

Continued next page




PCR-125-18 (Sub A)

COPY

Bid
#

Name

Vendor(s)
Name/Address

Contract
Award

Contract
Period

Note | Code

2017

222

Analytical Testing
of Water Samples

RI Analytical
Laboratories
40 Ilinois Ave.
Warwick, RT 02888

$14,588.50

12

2017

257

Fire Dept. Dress
Uniforms, Badges,
Insignias & Name Plates

Stillman Uniforms
271 Post Rd. E-1
Westerly, R1 02891

$15,000.00

12

2018

089

Gutter & Tube-Type
Brooms

United Rotary Brush
Corporation
15607 W. 100th Terrace
Lenexa, KS 66219
Keystone Plastics Inc.
3451 S. Clinton Ave.
South Plainfield, NJ 07080
Atlantic Broom
Service, Inc.

345 John Quincy
Adams Road
Taunton, MA 02780

$10,000.00

12

2018

093

Street
Improvements

Cardi Corp.
400 Lincoln Ave.
Warwick, RI 02888

$3,000,000.00

12

2019

050

Overhead Door
Repair/Replacement

Overhead Door Co.
One Overhead Way
Warwick, RT 02888

Fire Only
$13,000.00

12

2018

310

Structural
Fire Fighting
Boots

C & S Specialty
1181 Old

Smithfield Rd.

N. Smithfield, RI
02896

Fire Tech & Safety

90 Progress Ave.

Unit 3
Tyngsborough, MA 01879

$20,000.00

2 years
from date | §
of award

Continued next page




PCR-125-18 (Sub A)

COPY

Bid Vendor(s) Contract Contract
# Name Name/Address Award Period Note| Code
Falcon Pest
2019 Pest Control Services, LLC o1
- . $3,920.00 - 9
051 Services 38 Everglade Ave : 8/31/19
Warwick, RI 02886
Cardi Corp.
400 Lincoln Ave.
2019 Winter - Warwick, RT 02888 7/1/18
- Sand G. Lopes $40,000.00 -
053 Construction, Inc. 6/39/19
490 Winthrop St.
Taunton, MA 02780
2019 | Fertilizer, Liquid Weed Si‘eo’f;ui;”’l;‘l’cape 8/27/18
056 C(?ngisi—%e 1305 East 36" st | 1200000 8126/19
Cleveland, OH 44114
. . Murphy
Repairs of Existing .
2019 Plymovent Vehicle Sp ecza.lty, Inc. 2 years
- Exhaust Removal 158 Arlington St. $16,000.00 |from date of
066 Systems Boston, MA 02136 award
2019 Street Safety Marking, Inc. 1 year from
- Strinin 255 Hancock Ave. $30,000.00 date of
077 PIng Bridgeport, CT 06605 award
2019 Purchase Police Tasca Ford 1 year from
- Vehicles 250 Webster Sq. Rd. | $295,582.00 | dateof | 10
078 Berlin, CT 06037 award

Continued next page




PCR-125-18 (Sub A)

Bid Vendor(s) Contract Contract
# Name Nam_e/Address Award Period Note | Code
McGuiness Media &
2019 . Marketing
i peecycling Catondar 2346 Post Rd. $400.00
086 & Ste. 2021
Warwick, RI 02886
2019 Indiana Printing &
i Recycling Calendar Publishing Co., Inc. $29.639.70
087 Printing & Mailing 899 Water St. e
Indiana, PA 15701
2018 Fire Apparatus Coastal International | $25,000.00 56
- Repairs 17 O’Keefe Lane (inclusive of -
314B (Additional Vendor) Warwick, R1 02888 | Bid2018-314) 6
- : Linear Systems
2019 Digital Information 11/1/18 56
8403-Maple PI.
- Management Systems Rancho Cucamonga, $7,000.00 -
097 Warranty CA 91730 10/31/19 6
CALEA
2019 Re-Accreditation 10306 Easton P1. L7118 56
- : $20,000.00 - -
101 Services Ste. 320 10/31/19 6
Fairfax, VA 22030
University of RI
2019 BCI 41 Lower College Re. | ¢ (00 o o %
1 (-)8 School Kingston, RI 02881 e é
Miscellaneous
Viewpoint Government
2019 Online Solutions 6/1/18 56
- Permitting Program 320 Coﬁx}grcss St. $22,295.00 - -
109 57 FlL 5/31/19 6
Boston, MA 02210
2019 Interior Tree Planting RI Tree Council 1 year from 56
- Program & Street Tree PO Box 6144 $15,000.00 date of -
110 Initiative Providence, RI 02840 award 6
Continued next page




PCR-125-18 (Sub A) ‘ Q

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest
responsible bidder.

L.

2.

N wm kW

8.

9.

Request permission to extend PCR-110-17 from July 1, 2018 through

September 30, 2018. MPA #348.

Request permission to increase and extend PCR-98-18. Increase from $160,000.00 to
$170,000.00 and extend from July 1, 2018 through September 30, 2018. MPA #352.
Request permission to increase PCR-59-17 (Sub A) from $24,000.00 to $38,588.50.
Request permission to increase PCR-64-17 from $15,000.00 to $30,000.00.

Request permission to increase PCR-136-17 (Sub A) from $10,000.00 to $20,000.00.

Request permission to increase PCR-128-17 (Sub A) from $2,500,000.00 to $5,500,000.00.

Request permission to include the Fire Department on PCR-111-18 (Amended/Sub A) and
increase from $20,000.00 (DPW) to $33,000.00.

C & S Specialty: Items 1 and 2. Fire Tech & Safety: Item 3.

Fire: $1,920.00. DPW: $2,000.00.

10. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, THAT this Resolution is an affirmative action of the City

Council of the City toward the execution and delivery of the Lease Purchase Financing
Documents in accordance with the purposes of the laws of the State. This Resolution
constitutes the City’s declaration of official intent, pursuant to Treasury Regulation -
1.150(2), to reimburse the City for certain expenditures paid on or after the date of which is
sixty (60) days prior to the date of this Resolution, but prior to the execution and delivery
of the Lease Purchase Financing Documents. Such amounts to be reimbursed shall not
exceed $295.582.00 and shall be reimbursed not later than eighteen (1 8) months after (a)
the date on which the expenditure is paid or (b) the date the property is placed in service or
abandoned, but in no event later than three (3) years after the date the expenditure is paid.

11. Seminar: $3,200.00. Miscellaneous: $300.00.

ACTIONS TAKEN

Bid2019-048 Asphalt Concrete Hot Mixes & Cold Patch PCR-128-18 (Sub A)
Amend to remove
Narragansett Improvement

Bid2019-063 Police, Fire & Municipal Employees’ PCR-129-18 (Sub A)

Assistance Program Amend Contract Period 3
years from date of award to
2 years from date of award,
Amend Contract Award
from $43,000.00 to $28,666.66

Bid2019-065 Hydraulic Pipe Cutter PCR—130-18

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE

- -




Bid2019-066 Repairs of Existing Plymovent Vehicle Exhaust Removal Systems
e 2 bids submitted

CODE: 35-340 Fire/Service Contract

MANNER OF AWARD:  $16,000.00
2 years from date of award

RECOMMEND: Murphy Specialty, Inc.

Murphy Specialty, Inc.
158 Arlington St.
Boston, MA 02136

Air Cleaning Specialists of NE, LLC
1525 Hanover St.
Hanover, MA 02339

It;m Description Murphy Air Cleaning
1%*Year | 2" Year 1 Year | 2" Year
1 Normal Business Hourly Rate $110.00 $110.00 $120.00 $120.00
p | Weekend and Holiday $154.00 | $154.00 | $180.00 | $180.00
Hourly Rate
3 Parts Cost (% Off List Price) 11% 11% 15% 15%
Normal Business Hours 7:00 AM - 3:30 PM 6:00 AM - 3:00 PM
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(401) 468-4044

&ﬁ Marcel E. Fontenault, Jr.
RSV Acting Chief of Department Fax: (401) 468-4001

111 Veterans Memoriul Drive
HWarwick, Rhode [sland 02886

July 20,2018

Mrs. Patricia Peshka
Purchasing Agent
City of Warwick

Dear Mrs. Peshka,

The City of Warwick Fire Department has reviewed Bid 2019-066 Repairs of Existing Plymovent
Vehicle Exhaust Removal Systems. The City of Warwick received two bids. After careful review, the
Warwick Fire Department recommends the bid be awarded to Murphy Specialty, Inc of Boston, MA.
Murphy Specialty, Inc was the lowest bidder and meets all of the bid requirements.

This award will be for the period of two years from the date of the award. The previous contract expired

on 1/4/18. The total award is for $16,000.00 based upon available funds. The funds will come from the
budget code 35-340.

Sincerely,

NaralZ Fortunsests .

Marcel E. Fontenault Jr.
Acting Chief of Department

MEF:krb

Email: marcel efdfenault@warwickri.com




Bid2020-105 Landscape Architectural Services for Rocky Point Park

e 7 bids received

CODE: 60-442 Dept. of City Planning—State Grant Pass Through

MANNER OF AWARD:  $50,000.00
One year from date of award

RECOMMEND: Stantec Planning & Landscape Architecture

Traverse Landscape Architects
150 Chestnut St., 4™ Floor
Providence, RI 02903

Land Design Collaborative
c/o Elena Pascarella
200 Centerville Rd. Suite 6
Warwick, RI 02886

Ray Dunetz Landscape Architecture, Inc.
179 Green St.
Boston, Ma 02130

Stantec Planning & Landscape Architecture
260 West Exchange St., Suite 001
Providence, R 02903

Kyle Zick Landscape Architecture, Inc.
36 Bromfield St., Suite 202
Boston, MA 02108

Symmes Maini & McKee Associates
275 Promenade St., Suite 275
Providence, RI1 02908

Vanasse Hangen Brustlin, Inc.
1 Cedar St., Suite 400
Providence, RI 02903

Pricing as follows

Continued next page
-11-




RFP2020-105 Professional Landscape Architectural Services for Rocky Point Park

Land Ra Symmes Vanasse |
Description | Traverse Desien Dunth Stantec Kyle Zick | Maini & Hangen
g McKee Brustlin
Total
Proposed $63,835.00
Project Cost | $21,060.00 | $23,950.00 | $36,600.00 | $44,275.00 | $46,500.00 | $52,260.00 | (See Note
(Base ' 1)
Services)
Supplf: mental $15,000.00 | $15,000.00 | $15,000.00 { $15,000.00 | $15,000.00 | $15,000.00 | $15,000.00
Service Fee
TOtagi);OJe“ $36,060.00 | $38,950.00 | $51,600.00 | $59,275.00 | $61,500.00 | $67,260.00 | $78,835.00
Notes:

1. Total cost includes $1,000.00 for expenses

-12-
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JAN 0 6 2020

CITY OF WARWICK

JOSEPH J. SOLOMON, MAYOR

MEMORANDUM

TO: Patricia A. Peshka, Purchasing Agent

FROM: Lucas Murray, Principal Planner/ Special Projects

DATE: Monday, January 6, 2020

RE: RFP#2020-105 — Professional Landscape Architectural Services for Rocky Point Park

I hereby request the award of REP#2020-105, Professional Landscape Architectural Services for Rocky
Point Park, to Stantec Planning and Landscape Architecture, P.C. in the amount of fifty thousand dollars
and zero cents ($50,000.00) under Section 56-5 of the City of Warwick Code of Ordinances.

The City issued a Request for Proposals for Landscape Architectural Services at Rocky Point Park on
July 30, 2019. Bid documents were posted on the City’s website as well as the City of Newport’s central
purchasing site. In addition fourteen (14) design firms known for specializing in park and open space
design were provided the RFP directly. On August 14, 2019, a mandatory pre-bid meeting was held at
the project site.

Seven (7) bids were received for the project on August 28, 2019. Proposals were reviewed by a three
member panel from the City and scored based on the overall approach, background, and experience, in
addition to the proposed cost. Scores were combined and firms were ranked accordingly In addition,
several staff members from the Rhode Island Department of Environmental Management’s Division of
Planning and Development (RIDEM) reviewed the proposals and provided a list of their top three
recommendation to the City for selection.

After a thorough review of the design submittals the City, in consultation with RIDEM, determined that
Stantec Planning and Landscape Architecture, P.C. (Stantec) has extensive experience in the design of
public parks, open space, and gateways and determined they provide the best overall value for the
project.

This project cost will be funded under budget code 60-442. All City funds will be fully reimbursed to
the City by an existing $100,000 RIDEM Recreation Development Grant. The term of the contract
requested is one year from award.

PLANNING DEPARTMENT e WILLIAM DEPASQUALLE, JR. AICP, DIRECTOR
3275 POST ROAD e WARWICK, RI 02886 e 401-738-2009

-14-




RHODE ISLAND
DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT
OFFICE OF PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT

235 Promenade Street, Room 320
Providence, Rhode Island 02908

Januvary 12, 2017

Richard Crenca

City of Warwick

3275 Post Road

Warwick, RI 02886

RE: 2016 DEM Recreation Grant: Rocky Point Improvements & City Park Improvements
Dear Mr. Crenca:

Enclosed please find a copies of a fully executed grant agreements for your files. If you have any
questions, please do not hesitate to contact me at 222-2776, Ext. 7611 or lisa.mcgreavy@dem.ri.gov .

We wish you great success with your project!
Sincerely,

_Q*, W Cr‘*’a/’
Lisa McGreavy '

Senior Environmental Planner

Enclosures

Telephone 401.222.4700 | www.dem.ri.gov | Rhode Island Relay 711
-15-




RHODE ISLAND
RECREATION GRANT PROGRAM

RECREATION DEVELOPMENT GRANT AGREEMENT

RECREA IION eV e e ———

This agreement is made to be effective September 22, 2016 through and including September
22, 2018.

BETWEEN THE CITY OF Warwick
Hereinafter referred to as the "CITY"

AND THE STATE OF RHODE ISLAND, THROUGH THE DIRECTOR OF THE DEPARTMENT OF
ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT .
Hereinafter referred to as the "STATE"

WHEREAS, the CITY is the owner in fee simple of certain real. p!;opeﬁy located at Rocky
Polnt Avenue (Map P380/Lot 287) in Warwick, Rhode Island (the "Premises”);and, . .

'WHEREAS, the CITY has filed an application with the STATE (the “Application”) under
Rhode lsland Public Law 145, known as The 2014 Clean Water, Open Space and Healthy
Communities Bonds (the "Act”) to develop the Premises for public recreation purposes in
qccordance with the Rules and Regulations for the Agricultural, Recreation Acquisition and
Development, Roger Williams Park, and Roger Williams Zoo Grant Programs, adopted pursuant
to the Act (the "Rules and Regulations"), and

WHEREAS, the STATE has awarded a grant to the CITY in an amount not to exceed
$100,000 to develop the Premises for public recreation purposes, in accordance with the
Application and as delineated on Exhibit A: Project Boundary Map and specifically referred to
as Grant Number # 2016-40-14, entitled Rocky Point Park Improvements hereinafter referred to
as the “Project”, and

WHEREAS, failure to meet the conditions: (i) set forth herein, (ii) of the Act, and (jii) of the
Rules and Regulations can result in withdrawal of funds allocated to the Grant.

_ WITNESSETH: In consideration of the Premises, the covenants contained in this
Agreement and for other good and valuable consideration the receipt and sufficiency of which are
hereby acknowledged; the CITY and the STATE hereby covenant and agree as follows:

1. The CITY agrees:
(@) To attend a mandatory grant administration workshop to be coordinated by the STATE.

(b)  To provide a minimum 20% match of total eligible Project expenses.
(¢) Todevelop the Premises as set forth in the Application, to complete items outiined in Exhibit

RIDEM 10/2016- ’ Page 1 of §,

-16-




B: Scope of Work, and to hold and maintain the same in accordance with the Rules and
Regulations.

(d) To complete the Project on or before September 22, 2018.

(e) To submit all expenses together with required documentation related to the Project
including a Final Project Report and photos, within 80 days of the date of Project
completion. Note that up to 2 partial payments are allowed for activities outlined in this
contract.

(H  Expenses submitted for reimbursement must be for work performed within the grant period
of September 22, 2016 through September 22, 2018.

(@) To have an audit upon request of the STATE, at the expense of the CITY, by a certified
public accountant in all instances where In-kind services or materials are utilized.

(h) Tograntthe right to inspect the Premises to the Department of Environmental Management
for compliance under this agreement.

- ()  To obtain all required local and state permits. prior to commencement of the Project.

()  To comply with the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) and utilize the universal design
standards.

(k)  To provide suitable permanent public acknowledgment of financial assistance by State
Bond Funds at the Project site.

()  To perpetually use the Premises only for public recreation purposes as more clearly set
forth In the Rules and Regulations and not divert the Premises to any other use or dispose
of the Premises.

(m) In the event the CITY shall fail to maintain or use the Premises in accordance with this
Agreement, the Act, and the Rules and Regulations, the STATE shall have the right to
enforce this Agreement.

(n) Any and all proposed amendments to the Scope of Work and to this agreement must be
requested in writing by the CITY and approved by the STATE. )

2. The STATE agrees to:
(a) Reimburse the CITY, 80% of the eligible expenses for the development of the Project not
to exceed $100,000.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have hereunto set their hands and seals the day and year
first above written.

WITNESS: CITY OF WARWICK

WL G

Scott AVed Slan, man oy~

GNTAL MANAGEMENT

RIDEM 1012016 , Page 2 of §
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STATE OF RHODE ISLAND, COUNTY OF KENT

In WARWICK in said County and State, on the 20 day of B&C—W\QQ 221 b pefore me
personally appeared & v Ll , of the CITY OF WARWICK,
RHODE ISLAND to me known and known by me to be the party executing the foregoing
Instrument for and on behalf of the CITY OF WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND and he/she
acknowledged said instrument by him/her executed to be his/her free act and deed, his/her free
act and deed in his/her capacity as aforesaid, and the free act and deed of the CITY OF
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND.

Notary Public « % ~
My Commissidn Expires: ¢ 2 ,7

}ﬁcuv‘ V. \\\U‘S‘,)q ‘3 ¢

(z‘ G

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND, COUNTY OF PROVIDENCE R

[n Providencs, ip sald County and State, on the (O—‘day o[,\a N’(W M l]efore me

personally appeared Janet Colt, the Director of the STATE OEBHODE ISLAND, DEPARTMENT
OF ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT, to me known and known by me to be the party executing
the foregoing instrument for and on behalf of the STATE OF RHODE ISLAND, DEPARTMENT
OF ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT and she acknowledged said instrument by her executed
to be her free act and deed, her free act and deed in her capacity as aforesaid, and the free act
and deed of the STATE OF RHODE ISLAND, DEPARTMENT. OF EINI;,%ONMENTAL
MANAGEMENT, -~ it

Notary Public-
My Commissign

/,// VN}\V‘S \\‘\\\

”Wumm““

RIDEM 10/2016 Page 3 of 6
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EXHIBIT A: PROJECT BOUNDARY MAP :

Rocky Point Park Improvements ,
Rocky Point Avenue, Warwick, R
" (Map P380/Lot 287 ‘

1 o v, . 4 - o o o . . ) .A - ) . - . . - N ) R - ] - K ’” 2
9 M0 €00 1,200Feat 2016 R Racrsatioh Devsiopmeht Grant Appication ?
S S of Warwick <Rocky Pdint Park improvements
Chr o ek o <
RIDEM 10/2016 Page4 of 5
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EXHIBIT B: SCOPE OF WORK

Rocky Point Park Improvements
Rocky Point Avenue, Warwick, RI
(Map P380/Lot 287

ITEM# | PROPOSED WORK DESCRIPTON:
1 Picnic tables and benches
2 Open alr shelter structure to be located on City property in vicinity of the pool
3 Interpretive signage (pool, arch, dining hall, ballfield, etc.) to be located at strategic locations
throughout the park
4 Design, engineering, and construction (as funds allow) of a new entrance gate
RIDEM 10/2016 Page5of 5

-20-




RHODE ISLAND
RECREATION GRANT PROGRAM

RECREATION DEVELOPMENT GRANT AGREEMENT

This agreement is made to be effective September 22, 2016 through and including September
22, 2018.

BETWEEN THE CITY OF Warwick
Hereinafter referred to as the "CITY"

AND THE STATE OF RHODE ISLAND, THROUGH THE DIRECTOR OF THE DEPARTMENT OF
ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT :
Hereinafter referred to as the "STATE"

WHEREAS, the CITY is the owner in fee simple of certain real property located at Asylum
Road (Map P372/Lot 1) in Warwick, Rhode Island (the "Premises"), and

WHEREAS, the CITY has filed an application with the STATE (the “Application”) under
Rhode Island Public Law 145, known as The 2014 Clean Water, Open Space and Healthy
Communities Bonds (the "Act") to develop the Premises for public recreation purposes in
accordance with the Rules and Regulations for the Agriculfural, Recreation Acquisition and
Development, Roger Williams Park, and Roger Williams Zoo Grant Programs, adopted pursuant
to the Act (the "Rules and Regulations"), and

WHEREAS, the STATE has awarded a grant to the CITY in an amount not to exceed
$350,000 to develop the Premises for public recreation purposes, in accordance with the
Application and as delineated on Exhibit A: Project Boundary Map and specifically referred fo
as Grant Number # 2016-70-07, entitled City Park Improvements hereinafter referred to as the
“Project”, and i

WHEREAS, failure to meet the conditions: (i) set forth herein, (ii) of the Act, and (iii) of the
Rules and Regulations can result in withdrawal of funds allocated to the Grant.

WITNESSETH: In consideration of the Premises, the covenants contained in this
Agreement and for other good and valuable consideration the receipt and sufficiency of which are
hereby acknowledged, the CITY and the STATE hereby covenant and agree as follows:

1. The CITY agrees:
(a) To attend a mandatory grant administration workshop to be coordinated by the STATE.

(b) To provide a minimum 20% match of total eligible Project expenses.
() Todevelop the Premises as set forth in the Application, to complete items outlined in Exhibit

RIDEM 10/2016 Page 1 of 5
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B: Scope of Work, and to hold and maintain the same in accordance with the Rules and
Regulations.

(d) To complete the Project on or before September 22, 2018. :

(e) To submit all expenses together with required documentation related to the Project
including a Final Project Report and photos, within 90 days of the date of Project
completion. Note that up to 4 partial payments are allowed for activities outlined in this
contract.

()  Expenses submitted for reimbursement must be for work performed within the grant period
of September 22, 2016 through September 22, 2018.

(@) To have an audit upon request of the STATE, at the expense of the CITY, by a certified
public accountant in all instances where in-kind services or materials are utilized.

(h)  Tograntthe right to inspect the Premises to the Department of Environmental Management
for compliance under this agreement.

()  To obtain all required local and state permits prior to commencement of the Project.

() - To comply with the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) and utilize the universal design
standards.

(k)  To provide suitable permanent public acknowledgment of financial assistance by State
Bond Funds at the Project site. )

()  To perpetually use the Premises only for public recreation purposes as more clearly set
forth in the Rules and Regulations and not divert the Premises to any other use or dispose
of the Premises.

(m) In the event the CITY shall fail to maintain or use the Premises in accordance with this
Agreement, the Act, and the Rules and Regulations, the STATE shall have the right to
enforce this Agreement.

(n) Any and all proposed amendments to the Scope of Work and to this agreement must be
requested in writing by the CITY and approved by the STATE.

2,  The STATE agrees to:
(@ Reimburse the CITY, 80% of the eligible expenses for the development of the Project not
to exceed $350,000.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have hereunto set their hands and seals the day and year
first above written.

WITNESS: CITY OF WARWICK
' A .
&,&Ma&m:tﬁ O
. Scott Avediscan, pal e

AL MANAGEMENT

.Janet Coit, Director

RIDEM 10/2016 Page2of 5
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STATE OF RHODE ISLAND, COUNTY OF KENT

In WARWICK in said County and State, on the '3“" day of 3&*%», , 2011 before me
personally appeared Se v Ave Alsiea _of the CITY OF WARWICK,
RHODE ISLAND to me known and known by m to be the party executing the foregoing
instrument for and on behalf of the CITY OF WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND and he/she
acknowledged said instrument by him/her executed to be his/her free act and deed, his/her free
act and deed in his/her capacity as aforesaid, and the free act and deed of th CITY OF

WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND.
S

Notary Public (4. ti.q A7 ?Mx. :
My Commission Explres ,/7_, /,_gu

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND, COUNTY OF PROVIDENCE

' MW M ’ Qefore me

In Providence, in said County and State, on the Ia’ dayof .~
personally appeared Janet Coit, the Director of the STATE QF{RIAODE ISLAND, DEPARTMENT
OF ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT, to me known and knowfi by me to be the party executing
the foregoing instrument for and on behalf of the STATE OF RHODE ISLAND, DEPARTMENT
OF ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT and she acknowledged said instrument by her executed
to be her free act and deed, her free act and deed in her capacity as aforesaid, and the free act
and deed of the STATE OF RHODE ISLAND, DEPARTME yF OF ENVIRONMENTAL

MANAGEMENT. C fanntisig,
[ S ad38 304X W /i

- g . K 0'-.-

=Xpir e,

Notary Public 2
My Commiss; 52
‘ % B =
™ TS
ON ‘?"4 C’:)' §

////// N/\V \ -
GOTTION,
RIDEM 10/2016 Page 3 of 5
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EXHIBIT A: PROJECT BOUNDARY MAP

City Park Improvements
Asylum Road, Warwick, Rl
(Map P372/Lot 1)

SODFoet Cay of Wirwick - Oty Pick Inpiovements
RIDEM 1072016
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EXHIBIT B: SCOPE OF WORK

City Park Improvements
Asylum Road, Warwick, RI
(Map P372/Lot 1)

ITEM #

PROPOSED WORK DESCRIPTON:

Installation of solar powered composting restrooms (3)

30' x 44' Picnic Shelters (2)

PN

Softball dugout shelters (8)

Solar powered trash compacting bins (4)

RIDEM 10/2016
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STATE OF RHODE ISLAND
DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT

DIVISION OF PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT
235 Promenade Street, 3" Floor
Providence, Rhode Island 02908

November 30, 2018

Joseph J. Solomon, Mayor

City of Warwick

3275 Post Road

Warwick, Rl 02886

RE: City Park improvements — DEM Recreation Grant Agreement Amendment 2016-70-07 #1

Dear Mayor Solomon:

Enclosed please find a signed original copy of Grant Agreement Amendment #1 for City Park
Improvements extending the grant period to December 31, 2019.

If you have any questions, please contact me at 222-2776 Extension 7611 or |isa.mcgreavy@dem.r.gov
Best of luck on this great project!

Sincerely,
IM)“, o ()y., 4,\ —
Lisa McGreavy '

Sr. Environmental Planner

ec: Daniel Geagan, Principal Planner
Enclosures

Telephone 401.222.2776 | www.dem.ri.gov | Rhode Island Relay 711
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RHODE ISLAND RECREATION GRANTS PROGRAM

AMENDMENT TO THE RECREATION GRANT AGREEMENT
Amendment No. 1

This amendment to the Recreation Grant Agreement for Project # 2016-70-07 entitled,

CITY PARK IMPROVEMENTS

is hereby made and agreed upon by the Rhode Island Department of Environmental
Management, acting through the Director and by the
CITY OF WARWICK
pursuant to the Rules and Regulations for the
Open Space Recreational Bonds 1987, 1989, 2000, and 2004 as amended including the Rules
and Regulations for the Agricultural, Recreation Acquisition and Development, Roger
Williams Park, and Roger Williams Zoo Grant Programs dated September 2015.

The CITY OF WARWICK

and the State of Rhode Island Department of Environmental Management in mutual
consideration of the promises herein and in the Recreation Grant Agreement of which this
is an amendment, do promise as follows:

TO AMEND THE SCOPE OF WORK BY REMOVING THE INSTALLATION OF FOUR (4) SOLAR
POWERED TRASH COMPACTING BINS AND TO EXTEND THE GRANT PERIOD TO

DECEMBER 31, 2019

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND,

CITY OF WARWIC

By (Sign): 'f
Janet Coit, Director Print Name tle:
‘ / LS
Date: /f zjj )f Date: _} ! M \I )
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STATE OF RHODE ISLAND
DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT

DIVISION OF PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT
235 Promenade Street, 3" Floor
Providence, Rhode Island 02908

November 30, 2018

Joseph J. Solomon, Mayor

City of Warwick

3275 Post Road

Warwick, Rl 02886

RE: Rocky Point Park Improvements ~ DEM Recreation Grant Agreement Amendment 2016-40-14 #1

Dear Mayor Solomon:

Enclosed please find a signed original copy of Grant Agreement Amendment #1 for Rocky Point Park
Improvements extending the grant period to December 31, 2019.

If you have any questions, please contact me at 222-2776 Extension 7611 or lisa.mcgreavy@dem.ri.gov
Best of luck on this great project!

Sincerely,

{

,-f""f‘ (/
LY /w"' ‘\_\f\_/) < '; Fawr ‘Bm

Lisa McGreavy
Sr. Environmental Planner

ec: Daniel Geagan, Principal Planner
Enclosures

Telephone 401.222.2776 | www.dem.ri.gov | Rhode Island Relay 711
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RHODE ISLAND RECREATION GRANTS PROGRAM

AMENDMENT TO THE RECREATION GRANT AGREEMENT
Amendment No. 1

This amendment to the Recreation Grant Agreement for Project # 2016-40-14 entitled,

ROCKY POINT IMPROVEMENTS

is hereby made and agreed upon by the Rhode Island Department of Environmental
Management, acting through the Director and by the
CITY OF WARWICK
pursuant to the Rules and Regulations for the
Open Space Recreational Bonds 1987, 1989, 2000, and 2004 as amended including the Rules
and Regulations for the Agricultural, Recreation Acquisition and Development, Roger
Williams Park, and Roger Williams Zoo Grant Programs dated September 2015.

The CITY OF WARWICK

and the State of Rhode Island Department of Environmental Management in mutual
consideration of the promises herein and in the Recreation Grant Agreement of which this
is an amendment, do promise as follows:

TO EXTEND THE GRANT PERIOD TO DECEMBER 31, 2019

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND,
{T OF ENVIRONMENTAL CITY OF WARWICK

By (Sign):

. g

Janet Coit, Director | Print Name g/Title: !

Joseph T. Splomon, May s

Date: [l/i/‘i/lé/ V Date: llll‘-l-l\%
I/ '
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Bid2020-210 Mobile Self-Contained Food Concessions

e 3 bids received

REVENUE
CODE: 100-03632 General Fund/Miscellaneous Income
MANNER OF AWARD:  $18,300.00
April 1, 2020 — March 31, 2021 ;
RECOMMEND: See Below
New England Lemonade City Park, Oakland Beach, Confreda Sports Complex, Conimicut

Point, Mickey Stevens Sports Complex, & Rocky Point Park
($16,100.00)

Poppy’s Kettle Corn & Waffles Confreda Sports Complex, Oakland Beach, & Mickey Stevens
Sports Complex ($2,200.00)

Rhode Island Kona LI.C Kona Ice of Warwick/EG
4 Cider Lane
Greenville, RT 02828

Poppys Kettle Corn & Waffles
72 Sayles Ave.
Warwick, RI 02889

New England Frozen Lemonade
734 Oakland Beach Ave.
Warwick, RI 92886

Pricing as follows

Continued next page
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Bid2020-210 Mobile Self-Contained Food Concessions at Various City Locations

Rhode Island Kona LLC Poppys Kettle New England
LOCATION # | LOCATION Kona Ice of Warwick/EG | Corn & Waffles | Frozen Lemonade

1 City Park $1,000.00 No Bid $3,250.00

2 Oakland $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $7,750.00
Beach

3 Conimicut No Bid No Bid $750.00
Point
Confreda

4 Sports $1,000.00 $350.00 $2,750.00
Complex
Mickey

5 Stevens No Bid $350.00 $600.00
Sports
Complex

6 Rocky Point No Bid No Bid $1,000.00
Park

-31-
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JAN 07 2020

JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
MAYOR

James E. Scott
DIRECTOR OF PARKS &
RECREATION

DEPARTMENT OF PARKS AND RECREATION
885 SANDY LANE @ WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02889
TEL (401) 921-9623 ® FAX (401) 732-5208

To: Pat Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: James Scott, Director of Parks and Recreation@

Date: 6 January 2020

Re: Bid 2020-210 Mobile Self-Contained Food Concessions at Various City Locations

We have reviewed the three bidders’ submissions (two bids for City Park, three bids for Confreda
Sports Comples, one bid for Conimicut Point, two bids for Mickey Stevens, three bids for Oakland

Beach and one bid for Rocky Point) and recommend award as follows:

New England Lemonade — City Park, Oakland Beach, Confreda Sports Complex, Conimicut Point,
Mickey Stevens Sports Complex, Oakland Beach and Rocky Point ($16,100.00)

Poppys Kettle Corn — Confreda Sports Complex, Mickey Stevens Sports Complex and Oakland
Beach ($2,200)

This generates $18,300.00 in revenue for a one-year period. Please note that vendors cannot sell like
products at the same location. Consequently, Kona Ice was not awarded the bids at Confreda, City
Park or Oakland Beach because their signature product, Kona Ice is similar to the frozen lemonade
that the highest responsive bidder, New England Lemonade serves.

The current bid expires March 31, 2020. The new contract period will run from April 1, 2020 to March
31, 2021.
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Bid2020-239 Mobile Thermal Printers

e 4 bids received

CODE:

MANNER OF AWARD:

RECOMMEND:

30-231 Police Department—Supplies/Computer

$6,500.00
March 27, 2020 — March 26, 2021

Whalley Computer Associates

Continued next page

Howard Technology Solutions
P.O Box 1590
Laurel, MS 39441

Island Tech Services
51 Winthrop Street
Rehoboth, MA 02769

Whalley Computer Associates
1 Whalley Way
Southwick, MA 01077

Scan Technology, Inc.
2114 SW 75" Terrace
Gainesville, FL 32607

Pricing as follows

-34-
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CITY OF WARWICK

Colonel Rick J. Rathbun Joseph J. Solomon

Chief of Police Mayor
IANO7 000
Police Department
99 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617
Telephone: (401) 468-4200
January 3, 2020
Ms. Patricia Peshka ;
Purchasing Agent
Warwick City Hall
3275 Post Road

Warwick, RI 02886

Re: Bid # 2020-239
E-Citation Mobile Printing Equipment
Funding Source: 30-240

Dear Ms. Peshka:

The department has gone out to bid for Bid # 2020-239 and received (4) four responses. The following companies
submitted bids:

Scan Technologies, 2114 SW 75% Terrace, Gainesville, FL 32607

Whalley Computer Associates, Inc. 1 Whalley Way, Southwick, MA 01077
Howard Technology Solutions, P.O. Box 1590, Laurel MS, 39441

Island Tech Services, 51 Winthrop St., Rehoboth, MA 02769

The department is recommending that a (1) one year contract be awarded to the overall lowest qualified bidder; Whalley
Computer Associates Inc. This is for the purchase of E-Citation Mobile Printing Equipment to be bought on an as
needed basis as older original equipment needs to be replaced. The E-Citation program is mandated by the State of Rhode
Island. The project involves maintaining printing equipment and associated software in each of the active marked police
cars of the department and allows tickets to be filled out on the cruisers laptops, the tickets printed in the car, and all
information automatically sent electronically to the state RITT Court.

The current contract expires 03/26/20.

The department is requesting the ability to expend funds not exceeding $6,500 during a 1 year contract from 03/27/20-
03/26/21. A

Funding for this purchase if approved is from the Police Department Operating Budget Code 30-231, Supplies-
Computers.

Pleas féel free to contact me if you have any questions.

QC«/ M,

inistrative Bureau Commander
Warwick Police Department
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Bid2020-240 Various Portable Radio Batteries

e 12 bids received

CODE: 30-271 Police Department—Parts/Communication

MANNER OF AWARD: $10,000.00
March 22, 2020 — March 21, 2022

RECOMMEND: See Below

Visions of Video Items: 1-4

Global Technology Systems Items: 5-8

Holzberg Communications, Inc. PO Box 322 Totowa, NJ 07511
Utility Communications, Inc. 920 Sherman Avenue Hamden, CT 06514

Interstate All Battery Center of Auburn 139 Washington Street

Global Technology Systems (GTS) 550 Cochituate Road
SAT Radio Communications LTD 1019 E Euclid Avenue
d/b/a Industrial Communications

Impact Power Technologies LLC 145 Wood Rd

Cyber Communications 90 Colorado Avenue
Batteries Plus LLC 1325 Walnut Ridge Drive
Visions of Video 9030 Balboa Blvd.

OSI Batteries 6024 Cullligan Way
Continental Wireless, Inc. 10455 Vista Park Rd.
Haight Bey & Associates, LLC 1972 W. 2550 S. Ste. A

Pricing as follows

Continued next page
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Auburn, MA 01510
Framingham, MA 01701

San Antonio, TX 78212

Braintree, MA 02184
Warwick, RI 02888
Hartland, WI 53029
Northridge, CA 91325
Minnetonka, MN 55345
Dallas, TX 75238

West Haven, UT 84401
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ATTACHMENT 1 CYBER COMMUNICATIONS

A B C D E
1 Warwick Battery Bid Attachment A
2 Radio Battery PN
3 Battery Description maH | Bid Price
4 APX4000 BP4448L| - 7.2V Li-lon IP67 with clip 2900 |$ 69.86
5 BP4409LIIC 7.2V Li-on IP67 smart with clip 2500 |$ 79.10
6
7 APX8000 BP7034PL 9.0V Li-Mn02 4500 |$ 5348
8 PM4486LIPIC | 7.4V LiPo smart IP68 PolyMax HPC 3400 |$115.36
9 PM4487LIPIC 7.4V LiPo smart PolyMax HPC 4900 |$131.46
10
11 HT1000 BP7143-1 7.5V NiCd with clip 1200 |$ 34.86
12 BP7144-1 7.5V NiCd with clip 1500 |$ 37.66
13 BP7144MHXT 7.5V NIMH with clip 2000 |S 43.96
14 BP7144MHXT 7.5V NiMH with clip 2700 |$ 55.86
15
16 XTS2500 BP9815-1 7.5V NiCd with clip 1200 | S 50.54
17 ‘ BP9858MH 7.5V NiMH with clip 2000 |$ 48.44
18 BP9858MHIC 7.5V NiMH with clip smart 2500 ‘| $ 71.96
19 BP9858MHXT 7.5V NiMH with clip 2700 |$ 59.08
20 LES857MHIS 7.5V NiMH IS with clip 2500 |$ 92.26
21 PM9858LIP 7.4V LiPo PolyMax HPC with clip 4100 |$ 97.16
22 PMB858LIPIC | 7.4V ILiPo PolyMax HPC smart w/clip| 4100 | $101.50
23 ' A
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39 X
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CITY OF WARWICK

Colonel Rick J. Rathbun B Joseph J. Solomon
Chief of Police Mayor
AN U7 2020

Police Department
99 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617
Telephone: (401) 468-4200

January 2, 2020

Mrs. Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent
Warwick City Hall

3275 Post Road

Warwick, Rl 02886

Re: Bid # 2020-240 Portable Radio Batteries/Police

Dear Mrs. Peshka,

The Police Department has reviewed the twelve bids submitted for bid # 2020-240, Various Portable Radio Batteries.
Bids were received from the following companies:

Continental Wireless Inc, 10455 Vista Park Road, Dallas, Texas, 75238

Holzberg Communications Inc, PO Box 322, Totowa NJ, 07511

Batteries Plus LLC, 1325 Walnut Ridge Dr., Hartland, W1 53029

Cyber Communications, 90 Colorado Avenue, Warwick, Rl 02888

Interstate All Battery Center-of Auburn, 139 Washington St., Auburn, MA 01510
Utility Communications, Inc., 920 Sherman Avenue, Hamden CT 06514

Impact Power Technologies, LLC, 145 Wood Rd., Braintree MA 02184 A
SAT Radio Communications LTD, dba Industrial Communications, 1019 E. Euclid Ave.,
San Antonio, TX 78212 _

9. Global Technology Systems (GTS), 550 Cochituate, Rd., Framingham, MA 01701
10. Visions of Video; 9030 Balboa Blvd., Northridge CA 91325

11. Haight Bey & Associates, LLC, 1972 W. 2550 S. Ste. A, West Haven, UT 84401
12. OSI Batteries, 6024 Culligan Way, Minnetonka, MN 55345

ONODOA LN

We recommend awarding Items 1-4 Motorola Battery Products, to the overall lowest bidder, Visions of Video. It should be
noted that Interstate All Battery Center of Auburn bid on compatible batteries for items 1-4, —Not Motorola products as
specified. ,

We further recommend awarding item 5-8, Motorola Compatible Lithium Batteries to Global Technology Systems (GTS).
GTS was able to provide substantially increased capacity on items 6 and 8, for modest additional cost. GTS was also the
lowest overall bid on item 7 for mAH capacity of 2500.

The current contract expires on 03/21/20.

Funding for this award, if approved, would be from the Police Department Operating Budget, Budget Code # 30-271, for a

total not to exceed $10,000.00 during a two year contract for 03/22/20 — 03/21/22. Please feel free to contact me if you
have any questions.

Sincerely, [(Z}\ L,L;(i;\( [& ﬁ(/’(d

Major L{’)ri ichailides
Administrative Bureau Commander
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Bid2020-256 Cement Concrete Mixes & Controlled Low Strength Materials
(CLSM) Flowable Fill

e 3 bids received

CODE: 63-231 Highway—Gravel/Stone

MANNER OF AWARD:  $8,000.00
April 2,2020 — April 1, 2021

RECOMMEND: Consolidated Concrete Corp.

Cardi Materials, LLC
400 Lincoln Ave
Warwick, RI 02888

Rhode Island Ready Mix, LLC
35 Stilson Road
Richmond, RI 02898

Consolidated Concrete Corp.
835 Taunton Ave
East Providence, RI 02914

Pricing as follows

Continued next page
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Cement Concrete Mixes & Controlled Low Strength Materials (CLSM) Flowable Fill

Bid Results
Rhode
Cardi Island Consolidated
Description Materials, Ready Mix, Concrete
Item LLC LLC Corp.
Cost per Cost per Cost per
cubic yard cubic yard cubic yard
Class A cement concrete for general use, 3/4”
1 | max. size aggregate, (3,000 psi) with air
entrainment $120.00 $108.00 $106.00
Class XX cement concrete for sidewalks, 3/4”
2 | max size aggregate, (4000 psi) with air
entrainment $130.00 $115.00 $111.00
Class HP cement concrete for reinforced slab
3 | sections, 3/4” max size aggregate, (5,000 psi)
with air entrainment $165.00 $127.00 $139.00
Class A cement concrete for general use, 3/8”
4 | max. size aggregate, (3,000 psi) with air
entrainment $123.00 $110.00 $108.00
Class XX cement concrete for sidewalks, (pea
5 | stone) 3/8” max size aggregate, (4000 psi)
with air entrainment $133.00 $120.00 $113.00
Class HP (5,000 psi) cement concrete for
6 | reinforced slab sections, 3/8” max size
aggregate with air entrainment $170.00 $133.00 $138.00
7 Additional cost for providing re-enforced fiber
to items 3 and 6 $10.00 $9.00 $8.00
CLSM Flowable Fill concrete,
8 | EXCAVATABLE Class I FLOWABLE as per
RIDOT Spec, Edition of 2016, Section 603 $85.00 $78.00 $68.00
CLSM Flowable Fill concrete,
9 | EXCAVATABLE Class II FLOWABLE as
per RIDOT Spec, Edition of 2016, Section 603 $85.00 $80.00 $72.00

Continued next page
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Cement Concrete Mixes & Controlled Low Strength Materials (CLSM) Flowable Fill

Any fees requested by the awarded vendor will not be honored unless they appear on the bid form.

Bid Results (continued)

List any prospective additional costs (delivery, chemical additives, etc.):

Cardi Materials, LLC

Item Cost per Measurement

Winter Conditions $6.00 CY

Non-Chloride Accelerator Per 1% | $6.00 CY

Min Load Fee 4CY or Less $200.00 LD

Min Load Fee 4.5CY to 7.5CY $125.00 LD

Rhode Island Ready Mix, LLC
Item Cost per Measurement
Winter Heat $5.50/CY Cubic Yard
Wait time after 1 hour $1.00/min Per minute
Min load charge 1-2 yards $250.00 Per Load
Min load charge 3-5 yards $250.00 Per Load
Non-chloride per % $5.00/CY Cubic Yard
Retarder per % $3.50/CY Cubic Yard
Fiber mesh $8.00/CY Cubic Yard
Plasticizer (mid-range) $5.00/CY Cubic Yard
Plasticizer (high-range) $6.00/CY Cubic Yard
Consolidated Concrete Corp.
Item Cost per Measurement

Delivery charge under 6 yards | $150.00 Per load
Heat $6.00 Per yard
Retarder $4.00 Per yard
Accelerator $5.00 Per yard
Waiting time after 1 hour $125.00 Per hour
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CITY OF WARWICK -
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
925 SANDY LANE
WARWICK, Rl 02889
TEL. 401-738-2003
FAX 401-732-5208

To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent
From: Mathew Solitro, Public Works Director @b

Date: January 2, 2020

WO 3 20

JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
MAYOR

MATHEW J. SOLITRO
DIRECTOR

Subj: Bid2020-256 Cement Concrete Mixes & Controlled Low Strength Materials (CLSM)

"Flowable Fill"

We have reviewed the three bids submitted and recommend award to Consolidated Concrete
Corporation as the lowest overall responsible bidder for the purchase of concrete products. The current
bid expires April 1, 2020. The new contract period will be April 2, 2020 to April 1, 2021. The

recommended cap is $8,000.00 for the contract period.

(Code 63-231 - $8,000)
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Bid2020-261 Radiator Manufacture and/or Repair

e 1 bid received

CODE:

MANNER OF AWARD:

RECOMMEND:

65-314 Automotive-Equipment Repair

$5,000.00
March 5, 2020 — March 4, 2021

Brooklyn General Repair Inc. dba BGR Radiator

Brooklyn General Repair Inc.
dba BGR Radiator
25 center parkway
Plainfield, CT 06374

Hourly Rate $ 105.00
Percentage Over Vendor Cost 29 %
Warranty on parts and/or labor 1 year new parts

Continued next page
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Brooklyn General Repair Inc. dba BGR Radiator

SAMPLING SHEET
Part No. Description Vendor Percentage Net Price
Cost
8096FD RADIATOR $592.14 29% $834.00
8127FD RADIATOR $592.14 29% $834.00
8122FD RADIATOR $592.14 29% $834.00
8269FL RADIATOR $856.97 29% $1207.00
8067FL RADIATOR $666.89 29% $939.00
8081FL RADIATOR $633.32 29% $892.00
8090IN RADIATOR $540.31 29% $761.00
8142IN RADIATOR $564.45 29% $795.00
8046PB RADIATOR $592.14 29% $834.00
19001FD CHARGE AIR COOLER
$674.50 29% $950.00
18105FL CHARGE AIR COOLER
$493.45 29% $695.00
17310MK CHARGE AIR COOLER
$337.25 29% $475.00
17315MK CHARGE AIR COOLER
$674.50 29% $950.00
16415IN CHARGE AIR COOLER
$461.50 29% $650.00
16417IN CHARGE AIR COOLER
$656.75 29% $925.00
17702PB CHARGE AIR COOLER
$514.75 29% $725.00
8104VV RADIATOR $614.86 29% $866.00
6003VV RADIATOR $457.95 29% $645.00
8064FD RADIATOR $592.14 29% $834.00
8163FD RADIATOR $592.14 29% $834.00

Please note: This above list represents only a sampling of the most commonly used parts
for the purposed of bid award and is not indicative of all parts that may be purchased.
Percentage above cost for parts must be held firm for the length of the contract. Equal
products are allowed, if indicated on bid submission. A separate page can be used, if
necessary.
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CITY OF WARWICK
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
925 SANDY LANE
WARWICK, RI 02889
TEL. 401-738-2003
FAX 401-732-5208

To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent
From: Mathew Solitro, Public Works Director ¥
Date: January 2, 2020

Subj: Bid2020-261 Radiator Manufacture and/or Repairs

JAN 0 3 2020

JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
MAYOR

MATHEW J. SOLITRO
DIRECTOR

We have reviewed the only bid submitted for the above and recommend award to BGR Radiator Inc. for

the repair and manufacture of vehicle radiators. The current bid expires on March 4, 2020. The new
contract period will be March 5, 2020 to March 4, 2021. The recommended cap is $5,000.00 for a one-
year period. Please note that this is the second advertisement of this bid and the only response received.

(Code 65-314 - $5,000)
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