#### STATE OF RHODE ISLAND

## RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

MEETING DATE:	
NO:	
APPROVED:	MAYOR
DATE:	

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following bid(s):

Bid #	Name	Vendor(s) Name/Address	Contract Award	Contract Period	Note	Code
2024 - 222	Purchase 2022 Ford Interceptor Utility Hybrid AWD	McGovern Municipal Headquarters 1200 Worcester Road Framingham, MA 01702	\$54,819.35			56
2024 - 179	Motorola Two-Way Radio Accessories, Replacement Parts, and Vehicle Mounting Hardware	SAT Radio Communications Ltd. Dba Industrial Communications 1019 E Euclid Ave. San Antonio, TX 78212	\$25,000.00	11/9/2023 - 11/8/2024		

#### PCR-105-23

Bid #	Name	Vendor(s) Name/Address	Contract Award	Contract Period	Note	Code
2024 - 176	Police Motorcycle Repairs	Russ' Ocean State Harley-Davidson 35 Albany Road Warwick, RI 02888	\$10,000.00	12/13/2023 - 12/12/2024		
2024 - 210	UCMR 5 Testing	Alpha Analytical 320 Forbes Blvd. Mansfield, MA 02048	\$10,000.00	Two Years from Date of Award		56 - 6
2024 - 175	Police Vehicle Window Tinting	All Mobile Towing & Recovery LLC PO Box 14544 East Providence, RI 02914	\$5,000.00	11/18/2023 - 11/17/2024		
<del></del>	-	<i>027</i> 1-1				

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder.

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE

# TABLE OF CONTENTS

# **CITY COUNCIL MEETING OCTOBER 2, 2023**

<u>Item#</u>	<u>BID #</u>	DESCRIPTION	<b>PAGE</b>
1	2024-222	Police Purchase 2022 Ford Interceptor Utility Hybrid AWD (Sec. 56-6)  Dated: September 13, 2023 Requested Amount: \$54,819.35 (510-0400)	1-4
2	2024-179	Police Motorola Two-Way Radio Accessories, Replacement Parts, and Vehicle Mounting Hardware  Dated: September 14, 2023 Requested Amount: \$25,000.00  (30-271)	5-10
3	2024-176	Police Police Motorcycle Repairs Dated: September 13, 2023 Requested Amount: \$10,000.00 (76-358, 30-330)	11-13
4	2024-210	Water UCMR5 Water Testing (Sec. 56-6)  Dated: September 12, 2023 Requested Amount: \$10,000.00 (84-799)	14-16
5	2024-175	Police Vehicle Window Tinting Dated: September 13, 2023 Requested Amount: \$5,000.00 (30-330)	17-19



# SECTION 56-6

Bid2024-222 Purchase 2022 Ford Interceptor Utility Hybrid AWD

McGovern Municipal Headquarters 1200 Worcester Road Framingham, MA 01702

Contract Award: <u>\$54,819.35</u>

Contract Period: One Time Purchase

Colonel Bradford Connor Chief of Police



Frank J. Picozzi Mayor

Police Department 99 Veterans Memorial Drive Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617 Telephone: (401) 468-4200

September 13, 2023

Ms. Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent Warwick City Hall 3275 Post Road Warwick, RI 02886

Re: Request for Purchase Authorization - 2022 Ford Interceptor Utility Hybrid AWD

City Ordinance 56-6 Exception to Bid

Funding Source: ARPA Capital Outlay - budget code 510 0400

Dear Ms. Gomez,

The police department is seeking a 56-6 exception to bid for the purchase of one (1) 2022 Ford Interceptor Utility Hybrid AWD vehicle. This vehicle will be purchased from McGovern Municipal HQ under the Greater Boston Police Council (GBPC) BAPERN cooperative bid. The total cost for this vehicle is \$54,819.35.

The itemized list is as follows:

(1) 2022 Ford Interceptor Utility Hybrid AWD \$54,819.35

The reason for the exception to bid request is due to the immediate availability of this vehicle. This vehicle is approximately \$4,000 cheaper than the non-hybrid 2023 model and even more so when compared the anticipated 2024 model year prices. The 2024 Ford Explorers are set for production in October with an inevitable model year price increase. Based on this, it would be a disadvantage for the city to go out to bid as we've found these government bids out of Massachusetts to be a better option for purchasing new police vehicles.

The purchase of this Ford Interceptor Utility Hybrid vehicle will be part of our FY2024 vehicle purchase plan.

The total amount, if approved, would be \$54,819.35 and would be funded by ARPA Capital Outlay – budget code 510 0400. The police department currently does not have a budget line item for police vehicles.

Please feel free to contact me at 468-4230 should you require any further information.

Sincerely,

Major Andrew P. Sullivan

· Administrative Bureau Commander



# Quote

Date:

9/8/2023

Customer ID:

Warwick PD

To:

Warwick Police Department

Attn: Mike Grant

Salesperson:

Michael Chase

508-280-6603

Unit P8

Price Per GBPC/BAPERN

Qty' 📜 .	Item# \$ 4.50	Description	Unit	Price	Lin	e Total
1.00	K8A	2022 Ford Police Interceptor Utility Hybrid AWD Black	\$	36,802.00	\$	36,802.00
1.00	<b>43</b> D	Dark Car Feature	\$	24.25	\$	24.25
 1.00	-51R	Driver Side Unity LED Spotlight	\$	383.15	\$	383.15
1.00	549	Power Heated Mirrors	\$	58.20	\$	58.20
1.00	76R	Reverse Sensing System	\$	266.75	\$	266.75
1.00	53M	SYNC Voice Activated System	\$	-	\$	-
1.00	86P	Front Headlamp Housing	\$	-	\$	-
1.00	87R	Rear View Camera Relocate to Mirror	\$	-	\$	-
1.00	18D	Rear Liftgate Lock Disable Delete	\$	-	\$	-
1.00	EB82DEDE	Whelen Duo Legacy Package Red Blue with photocell with Core	\$	4,490.00	\$	4,490.00
1.00	FK	Fleet Key to Department Specs 1284X	\$	250.00	\$	250,00
1.00	Graphics	Per Department Specs	\$	695.00	\$	695.00
2.00	VTX609-C	Whelen Vertex Front Hide a Ways Clear	\$	175.00	\$	350.00
1.00	36-2125	Westin Push Bar	\$	500.00	\$	500.00
1.00	36-6005W4	Westin Push Bar Channel 4 Light	\$	50.00	\$	50.00
2.00	12E	Whelen Duo ION Blue White Front Push Bar	\$	200.00	\$	400.00
2.00	(2D	Whelen Duo ION Red White Front Push Bar	\$	200.00	\$	400.00
1.00	TLI2E	Whelen T-ION Blue White Side of Push Bar	\$	200.00	\$	200.00
1.00	TLI2D	Whelen T-ION Red White Side of Push Bar	\$	200.00	\$	200.00
2.00	SAK1	Whelen Siren Speaker Bracket for Push Bar	\$	-	\$	-
1.00	C399K4	Whelen OBDII Port	\$	-	\$	-
1.00	CCTL6	Whelen Rotary Knob Siren	\$	-	\$	-
1.00	CEM16	Whelen Expansion Module	\$	200.00	\$	200.00
1.00	CV2V	Whelen Vehicle to Vehicle SYNC	\$	250.00	\$	250.00
1.00	MBIONV3B	Whelen Mirror Beams V Series Blue	\$	300.00	\$	300.00
1.00	MBIONV3R	Whelen Mirror Beams V Series Red	\$	300.00	\$	300.00
1.00	MBFX20	Whelen Mirror Beam Housing	\$	-	\$	-
1.00	LINSV2E	Whelen Under Mirror Light Blue	\$	275.00	\$	275.00
1.00	LINSV2D	Whelen Under Mirror Light Red	\$	275.00	\$	275.00

7	-		SEP 15	2023		Page 2 of 2
1.00	LSVBKT	Whelen Under Mirror Bracket Kit	\$	-	\$	-
1.00	SA315P	Whelen Siren Speaker on Push Bar	\$	350.00	\$	350.00
1.00	P1000UINT20AOSB	Pro-Gard Single Cell with Officer Safety Belt	\$	2,850.00	\$	2,850.00
1.00	OEWD50	Whelen Outter Edge 3 OEI2K and 3 OEI2M	\$	1,000.00	\$	1,000.00
1.00	TLI2E	Whelen T-ION Blue White Rear Plate	\$	200.00	\$	200.00
1.00	TLI2D	Whelen T-ION Red White Rear Plate	\$	200.00	\$	200.00
1.00	TLI2E	Whelen T-ION Blue White Side Cargo Exterior	\$	200.00	\$	200.00
1.00	TLI2D	Whelen T-ION Red White Side Cargo Exterior	\$	200.00	\$	200.00
2.00	TIONWEDG	Whelen TION Wedge Kit for Rear Side	\$	-	\$	-
2.00	VTX609-R	Whelen Vertex Rear Hide a Ways Red	\$	175.00	\$	350.00
2.00	VTX609-C	Whelen Vertex Rear Hide a Ways Clear	\$	175.00	\$	350.00
1.00	CG-X	Havis Charge Gard For Computer	\$	250.00	\$	250.00
1.00	C-VS-0618-INUT	Havis Flat Console	\$	650.00	\$	650.00
1.00	C-ARM-103	Havis Arm Rest	\$	-	\$	-
1.00	CUP2-1001	Havis Cup Holder	\$	-	\$	-
. 2.00	C-MCB-	L Bracket			¯ <b>\$</b>	<del>,</del>
1.00	C-PM-124	Havis Printer Mount	\$	400.00	\$	400.00
1.00	HAVIS	Havis Rear Box	\$	600.00	\$	600.00
1.00	C-LP2-PS1-USB2	Dual USB Port	\$	75.00	\$	75.00
1.00	,MNMOM-5F	Antenna Cable	\$	-	\$	-
1.00	894090	Front and Rear Vent Shades	\$	95.00	\$	95.00
1.00	Transfer	Dual Head RADAR	\$	180.00	\$	180.00
1.00	Transfer	Radio	\$	200.00	\$	200.00
					\$	-
					\$	-
Specia	Instructions:		Vehicle	Subtotal	\$37,	534.35
			Upfit S	ubtotal	\$17,	285.00

Grand Total \$54,819.35

# Bid2024-179 Motorola Two-Way Radio Accessories, Replacement Parts & Vehicle Mounting Hardware

• 3 bids received

BID ADVERTISED DATE: August 29, 2023

BID OPENING DATE:

September 12, 2023

CODE:

30-271 Police - Communications/Radios

MANNER OF AWARD:

\$25,000.00

11/9/2023 - 11/8/2024

RECOMMEND:

SAT Radio Communications Ltd. Dba Industrial Communications

## 

SAT Radio Communications LTD.
Dba Industrial Communications
1019 E Euclid Ave.
San Antonio, TX 78212

Cyber Communications, Inc. 90 Colorado Ave. Warwick, RI 02888

Holzberg Communications, Inc. PO Box 322 Totowa, NJ 07511

Pricing as Follows

Colonel Bradford Connor Colonel



Frank J. Picozzi Mayor

Police Department 99 Veterans Memorial Drive Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617 Telephone (401) 468-4200

September 14, 2023

Ms. Francis Gomez
Purchasing Agent
City of Warwick
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island—02886

Re: Request for Spending Authorization- Motorola Two Way Radio Accessories, Replacement Parts & Vehicle Mounting Hardware Bid2024-179
Funding Source: Parts-Communication 30-271

Dear Ms. Gomez,

The police department went out to bid for accessories, replacement parts, and vehicle mounting hardware for Motorola two-way radios. These items are will be used for both the radio system in each police cruiser and the portable radios that our officers carry on their person. The department received bids from the following three (3) vendors:

- 1. Cyber Communications, Inc of 90 Colorado Ave Warwick, RI 02888
- 2. Holzberg Communications, Inc., P.O. Box 322, Totowa, NJ 07511
- 3. SAT Radio Communications Ltd d/b/a Industrial Communications of 1019 E Euclid Ave San Antonio, TX 78212

The department recommends this bid be awarded to SAT Radio Communications Ltd d/b/a Industrial Communications, who was the overall lowest, qualified bidder. This current contract expires on November 8, 2023.

Funding for this purchase, if approved, would be allocated from the Police Communications-Parts budget (30-271), for an amount not to exceed \$25,000.00. This would be a one year contract starting on November 9, 2023 through November 8, 2024.

Sincerely,

Andrew P Sullivan

Administrative Bureau Commander

<u></u>			:	SAT	Radio Comm	ınications	Т	Cy	ber	Communi	cations	Holzberg Communications				
Line	Item	Description	MSR	P	Unit Price	Price Per 10	1	MSRP		nit Price	Price Per 10	MSRP		it Price		ce Per 10
1	C-EB30-APR-1P	Havis Console Plate for APX 4500 Remote	\$ 33	.00	\$ 24.75	\$ 247.50	\$	33.00	\$		\$ 297.00		\$	31.00		310.00
2	C-EB30-APS-1P	Havis Console Plate for APX 4500 Self Contained	\$ 33	.00	\$ 24.75	\$ 247.50	) \$	33.00	\$	29.70	\$ 297.00		\$	31.00	\$	310.00
3	HLN6861	Motorola Installation Trunnion for APX 4500	\$ 58	.44	\$ 49.67	\$ 496.70	\$	58.44	\$	52.60	\$ 526.00		\$	51.00	\$	510.00
4	C-EB25-CDR-1P	Havis Console Plate for CDM Remote	\$. 33	.00	\$ 24.75	\$ 247.50	\$	33.00	\$	29.70	\$ 297.00		\$	31.00	\$	310.00
5	C-EB25-CDS-1P	Havis Console Plate for CDM Self Contained	\$ 33	.00	\$ 24.75	\$ 247.50	5	33.00	\$	29.70 i	\$ 297.00		\$	31.00	\$	310.00
6	GLN7324	Motorola Mounting Trunnion for CDM	\$ 13	.12	\$ 11.15	\$ 111.50	\$	14.31	\$	12.88	\$ 128.80		\$	15.00	\$	150.00
7	C-EB30-MCR-1P	Havis Console Plate for MCS 2000 Remote	\$ 33	.00	\$ 24.75	\$ 247.50	\$	33.00	\$	29.70	\$ 297.00		\$	31.00	\$	310.00
8	C-EB30-MCS-1P	Havis Console Plate for MCS 2000 Self contained	\$ 33	.00	\$ 24.75	\$ 247.50	, s	33.00	\$	29.70	\$ 297.00	,	\$	31.00	\$	310.00
9	C-EB25-MMT-1P	Havis Console Plate for XTL 1500	\$ 33	.00	\$ 24.75	\$ 247.50	\$	33.00	\$	29.70	\$ 297.00		\$	31.00	\$	310.00
10	C-EB30-MMT-1P- A	Havis Angled Console Plate for XTL 1500	\$ 33	.00	\$ 24.75	\$ 247.50	\$	33.00	\$	29.70	\$ 297.00	i.	\$	31.00	\$	310.00
11	HSN4032B	Motorola External 13 Watt Remote Speaker	\$ 77	.22	\$ 65.63	\$ 656.30	\$	77.22	\$	69.50	\$ 695.00		\$	63.00	\$	630.00
12	HLN6863B XTL	Motorola Ignition Cable	\$ 43	.63	\$ 37.08	\$ 370.80	\$	43.63	\$	39.30	\$ 393.00		\$	41.00	\$	410.00
13	MB8M	Laird NMO Mount with 17' Coaxial, Mini UHF Termination	\$ 27	.84	\$ 23.66	\$ 236.60	\$	27.84	\$	i 25,25	\$ 252.50		\$	19.00	\$	190.00
14	NMO-60-300-M1- N	PCTEL 3/4 in NMO Mount 25 ft RG58/U Mini-UHF	\$ 28	.81	\$ 24.48	\$ 244.80	\$	28.81	\$	25.95	\$ 259.50		\$	18.00	\$	180.00
15	MLPV450	PCTEL/MAXRAD 450- 512MHz Low Profile Antenna	\$ 53	.62	\$ 45.57	\$ 455.70	\$	28.27	\$	25.45	\$ 254.50		\$	30.00	\$	300.00
Continu	ed next page									1						

		<u> </u>	SAT	Radi	o Commu	nicati	ons		Су	ber (	Communi	icati	ions	Holzberg Commun				ications	
Line	Item	Description	 MSRP	Un	it Price	Pri	ce Per 10	Ι.	MSRP	Un	it Price	F	rice Per 10	MSRP		iit Price	,	rice Per 10	
16	LPT800900NMO	Larsen Black Low Profile NMO Antenna for 806-960 MHz	\$ 60.49	\$	51.41	\$	514.10	\$	60.49	\$	54.45	\$	544.50		\$	38.00	\$	380.00	
17	HKN6169	Motorola Remote Mount Control Cable	\$ 98.52	\$	83.74	\$	837.40	\$	98.52	\$	88.65	\$	886.50		\$	82.00	\$	820.00	
18	HKN4192	Motorola Power Cable	\$ 47.52	\$	40.39	\$	403.90	\$	47.52	\$	42.77	\$	427.70		\$	40.00	\$	400.00	
19	HKN6188	Motorola Control Head Power, Ignition, Speaker Cable	\$ 53.36	\$	45.35	\$	453.50	\$	53.36	\$	48.00	\$	480.00		\$	48.00	\$	480.00	
20	HMN1090A	Motorola Palm Microphone for XTL/APX	\$ 81.00	\$	68.85	\$	688.50	\$	81.00	\$	72.90	\$	729.00		\$	69.00	\$	690.00	
21	3064078H02	Motorola replacement cord for HMN1090	\$ 50.09	\$	42.57	\$	425.70	\$	50.09	\$	45.08	\$	450.80		\$	47.00	\$	470.00	
22	PMMN4062AL	Motorola Remote Speaker Mic for APX 4000	\$ 127.12	\$	108.05	\$	1,080.50	\$	127.12	\$	114.41	\$	1,144.10		\$	102.00	\$	1,020.00	
23	IPMKN4234A	Replacement Cord for PMMN4062AL	\$ 54.00	\$	45.90	\$	459.00	\$	54.00	\$	48.60	\$	486.00		\$	45.00	\$	450.00	
24	V-11019	Otto Audio Adapter for APX	\$ 52.25	\$	44.41	\$	444.10	\$	163.59	\$	147.25	\$	1,472.50		\$	119.00	\$	1,190.00	
25	V1-10335	Otto Audio Adapter for XTS	\$ 52.25	\$	44.41	\$	444.10	\$	66.52	\$	66.52	\$	665.20	-	\$	50.00	\$	500.00	
26	1 V 4= MA /   VIA 1M	Breeze Pigtail With Remote PTT	\$ 60.95	\$	51.80	\$	518.00		No Bid	N	lo Bid		No Bid	No Bid	]	No Bid		No Bid	
27	PMPN4174A	APX 4000 Desktop Charger	\$ 82.08	\$	69.76	\$	697.60	\$	82.08	\$	73.85	\$	738.50	No Bid	1	No Bid		No Bid	

Bid2024-179 Motorola Two Way Radio Accessories, Replacement	Parts, and Vehicle Mounting Hardwar	e			
The following vendors were sent specifications		_	<del> </del>		
The following vendors were sent specifications		<del></del>	<del> </del> -		
VENDOR	ADDRESS	CITY	STATE	ZIP	EMAILS
CTS SERVICES, INC.	260 MAPLE STREET	BELLINGHAM	MA		mcariow@ctsservices.com
Cyber Com, Inc.	90 Colorado Ave	Warwick	RI		abatty@cybercomminc.com; bsalvatore@cybercomminc.com; prush@cybercomminc.com
Dba Industrial Communications	900 Waterman Ave.	E. Providence	RI	02914	rhopkins@challengeusa.net
Direct Network Services	20 Taylor St.	Littleton	MA		duhigg@directnetserv.com
Fast Links	PO Box 343	N. Scituate	MA		robcuomo@fastlinks-wireless.com
Finger Lake Comm. Co., Inc.	305 Clark St.	Auburn	NY		sales@fingerlakescomm.com
Frequency Electronics, Inc.	55 Charles Lindbergh Blvd.	Mitchel Field	NY	11553	sales@fei-zyfer.com
Glacier Computer	46 Bridge Street	New Milfored	CT		aharootunlan@northeast-mdt.com
Global Data Products	There is no specific address because	e he is a salesman.			jean@globaldataproducts.com
Holzberg Communications, Inc.	P.O. Box 322	Totowa	NJ	07511	holzberg@juno.com
Houston Communication	1105 Industrial	Sugarland	TX		joses@houstoncommunications.com
Imaging Products Int'I	2205 First St. #105	Simi Valley	CA		robynm@imagingproducts.com
Impact Power Technologies, Inc.	145 Wood Rd.	Bräintree	MA	02184	info@impactpowertech.com
Industrial Communications	40 Lone St.	Marshfield	MA	02050	Don.lincoln@induscom.com; wireless@induscom.com
Island Tech Services	980 S 2nd Street	Ronkonkoma	NY		jdanella@itsg.us.com
KCM Marketing, Inc.	1631 S. Sinclair St.	Anaheim	CA	92806	info@mkbattery.com
LEEPOPO Corporation	7111 Autumn Park	San Antonio	TX	78249	chrisn@leepopo.com
Matronics	PO Box 934519	Margale	FL	33063	martronics@mindspring.com
Motorola Solutions	Five Paragon Dr.	Montvale	NJ	07645	jon.lamoureux@motorolasolutions.com
PacketLogix, Inc.	140 Lincoln Ave.	Barrington	RI		Terrence@packetlogix.com
SAT Radio Communication LTD dba Industrial Communications	1019 E. Euclid Avenue	San Antonio	TX	78212	agollinger@indcom.net; kbarton@indcom.net; ktreptow@indcom.net; svick@indcom.net
Seaport Communications Co.	304 Pt. Judith Rd.	Narragansett	RI		Seaportcom12@aol.com
SideBand Systems, Inc.	30 Rantoul St.	Beverly	MA		jdavis@sidebandsys.com
Stanford Research Systems, Inc.	1290-D Reamwood Ave.	Sunnyvale			info@thinksrs.com
Continued next page		t.			

VENDOR	ADDRESS	CITY	STATE	ZIP	EMAILS
Techworld Solutions, LLC	119 Wildwood Rd.	Stamford	CT	06903	gene@techworldsolutions.com
Tessco	11126 McCormick Rd.	Hunt Valley	MD	21031	salessupport@tessco.com
Upstate Wholesale Supply Inc. DBA brite	7647 Main Street Fishers	Victor	NY	14564	jfoos@brite.com
Utility Communications, Inc.	920 Sherman Ave.	Hamden	CT	06514	mikec@utilitycommunications.com;eda @utilitycommunications.com
Vision Communications	4501 E. Pacific Coast Hwy., Ste. 400	Long Beach	FL	90804	bmoayeri@2viscom.com
Visions of Video	9030 Balboa Blvd.	Northridge	CA	91325	sarar@visionsofvideo.com

## Bid2024-176 Police Motorcycle Repairs

• 1 bids received

BID ADVERTISED DATE: August 25, 2023

BID OPENING DATE:

September 12, 2023

CODE:

76-358 Insurance – Insured Accidents Police

30-330 Police - Auto & Vehicle Maintenance

MANNER OF AWARD:

\$10,000.00

12/13/2023 - 12/12/2024

RECOMMEND:

Russ' Ocean State Harley-Davidson

# COPIES OF BID SUBMISSIONS ARE AVAILABLE UPON REQUEST VIA REGULAR PROCESS.

Russ' Ocean State Harley-Davidson 35 Albany Road Warwick, RI 02888

MOTORCYCLE REPAIRS	<u>Bid</u>
RI STATE INSPECTION	\$11.00
LABOR-HOURLY RATE	\$120.00
POLICE MOTORCYCLE LOANER	N/A
PICK UP OR DELIVER MOTORCYCLE TO POLICE DEPARTMENT	\$125.00/trip

Colonel Bradford Connor Chief of Police



Frank J. Picozzi Mayor

Police Department
99 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617
Telephone: (401) 468-4200

September 13, 2023

Ms. Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent City of Warwick 3275 Post Road Warwick, Rhode Island 02886

RE: Bid Recommendation: Bid2024-176 "Police Motorcycle Repairs"

Dear Ms. Gomez,

The police department went out to bid to seek a qualified vendor for the repairs of our motorcycle fleet as needed. The department received one (1) qualified bid for Bid2024-176, Police Motorcycle Repairs.

The vendor is:

Russ' Ocean State, Inc., DBA Russ' Ocean State Harley -Davidson, 35 Albany Rd. Warwick, RI 02888

The department is recommending that the bid be awarded to **Russ' Ocean State Harley-Davidson** as they were the sole bidder. Russ' Ocean State Harley-Davidson is also a Warwick-based business. Their bid rates increased slightly over last year's bid. The police department will pick up and deliver the motorcycles to Ocean State Harley-Davidson when applicable, thus negating the \$125 fee per trip.

The Warwick Police Department does have a fully staffed garage with certified mechanics although none of our mechanics are certified in the repair of Harley-Davidson motorcycles. Allowing our mechanics to work on these motorcycles, even for the smallest repair would not be prudent and could result in liability to the agency and the City of Warwick. The police department currently has a fleet of 7 motorcycles, including 2010 through 2022 Harley Davidson Electra Glide model FLHTP motorcycles. These motorcycles are essential to the mission of the traffic unit; they provide funeral escorts, VIP escorts and are utilized to conduct traffic enforcement.

We request permission to expend up to \$10,000.00, which if approved, would be allocated from the department's budget, code 76-358, "Insurance Proceeds" and/or the department's budget code 30-330, "Auto and Vehicle Maintenance". This contract would be for one year; 12/13/23 through 12/12/24.

The current contract expires on 12/12/23.

Please feel free to contact me at 468-4230, should you require any further information.

Sincerely,

Major Andrew P Sullivan

Administrative Bureau Commander

Bid2024-176 Police Motorcycle Repairs		!			Ī.
		1			
The following vendors were sent specifications.		i			
·					
VENDOR	ADDRESS	CITY	STATE	ZIP	EMAILS
Cape Cod Harley Davidson	750 MacArthur Blvd.	Pocasset-	MA	02559	info@capecodharley.com
Mike's Famous Harley-Davidson	951 Bank St.	New London	CT	06320	MAIL
Minuteman Harley-Davidson	Five Albany Rd.	Warwick	RI	02888	sales@minutemanharley.com
New England Police Vehicle Leasing Corp.	17 Lafayette Rd.	N. Hampton	NH	03862	slillie@seacoastharley.com; pmiles@seacoastharley.com
Russ's Ocean State Harley Davidson	35 Albany Rd.	Warwick	RI	02888	stevetoshd@aol.com; bhamptona@aol.com
Precision Harley Davidson	269 Armistice Blvd.	Pawtucket	RI	02860	sales@precisionhd.com; john@precisionhd.com
Razee Motorcycle Center	730 Tower Hill Rd.	N. Kingstown	RĪ	02852	info@razeemotorcycle.com

CODE: 84-799 Water Department - Capital Improvement

# SECTION 56-6

Bid2024-210 UCMR 5 Testing

Alpha Analytical 320 Forbes Blvd. Mansfield, MA 02048

Contract Award: \$10,000.00

Contract Period: Two Years from Date of Award



# CITY OF WARWICK DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 925 SANDY LANE • WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02889 TEL (401) 738-2003 • FAX (401) 732-5208

SEY 1 2 2023

FRANK J. PICOZZI MAYOR

ERIC J. EARLS, PE DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC WORKS

To: Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent

From: Terry DiPetrillo, Water Division Chief

Date: September 12, 2023

Subj: UCMR 5 Testing

The Safe Drinking Water Act (SDWA) requires that once every five years EPA issue a list of unregulated contaminants to be monitored by public water systems (PWSs). This is a mandated program.

The fifth Unregulated Contaminant Monitoring Rule (UCMR 5) requires sample collection for 30 chemical contaminants between 2023 and 2025 using analytical methods developed by EPA and consensus organizations. This first round of samples is required to be tested and results submitted to the EPA by December 2023.

Large public water systems (PWSs) are required to use laboratories approved by the EPA to analyze their UCMR 5 samples. As such, this department has chosen the mostly locally located laboratory to our location, Alpha Analytical in Mansfield, MA. From the list published by the EPA with approved laboratories.

Please accept this memo as a request for a Sec. 56-6, Exception to Notice for UCMR 5 testing requirements as mandated for a two year period beginning from date of award to Alpha Analytical in the amount of \$10,000.

(84-799 - \$10,000)

# **Laboratories Approved by EPA to Support UCMR 5**



EPA approved the following laboratories after they met the application requirements and Proficiency Testing (PT) criteria for the Laboratory Approval Program (LAP) supporting the fifth cycle of the Unregulated Contaminant Monitoring Rule (UCMR 5). These laboratories can analyze UCMR 5 samples using those methods marked with an "X" next to their names. Any laboratory that withdraws from the LAP or subsequently fails to meet the method and program quality assurance/quality control (QA/QC) requirements will be permanently removed from this list.

Laboratory Information	Per- and Polyfluoroalkyl Substances (PFAS)		Lithium	Commercial	
Eaboratory information	EPA 533	EPA 537.1 Rev.2.0	EPA 200.7	Services	
Accurate Environmental, LLC 505 South Lowry Stillwater, OK 74074 (405) 372-5300 danny.chance@accuratelabs.com	X	X	X	X	
Advanced Environmental Laboratories, Inc. 9610 Princess Palm Avenue Tampa, FL 33619 (813) 630-9616			X	X	
Advanced Environmental Laboratories, Inc. 6681 Southpoint Parkway Jacksonville, FL 32216 (904) 363-9350	X	X	Χ	X	
Alpha Analytical 320 Forbes Boulevard Mansfield, MA 02048 (508) 898-9220	X	X	X	X	
ALS Environmental - Holland 3352 128th Avenue Holland, MI 49424 (616) 399-6070 UCMR@ALSGlobal.com	X	X	X	X	
ALS Environmental - Kelso 1317 South 13th Avenue Kelso, WA 98626 (360) 577-7222	X	X	X	X	
American Analytics, Inc. 9765 Eton Avenue Chatsworth, CA 91311 (818) 998-5547	X	Х	Х	X	
American Water Central Laboratory 1115 South Illinois Street Belleville, IL 62220 (618) 235-3600 document@amwater.com	X	X	X	X	



Office of Water (MS-140) 815-B-23-007

## **Bid2024-175 Police Vehicle Window Tinting**

• 1 bids received

BID ADVERTISED DATE: August 24, 2023

BID OPENING DATE:

September 12, 2023

CODE:

30-330 Police - Auto & Vehicle Maintenance

MANNER OF AWARD:

\$5,000.00

11/18/2023 - 11/17/2024

RECOMMEND:

All Mobile Towing & Recovery, LLC

# COPIES OF BID SUBMISSIONS ARE AVAILABLE UPON REQUEST VIA REGULAR PROCESS

All Mobile Towing & Recovery LLC PO Box 14544 East Providence, RI 02914

Item #	Description	Bid
1.	Ford Explorer Police Interceptor 2013-2024 model years	
a	Front door (2) windows only	\$130.00
b.	(2)-Front,(2) rear door windows	\$230.00
2.	Miscellaneous vehicles:	
a.	Complete 2 front, 2 rear doors front and rear back window.  Vehicles; Ford Edge, Escapes, Superduty	\$325.00
b.	All (4) door windows rear window and front windshield strip	\$365.00
3.	Front windshield strip 4-6 inch strip	\$60.00

Colonel Bradford E. Connor Chief of Police



Frank J. Picozzi Mayor

Police Department 99 Veterans Memorial Drive Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617 Telephone: (401) 468-4200

September 13, 2023

Ms. Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent Warwick City Hall 3275 Post Road Warwick, RI 02886

RE: Vehicle Window Tinting

\_\_\_ Bid2024-175\_\_\_ \_\_\_

Funding Source: Auto/Vehicle Maintenance - 30-330

Dear Ms. Gomez,

The Police Department went out to bid for window tinting for police vehicles. This would include all of our marked and unmarked vehicles.

We received one (1) bid from the following vendor:

All Mobile Towing & Recovery, LLC P.O. Box 14544, East Providence, RI 02914

The police department recommends All Mobile Towing & Recovery, LLC be awarded this contract as they were the sole bidder. This would be the 2<sup>nd</sup> year for this bid. All Mobile Towing & Recovery, LLC was awarded the bid last year and our garage personnel have been satisfied with their work.

If approved, it will be funded by Police Operating budget code: 30-330, for an amount not to exceed \$5,000.00. Purchases will be made on an as-needed basis. The current contract expires November 17, 2023. The new contract would begin November 18, 2023 and expire November 17, 2024.

If you have any questions or concerns, please contact me at 468-4230.

Sincerely,

Major Andrew P Sullivan

Administrative Bureau Commander

Bid2024-175 Police Vehicle Window Tinting		_			
			_		
The following vendors were sent specifications					
VENDOR	ADDRESS	CITY	STATE	ZIP	EMAILS
All Mobile Towing & Recovery	PO Box 14544	East Providence	RI	02914	jreis14@aol.com
Black Glass Window Tint	45 Homeside Drive	Cranston	RI	02905	MAIL
Minty's Auto Salon	1568 Broad Street	Cranston	RI	02905	Mintysautosalon401@yahoo.com
Providence Tint	790 Charles Street, Unit 3	Providence	RI	02904	MAIL
Quality Tint	58 Grove Avenue	East Providence	RI	02914	qualitytintnow@gmail.com
Solar Guard Window Tint, LLC	178 Airport Road	Warwick	RI	02889	Jmlri8@yahoo.com
Sunset Tint & Sign	971 Cranston Street	Cranston	RI	02920	Ray.sunsetsign@hotmail.com
Superior Mobile Wash & Detail LLC	40 Whitford Street	Warwick	RI	02889	superiormobiledetails@yahoo.com
Top Notch	133 Hallene Road Suite	Warwick	RI	02886	topnotchllcri@gmail.com