Patricia A. Peshka Joseph J. Solomon

Purchasing Agent Mayor

City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364

TO: Members of the Finance Committee
FROM: Patricia A. Peshka, Purchasing Age'@Q
DATE: January 23, 2020

RE: Bids for the Finance Committee Monday, February 3, 2020




PCR-17-20

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of

CITY OF WARWICK

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

APPROVED:

NO:

MAYOR

DATE:

Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on
purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following

bid(s):
Bid Vendor(s) Contract | Contract
# Name Name/Address Award Period Note| Code
2018 Ti-Sales, Inc. 3/27/20 6
i Nep“m&ectgi‘: Water 36 Hudson Rd. $75,000.00 : |-
247 Sudbury, MA 01776 3/26/21 12
2020 Tri‘-;’mger S}l:,ljs & 6
- | Hydraulic Parts & Repairs ervice, Jnc. $15,000.00 2 -
019 64 Minnesota Ave. 12
Warwick, RI 02886
Griggs & Browne Co.,
2020 Pest Control Services Inc. DPW ONLY 3 °
71 ORtroL Servi 175 Niantic Ave. $230.00 .
Providence, R1 02907
R.P. Iannuccillo &
2020 Inspection of the Lincoln Sons Construction
" |Avenue Transmission Main Co. $241,250.00
206 70 Calverly Street

Providence, RI 02908

Continued next page




PCR-17-20

Bid Vendor(s) Contract | Contract
# Name Name/Address Award Period Note| Code
City of Warwick (District .
2020'| '6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur | Dennis K Burke, Inc. | pypyy | 4710720
494 Diesel & Ulﬁa Low Sulfur Taunton, MA 02780 $850,000.00 4971
= Diesel Fuel
City of Warwick (District | Roberts Energy, LLC
2020 1 6y Gasoline, Low Sulfur | 237 Albany St. poLice | #1020
., |Diesel & Ultra Low Sulfur|  Springfield, MA $320,000.00 .
2498 Diesel Fuel 01104 49121
City of Warwick (District ,
20_20 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur lg?sngof’s ,f tﬁi II)r:c FIRE 4/1(_)/20
249C Diesel & Ultra Low Sulfur Taunton, MA 02780 $148,000.00 4/9/21
= Diesel Fuel
2020 Part D Advisors, Inc. One vear
) Healthcare Dependent 17199 N Laurel Park | $19,850.00 from}cllate
Eligibility Audit Drive, Suite 400
251 of award

Livonia, MI 48152

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest
responsible bidder.

1.

2.
3.

Request permission to increase PCR-107-19 (Sub A) from $235,000.00 to $310,000.00
and extend from March 27, 2020 through March 26, 2021.
Request permission to increase PCR-62-19 from $20,000.00 to $35,000.00.
Request permission to increase PCR-123-19 from $8,800.00 to $9,030.00.

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE




BID #
2018-247
2020-019
2020-071
2020-206

2020-2494

2020-249B

2020-249C

2020-251

TABLE OF CONTENTS

CITY COUNCIL MEETING February 3, 2020

DESCRIPTION

Neptune Cold Water Meters (Sec. 6-12)

Hydraulic Parts & Repairs (Sec. 6-12)

Pest Control Services (Sec. 6-12)

Inspection of the Lincoln Avenue Transmission Main

City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur
Diesel & Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur
Diesel & Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur
Diesel & Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

Healthcare Dependent Eligibility Audit

49-52

53-58




CODE: 84-799 Water Department/Capital Improvement

SECTION 6-12

Request permission to increase PCR-107-19 (Sub A)
from $235,000.00 to $310,000.00 and extend from March 27, 2020 through March 26, 2021

Bid2018-247 Neptune Cold Water Meters

Ti-Sales, Inc.
36 Hudson Rd.
Sudbury, MA 01776

LAST ACTION TAKEN

Section 6-12: PCR-107-19 (Sub A) approved September 6, 2019 in the amount of $75,000.00. No
change in contract period.

Contract Increase Requested $ 75,000.00
Current Contract Award $235,000.00
Contract Period Requested March 27, 2020 — March 26, 2021

Current Contract Period March 27, 2018 — March 26, 2020




DANIEL P. O'ROURKE
DIVISION CHIEF

JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
MAYOR

MICHAEL S. ST. PIERRE
BUSINESS MANAGER/
FINANCIAL ANALYST

CITY OF WARWICK
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

DIVISION OF WATER
935 SANDY LANE + WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02889
Tel (401) 738-2008 « Fax (401) 732-0616

January 15, 2020

To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: Daniel O’Rourke, Chief of Water Division\_ '

Subject: Neptune Cold Water Meters (Section #6-12), Ti Sales
Bid# 2018-247 (Contract Period 3/27/18 — 3/26/20)

As you are aware, the Water Division has an existing contract with Ti Sales for the purchase of cold
water meters. The current two year contract is set to expire on March 26, 2020. The contract provides
for the purchase of deduct meters, replacement of malfunctioning meters, and upgrading of existing
accounts to a radio remote reading capability. Over the course of the two year contract, the City Council
has authorized a total expenditure of $235,000.

A clause in the bid specifications states that “term contracts may be extended for one additional term
upon mutual agreement unless otherwise stated”. Attached is a letter from Ti Sales Inc. stating that they
are willing to extend their current pricing for all line items in the existing contract for one (1) additional
year. This would represent no increase in pricing for a minimum of three years. Ti Sales is the
exclusive distributor for Neptune products in the entire region.

Therefore, in light of this pricing commitment agreed upon between the Water Division and Ti Sales

Inc., I am seeking permission under Section #6-12, Alteration to Existing Contract of the Warwick Code
- of Ordinances to extend the contract for one (1) additional year with Ti Sales Inc. Coupled with the
extension, I am requesting the City Council authorize an additional $75,000 for the aforementioned
products. If this increase is approved, the new total contract award will total $310,000. Funding for this
increase will originate from budget code # 84-799.

If you have any questions or need additional clarification, please contact me at extension 9734.

Cc:  Mathew Solitro — Director of Public Works
Terry Dipetrillo — Water Division Program Manager
Michael St. Pierre — Water Division Business Manager
Richard Moniz — Lead Meter Service Person

-2~




Ti)SALES

WATER and WASTEWATER SUPPLIES
36 Hudson Road

Sudbury, MA 01776-2039

P: 800-225-4616

F: 978-443-7600

www.tisales.com

City of Warwick January 15, 2020
Purchasing Division

3275 Post Road

Warwick, RI 02886

Attention: Dan O’Rourke
RE: 1-Year Price Extension, Bid 2018-247 Neptune Cold Water Meters

-Dear Mr. O’Rourke

I am pleased to inform you that Ti-SALES is able to extend the current pricing, based on Bid 2018-247, for
another year. According to our records this extension will begin on March 27, 2020 and expire at the close
of business on March 26, 2021. '

Thank you for the opportunity, and please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards,

Louis Schoolcraft Il
Vice President

Famous Fon Fast Senvice

-3-




PCR-107-19 (Sub A)

APPROVED:

CITY OF WARWICK

COPY

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

‘DA

R-19-102

YU/ —
7

Stotenbs- £ 2019

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of
Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on
purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance -of the following

bid(s):
Bid Vendor(s) Contract | Contract
4 Name Name/Address Award | Period |\ote|Code
2018 Ti-Sales, Inc. 6
. N"'Pt‘m;d‘éfelrd Water 36HudsonRd. | $75,000.00 1| -
247 Sudbury, MA 01776 12
2019 . . Palmer Spring 6
- S%ﬁagtelff%,a;‘:k& One Althea St. | $7,362.31 2 | .
032 Providence, RI 02907 12
Precision Alarm
2020 | Quarterly Fire Alarm Corp. 7/12/19
- Panel Inspections 14 Wakefield St. $6,780.00 - 3
052 & Testing West Warwick, RI 7/11/20
02893
Continued next page




PCR-107-19 (Sub A)
/
Bid : Vendor(s) Contract | Contract
# Name Name/Address Award Period Note | Code
D’Ambra
Construction Co., Inc.
Coventry, R1 02816
Johnston Asphalt,
LLC
2020 Asphalt Concrete Hot Johnston, R 02919 As 9/15/19
" | Mixes & Cold Patch Lynck Corp. Needed -
058 ' Cumberland. RT 02864 Basis 9/14/20
Cardi Corp.
Warwick, RT 02888
PJ Keating Co.
Lunenburg, MA
01462
2020 | Service & Maintenance Sitylr Jales 8/25/19
- Agreement for Stryker orporarion $4,700.25 -
067 |  EMS Equipment 11811 Willows Rd. 824120
Redmond, WA 98052
2020 Mental The Providence M9 56
- Health 1 (;r';srs X $40,000.00 - ]
033 Clinician Providence, RI 02901 6/30/20 6
2020 | Assessor CAMA V“"";o(l":;z;"s’"e”‘ N9 56
- | Application Maintenance . $20,308.00 - -
. . 1 Cabot Rd. Suite 100
072 & Web Hosting Hudson, MA 01749 6/30/20 6
2020 Towi't of Barrington 56
. Purchase Used Police Department $4.700.00
076 Police Cruisers 100 Federal Rd. 2o )
Barrington, RI 02806
Curia Systems
2020 | Municipal Cowt Software|  POBox2031 | gcongop | %
077 Maintenance & Upgrades |  E. Greenwich, RI e 8/31/20
02818
Continued next page




PCR-107-19 (Sub A)

Bid Vendor(s) Contract | Contract
# Name Name/Address . | Award | Period | \0t¢| Code
2020 | State of RI Computer ”Z‘:’fy f:””}”ze' 56
- Hardware, Computer soctates, 'n $1,252.39 4 -
073 Products One Whalley Way | = 10
Southwick, MA 01077

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest
responsible bidder.

1
2.
3. DPW: $4,000.00. P & R: $600.00. Fire: $1,800.00. Police: $200.00. Animal

4,

. Request permission to increase PCR-41-19 (Sub A) from $160,000.00 to $235,000.00.

Request permission to increase PCR-101-18 (Sub A) from $25,000.00 to $32,362.31.

Shelter: $180.00.

Request permission to piggyback MPA #345.

Actions Taken:

Bid2019-060 HVAC Maintenance & Repair
Thayer/Warburton Arena

PCR-110-19
Withdrawn per department

Bid2020-053 Security System Monitoring & Maintenance PCR-111-19 (Sub A)

Amend total award from
$11,394.60 to $11,594.60.
Amend DPW award from
$7,500.00 to $8,000.00.

Bid2019-277B Fire Apparatus Repair (Additional Vendor) ~ PCR-112-19

Hold until 8/19/19

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE




CODE: 84-799 Water Department/Capital Improvement

SECTION 6-12

Request permission to increase PCR-41-19 (Sub A)
from $160,000.00 to $235,000.00.

Bid2018-247 Neptune Cold Water Meters

Ti-Sales, Inc.
36 Hudson Rd.
Sudbury, MA 01776

LAST ACTION TAKEN

Section 6-12: PCR-41-19 (Sub A) approved March 21,2019 in the amount of $35,000.00. No
change in contract period.

Contract Increase Requested $ 75,000.00

Current Contract Award $160,000.00

Contract Period Requested No change in term

Current Contract Period March 27, 2018 — March 26, 2020




JUN 27 2015

OFPY WARWICK
WATER DIVISION
MEMO )
To:  Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent @
From: Daniel O’Rourke, Chief of Water Division

Date: June 26,2019
Re:  Section #6-12, Bid2018-247 Cold Water Meters

As you are aware, the Water Division has an existing contract,
Bid#2018-247 for the purchase of Cold Water Meters with Ti-Sales
which expires March 26, 2020. The contract provides for the purchase of
deduct meters, replacement of malfunctioning meters, and upgrading of
existing accounts to a radio remote reading system. Recently at the
March 2019 Council meeting, the Finance Committee recommended an
additional authorization of $35,000 for the remainder of 2019 fiscal year.
This recommendation and approval was awarded with the condition of
seeking additional funding during the 2020 fiscal year.

Currently the Water Division has exhausted the supply of meters for the
aforementioned reasons. Please be advised that this request is not to
stockpile meters; rather it is to respond to urgent needs and new requests
from customers for deduct meters. The breakdown of the contract as
follows:

Original award- $125,000 (2/18)
Section #6-12 - $35,000 (3/19)
Request #6-12 - $75,000 (7/19)

TOTAL CONTRACT AWARD $235,000

Therefore, in light of the circumstances, the Water Division is requesting
permission under Section #6-12 Alteration to Existing Contract of the
Warwick Code of Ordinances to increase the contract by $75,000
previously awarded to Ti-Sales. Funding for this purchase will originate
from budget code #84-799.

1




If you have any questions, or need additional information, please contact
me at extension 9734,

Cc: Mike St. Pierre- Water Division
Terry Dipetrillo- Water Division

® Page 2




PCR-41-19 (Sub A)

CITY OF WARWICK
STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS
RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

R-19-38

%/ )/

_#;mﬂé,_z;/ ,,1/ 2219

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of
Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on

purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the followmg
bid(s):

Bid Vendor(s) Contract | Contract
# Name Name/Address Award Period Note | Code
2018 Ti-Sales, Inc. 6
- Nepm&ft:i‘si Water 36 HudsonRd. | $35,000.00 1] -
247 Sudbury, MA 01776 12
Green Acres
2019 . Landscape & One Year
- Playg"‘é‘:l‘irls{egr";?"ns &\ Construction Co. | $101,739.00 |from Date of
248 21 Albone St. Award
' Lakeville, MA 02347

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest
responsible bidder. .

#1. Request permission to increase PCR-37-18 (Sub A) from $125,000.00 to $160,000.00.

Continued next page
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PCR~41-19 (Sub A) C ‘

ACTIONS TAKEN

Bid2019-246 Fire Apparatus Annual Pump Testing & Services =~ PCR-43-19
Hold until 4/1/19

Bid2019-250 Turnkey Operation for Printing & Mailing of PCR-44-19 (Sub A)

Water, Sewer & Tax Billing Amend confract award
from $81,213.85 to
$40,112.10. Amend
contract period from
5/2/19-5/1/21 to
5/2/19-5/1/20

Bid2019-252 Rescue Service Billing Administration PCR~45-19 (Sub A)
Amend contract award
from $315,000.00 to
$131,250.00. Amend
contract period from
4/1/19-3/31/22 to
4/1/19-6/30/20

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE

-11-




CODE: 84-799 Water/Capital Improvehnent

SECTION 6-12

Request permission to increase PCR-37-18 (Sub A) from $125,000.00 to $160,000.00

Bid2018-247 Neptune Cold Water Meters

Ti-Sales, Inc.
36 Hudson Rd.
Sudbury, MA 01776

LAST ACTION TAKEN

Award (Bid): PCR-37-18 (Sub A) approved February 22, 2018. Contract period two years from date of
award.

Contract Increase Requested ~ $35,000.00
Current Contract Award $160,000.00

Contract Period Requested No change in contract period
Current Contract Period March 27, 2018 through March 26, 2020

-12-




WARWICK
WATER DIVISION
MEMO

To:  Patricia A. Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: Daniel ORourke, Chief of Water Division - @
Date: March 1, 2019

Subject: Bid #2018-247 Cold Water Meters

As you are aware, the Water Division has an existing
contract, Bid#2018-247 for the purchase of cold water
meters with Ti-Sales Inc. which expires March 26, 2020.
The contfract primarily covers the provision of water meters
for new and existing meters for customers wishing to
purchase “deduct” meters. The City Council awarded a
contract for $125,000 at the February 2018 meeting which
covered the remainder of the 2018 and a portion of the 2019
fiscal years. As of this writing, the Water Division has nearly
depleted its inventory of meters and is in need of an
additional authorization until the expiration of the current
fiscal year.

Therefore, in light of the fact that we have depleted our
inventory and the expected demand in the coming months for
the purchase of deduct meters, I am asking permission to
increase the existing contract from $125,000 to $160,000.
This would represent an increase of $35,000. In order to
accomplish this, I am requesting permission under Section
#6-12 Alteration to Existing Contract of the Warwick Code
of Ordinances to increase the aforementioned contract
previously awarded to Ti-Sales, Inc.

1

-13-




Provided this request is approved by the City Council,
purchases will originate from budget code #84-799. Please
be advised that additional purchases under this contract will
be requested during fiscal year 2020 subject to availability
of funding approved by the Mayor and reviewed by the City
Council.

If you have any questions or need additional information,
please contact me at extension 9734.

® Page 2
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CODE: 65-250 Automotive /Mechanical Parts $10,000.00
65-314 Automotive/Equipment Repair $5,000.00

SECTION 6-12

Request permission to increase PCR-62-19
from $20,000.00 to $35,000.00.

Bid2020-019 Hydraulic Parts & Repairs
Tri-Power Sales & Service, Inc.

64 Minnesota Ave.
Warwick, RI 02886

LAST ACTION TAKEN

Award (Bid): PCR-62-19 approved June 24, 2019 in the amount of $20,000.00. Contract period July
1,2019 — June 30, 2020.

Contract Increase Requested $15,000.00

Current Contract Award $20,000.00

Contract Period Requested No change in term

Current Contract Period July 1, 2019 — June 30, 2020

-1 5._



CITY OF WARWICK 0;1 1 5 ? o JOSEPH J. SOLOMON

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS MAYOR
925 SANDY LANE
WARWICK, RI 02883 MATHEW J. SOLITRO
TEL. 401-738-2003 DIRECTOR

FAX 401-732-5208

To:  Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: Mathew Solitro, Director of Public Work§ v
Date: January 15, 2020

Re:  Bid2020-019 Hydraulic Parts & Repairs

The above bid was awarded by the City Council in the amount of $20,000 to Tri Power Sales & Service,
Inc. for hydraulic parts and repairs for City vehicles and equipment. This department has nearly
exhausted that amount and is requesting an increase on the bid cap. The majority of the vehicles and
equipment that is serviced by the Automotive Division has miscellaneous hydraulic components on board
that require repairs. This bid does not expire until June 30, 2020.

Please consider this memo a request for Sec. 6-12, alteration to contract, of the City Charter to increase
the cap on the above bid in the amount of $15,000, for a total cap of $35,000.

(66-250 - $10,000)
(65-314 - $5,000)

-16-




PCR-62-19 COPY

CITY OF WARWICK
STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS
RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

R-19-85
NO:
APPROVED: /z/)ﬁ 0 \,/‘;44’1/ MAYOR
(LA 4 L b

pDATE!_Jinl Y 20/9

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of
Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on
purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following

bid(s):
- Bid Vendor(s) Contract Contract Fiscal
4 Name Name/Address Award | Period | \°te| Code| year
2020 |  Hydraulic Parts Tri Power Sales & 711119
- ’ -
- B 4 Nemmerpta fve, | S2000000 | - 2020
P Warwick, RI 02886

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest
responsible bidder.

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE

-17-




Bid2020-019 Hydraulic Parts & Repairs

e 2 bids received
CODE: 65-314 Automotive/Equipment Repair

MANNER OF AWARD:  $20,000.00
July 1, 2019 — June 30, 2020

RECOMMEND: Tri-Power Sales & Service, Inc.

COPY

FY2020

Tri-Power Sales & Service, Inc.
64 Minnesota Ave.
Warwick, RI 02886

Lawson Products, Inc.
8770 W. Bryn Mawr Ave., Ste. 900
Chicago, IL 60631

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page
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Bid2020-019 Hydraulic Parts & Repairs

COPY

BID RESULTS
TRI-POWER LAWSON (see note 1)
Item .. Bid Price Bid Price
4 Description Brand % off Brand % off
1. | Hydraulic pump, . ‘
Muncie or equivalent Muncie 20-30 Enerpac 52
Hydraulic or Air
Valves, Muncie, Muncie,
2. Hydrastar, Parker or Hydrastar,Cross 20-30 Gates,Eaton 52
equivalent
Hydraulic Hoses and
3. Fittings, Gates brand Gates 50 Gates,Eaton 52
Hydraulic Adapters, Gates,Brennan,
4. Gates or equivalent Dixon 50 Gates,Eaton,Brennan 52
Cables and controls, . .
5. Gates or equivalent Buyers 20 No bid No bid
6. |Electric/Hydraulic Monarch 20 No bid No bid
Pump, Monarch
7. | Absorbent pads No bid No bid Spilfyter 17
8. | Absorbent booms No bid No bid Spilfyter 17
9. | Replacement parts for:
a. Muncie Muncie 20 No bid No bid
b. Greson Greson 20 No bid No bid
c. Commercial Commercial 20 No bid No bid
d. Hydrastar Hydrastar 20 No bid No bid
e. Vickers Vickers 20 No bid No bid
f. Sundstrand Sundstrand 20 No bid No bid
Central Grease/Auto
Grease System . . .
10. Replacement Parts, Lincoln 20 No bid No bid
Lincoln brand
Ih,abor Ra‘Ees per . $60.00 _ N/A
our/repairs
Provide parts 24/7
when necessary in - Yes - No
emergency situations
Note
1. Deviations/Alternate Equivalents: Lawson does not provide repairs to hydraulic pumps

or valves. Lawson does have an Engineering Hotline. Lawson cannot supply parts 24/7,
but can provide overnight-expedited shipping for an additional cost.

-19-
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COPY

CITY OF WARWICK JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS MAYOR
925 SANDY LANE
WARWICK, Rf 02889 MATHEW J. SOLITRO
TEL. 401-738-2003 DIRECTOR

FAX 401-732-5208

To:  Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent
From: Mathew Solitro, Director of Public Works MS
Date: April 4,2019

Re:  Bid2020-019 Hydraulic Parts & Repairs

We have reviewed the two bids received on the above recommended award to Tri Power Sales and Service
for the purchase of hydraulic parts and hydraulic repairs. The recommended cap is $20,000.00 for the
contract period. The current contract expires June 30, 2019. The new contract period will be July 1, 2019 to
June 30, 2020.

-21-




CODE: 66-340 Building Maintenance/Service Contracts

DPW ONLY

SECTION 6-12

Request permission to increase PCR-123-19
from $8,800.00 to $9,030.00.

Bid2020-071 Pest Control Services
Griggs & Browne Co., Inc.

175 Niantic Ave.
Providence, RI 02907

LAST ACTION TAKEN

Award (Bid): PCR-123-19 approved September 6, 2019 in the amount of $8,800.00, which included
DPW ($3,600.00), Parks & Rec. ($1,200.00), and Fire ($4,000) Contract period September 1, 2019 —~
August 31, 2020.

Contract Increase Requested $230.00
Current Contract Award $3,600.00 (DPW portion only)
Contract Period Requested No change in term

Current Contract Period Septemb;rzl, 2019 — August 31, 2020




JAN 16 2020

CITY OF WARWICK JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS MAYOR
925 SANDY LANE
WARWICK, RI 02889 MATHEW J. SOLITRO
TEL. 401-738-2003 DIRECTOR

FAX 401-732-5208

To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: Mathew Solitro, Director of Public Works P“,’
Date: January 16, 2020

Subj: Bid2020-071 Pest Control Services

The above bid was awarded by the City Council in the amount of $3,600 for the Public Works portion.
There is an additional building that requires services that was not known at the time that this bid was
advertised. This department is requesting to add services for one additional building to the contract until
its expiration of August 31, 2020. The vendor, Griggs and Browne, has agreed to service the building for
$28.75 per month.

Please consider this memo a request for Sec. 6-12, alteration to contract, of the City Charter to increase
the cap on the above bid in the amount of $230, for a total cap of $3830.00 to service the occupied area
of Holden School.

(66-340 - $230)

-23—-




COPY

PCR-123-19

CITY OF WARWICK
STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS
RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

R-19-112

, ///\[44«*%/—\ MAYOR
DAry M é', C’lﬂ/ G

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of
Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on
purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following
bid(s): ‘

NO:

APPROVED:

Bid Vendor(s) Contract | Contract
# Name Name/Address Award Period Note | Code
2020 Griggs & Browne Co., 9/1/2019
0:/1 Pest Controls Services 175 Niantic Ave. $8,800.00 o3 1/-2020
Providence, RI 02907

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest
responsible bidder.

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE

-24-




Bid2020-071 Pest Control Services C 0 PY

e 3 bids received

CODE: 66-340 Building Maintenance/Service Contracts $3,600.00
45-331 Parks & Recreations/Building Maintenance $1,200.00
35-340 Fire/Service Contracts $4,000.00

MANNER OF AWARD:  $8,800.00
September 1, 2019 — August 31, 2020

RECOMMEND: Griggs & Browne Co., Inc.

Griggs & Browne Co., Inc.
175 Niantic Ave.
Providence, RI 02907

Big Blue Bug Solutions
161 O’Connell St.
Providence, RI 02905

Citron Hygiene

13 Linnell Circle
Billerica, MA 01821

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page
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CITY OF WARWICK

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
925 SANDY LANE
WARWICK, R1 02889
TEL. 401-738-2003
FAX 401-732-5208

To:  Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent
From: Mathew Solitro, Director of Public Works I\Bb
Date: July 17, 2019

Subj: Bid2020-071 Pest Control Services

JuL 19 201

JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
MAYOR

MATHEW J. SOLITRO
DIRECTOR

We have reviewed the three bids submitted and recommend award to Griggs and Browne Co., Inc. as the
overall lowest responsible bidder with a recommended cap of $3600.00 for pest control. The current bid
expires on August 31, 2019. The new contract period is September 1, 2019 to August 31, 2020. The

recommendation is for Public Works portion only.
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JOSEPH J. SOLOMON

James E. Scott
MAYOR

DIRECTOR OF PARKS & OIS
RECREATION

CITY OF WARWICK
DEPARTMENT OF PARKS AND RECREATION
885 SANDY LANE » WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02889
TEL (401) 921-9623 » FAX (401) 732-5208

To: Pat Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: James Scott, Director of Parks and Recreation@

Date: 1 August 2019

Re: Bid 2020-071 Pest Control Services

We have reviewed the three bids submitted and recommend awarding the bid to Griggs and Brown,
the lowest bidder, for pest control services in City buildings in the Parks and Recreation Department.

The current bid expires on August 31, 2019. The new contract period will be September 1, 2019 to
August 31, 2020. The recommended cap is $1200.00.
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JuL 23 2088

Office: (401) 468-4044

féﬁ Jason Umbenhauer
N Assistant Chief Fax: (401) 468-4043

Warwick Fire Department
111 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886

July 22,2019

Patricia Peshka

Purchasing Agent

City of Warwick

The bid for Pest Control Services, Bid#2020-071 has been carefully reviewed by the Fire Department.
Three (3) vendors submitted bids, and after evaluating pricing the following vendor has met all the
specifications outlined in our request and have proposed the lowest price. Therefore, I recommend the

bid be awarded to the following vendor:

Griges & Brown, Providence, RI

The Fire Department has 10 buildings that require monthly pest control. The proposed yearly total for
monthly treatments of all 10 buildings from this vendor was $3,450 per year. The Fire Department also
is requesting an additional $550 as a contingency for as-needed treatment for pests that may not be
covered by this monthly service.

Funding for this service will be from budget code 35-340 Service Contracts.

The current bid expires on 8/31/19 and, if approved, the new bid will have an effective date of 9/1/2019
through 8/31/2020, for an amount not to exceed $4,000.

Please contact me should you have any questions.
Jason Umbenhauer
Assistant Chief

Email: Jason.Umberdquer@warwickri.com




Bid2020-206 Inspection of the Lincoln Avenue Transmission Main

e 2 bids received

CODE: 84-799 Water Department/Capital Improvement
MANNER OF AWARD:  $241,250.00

One time purchase
RECOMMEND: R.P. Iannuccillo & Sons Construction Co.

R.P. Iannuccillo & Sons Construction Co.
70 Calverly Street
Providence, RI 02908

Dewecon Inc.
PO Box 439
Basking Ridge, NJ 07920

Pricing as follows

Continued next page
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DANIEL P. O'ROURKE JOSEPH J. SOLOMON

DIVISION CHIEF MAYOR
MICHAEL S. ST. PIERRE
BUSINESS MANAGER/
FINANCIAL ANALYST
CITY OF WARWICK
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
DIVISION OF WATER
935 SANDY LANE » WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02889
Tel (401) 738-2008 + Fax (401) 732-0616

January 13, 2020
To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent %
From: Daniel O’Rourke, Chief of Water Division \

Subject: Bid # 2020 — 206 Inspection of Lincoln Avenue Transmission Line

As you are aware, the Water Division went out to bid for the inspection on one of our major
transmission mains in the past few months. The purpose of this work is to provide a comprehensive
condition assessment of approximately 2,250 feet of 24 and 30-inch cast iron pipe (CIP) and ductile iron
pipe (DIP) transmission main utilizing what is known as the SAHARA PLATFORM. This technology
detects acoustic activity associated with leaks or pockets of trapped air and potential structural defects
via CCTV in pressurized water pipelines of all types of construction types and materials.

What makes this unique from other systems? The system is inserted into a live pipeline through a series
of live “taps” with a minimum diameter of 2-inches using the insertion assembly. The sensor is
propelled by the water flow using a “drag chute” that carries the sensor head through the pipe for
distances up to 6,000 feet per insertion as the data cable is unrolled from the cable drum. Leaks can

be detected as small as 0.01 gallons per minute under pressure conditions.

In order to accomplish this goal, the Water Division is seeking to hire a general contractor who will
provide the required excavation and water work on the transmission main and utilizing the specified
SAHARA PLATFORM. Bid specifications were mailed and/or emailed to twelve contractors seeking
bid proposals. Only two contractors responded to this request. Bid prices ranged from $241,250.00 to
$383,080.00. In addition, depending on whether the Water division would recommend the deduct
alternatives, the bid prices would be reduced to a range of $191,250.00 to 325,395.00.

The Water Division retained our engineering consultant Stantec Consulting Services, Inc. to prepare bid
specifications and review the proposals received through a competitive bid process. It is the collective
opinion of our consultant our staff that RP Iannucillo and Sons Construction Company has submitted a
properly executed low bid pursuant to the bid specifications. For your information, this company has
been in business for over 35 years and is in good standing. They are known for their work in
underground utilities, specifically rehabilitation and construction of water and wastewater infrastructure.
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In addition, a check of some local references revealed that they have successfully performed various
water and sewer projects, including such specific services as live large water main tapping, televising of
water mains and deep sensitive excavations. In fact, the Providence Water Supply Board and the
Warwick Sewer Authority have recently utilized this company and have deemed them highly competent,
reliable, and professional on similar projects.

I have attached a bid tabulation completed by our engineering consultant detailing the various work
items and specific pricing. As you will observe, there are various bid alternatives which we included,
which depending on the status of the 102” line either being in service will allow us to eliminate some of
the exploratory excavation and televising. In short, if the transmission main has normal flow and
pressure, it would allow us to eliminate a portion of the full scope of work. As of this writing, the lower
portion of the 102” Providence Water Supply Board aqueduct will not be restored until mid-March, thus
necessitating the need for all entry points into the live water main.

Therefore, in light of our extensive review of the proposals, I am recommending the bid be awarded to
RP Jannuccillo and Sons Construction Company for an amount not to exceed $241,250.00. This is a
one-time purchase which will originate from budget code #84-799.

If you have any questions or need additional clarification, please contact me at extension 9734.

Cc:  Mathew Solitro — Director of Public Works
Terry Dipetrillo — Water Division Program Manager
Michael St. Pierre ~ Water Division Business Manager
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Bib 2020-206 inspection of the tincoln Avenue Transmission Main

City of Warwick
BID TABULATION
BID OPENING: November 8, 2019 AT 11:00 AM
R.P. lannuccillo & Sons Construction Co. Dewcon Inc.
70 Calverly St. PO Box 439
Providence, Rl 02908 Basking Ridge, NH 07920
Engineer's 401-640-9443 908-835-5710
No, item of Work Qty Units|  $ PerUnit Total $ Per Unit Total $ Per Unit Total
1 Yelevising of Lincoln Avenue 2250 LF |$S 4300 $  96,750.00($ 94.00 $ 211,500.00 | § 131.00 §  294,750.00
2 Traffie Control and Barriers 1 s S 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 4,500,00 $ 4,500.00 | § 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
3 Police Altowance 1 1S {$ 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 § 2,500.00| $ 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00
4 Testing Allowance 1 s §s 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | § 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00
5 Earth Excavation Below Grade 10 cY | 5000 $ 500.00{ $ 25.00 $ 250,00 { $ 100.00 § 1,000.00
6 Gravel Borrow 10 cr |$ 4500 § 450.00 { § 50.00 $ 500.00 § § 40,00 § 400.00
7 Crushed Stone 10 Y {s 40.00 § 400.00 { $ 5000 $ 500.00 | $ 40.00 $ 400.00
8 Rock Excavation 10 oY {$ 10000 $ 1,000.00 | § 15000 $ 1,500.00| § 100 $ 10.00
9 Explaratory Excavation 6 EA | S 9,750.00 $ 58,500.00 | § 2,500.00 $ 15,000.00 | $  13,000.00 § 78,000.00
A, ESTIMATED TOTAL 8ID PRICE $ 170,100.00 $ 241,250.00 $ 383,060.00
B. Reduction of Televising 300 LF $ 3400 $ 10,200.00 | $ 13000 S 39,000.00} $ 4375 § 13,125.00
Reduction of Exploratory Excavation 3 EA $ 8,500.00 $ 25,500.00 | § 2,000.00 $ 500000|$ 13,000.00 $  39,000.00
D. R | of Testing All e 118 $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | § 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00
TOTAL BID PRICE MINUS ALTERANTIVES $ 129,400.00 $ 191,250.00 $ 32593500
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Bid2020-249A City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel
& Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

e 4 bids received DPW ONLY

CODE: 65-220 Automotive—Gasoline

MANNER OF AWARD:  $850,000.00
April 10,2020 - April 9, 2021

RECOMMEND: Dennis K. Burke, Inc.

Roberts Energy, LLC
237 Albany St.
Springfield, MA 01104

Dennis K. Burke, Inc.
555 Constitution Dr.
Taunton, MA 02780

Sprague Operating Resources, LLC
185 International Dr.
Portsmouth, NH 03801

Santa Buckley Energy, Inc.
154 Admiral St.
Bridgeport, CT 06605

Pricing as follows

Continued next page a1




Bid2020-249 City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

RESULTS
. Sprague Santa
ITEM#| DESCRIPTION Enf:g';er& c Blzl er‘;{‘;‘slllf; Operating Buckley
’ > | Resources, LLC | Energy, Inc.
1 Unleaded
FIRE
POLICE
DPW 0.04 0.0372 0.0894 0.1545
SEWER 0.24 0.2092
2 Plus Unleaded
FIRE
POLICE 0.035 0.0692 0.0509 0.125
DPW
SEWER
3 Winter Diesel
FIRE 0.1492
POLICE
DPW 0.0372 0.0399
SEWER 0.2392
4 New Ultra Diesel
FIRE 0.24 0.1492
POLICE
DPW 0.04 0.0372 0.0654 0.1175
SEWER 0.2392
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JAN 15 2020

CITY OF WARWICK JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS MAYOR
925 SANDY LANE
WARWICK, RI 02889 MATHEW J. SOLITRO
TEL. 401-738-2003 DIRECTOR

FAX 401-732-5208

To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: Mathew Solitro, Public Works Director M’

Date: January 15, 2020

Subj:  Bid2020-249 City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel, Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

We have reviewed the four bids submitted for the above and recommend award to Dennis K. Burke, Inc.
for the delivery of unleaded and diesel fuel for the Public Works Department. This vendor offered the
lowest increment over the daily posted price, making them the lowest bidder. This request is only for the
Department of Public Works.

The current bid expires on April 9, 2020. The new contract period will be April 10, 2020 to April 9, 2021.
The recommended cap is $850,000.00 for a one-year period.

(Code 65-220 - $850,000)
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Bid2020-249B City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel
& Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

e 4 bids received POLICE ONLY

CODE: 30-220 Police Department—Gasoline

MANNER OF AWARD:  $320,000.00
April 10, 2020 — April 9, 2021

RECOMMEND: Roberts Energy, LLC

Roberts Energy, LLC
237 Albany St.
Springfield, MA 01104

Dennis K. Burke, Inc.
555 Constitution Dr.
Taunton, MA 02780

Sprague Operating Resources, LLC
185 International Dr.
Portsmouth, NH 03801

Santa Buckley Energy, Inc.
154 Admiral St.
Bridgeport, CT 06605

Pricing as follows

Continued next page
—-45-



Bid2020-249 City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

RESULTS
. Sprague Santa
ITEM #| DESCRIPTION E;;’gby“& c 1:1 ‘:{‘Z‘slﬁ Operating Buckley
’ > | Resources, LLC | Energy, Inc.
1 Unleaded
FIRE
POLICE
DPW 0.04 0.0372 0.08%4 0.1545
SEWER 0.24 0.2092
2 Plus Unleaded
FIRE
POLICE 0.035 0.0692 0.0509 0.125
DPW
SEWER
3 Winter Diesel
FIRE 0.1492
POLICE
DPW 0.0372 0.0399
SEWER 0.2392
4 New Ultra Diesel
FIRE 0.24 0.1492
POLICE
DPW 0.04 0.0372 0.0654 0.1175
SEWER 0.2392
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CITY OF WARWICK
Colonel Rick J. Rathbun
Chief of Police

Joseph J. Solomon
Mayor

JAN 16 29

Police Department
99 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617
Telephone: (401) 468-4200
January 16, 2020

Mrs. Patricia A. Peshka, Purchasing Agent
Warwick City Hall

3275 Post Road

Warwick, Rl 02886

Re: Bid # 2020-249 Gasoline and Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel
Dear Mrs. Peshka,
The department has reviewed the four (4) bids received for Bid # 2020-249 Gasoline.

Per the recommended octane requirements for our police vehicle fleet as established by the Ford Motor
Vehicle Company, the police department’s bids are for unleaded-plus gasoline only.

The vendors who submitted qualified bid responses for the police depar’tmen"c included:

Robert's Energy LLC, 237 Albany Street, Springfield, MA 01105

Sprague Operating Resources LLC, 185 International Drive, Portsmouth, NH 03801
Santa Buckley Energy Inc. 154 Admiral Street, Bridgeport, CT 06604

Dennis K. Burke, Inc., 284 Eastern Avenue, Chelsea, MA 02150

Based on the bids submitted, the Department recommends awarding the bid to the lowest qualified bidder

which is Roberts Energy, LLC of Springfield, MA who bid at plus .035 cents per gallon calculated from the

lowest daily terminal unbranded gasoline low rack price with nonexempt taxes included prior to their added
markup.

The current contract in place expires on April 9, 2020.

Funding for purchases under this bid would be allocated from the department’s current operating budget, code
#30-220 “Gasoline.”

The department requests authorization to expend funds not to exceed $320,000.00 during the term of contract,
which is for one (1) year from April 10, 2020 thru April 9, 2021.

Respectfully,

S I C"/(_('u (e s

jor Lori Michailides
dministrative Bureau Commander
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Bid2020-249C City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel
& Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

e 4 bids received

CODE:

MANNER OF AWARD:

RECOMMEND:

FIRE ONLY

35-221 Fire Department-Diesel Fuel

$148,000.00
April 10, 2020 — April 9, 2021

Dennis K. Burke, Inc.

Continued next page

Roberts Energy, LLC
237 Albany St.
Springfield, MA 01104

Dennis K. Burke, Inc.
555 Constitution Dr.
Taunton, MA 02780

Sprague Operating Resources, LLC
185 International Dr.
Portsmouth, NH 03801

Santa Buckley Energy, Inc.
154 Admiral St.
Bridgeport, CT 06605

Pricing as follows
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Bid2020-249 City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

RESULTS
. Sprague Santa
ITEM#| DESCRIPTION Enﬁ"g‘;‘”& c 1;:1 ‘:{‘L‘SII; Operating Buckley
’ > | Resources, LLC | Energy, Inc.
1 Unleaded
FIRE
POLICE
DPW 0.04 0.0372 0.0894 0.1545
SEWER 0.24 0.2092
2 Plus Unleaded
FIRE
POLICE 0.035 0.0692 0.0509 0.125
DPW
SEWER
3 Winter Diesel
FIRE 0.1492
POLICE
DPW 0.0372 0.0399
SEWER 0.2392
4 New Ultra Diesel
FIRE 0.24 0.1492
POLICE
DPW 0.04 0.0372 0.0654 0.1175
SEWER 0.2392
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Jason Umbenhauer
Assistant Chief

Office: (401) 468-4044
Fax: (401) 468-4043

JAN 1§ 2020

Warwick Fire Department
111 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886

January 16, 2020

Patricia Peshka
Purchasing Agent
City of Warwick

The bid for City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel & Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel,
Bid#2020-249 has been carefully reviewed by the Fire Department.

Four (4) vendors submitted bids, with only two (2) of the vendors submitting bids for Ultra Low Sulfur
Diesel for the Fire Department. After evaluating pricing, the following vendor has met all the
specifications outlined in our request and have proposed the lowest price. Therefore, I recommend the
bid be awarded to the following vendor for Item #4 fire Department Only.

Dennis K. Burke, Taunton MA

Dennis K. Burke submitted a bid price of $0.1492 increment over the daily unbranded low rack price,
based on the Oil Price Daily provided by Oil Price Information Service (OPIS) Port of Providence.
Funding for this service will be from budget code 35-221 Diesel Fuel.

The current bid expires on 4/9/2020 and, if approved, the new bid will have an effective date of
4/10/2020 through 4/9/2021, for an amount not to exceed $148,000. Of these budgeted funds, $37,00
will come from FY20 and $111,000 will come from FY21 based on previous years usage.

Please contact me should you have any questions.

il

Jason Umbenhauer
Assistant Chief

Email: Jason. Umbenhauer@warwickri.com
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Bid2020-251 Healthcare Dependent Eligibility Audit

e 2 bids received

CODE: 18-400 Finance Administration—Contingency

MANNER OF AWARD: $19,850.00
One year from date of award

RECOMMEND: Part D Advisors, Inc.

Mercer
99 High Street
Boston, MA 02110

Part D Advisors, Inc.
17199 N Laurel Park Drive, Suite 400

Livonia, MI 48152
Mercer Part D Advisors,
Inc.

Cost for this services as outlined in this
RFP Lump Sum Amount for Audit $22,000.00 $19,850.00
Any Additional Costs

None None
Total Cost

$22,000.00 $19,850.00
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JAN 10 2020

Jean Bouchard Joseph J. Solomon
Personnel Director Mayor
CITY OF WARWICK
D IVISION OF PERSONNEL
3275 POST ROAD - WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
Tel (401) 738-2011 ~ Fax (401) 732-7636
T.D.D. (401) 739-9150
TO: Honorable City Council

FROM: Jean Bouchard, Director of Personnel
DATE: January 11,2020
SUBJECT: Healthcare Dependent Eligibility Audit Bid 2020-251

As you are aware, the City recently went out to bid for a Healthcare Dependent Eligibility Audit. This is a new
bid and the RFP is to contract a Health Care Consultant to perform an audit on all employees and retiree’s to
obtain information about any ineligible dependent participants on the City’s Health Care plan. The original bid
2020-184 had to be re-bid because after the bid was opened and reviewed it was determined that none of the
bidders met the specifications. Therefore those bids were rejected and the RFP was revised and resent to
purchasing to advertise with the new specifications.

The Healthcare Dependent Eligibility Audit will verify the eligibility of all employee and retiree dependents
covered by the City’s healthcare plans, The consultant will provide all necessary notices to employees,
document verification, and a live call center available to provide assistance to employees in the verification
process. The average eligibility audit achieve a minimum 2% of ineligible dependents which should produce
savings to the City that exceeds the cost of this contract. As shown below, the City received two (2) proposals
for the RFP 2020-251 Healthcare Dependent Eligibility Audit and their bids are listed below along with the
Scope of the consulting services.

Bidders Part D Advisors, Mercer Health & Benefits LL.C,
Livonia, Michigan Boston, MA.,

Primary Service Center located
in Urbandale, Yowa, Back office

Support Gurgaon, India or
Noida, India.
Cost of Services $19,850 — All-inclusive fee $22,000 — This is not an-inclusive
includes postage and printing costs | fee, Additional costs will be
charged.

Recommendation of Healthcare Dependent Eligibility Audit Consultant RFP 2020-251
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Jean Bouchard Joseph J. Solomon
Personnel Director Mayor

The two bidders that responded include Part D Advisors, and Mercer Health & Benefits LLC, both submitted
responsive, competitive offers to provide the level of services that the City requires to obtain dependent
eligibility audit of active and retired employees.

Both bids were reviewed by William DePasquale, Chief of Staff, Brian Silvia, Finance Director and Jean
Bouchard, Personnel Director. After reviewing the qualifications of the two proposals for the Healthcare
Dependent Eligibility Audit Consultant the recommendation of the review committee is to award the contract to
Part D Advisors, of Livonia, Michigan, for $19,850 because they were the lowest qualified bidder based on the
evaluation scoring. Part D Advisors submitted a bid which is all-inclusive of all costs and they have over 27
years of experience in health benefits verification. They have conducted healthcare dependent eligibility audits
since 1993 to many municipalities throughout the country. Part D Advisors team consists of thirty staffers in
their Livonia, MI office and they do not use subcontractors in the verification process. All audit activity takes
place in their corporate office in Livonia, Michigan. Our reference check indicated exceptional services
working with their clients in completing the verification process with excellent reviews for their
professionalism, and accomplishing the audit.

Both bidders may adjust fees for a change in the number of dependents to be audited if the number of family
plans varies by more than their allowable overage percentage. Part D Advisors will charge additional for a
change in the dependents to be audited if the number varies by 5%. If the overage is under 5% than there are no
additional charges. The cost for over the 5% is $24.00 for each plan over the 818. Mercer will adjust fees as
necessary for the number of dependents to be audited if it varies by more than 10% but did not disclose the cost.
We do not anticipate the number of plans to change by 5%. As of January 1, 2020 we have 819 family plans for
active and retired. So we do not anticipate any additional fees.

Mercer Health & Benefits LLC cost is not all-inclusive. In their bid they list many additional pass through costs
over and above their quoted base bid amount of $22,000. Some additional costs that stand out that are
substantial include the cost of postage for the mailing which is not part of their base contract cost. Mercer will
charge for the postage used throughout the project on a monthly basis. Additional communications and/or
increase frequency may be accommodated at an additional cost of $1.50/letter plus postage. They can also
charge additional fees for any need of corrections of data, or need for other communications. Mercer’s hourly
charge is $200.00 an hour. If data is not in a specific electronic format additional fees will be charged on a
pass-through basis for eligibility files that require manipulation. Although they have done work locally in
Rhode Island for both the City of Providence and the Town of Coventry School System their back office
support such as document review and data processing will occur in Mercer offices in Gurgaon, India or Noida,
India. The Bid did not include estimates of the additional costs.

Recommendation of Healthcare Dependent Eligibility Audit Consultant RFP 2020-251
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Jean Bouchard

Personnel Director
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Joseph J. Solomon

Mayor

The minimum qualifications the Bidders should have based of the RFP for experience of the Firm and
Consultants are listed in the table below:

Bidder Firm should Firm should have at Consultant should | Consultant should
have a minimum | least 5 years of have a minimum have a minimum of 5
10 Years’ experience in consulting | with a minimum of | years’ experience as a
experience in for a minimum of 3 ten years’ health consulting with
health consulting | municipalities in the experience in health | resumes of principal
regions of R. I, MA, & | consulting consultants & list of
CT ftristate area engagement where
services were provided
Part D Advisors | yes no yes yes
Mercer Health | yes yes with two R. L. yes yes
& Benefits LLC municipalities’ with
City of Providence and
Town of Coventry
Schools.

The evaluation for each responder was ranked on five evaluation components which are the Cost, Experience of
the Principal, Project Understanding and Technical Approach, Stability of the firm, Other Qualifications/Live
call center. The percentage weights of the evaluation are listed in the table below based on their reasoning

above:
Bidder Cost | Experience of | Project Stability of | Other Totals
30% | Principals Understanding | the Firm | Qualifications/
20% &Technical 15% Live Call Center
Approach 20% 15%

Part D Advisors |30% |15% 20% 15% 15% 95%
Mercer Health | 20%* | 20% 20% 15% 15% 90%
& Benefits LLC

*Note: Extra Fee structure

Based the evaluation criteria, and the weight of the components the lowest qualified bidder that
meets the needs of the City being recommended is Part D Advisors for a one year contract in the
amount of $19,850. The term contract will begin at the time of award up to the selection and final

Recommendation of Healthcare Dependent Eligibility Audit Consultant RFP 2020-251
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Jean Bouchard Joseph J. Solomon
Personnel Director Mayor

approval of the Healthcare Dependent Eligibility Audit Consultants by the City Council until
completion of the audit and all required work required in the proposal is performed and the project
and the reports are finalized. The term of the contract is one year.

The current amount budgeted for this cost in F/Y 20 is $30,000 and the budget code is 18-400: Finance
Administration/Contingency 18-400. If you have any questions, please call or email me
(jean.m.bouchard@warwickri.com).

Respectfully Submitted,

L Rewded

Jean Louchard

Recommendation of Healthcare Dependent Eligibility Audit Consultant RFP 2020-251
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