

Bid2020-293 Janitorial & Cleaning Supplies

- 12 bids received

CODE: 45-281 Parks & Rec./Maintenance Materials

MANNER OF AWARD: \$15,000.00
June 25, 2020 – June 24, 2021

RECOMMEND: Banner Systems
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.

Banner Systems	135 Elliot St.	Brockton, MA 02302
Casey EMI	8 Panas Rd.	Foxboro, MA 02035
MSC Industrial	40 Albion Rd.	Lincoln, RI 02865
C&C Janitorial Supplies	665 New Britain Ave.	Newington, CT 06111
Pyramid School Products	6510 North 54 th St.	Tampa, FL 33610
W.B. Mason Co., Inc.	99 Bald Hill Rd.	Cranston, RI 02920
Bob Arnold Imperial Bag & Paper Co., LLC Burke Supply Division	255 Route 1 & 9	Jersey City, NJ 07306
Central Poly Bag Corp.	2400 Bedle Pl.	Linden, NJ 07036
Fordion Packaging Ltd.	637 Wyckoff Ave. Suite 335	Wyckoff, NJ 07481
All American Poly	40 Turner Place	Piscataway, NJ 08854
Glopak Corporation	132 Case Dr.	South Plainfield, NJ 07080
Interboro Packaging	114 Bracken Rd.	Montgomery, NY 12549

Pricing as follows

Continued next page

Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Banner Unit Price	Casey Unit Price	MSC Industrial Unit Price	C&C Janitorial Unit Price	Pyramid Unit Price	WB Mason Unit Price
1	Renature Brown Roll Towel, 2" core, 7.87"x350', 12/cs	case	\$13.82	\$25.33	\$50.29	\$28.13	No Bid	\$12.99
2	Non-para Urinal Screen, Evergreen	each	\$25.75/dozen	\$1.68	\$34.21	\$2.41	\$0.39 each (50/cs)	\$0.73
3	Clorox Mold/Mildew Remover plus Tiles, 16 oz. trigger sprayer, 12/cs	case	\$28.77	\$45.96	\$52.22	\$47.92	\$39.98	\$35.24
4	Fabuloso All-Purpose cleaner, Ocean Cool Scent, 1 gal., 4/cs.	case	\$42.75	\$28.60	\$59.39	\$44.22	\$64.98	\$53.40
5	Janico Large Looped End Wet Mop, green, 4 ply, 5" headband	each	\$4.86	\$4.50	\$10.23	\$12.30	\$4.89 each (12/cs)	\$2.44
6	Linar 10"x10" recycled terry towels, 50lb box	box	\$111.55	\$128.45	No Bid	\$93.52	No Bid	No Bid
7	Beta 38x58 XH Black Liner, 1.5 mil, 55 gal, 100/cs	case	\$19.55	\$29.80	\$75.37	\$32.41	No Bid	\$19.66
8	Marcal Brown Multifold Towels, 4000/cs, 16 packs of 250 towels	case	\$14.14	\$17.76	\$16.84	\$25.78	No Bid	\$12.98
9	Bay Lotion Pink Hand Soap, 1 gal., 4/cs	case	\$22.75	\$36.44	\$20.86	\$39.95	\$42.98	\$14.98
10	Drano Clog Remover Liquid Drain Cleaner, 32oz. Bottles, 12/cs	case	\$53.97	\$36.60	\$13.38	\$39.57	No Bid	\$24.93
11	Solaris Livi Jumbo 2-ply Bath Tissue, 1000' Rolls, 12/cs	case	\$21.25	\$28.95	\$102.35	\$38.94	No Bid	\$17.09
12	Solaris Nvi LoCor 2-ply Bath Tissue, 1000 sheets, 30/cs	case	\$38.85	No Bid	\$18.90	\$66.30	No Bid	\$31.12
13	Spartan TB-Cide Cleaner, Deodorizer and Disinfectant, Lemon Scent, 32oz Trigger, 12/cs	case	\$33.10	\$46.80	\$89.98	\$48.96	No Bid	\$22.67
14	Windex Glass Cleaner, 32oz, Trigger-Sprayer, 12/cs	case	\$42.69	\$37.68	\$7.50	\$25.08	\$59.98	\$23.20
15	Janico 30" Straight Floor Squeegee	each	\$18.50	No Bid	\$45.11	\$39.83	\$7.99 each (6/cs)	No Bid
16	Pearly Bay Lotion Soap, 1 gal. 4/cs/	case	\$29.75	No Bid	\$17.04	\$42.12	No Bid	\$15.64
17	Janico 60" Tapered Wood Broom Handle	each	\$3.99	\$4.27	\$9.18	\$5.21	\$2.79 each (12/cs)	\$2.80
18	Spartan Consume Cleaner, Odor Eliminator, Stain Remover, Drain Maintainer, 32oz Flip Cap, 12/cs	case	\$30.75	\$45.12	\$72.09	No Bid	No Bid	\$30.40
19	Von Drebble Preserve White Rolls	case	\$38.85	No Bid	\$100.01	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.26
20	Clorox Toilet Bowl Cleaner with Bleach	each	\$23.75	No Bid	\$4.31	\$38.98	No Bid	\$1.61
21	Compact Cordless 2-ply Bathroom Tissue	case	\$36.68	\$52.20	\$97.39	\$59.01	No Bid	\$41.53
22	Emotion High Capacity White Roll Towels	case	\$38.50	No Bid	\$123.78	\$73.92	No Bid	\$48.27
23	Beta 30x36 Black Liners, 1 mil series, 55gal, 100/cs	case	\$14.80	\$31.31	\$65.76	\$42.84	No Bid	\$22.28
24	Pitt 30x36 black liners, 7 mil, 20-30gal, 500/cs	case	\$16.15	No Bid	\$65.76	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.36
25	Pledge Furniture Polish, Lemon, 9.7oz, Aerosols, 12/cs	case	\$30.98	\$47.52	\$85.19	\$48.17	\$64.98	No Bid
26	High Efficiency Vacuum Bags, 10pk/cs	case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	Pine-Sol Lemon Fresh Multi-Surface Cleaner, 60oz Bottle, 6/cs	case	\$26.50	\$30.80	\$47.66	\$41.37	\$58.95	\$28.52
28	Preference 2-ply embossed bathroom tissue, 550 sheets/roll, 80/cs	case	\$33.70	\$36.12	\$37.89	\$62.16	No Bid	\$27.55
29	Koala Care Bed Liners, 300/cs	case	No Bid	\$56.27	\$61.91	\$78.77	\$49.98	\$33.97
30	Koala Care Plastic Liner Dispenser	each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$94.21	No Bid	No Bid
31	Microflex Diamond Grip Latex Gloves, all sizes, 100/box	box	\$3.81	\$4.05	\$32.48	\$16.15	\$4.29/box (10bx/cs)	\$2.65
32	Scotch Brite Professional Scrub Pads, 6"x9", medium or heavy duty, 10/pk	pack	\$10.75 60/cs	\$7.07	\$9.63	\$18.27	\$2.29/pack (6pk/cs)	\$4.18
33	Comet w/ Bleach Cleaning Powder, 25oz container, cs	case	\$29.75	\$30.11	\$2.94/each	\$37.93	No Bid	\$23.04
34	Pure Bright Liquid Ultra Germicidal Bleach, gallon, 6/cs	case	\$15.33	\$17.40	\$33.70	\$20.35	No Bid	\$11.73
35	Lysol Disinfectant Foam Cleaner, 24oz, 12/cs	case	\$37.55	\$41.40	\$60.70	\$52.77	\$47.98	\$35.76
36	Lysol Disinfectant Spray, Crisp Linen, 19oz, 12/cs	case	\$79.85	\$630.00	\$130.45	\$136.36	\$81.95	\$67.79
37	TimeMist Metered Air Freshener Refills, 12/cs	case	\$91.72	\$59.76	\$91.72	No Bid	\$31.98	No Bid
38	HBR-25 Cotton Rags, 50lb box	box	No Bid	\$106.67	\$161.78	\$57.87	No Bid	\$43.62
39	Simple Green D Pro 3 Plus	gallon	\$69.18/pail	\$10.26	\$115.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Notes: Interboro Packaging
 Item #7 (A) INT-3858-Super Exh \$17.72 (B) INT-3858 EXH \$14.98 (C) INT-3858-XXH \$13.32 (D) INT-3858-XXH \$10.82 (E) INT-3858-X-Hvy \$9.32
 Item #23 (A) INT-3036-XXH \$6.68 (B) INT-3036-X-Hvy \$6.32 (C) INT-3036-Hvy \$5.24 (D) INT-3036-H \$4.48
 Item #24 (A) INT-3037-Reg \$13.24
 Continued next page

Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Imperial Bag Unit Price	Central Poly Unit Price	Fortition Packaging Unit Price	All American Unit Price	Glopak Corp. Unit Price	Interboro Unit Price
1	Renature Brown Roll Towel, 2" core, 7.87"x330', 12/cs	case	\$15.46	\$15.81	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Non-para Urinal Screen, Evergreen	each	\$15.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Clorox Mold/Mildew Remover plus Tiles, 16 oz. trigger sprayer, 12/cs	case	\$29.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Fabuloso All-Purpose cleaner, Ocean Cool Scent, 1 gal., 4/cs.	case	\$18.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Janico Large Looped End Wet Mop, green, 4 ply, 5" headband	each	\$3.43 (Sold in lots of 12 only)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Linnax 10"x10" recycled Terry towels, 50lb box	box	\$37.42 (25lb box)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Beta 38x59 XH Black Liner, 1.5 mil, 55 gal, 100/cs	case	\$18.70	\$17.00	\$16.36	\$14.69	\$15.40	See Note
8	Marcal Brown Multifold Towels, 4000/cs, 16 packs of 250 towels	case	\$15.27	\$15.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Bay Lotion Pink Hand Soap, 1 gal., 4/cs	case	\$20.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Drano Clog Remover Liquid Drain Cleaner, 32oz. Bottles, 12/cs	case	\$36.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Solaris Jumbo 2-ply Bath Tissue, 1000' Rolls, 12/cs	case	\$13.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Solaris Nvl LoCor 2-ply Bath Tissue, 1000 sheets, 36/cs	case	\$36.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Spartan TB-Cide Cleaner, Deodorizer and Disinfectant, Lemon Scent, 32oz Trigger, 12/cs	case	\$29.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Windex Glass Cleaner, 32oz. Trigger Sprayer, 12/cs	case	\$37.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	Janico 30" Straight Floor Squeegee	each	\$8.56	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	Pearly Bay Lotion Soap, 1 gal. 4/cs/	case	\$24.06	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Janico 60" Tapered Wood Broom Handle	each	\$1.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Spartan Consume Cleaner, Odor Eliminator, Stain Remover, Drain Maintainer, 32oz Flip Cap, 12/cs	case	\$31.73	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Yon Drebile Preserve White Rolls	case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	Clorox Toilet Bowl Cleaner with Bleach	each	\$23.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	Compact Coreless 2-ply Bathroom Tissue	case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22	Emmotion High Capacity White Roll Towels	case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	Beta 30/36 Black Liners, 1 mil series, 55gal, 100/cs	case	\$17.83	\$9.20	\$8.32	\$14.81	\$5.04	See Note
24	Pitt 30x36 black liners, 7 mil, 20-30gal, 500/cs	case	\$13.46	\$13.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	See Note
25	Pledge Furniture Polish, Lemon, 9.7oz. Aerosols, 12/cs	case	\$28.06 (19oz)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
26	High Efficiency Vacuum Bags, 10pk/cs	case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	Pine-Sol Lemon Fresh Multi-Surface Cleaner, 60oz Bottle, 6/cs	case	\$25.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
28	Preference 2-ply embossed bathroom tissue, 550 sheets/roll, 80/cs	case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
29	Koala Care Bed Liners, 500/cs	case	\$30.53	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30	Koala Care Plastic Liner Dispenser	each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
31	Microflex Diamond Grip Latex Gloves, all sizes, 100/box	box	\$3.19 (Sold 10/cs only)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
32	Scotch Brite Professional Scrub Pads, 6"x9", medium or heavy duty, 10/pk	pack	\$4.09	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
33	Conet w/ Bleach Cleaning Powder, 25oz container, cs	case	\$37.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
34	Pure Bright Liquid Ultra Germicidal Bleach, gallon, 6/cs	case	\$12.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
35	Lysol Disinfectant Foam Cleaner, 24oz, 12/cs	case	\$41.33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36	Lysol Disinfectant Spray, Crisp Linen, 19oz, 12/cs	case	\$73.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
37	TimeMint Metered Air Freshener Refills, 12/cs	case	\$28.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
38	HBR-23 Cotton Rags, 50lb box	box	\$34.65	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
39	Simple Green D Pro 3 Plus	gallon	\$11.01 (Sold 6/cs only)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

JAMES E. SCOTT
DIRECTOR OF PARKS &
RECREATION



JOSEPH J. SOLOMON
MAYOR

CITY OF WARWICK
DEPARTMENT OF PARKS AND RECREATION
885 SANDY LANE • WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02889
TEL (401) 921-9623 • FAX (401) 732-5208

To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: James E. Scott, Director of Parks & Recreation

JS

Date: March 20, 2020

Subj: BID 2020-093 Janitorial & Cleaning Supplies

We have reviewed the 12 bids received for the above contract and recommend awarding the bid to Banner Systems Inc & WB Mason Co Inc. as the lowest bidders. The current bid expires 6/24/20. The new contract period will run from June 25, 2020 to June 24, 2021. The cap for this bid is \$15,000.00 and will be paid from Maintenance Materials 45-281