PCR-17-18

CITY OF WARWICK
STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

NO:

APPROVED: MAYOR

DATE:

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of
Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on

purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following
bid(s):

Bid Vendor(s) Contract | Contract
# Name Name/Address Award Period Note| Code
Holzberg
2018 Various Portable Communications, Inc. 322118
- . . $6,000,00 -
291 Radio Batteries PO Box 322 3/21/20
Totowa, NI 07511 _

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest
responsible bidder.

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE




Patricia A. Peshka Scott Avedisian

Purchasing Agent Mayor
City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel {401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364
TO: Members of the Finance Committee
FROM: Patricia A. Peshka, Purchasing Agent @?
DATE: January 4, 2018

RE: Bids for the Finance Committee Wednesday, January 21, 2018
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Bid2018-221 Various Portable Radio Batteries

¢ 3 bids submitted

CODE: 30-271 Police/Parts-Communication

MANNER OF AWARD: $6,000.00
March 22, 2018 — March 21, 2020

RECOMMEND: Holzberg Communications, Inc,

Holzberg Communications, Inc.
PO Box 322
Totowa, NJ 07511

Connecticut Radio, Inc.
1208 Cromwell Ave.
Rocky Hill, CT 06067

Batteries Plus Bulbs

999 Fall River Ave.
Seekonk, MA 02771

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page




Bid2018-221 Various Portable Radio Batteries

HOLZBERG COMMUNICATIONS, INC.

| Item | Oty Description List Unit
1 Ea. | Motorola WPNN4013A $90.00 . $39.00
2 | Ea. | Motorola NTN9857C $132.00 $81.00
3 Ea. | Motorola PMNN442AR $117.00 $83.00
4 Ea. | Other Motorola OEM battery List minus | 10%
Other manufacturer OEM battery ..
> Ea. BRAND: Power Products Unltd., Inc. List minus >%
Optional | 3" year at no additional price increase No bid No bid
CONNECTICUT RADIO, INC.
Item | Oty Description List Unit
1 Ea. | Motorola WPNN4013A $90.00 $49.50
2 | Ea. | Motorola NTN9857C $132.00 $95.00
3 Ea. | Motorola PMINN442AR $117.00 $84.20
4 Ea. | Other Motorola OEM battery List minus 28%
5 "1 Ea. | Other manufacturer OEM battery List minus N/A
Optional 3" year at no additional price increase Yes Yes
BATTERIES PLUS BULBS
Item | Oty Description List Unit
1 Ea. | Motorola WPNN4013A $44.00
2 | Ea. | Motorola NTN9857C $92.00
3 Ea. | Motorola PMNN442AR $95.00
4 Ea. | Other Motorola OEM battery List minus No bid
5 Ea. | Other manufacturer OEM battery List minus No bid
Optional | 3" year at no additional price increase No No
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CITY OF WARWICK

Colonel Stephen M. McCartney Scott Avedisian
Chief of Police Mayor
Police Department
99 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617
Telephone: (401} 468-4200
December 21, 2617
Mrs, Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent
Warwick City Hall
© 3275 Post Road
Warwick, RI 02886

Re: Bid # 2018-221 Portable Radio Batteries/Police
Dear Mrs. Peshka,
- - The Police Department has reviewed the three (3) bids submitted for bid # 2018-221, Police Portable Radio Batteries.
Bids were received from the following companies:
Connecticut Radio, Inc. 1208 Cromwell Ave. Rocky Hill, CT 06067
Batteries Plus Bulbs, 999 Fall River Avenue Seekonk MA 02771
Holzberg Communications, P.0O. Box 322 Totowa NJ 07511
The Police Department recommends that the bid be awarded to the lowest qualified bidder for all three items combined,
Holzberg Communications. The department’s communication technician has conducted research into this company, has

spoken to other customers and feels that they will provide us with quality service.

Prices for individual replacement batteries are as follows:

Motorola WPNN4013A............. $39.00
Motorola NTN9857C................ $81.00
Motorola PMNN442AR............. $83.00

Funding for this award, if approved, would be from the Police Department Operating Budget, Budget Code # 30-271 )
for a total not to exceed $6,000.00. This award will be for a two year contract that would be valid from March 22, 2018
thru March 21, 2020.

During the current contract which began in March of 2016 the department expended $3,984.00 on appioximately 86
batteries. Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.

Sincerely,

wwm&*?';z LM W,__

Bradford E. Connor
Major
Administrative Bureau Commander




