

CITY OF WARWICK

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

NO: _____

APPROVED: _____ MAYOR

DATE: _____

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following bid(s):

Bid #	Name	Vendor(s) Name/Address	Contract Award	Contract Period	Note	Code
2018 - 178	Pipe Fittings & Valves	<p><i>Core and Main LP</i> 83 Progress Ave. <u>Springfield, MA 01104</u></p> <p><i>E.J. Prescott, Inc.</i> 38 Albion Rd. <u>Lincoln, RI 02865</u></p> <p><i>Ferguson Waterworks</i> 124 Costello Rd. <u>Newington, CT 06111</u></p> <p><i>John Hoadley and Sons, Inc.</i> 672 Union St. <u>Rockland, MA 02370</u></p> <p><i>Ti-Sales Inc.</i> 36 Hudson Rd. <u>Sudbury, MA 01776</u></p> <p><i>Warwick Winwaterworks</i> PO Box 81062 62 Wyoming Ave. Warwick, RI 02888</p>	\$50,000.00	1/25/18 - 1/24/19	1	

Continued next page

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder.

1. **Core and Main LP:** Items 10o,10p,12g,13g,17g,17h. **E.J. Prescott, Inc.:** Items 1,2a,2c,3,4a,4b,5,6,7d,7e,9e,9h-9o,10b-10n,11b-11f,11h-11k,12c-12f,12h,13a-13c,13e,13f,13h,15f,15h,15i,15n,15o,16b,18a-18i,19a-19m,20a-20j,21a,21c-21n,22a,22b,22e,22f,24d,25b,25d-25f. **Ferguson Waterworks:** Items 8a-8f,11a,11g,14a-14e,17b-17f,19n,19o,21b,23a-23c,23e. **John Hoadley & Sons, Inc.:** Items 2b,7bi,7bii,7biii,14f,17i. **Ti-Sales Inc.:** Items 15a-15e,15g,15j-15m,15p,15q. **Warwick Winwaterworks:** Items 7a,7c,9a-9d,9f,9g,10a,12a,12b,13d,16a,16c-16j,17a,22c,22d,23d,24a-24c,24e,24f,25a,25c,25g.

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE

Bid2018-178 Pipe Fittings & Valves

- 6 Bids submitted

CODES: 84-363 Water/Main Maintenance \$25,000.00
84-364 Water/Hydrant Maintenance \$25,000.00

MANNER OF AWARD: \$50,000.00
January 25, 2018 – January 24, 2019

RECOMMEND: *See below

*

Core and Main LP E.J. Prescott, Inc.	Items 10o, 10p, 12g, 13g, 17g, 17h Items 1, 2a, 2c, 3, 4a, 4b, 5, 6, 7d, 7e, 9e, 9h-9o, 10b-10n, 11b-11f, 11h-11k, 12c-12f, 12h, 13a-13c, 13e, 13f, 13h, 15f, 15h, 15i, 15n, 15o, 16b, 18a-18i, 19a-19m, 20a-20j, 21a, 21c-21n, 22a, 22b, 22e, 22f, 24d,25b, 25d-25f
Ferguson Waterworks	Items 8a-8f, 11a, 11g, 14a-14e, 17b-17f, 19n, 19o, 21b, 23a-23c, 23e
John Hoadley & Sons, Inc.	Items 2b, 7bi, 7bii, 7biii, 14f, 17i
Ti-Sales Inc.	Items 15a-15e, 15g, 15j-15m, 15p, 15q
Warwick Winwaterworks	Items 7a, 7c, 9a-9d, 9f, 9g, 10a, 12a, 12b, 13d, 16a, 16c-16j, 17a, 22c, 22d, 23d, 24a-24c, 24e, 24f, 25a, 25c, 25g

Core and Main LP	83 Progress Ave.	Springfield, MA 01104
E.J. Prescott, Inc.	38 Albion Rd.	Lincoln, RI 02865
Ferguson Waterworks	124 Costello Rd.	Newington, CT 06111
John Hoadley & Sons, Inc.	672 Union St.	Rockland, MA 02370
Ti-Sales Inc.	36 Hudson Rd.	Sudbury, MA 01776
Warwick Winwaterworks	62 Wyoming Ave.	Warwick, RI 02888

Pricing on Following Pages

Continued next page

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	CORE		EJ PRESCOTT		FERGUSON		HOADLEY		TI-SALES		WINWATER	
		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1	VALVE BOX	\$59.64		\$51.00		\$104.95		\$52.50		\$60.71		\$65.00	
2	VALVE BOX EXTENSIONS												
a	5 1/4" X 1"	\$5.25		\$3.89		\$20.04		\$4.00		\$4.29		\$4.65	
b	5 1/4" X 1 1/2"	\$7.90		\$5.11		\$22.14		\$5.10		\$5.71		\$6.49	
c	5 1/4" X 2"	\$9.85		\$6.45		\$23.20		\$6.50		\$7.14		\$7.95	
3	VALVE BOX TOPS (ROAD)	\$33.90		\$26.60		\$60.45		\$29.00		\$37.26		\$37.00	
4	VALVE BOX COVER												
a	Regular Valve Box Cover	\$9.68		\$7.59		\$12.70		\$7.75		\$10.12		\$11.00	
b	Locking Valve Box Cover	\$21.78		\$18.87		\$22.80		\$19.00		\$23.87		\$25.00	
5	SERVICE BOXES	\$25.84		\$22.27		\$54.39		\$23.00		\$25.00		\$32.00	
6	SERVICE BOX TOP	\$21.16		\$13.00		\$25.10		\$13.50		\$15.48		\$17.00	
7	CURB BOXES AND ACCESSORIES												
a	(Rod Box) Curb Box & Accessories	\$33.84		\$29.78		\$78.26		\$32.00		\$37.40		\$27.00	
b	Rod Box Extension												
i	Rod Box 6"	\$7.98		\$5.63		\$17.34		\$4.50		\$18.58		\$35.00	
ii	Rod Box 12"	\$9.37		\$7.96		\$18.78		\$6.50		\$20.12		\$40.00	
iii	Rod Box 18"	\$10.16		\$9.11		\$19.80		\$8.00		\$21.21		\$45.00	
c	Telescopic, with cast iron arch base	\$33.89		\$30.30		\$55.33		\$32.00		\$43.10		\$29.00	
d	(Rod Box) Repair Cover w/Set	\$8.78		\$6.18		\$62.66		\$6.50		\$19.63		\$10.00	
e	(Rod Box) Repair Cover Threaded	\$7.96		\$5.38		\$62.15		\$5.50		\$17.68		\$10.00	
4	(continued next page)												

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	CORE		EJ PRESCOTT		FERGUSON		HOADLEY		TI-SALES		WINWATER	
		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
8	VALVES GATE												
a	Size: 4"	\$368.33		\$387.87		\$359.39		\$375.00		No Bid			\$368.00
b	Size: 6"	\$470.04		\$501.87		\$460.46		\$481.00		No Bid			\$469.00
c	Size: 8"	\$735.31		\$780.68		\$721.23		\$754.00		No Bid			\$739.00
d	Size: 10"	\$1,140.86		\$1,213.98		\$1,121.28		\$1,172.00		No Bid			\$1,154.00
e	Size: 12"	\$1,433.14		\$1,534.09		\$1,410.62		\$1,475.00		No Bid			\$1,459.00
f	Size: 16"	\$4,715.42		\$5,149.97		\$4,656.02		\$4,875.00		No Bid			\$4,893.00
9	BENDS												
a	4" 45°	\$39.53		\$37.51		\$39.78		\$40.25		No Bid			\$35.00
b	4" 90°	\$44.08		\$42.06		\$44.46		\$45.00		No Bid			\$42.00
c	4" 22 1/2°	\$38.48		\$36.45		\$38.61		\$39.15		No Bid			\$33.00
d	6" 45°	\$58.90		\$56.43		\$59.67		\$60.75		No Bid			\$56.00
e	6" 90°	\$66.95		\$64.49		\$68.25		\$69.00		No Bid			\$65.00
f	6" 22 1/2°	\$56.10		\$53.63		\$56.94		\$58.00		No Bid			\$50.00
g	8" 45°	\$78.85		\$75.00		\$79.56		\$80.25		No Bid			\$69.00
h	8" 90°	\$90.40		\$86.93		\$92.04		\$92.50		No Bid			\$89.00
i	8" 22 1/2°	\$77.80		\$73.96		\$78.39		\$80.00		No Bid			\$75.00
j	10" 45°	\$115.15		\$109.00		\$115.83		\$115.00		No Bid			\$110.00
k	10" 90°	\$140.00		\$133.90		\$142.35		\$142.00		No Bid			\$154.00
l	10" 22 1/2°	\$114.80		\$108.66		\$115.44		\$116.00		No Bid			\$120.00
m	12" 45°	\$153.20		\$146.87		\$155.61		\$156.00		No Bid			\$167.00
n	12" 90°	\$175.95		\$169.65		\$179.79		\$180.00		No Bid			\$197.00
o	12" 22 1/2°	\$139.55		\$133.20		\$141.18		\$142.00		No Bid			\$146.00
10	TEES												
a	6x6x4	\$90.74		\$87.28		\$92.43		\$93.50		No Bid			\$87.00
b	6x6x6	\$98.15		\$94.64		\$100.23		\$101.50		No Bid			\$95.00
c	8x8x4	\$104.04		\$99.55		\$105.30		\$106.00		No Bid			\$105.00
d	8x8x6	\$117.40		\$112.52		\$119.34		\$120.00		No Bid			\$120.00
e	8x8x8	\$135.25		\$129.69		\$137.28		\$138.00		No Bid			\$140.00
f	10x10x4	\$152.59		\$145.47		\$154.44		\$154.00		No Bid			\$158.00
g	10x10x6	\$152.65		\$145.47		\$154.44		\$155.00		No Bid			\$158.00
(continued next page)													

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	CORE		EJ PRESCOTT		FERGUSON		HOADLEY		TI-SALES		WINWATER	
		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
h	10x10x8	\$171.55		\$163.69		\$173.55		\$174.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$175.00
i	12x12x4	\$177.34		\$170.00		\$180.18		\$181.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$190.00
j	12x12x6	\$180.55		\$173.15		\$183.30		\$174.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$190.00
k	12x12x8	\$201.90		\$193.48		\$205.14		\$206.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$215.00
l	16x16x4	\$564.20		\$555.92		\$454.68 16x6 tee w/6x4 SEB reducer		\$669.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$420.00
m	16x16x6	\$339.51		\$329.84		\$419.19		\$348.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$390.00
n	16x16x8	\$363.66		\$353.32		\$445.32		\$373.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$420.00
o	20x20x6	\$529.10		\$535.94		\$567.84		\$587.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$620.00
p	20x20x8	\$540.30		\$546.45		\$579.15		\$598.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$650.00
11	HYDRANT SWIVEL TEES MJ												
a	6x6x6	\$98.30		\$92.89		\$92.28		\$98.50		No Bid		No Bid	\$109.00
b	8x8x6	\$125.36		\$113.57		\$120.51		\$120.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$133.00
c	8x8x8	\$171.20		\$159.84		\$169.26		\$168.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$210.00
d	10x10x6	\$162.39		\$141.71		\$157.56		\$157.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$168.00
e	10x10x8	\$199.45		\$185.77		\$196.95		\$195.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$249.00
f	12x12x6	\$179.75		\$165.79		\$175.50		\$175.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$199.00
g	12x12x8	\$247.45		\$229.13		\$213.33		\$241.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$364.00
h	16x16x6	\$306.90		\$289.53		\$374.34		\$305.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$345.00
i	16x16x8	\$684.99		\$667.03		\$782.67		\$685.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$850.00
j	20x20x6	\$512.35		\$508.60		\$565.89		\$537.00		No Bid		No Bid	\$1,177.00
k	20x20x8	No Bid		\$1,036.82		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$1,244.00
	(continued next page)												

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	CORE		EJ PRESCOTT		FERGUSON		HOADLEY		TI-SALES		WINWATER	
		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE	
12	CAPS												
a	4"	\$18.54		\$17.53		\$18.72		\$19.00		No Bid		\$15.00	
b	6"	\$29.10		\$28.04		\$29.64		\$30.00		No Bid		\$25.00	
c	8"	\$42.40		\$40.66		\$42.90		\$43.00		No Bid		\$44.00	
d	10"	\$56.35		\$53.28		\$56.55		\$57.00		No Bid		\$57.00	
e	12"	\$74.85		\$71.86		\$76.05		\$76.00		No Bid		\$79.00	
f	16"	\$142.78		\$138.45		\$146.64		\$146.00		No Bid		\$169.00	
g	20"	\$223.75		\$227.84		\$253.50		\$241.00		No Bid		\$260.00	
h	24"	\$332.10		\$314.41		\$349.83		\$333.00		No Bid		\$333.00	
13	CAPS/ABOVE COMPLETE W/2" PIPE												
a	4"	\$29.04		\$28.04		\$29.64		\$30.00		No Bid		\$35.00	
b	6"	\$39.60		\$38.21		\$40.56		\$41.00		No Bid		\$46.00	
c	8"	\$52.55		\$50.82		\$53.82		\$54.00		No Bid		\$58.00	
d	10"	\$66.50		\$63.44		\$67.47		\$67.00		No Bid		\$63.00	
e	12"	\$85.35		\$82.00		\$86.97		\$87.00		No Bid		\$95.00	
f	16"	\$158.88		\$154.58		\$198.09		\$163.00		No Bid		\$185.00	
g	20"	\$244.40		\$248.52		\$263.25		\$263.00		No Bid		\$289.00	
h	24"	\$352.75		\$335.09		\$372.84		\$355.00		No Bid		\$362.00	
14	VALVES, TAPPING												
a	4"	\$454.39		\$484.00		\$430.77		\$475.00		No Bid		\$459.00	
b	6"	\$641.03		\$671.22		\$608.21		\$670.00		No Bid		\$648.00	
c	8"	\$942.84		\$995.88		\$902.77		\$990.00		No Bid		\$963.00	
d	10"	\$1,418.57		\$1,490.31		\$1,361.45		\$1,490.00		No Bid		\$1,452.00	
e	12"	\$2,128.07		\$2,277.59		\$2,056.50		\$2,244.00		No Bid		\$2,193.00	
f	16"	\$5,490.35		\$5,838.94		\$5,353.94		\$4,995.00		No Bid		\$5,035.00	
	(continued next page)												

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	CORE		EJ PRESCOTT		FERGUSON		HOADLEY		TI-SALES		WINWATER	
		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
15	SLEEVES, TAPPING/FABRICATED					*#665*					*Smith-Blair 622 Series*		
a	6 x 6 x 4	\$353.58	\$273.24	\$357.35	\$381.00	\$357.35	\$381.00	\$357.35	\$381.00	\$257.14	\$348.00	\$348.00	\$348.00
b	6 x 6 x 6	\$378.81	\$320.73	\$382.84	\$408.00	\$382.84	\$408.00	\$382.84	\$408.00	\$301.42	\$397.00	\$397.00	\$397.00
c	8 x 8 x 4	\$364.28	\$297.46	\$368.16	\$393.00	\$368.16	\$393.00	\$368.16	\$393.00	\$279.82	\$373.00	\$373.00	\$373.00
d	8 x 8 x 6	\$398.53	\$324.61	\$402.78	\$430.00	\$402.78	\$430.00	\$402.78	\$430.00	\$305.76	\$395.00	\$395.00	\$395.00
e	8 x 8 x 8	\$505.63	\$407.93	\$511.01	\$545.00	\$511.01	\$545.00	\$511.01	\$545.00	\$383.54	\$529.00	\$529.00	\$529.00
f	10 x 10 x 4	\$422.17	\$299.43	\$426.67	\$455.00	\$426.67	\$455.00	\$426.67	\$455.00	\$304.67	\$409.00	\$409.00	\$409.00
g	10 x 10 x 6	\$457.13	\$334.30	\$462.00	\$493.00	\$462.00	\$493.00	\$462.00	\$493.00	\$332.76	\$440.00	\$440.00	\$440.00
h	10 x 10 x 8	\$555.42	\$423.43	\$561.33	\$599.00	\$561.33	\$599.00	\$561.33	\$599.00	\$423.52	\$535.00	\$535.00	\$535.00
i	10 x 10 x 10	\$848.56	\$552.32	\$857.60	\$916.00	\$857.60	\$916.00	\$857.60	\$916.00	\$583.40	\$894.00	\$894.00	\$894.00
j	12 x 12 x 4	\$471.18	\$323.63	\$476.20	\$508.00	\$476.20	\$508.00	\$476.20	\$508.00	\$304.67	\$456.00	\$456.00	\$456.00
k	12 x 12 x 6	\$522.40	\$353.67	\$527.16	\$563.00	\$527.16	\$563.00	\$527.16	\$563.00	\$332.76	\$491.00	\$491.00	\$491.00
l	12 x 12 x 8	\$655.43	\$450.55	\$662.40	\$707.00	\$662.40	\$707.00	\$662.40	\$707.00	\$423.52	\$736.00	\$736.00	\$736.00
m	12 x 12 x 10	\$831.71	\$683.11	\$868.27	\$897.00	\$868.27	\$897.00	\$868.27	\$897.00	\$583.40	\$932.00	\$932.00	\$932.00
n	16 x 16 x 6	\$731.44	\$395.34	\$763.59	\$789.00	\$763.59	\$789.00	\$763.59	\$789.00	\$3,748.86	\$826.00	\$826.00	\$826.00
o	16 x 16 x 8	\$784.09	\$454.96	\$809.66	\$846.00	\$809.66	\$846.00	\$809.66	\$846.00	\$466.98	\$965.00	\$965.00	\$965.00
p	20 x 20 x 6	\$796.62	\$419.56	\$822.60	\$859.00	\$822.60	\$859.00	\$822.60	\$859.00	\$401.97	\$1,017.00	\$1,017.00	\$1,017.00
q	20 x 20 x 8	\$784.09	\$535.36	\$809.66	\$846.00	\$809.66	\$846.00	\$809.66	\$846.00	\$513.23	\$1,180.00	\$1,180.00	\$1,180.00
16	WATER MAIN (PIPE)												
a	2"	\$1.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.60
b	4"	\$4.98	\$2.77	\$3.16	No Bid	\$3.16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.00
c	6"	\$9.97	\$5.53	\$6.38	No Bid	\$6.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.00
d	8"	\$17.50	\$9.55	\$11.00	No Bid	\$11.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.00
e	10"	\$25.30	\$14.34	\$16.50	No Bid	\$16.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.00
f	12"	\$36.96	\$20.24	\$23.29	No Bid	\$23.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.00
g	16"	\$64.40	\$39.88	\$36.24	No Bid	\$36.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.00
h	20"	\$99.98	\$69.54	\$47.07	No Bid	\$47.07	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$38.00
i	24"	\$145.74	\$106.61	\$85.81	No Bid	\$85.81	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$60.00
j	30"	No Bid	\$222.80	\$143.90	No Bid	\$143.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$68.00
	(continued next page)												

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	CORE		EJ PRESCOTT		FERGUSON		HOADLEY		TI-SALES		WINWATER	
		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
17	WATER MAIN (PIPE)												
a	4"	\$15.85	\$16.14	\$15.05	\$16.20	No Bid	\$14.69						
b	6"	\$11.74	\$11.52	\$10.75	\$11.69	No Bid	\$10.89						
c	8"	\$16.79	\$15.17	\$14.15	\$15.43	No Bid	\$14.39						
d	10"	\$22.08	\$19.60	\$18.25	\$19.81	No Bid	\$18.47						
e	12"	\$27.69	\$25.16	\$23.40	\$25.41	No Bid	\$23.69						
f	16"	\$39.15	\$40.72	\$37.90	\$40.99	No Bid	\$38.21						
g	20"	\$52.18	\$56.47	\$52.55	\$56.71	No Bid	\$52.86						
h	24"	\$69.26	\$76.26	\$70.95	\$76.51	No Bid	\$71.34						
i	30"	\$138.46	\$129.53	\$127.50	\$112.92	No Bid	\$125.37						
18	MECHANICAL JOINT ACCESSORIES												
				imported									
a	4"	\$9.88	\$8.15	\$8.97	\$9.95	No Bid	\$19.00						
b	6"	\$13.37	\$11.33	\$12.48	\$13.85	No Bid	\$22.00						
c	8"	\$15.62	\$12.75	\$14.04	\$15.60	No Bid	\$26.00						
d	10"	\$22.83	\$18.06	\$19.89	\$22.00	No Bid	\$26.00						
e	12"	\$23.91	\$19.13	\$21.06	\$23.35	No Bid	\$39.00						
f	16"	\$38.40	\$31.17	\$60.42	\$38.00	No Bid	\$49.00						
g	20"	\$58.69	\$58.44	\$64.35	\$71.35	No Bid	\$65.00						
h	24"	\$107.61	\$81.81	\$90.09	\$100.00	No Bid	\$125.00						
i	30"	\$193.92	\$146.27	\$161.07	\$179.00	No Bid	\$160.00						
19	MECHANICAL JOINTS OFFSETS												
				C153 imported									
a	4 x 4 x 6	\$112.35	\$59.32	\$63.96	\$73.50	No Bid	\$80.00						
b	4 x 4 x 12	\$126.86	\$71.98	\$77.61	\$89.00	No Bid	\$106.00						
c	4 x 4 x 18	\$149.32	\$91.15	\$98.28	\$112.00	No Bid	\$137.00						
d	6 x 6 x 6	\$157.68	\$92.89	\$103.74	\$119.00	No Bid	\$142.00						
e	6 x 6 x 12	\$182.36	\$114.27	\$127.53	\$145.00	No Bid	\$150.00						
f	6 x 6 x 18	\$207.60	\$134.95	\$150.54	\$172.00	No Bid	\$184.00						
	(continued next page)												

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	CORE		EJ PRESCOTT		FERGUSON		HOADLEY		TI-SALES		WINWATER	
		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
g	8 x 8 x 6	\$217.15	\$126.89	\$141.57	\$162.00	No Bid	\$165.00						
h	8 x 8 x 12	\$253.19	\$156.33	\$174.33	\$198.00	No Bid	\$250.00						
i	8 x 8 x 18	\$286.74	\$189.28	\$210.60	\$239.00	No Bid	\$310.00						
j	10 x 10 x 6	\$318.80	\$187.36	\$202.02	\$230.00	No Bid	\$275.00						
k	10 x 10 x 12	\$371.27	\$235.11	\$253.50	\$288.00	No Bid	\$360.00						
l	10 x 10 x 18	\$418.81	\$273.45	\$294.84	\$335.00	No Bid	\$435.00						
m	12 x 12 x 6	\$427.32	\$244.31	\$272.22	\$310.00	No Bid	\$400.00						
n	12 x 12 x 12	\$454.92	\$309.24	\$297.96	\$338.00	No Bid	\$420.00						
o	12 x 12 x 18	\$511.36	\$364.69	\$351.39	\$399.00	No Bid	\$525.00						
20	GRIP RING GLAND PACKS												
a	4" for PVC	No Bid	\$31.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
b	4" for ductile	No Bid	\$31.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
c	6" for PVC	No Bid	\$37.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
d	6" for ductile	No Bid	\$37.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
e	8" for PVC	No Bid	\$52.93	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
f	8" for ductile	No Bid	\$52.93	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
g	10" for PVC	No Bid	\$75.83	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
h	10" for ductile	No Bid	\$75.83	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
i	12" for PVC	No Bid	\$103.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
j	12" for ductile	No Bid	\$103.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
21	MEGA LUG GLAND PACKS												
a	4" for PVC	\$21.35	\$25.57	\$29.22	\$32.50	\$29.34	\$33.00						
b	4" for ductile	\$17.39	\$22.26	\$21.16	\$28.25	\$25.60	\$29.00						
c	6" for PVC	\$25.88	\$32.02	\$35.45	\$41.00	\$37.11	\$39.00						
d	6" for ductile	\$20.47	\$27.49	\$30.92	\$35.00	\$31.86	\$34.00						
e	8" for PVC	\$38.30	\$43.19	\$49.92	\$55.00	\$50.11	\$53.00						
f	8" for ductile	\$31.24	\$37.46	\$42.70	\$48.00	\$43.22	\$48.00						
	(continued next page)												

Ford UFR 1400 & 1500 Series

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	CORE		EJ PRESCOTT		FERGUSON		HOADLEY		TI-SALES		WINWATER	
		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
g	10" for PVC	\$72.43		\$75.20	\$88.67	\$95.00	\$86.38	\$96.00					
h	10" for ductile	\$46.24		\$53.27	\$61.91	\$68.00	\$61.76	\$74.00					
i	12" for PVC	\$76.11		\$78.93	\$93.57	\$100.00	\$90.91	\$100.00					
j	12" for ductile	\$67.28		\$71.59	\$84.55	\$91.00	\$82.79	\$94.00					
k	16" for PVC	\$162.94		\$162.62	\$191.46	\$197.00	\$178.71	\$215.00					
l	16" for ductile	\$122.71		\$128.45	\$150.35	\$155.00	\$141.47	\$165.00					
m	20" for PVC	\$250.56		\$241.72	\$288.02	\$292.00	\$264.56	\$330.00					
n	20" for ductile	\$215.57		\$211.95	\$252.27	\$256.00	\$232.14	\$278.00					
22	MECHANICAL JOINT CROSSES												
a	6"x6"x6"x6"	\$138.50		\$133.90	\$141.96	\$168.50	No Bid	\$135.00					
b	8"x8"x6"x6"	\$146.15		\$139.86	\$148.20	\$185.00	No Bid	\$140.00					
c	8"x8"x8"x8"	\$155.25		\$151.14	\$156.78	\$185.00	No Bid	\$145.00					
d	10"x10"x6"x6"	\$186.30		\$178.00	\$188.76	\$223.00	No Bid	\$175.00					
e	10"x10"x8"x8"	\$219.20		\$209.61	\$222.30	\$262.00	No Bid	\$217.00					
f	10"x10"x10"x10"	\$240.45		\$228.19	\$242.58	\$285.00	No Bid	\$230.00					
23	BUTTERFLY VALVES												
a	12"	\$1,413.04		\$1,198.00	\$1,157.07	\$1,885.00	No Bid	\$1,398.00					
b	16"	\$2,717.39		\$2,333.00	\$2,240.43	\$3,600.00	No Bid	\$2,686.00					
c	20"	\$3,478.26		\$3,525.00	\$3,409.95	\$5,465.00	No Bid	\$3,440.00					
d	24"	\$4,347.83		\$4,760.00	\$4,610.92	\$7,385.00	No Bid	\$4,300.00					
e	30"	\$9,239.13		\$8,622.00	\$8,347.40	\$13,375.00	No Bid	\$9,139.00					
24	REDUCERS												
a	6x4	\$49.89		\$43.81	\$46.41	\$48.00	No Bid	\$39.00					
b	8x4	\$62.09		\$53.98	\$57.33	\$59.00	No Bid	\$53.00					
c	8x6	\$67.40		\$59.24	\$62.79	\$65.00	No Bid	\$57.00					
d	10x4	\$91.69		\$80.62	\$85.80	\$87.00	No Bid	\$86.00					
e	10x6	\$87.50		\$75.36	\$79.95	\$82.00	No Bid	\$73.00					
f	10x8	\$94.15		\$81.32	\$86.19	\$88.00	No Bid	\$79.00					
	(continued next page)												

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	CORE		EJ PRESCOTT		FERGUSON		HOADLEY		TI-SALES		WINWATER	
		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE	
25	2" PVC GASKETED												
a	Coupling	No Bid		\$12.71		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$11.00
b	Caps	No Bid		\$13.53		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$15.00
c	22 Degree	No Bid		\$58.10		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$56.00
d	45 Degree	No Bid		\$16.63		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$20.00
e	2x3/4 Tee	No Bid		\$18.28		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$20.00
f	2x1 Tee	No Bid		\$18.28		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$20.00
g	2x2 Tee	No Bid		\$31.25		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$30.00

Bid2018-178 Pipe Fittings & Valves						
The following vendors were sent specifications.						
VENDOR	ADDRESS	CITY	STATE	ZIP		
Applied Industrial Technologies	34 Avery Rd.	Cranston	RI	02910		
Automatic Heating Equipment, Inc.	400 Charles st.	Providence	RI	02904		
Baystate Winsupply Co.	Seven Everett Farmer Rd.	Billerica	MA	01821		
EJ Prescott	38 Albion Rd.	Lincoln	RI	02865		
Ferguson Waterworks	Two Whitman Rd.	Canton	MA	02021		
Ferguson Waterworks	124 Costello Rd.	Newington	CT	06111		
HD Supply Waterworks	125 Stergis Way	Dedham	MA	02026		
Independent Pipe & Supply Corp.	80 Coyle Ave.	Pawtucket	RI	02860		
John Hoadley, Inc.	672 Union St.	Rockland	MA	02370		
Stiles Co., Inc.	922 Pleasant St.	Norwood	MA	02062		
Tifco International	PO Box 402077	Houston	TX	77240		
Ti-Sales, Inc.	36 Hudson Rd.	Sudbury	MA	01776		
USA Bluebook	PO Box 9004	Gurnee	IL	60031		
Warwick Winwater Works Co., Inc.	PO Box 81062, 62 Wyoming Ave.	Warwick	RI	02888		

MEMO

To: Pat Peshka, Purchasing Agent
From: Daniel O'Rourke, Chief of Water Division
Date: November 30, 2017
Re: Bid2018-178 Pipe Fittings and Valves

10

The Water Division received six bids for Pipe Fittings and Valves and are recommending the lowest responsible bidders for all items listed in this bid. They are as follows:

EJ PRESCOTT-

1, 2a, 2c, 3, 4a, 4b, 5, 6, 7d, 7e, 9e, 9h-o, 10b-n, 11b-f, 11h-k, 12c-f, 12h, 13a-c, 13e, 13f, 13h, 15f, 15h, 15i, 15n, 15o, 16b, 18a-i, 19a-m, 20a-j, 21a, 21c-n, 22a, 22b, 22e, 22f, 24d, 25b, 25d-f

FERGUSON-

8a-f, 11a, 11g, 14a-e, 17b-f, 19n, 19o, 21b, 23a-c, 23e

HOADLEY-

2b, 7bi, 7bii, 7biii, 14f, 17i

TI-SALES-

15a-e, 15g, 15j-m, 15p, 15q

WINWATER-

7a, 7c, 9a-d, 9f, 9g, 10a, 12a, 12b, 13d, 16a, 16c-j, 17a, 22c,
22d, 23d, 24a-c, 24e, 24f, 25a, 25c, 25g

CORE AND MAIN-

10o, 10p, 12g, 13g, 17g,h

****ITEM#21 CORE AND MAIN- BID GLAND ONLY FOR
MEGA LEG DOES NOT MEET SPEC****

All items will be ordered on an as needed basis for an amount not to exceed \$25,000 budget code 84-363 and \$25,000 budget code 84-364. Assuming the recommendation is approved as presented, I am recommending a one year contract period from 1/25/18 to 1/24/19 per bid specs.

If you have any questions, or need additional information, please contact me at extension 9734.

Cc: Brian DeLuca- Water Division Storeroom
Brad Mellen- Water Division
Bob Denis- Water Division