CITY OF WARWICK

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

NO:	·
APPROVED:	MAYOR
DATE:	

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following bid(s):

Bid #	Name	Vendor(s) Name/Address	Contract Award	Contract Period	Note	Code
2018 - 250	City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel, and Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel	Global Montello Group 800 South St. Waltham, MA 02454 Sprague Operating Resources 185 International Dr. Portsmouth, NH 03801 Peterson's Oil Service 75 Crescent St. Worcester, MA 01605	\$1,337,000.00	4/10/18 - 4/9/19	1	

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder.

1. <u>Police:</u> Sprague Operating Resources/item 2 (\$360,000.00). <u>Fire:</u> Peterson's Oil Service/item 4 (\$157,000.00). <u>DPW:</u> Global Montello Group/item 1. Sprague Operating Resources/items 3 and 4 (\$820,000.00).

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE

Bid2018-250 City of Warwick (District 6) Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel, and **Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel**

6 Bids submitted

CODES:

30-220 Police/Gasoline

\$360,000.00

35-220 Fire/Gasoline

\$157,000.00

65-220 Automotive/Gasoline

\$820,000.00

MANNER OF AWARD:

\$1,337,000.00

April 10, 2018 - April 9, 2019

RECOMMEND:

See Below

Police:

Sprague Operating Resources item 2

Fire: DPW: Peterson's Oil Service

item 4

Global Montello Group

item 1

Sprague Operating Resources items 3 and 4

Dennis K. Burke

555 Constitution Drive Taunton, MA 02780

Global Montello Group

800 South St.

Waltham, MA 02454

Mansfield Oil Company

1025 Airport Pkwy. SW

Gainesville, GA 30501

Peterson's Oil Service

75 Crescent St.

Worcester, MA 01605

Santa Buckley Energy

154 Admiral St.

Bridgeport, CT 06605

Sprague Operating Resources 185 International Dr.

Portsmouth, NH 03801

Pricing as Follows

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	DENNIS K BURKE	PETERSONS	SPRAGUE	GLOBAL	MANSFIELD	SANTA BUCKLEY
1	Unleaded		2 - - - -				
	FIRE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	POLICE	0.1044	0.0450	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	DPW	0.1138	0.0650	0.0347	0.0283	0.0739	0.1550
	SEWER	0.1720	0.2500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2467
7	Plus Unleaded						
	FIRE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	POLICE	0.0920	0.0450	0.0099	0.0788	0.0829	0.0875
	DPW	0.1014	0.0650	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	SEWER	0.1596	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Winter Diesel						
	FIRE	0.2649	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	POLICE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	DPW	0.0526	0.0650	0.0185	No Bid	0.0807	0.0875
	SEWER	0.1574	0.2500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	New Ultra Diesel						
	FIRE	0.2649	0.1100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2467
	POLICE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	DPW	0.0526	0.0450	0.0168	0.0424	0.0651	0.0875
	SEWER	0.1574	0.2500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.2622
				-			

2018 - 250			
The following vendors were sent specifications.			
VENDOR	ADDRESS	CITY	STATE
Dennis K. Burke, Inc.	284 Eastern Ave.	Chelsea	MA
Diesel Direct, Inc.	74 Maple St.	Stoughton	MA
East River Energy	401 Soundview Rd./PO Box 388	Guilford	CL
Ginger's Oil	110 Oak St., PO Box 1427	Westerfy	RI
Global Montello Group, LLC	800 South St.	Waltham	MA
Mansfield Oil Co.	1025 Airport Pkwy. SW	Gainesville	GA
Mathews Oil Co.	855 Dyer Ave.	Cranston	RI
Peterson's Oil Service, Inc.	75 Crescent St.	Worcester	MA
Petroleum Traders Corp.	7120 Pointe Inverness Way	Ft. Wayne	N.
Robert's Energy LLC	237 Albany ST.	Springfield	MA
Santa Buckley Energy, Inc.	154 Admiral St./PO Box 1141	Bridgeport	CT
Superior Plus Energy	31 Hylestead St.	Providence	RI
Superior Plus Energy Services	1870 S. Winton Rd., Ste. 200	Rochester	NY

Colonel Stephen M. McCartney
Chief of Police



Scott Avedisian Mayor

Police Department
99 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617
Telephone: (401) 468-4200

January 9, 2018

Mrs. Patricia A. Peshka, Purchasing Agent Warwick City Hall 3275 Post Road Warwick, RI 02886

Re: Bid # 2018-250 Gasoline and Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

Dear Mrs. Peshka,

The department has reviewed the six (6) bids received for Bid # 2018-250 Gasoline and Low Sulfur Fuel. The bids received pertained only to the Police Department's portion of the entire bid package. The responses are listed below:

Sprague Operating Resources LLC 185 International Dr. Portsmouth, NH 03801
Peterson's Oil Service, Inc., 75 Crescent Street, Worcester, MA 01605
Global Montello Group Corporation, 800 South St., Waltham MA 02454
Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc., 1025 Airport Parkway, SW, Gainesville, GA 30501-6813
Dennis K. Burke, Inc., 284 Eastern Avenue, Chelsea, MA 02150
Santa Buckley Energy Inc. 154 Admiral St. Bridgeport, CT 06604

The Police bids are for unleaded-plus gasoline only. Based on the bids submitted, the Department recommends awarding the bid to the lowest bidder which is Sprague Operating Resources, LLC.

Funding for purchases under this bid would be allocated from the department's current operating budget, code #30-220 "Gasoline." The department requests authorization to expend funds not to exceed \$360,000.00 during the term of contract, which is for 1 year from April 10, 2018 thru April 9, 2019.

Sincerely,

Bradford Connor

Major

Administrative Bureau Commander





Office: (401)468-4018 Cell: (401)632-7046 Fax: (401) 468-4001 edward.v.hannon.iii@warwickri.com

111 Veterans Memorial Drive. Warwick, R.I. 02886

February 6, 2017

Mrs. Patricia Peshka Purchasing Agent City of Warwick

Dear Mrs. Peshka,

The City of Warwick Fire Department has reviewed Bid 2018-250 City of Warwick (District 6)—Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel & Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel. The Warwick Fire Department recommends that the bid be awarded to Peterson's Oil Service Inc. of 75 Cresent St. Worcester, MA. Of the three bids submitted, Peterson's Oil Service Inc. had the lowest increment (0.1100) for New Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel for the Warwick Fire Department and therefore was the lowest bidder.

This award will be for a period of one year from the date of the award. The total award is for \$157,000.00. The funds will come from budget code 35-220.

Sincerely, A/C Edward Hannon

Edward V. Hannon Assistant Chief

-150-



CITY OF WARWICK **DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS** 925 SANDY LANE WARWICK, RI 02886 TEL. 401-738-2000 Ext. 6500 FAX 401-732-5208

SCOTT AVEDISIAN MAYOR

RICHARD CRENCA DIRECTOR

To:

Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: Richard Crenca, Director of Public Works

Date: February 6, 2018

Subj: Bid2018-250 Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel & Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel

We have reviewed the six bids submitted and recommend award to Global Montecello Group Corp. as the lowest responsible bidder for the unleaded fuel and Sprague Resources LP for the ultra-low sulfur diesel and winter diesel for the fuel needs of this department. The requested cap is \$820,000 for the Public Works Department for a one-year period.