

CITY OF WARWICK

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

NO: _____

APPROVED: _____ MAYOR

DATE: _____

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following bid(s):

Bid #	Name	Vendor(s) Name/Address	Contract Award	Contract Period	Note	Code	FY
2017 - 243	Medical Evaluations for Warwick Fire Department	<i>Atmed Treatment Center</i> 5750 Post Rd. East Greenwich, RI 02818	\$120,000.00	2 years from date of award			

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder.

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE

Bid2017-243 Medical Evaluations for Warwick Fire Department

- 3 Bids Submitted

CODE 35-335 Medical Examinations

MANNER OF AWARD \$120,000.00
2 years from date of award

RECOMMEND Atmed Treatment Center

=====

Worksite Medical, LLC
510 Jamison Ave.
Ellwood City, PA 16117

Atmed Treatment Center
5750 Post Rd.
East Greenwich, RI 02818

Occupational Health Centers of the Southwest, P.A. dba Concentra Medical Centers
5080 Spectrum Drive #1200 W
Addison, TX 75001

PRICING AS FOLLOWS

Continued next page

Bid2017-243 Medical Evaluations for Warwick Fire Department

Item	Description	Worksite Medical, LLC			Atmed Treatment Ctr			Concentra		
		1 st Year	2 nd Year	3 rd Year	1 st Year	2 nd Year	3 rd Year	1 st Year	2 nd Year	3 rd Year
1.	Firefighter Annual Medical Evaluation	\$35.00*	\$36.05	\$37.13	\$315.00	\$315.00	\$315.00	\$224.00^	\$224.00^	\$224.00^
2.	Candidate Medical Evaluation	\$35.00*	\$36.05	\$37.13	\$354.00	\$354.00	\$354.00	\$346.00^	\$346.00^	\$346.00^
3.	Firefighter/HAZ-MAT Annual Medical Evaluation	\$35.00*	\$36.05	\$37.13	\$353.00	\$353.00	\$353.00	\$447.00^	\$447.00^	\$447.00^
4.	Firefighter Exit Medical Evaluation	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$393.00	\$393.00	\$393.00	\$224.00^	\$224.00^	\$224.00^
5.	Physical	\$35.00	\$36.05	\$37.13	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$65.00
6.	Hazardous Material Physical	\$35.00	\$36.05	\$37.13	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$65.00
7.	Audiogram	\$5.00	\$5.15	\$5.30	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$34.00	\$34.00	\$34.00
8.	Chem 20,CBC,CHD,UA	\$65.00	\$66.95	\$68.95	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$73.00	\$73.00	\$73.00
9.	Blood Lead/ZPP	\$65.00	\$66.95	\$68.95	\$45.00	\$45.00	\$45.00	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10.	Cholinesterase RBC, (Serum)	\$95.00	\$97.85	\$100.78	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$60.00
11.	Chest X-Ray 1 & 2-view	\$35.00	\$36.05	\$37.13	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
12.	EKG	\$20.00	\$20.60	\$21.22	\$55.00	\$55.00	\$55.00	\$43.00	\$43.00	\$43.00
13.	Hep A Vaccine	\$125.00	\$128.75	\$132.61	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
14.	Hep B Surface Antibody (titer)	\$30.00	\$30.90	\$31.83	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$51.50	\$53.05
15.	PSA (age 40 and over)	\$40.00	\$41.20	\$42.44	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
16.	Pulmonary Function Test	\$20.00	\$20.60	\$21.22	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$40.00
17.	Titmus Vision	\$5.00	\$5.15	\$5.30	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$12.00
18.	Archiving Urine and Blood (Existing Techs)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$49.00	\$49.00	\$49.00	\$0	\$0	\$0

Continued Next Page

Bid2017-243 Medical Evaluations for Warwick Fire Department

Item	Description	1 st Year	2 nd Year**	3 rd Year**	1 st Year	2 nd Year	3 rd Year	1 st Year	2 nd Year	3 rd Year
19.	Heavy Metals (urine) Arsenic, Cadmium, Mercury, Lead	\$170.00	\$175.10	\$180.35	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
20.	Drug Screen	\$50.00	\$51.50	\$53.05	\$55.00	\$55.00	\$55.00	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
21.	PPD 1 step	\$125.00	\$128.75	\$132.61	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$22.00	\$22.00	\$22.00
22.	PPD 2 step	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$22.00	\$22.00	\$22.00
23.	Hep C Surface Antibody (Titer)	\$30.00	\$30.90	\$31.83	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
24.	Hep B Vaccine	\$92.00	\$94.76	\$97.60	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
25.	Hemocult	\$20.00	\$20.60	\$21.22	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$12.00
26.	HIV Titer	\$30.00	\$30.90	\$31.83	\$38.00	\$38.00	\$38.00	\$38.00	\$38.00	\$38.00
27.	MMR Titer	\$45.00	\$46.35	\$47.74	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
28.	MMR Vaccine	\$125.00	\$128.75	\$132.61	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$92.70	\$95.48
29.	Varicella	\$15.00	\$15.45	\$15.91	\$130.00	\$130.00	\$130.00	\$130.00	\$130.00	\$130.00
30.	DOT Physical Card							\$25.00^^	\$25.00^^	\$25.00^^

*Item includes physical only. The various components of the specific physical must be added to fit the description on pages 9-10 of the RFP. Since some portions of the physicals are not mandatory the price could vary. Therefore, Worksite did not aggregate the costs but instead priced each item individually.

**There will be a 3% increase to the pricing for each year of the contract.

^PSA, Hepatitis Titers, and Chest X-ray are not included in price as these services are not rendered on every exam.

^^We affirm all clinicians will FMCSA-certified perform these exams in the Rhode Island

Midland Medical
1312 Oaklawn Ave.
Cranston, RI 02920

Professional Health Services, Inc.
83 S. Eagle Rd.
Havertown, P A 19083

Concentra Medical Centers
5080 Spectrum Dr., Ste 1200W
Addison, TX 75001
Kristine_beck@concentra.com

William Hochstrasser- Walsh
Comprehensive Community Action
226 Buttonwoods Ave.
Warwick, RI 02886

Pilgrim Medical
1243 Post Road
Warwick, RI 02888

Atmed Treatment Center
1526 Atwood Ave., Ste. 100
Johnston, RI 02919
Wayne.estes@atmedoc.com

The Kent Center
d/b/a Primary Care Partners
276 Post Road, Ste. 104
Warwick, RI 02886
rsheehan@thekentcenter.org

Concentra
400 Bald Hill Road
Warwick, RI 02886
Lisa_oliveira@concentra.com
Susan_clemens@concentra.com



James P. Kenney
Assistant Chief



Office: (401)468-4044
Cell: (401)374-1552
Fax: (401) 468-4001
james.p.kenney@warwickri.com

111 Veterans Memorial Drive.
Warwick, R.I.
02886

February 21, 2017


Mrs. Patricia Peshka
Purchasing Agent
City of Warwick

Dear Mrs. Peshka,

The City of Warwick Fire Department has thoroughly reviewed the three bids received for *Bid 2017-243 Medical Evaluations for Warwick Fire Department*. The Warwick Fire Department recommends the bid be awarded to Atmed Treatment Center. Atmed Treatment Center met the specifications of the bid with no exceptions and they were the lowest bidder.

This award will be for a period of two years from the date of the award. The total award is not to exceed \$120,000.00. The funds will come from budget code 35-335.

Sincerely,


James P. Kenney
Assistant Chief