PCR-80-18

CITY OF WARWICK
STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

NQ:

APPROVED: MAYOR

DATE:

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of
Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on
purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following

bid(s):

Bid Vendor(s) Contract Contract
# Name Name/Address Award Period Note| Code| FY
1 year
2018 Precast Items for Catch Anchor Concrete from date
) Basins & Manholes 30 Budlong Rd. $9,000.00 of award
313 ' Cranston, RI 02920

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest
responsible bidder.

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE




Bid2018-313 Precast Items for Manholes & Catch Basins

e 1 bid submitted

CODE.

MANNER OF AWARD:

RECOMMEND:

63-232 Highway/Drainage Blocks

$9,000.00
1 year from date of award

Anchor Concrete

Continued next page

Anchor Concrete
30 Budlong Rd.
Cranston, RI 02920

Pricing as Follows

_52_




Bid2018-313 Precast Items for Manholes & Catch Basins

It;m Description Unit Price | Picked Up | Delivered
1 1 X 4 X 8 solid block each No bid No bid
2 | 1 X 8X 16 solid block each $1.30 $1.49
3 | 6 X8X 16 solid biock each $2.24 $2.67
4 | 8 X 8X 16 solid block each $3.51 $4.06
5 8 X 6 X 14 + solid barrel block each $2.65 $3.06
6 | Batter Blocks #1 each $3.35 $3.75
7 | Batter Blocks #2 each $3.35 $3.75
8 | Batter Blocks #3 cach $3.35 $3.75
9 | Ring Row Blocks Square each set $3.77 $4.25
10 | Ring Row Blocks Round cach set $3.37 $4.25
11 | 6 X8 X 16 Hollow Block each $1.33 $1.69
12 | 8 X 8 X 16 Hollow Block each $1.53 $1.83
13 | 8 X 8 X 8 Hollow Half Block each $1.40 $1.62
14 | 12X 8X 16 Hollow Block each $2.37 $3.17
15 | 6 X8 X8 Hollow Block each $1.15 $1.30
16 112 X8 X8 Hollow Block each $2.05 $2.30
17 ¢ D Ring of Blocks 8 pieces each No bid No bid
18 | Bottom Plates 4” Thick 10 pieces gach set $4.36 $4.84

Bricks (Redclay) ASTM C-216 Grade '
19 | SW, Typed FBS Normal each $0.69 $.072
Size 8” long X 4™ thick X 2 %’ High
20 | 2X 8167 Solid each $1.16 $1.27
21 | 8 X4 16” Half High each $1.40 $1.53
22 | 12X 416" Half High cach $2.05 $2.27
23 | 4 X8 X 8” Half High cach $1.00 $1.19
24 | Common Brick K/F Antique Red each $0.75 $0.81
25 | Landscape Cobblestones each $3.15 $3.36
26 | Regulation Cobblestones each $3.50 $3.72
27 | Jumbo Cobblestones each $4.18 $4.51
28 | Lime each $8.96 $9.36
29 | Cement I/II each $13.00 $13.70
30 | Mortar Mix types cach $10.75 $11.25
Reinforcing Ladder Wire ‘
31 | Price Per Foot 4” each $0.33 $0.33
Reinforcing Ladder Wire
32 | Price Per Foot 6” each $0.33 $0.33
Reinforcing Ladder Wire '
33 | Price Per Foot 8” each $0.37 $0.37
| Reinforcing Ladder Wire
34 | Price Per Foot 127 each $0.40 $0.40
35 | Sakrete Bag $6.43 $7.03
36 | % Off List Items, Not Listed % No bid No bid

Note: Vendor added pallet charge $16.00/each.
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CITY OF WARWICK '  SCOTT AVEDISIAN

DEPARTMENT GF PUBLIC WORKS MAYOR
925 SANDY LANE
WARWICK, RI 02886 RICAHRD CRENCA
TEL. 401-738-2000 Ext. 6500 DIRECTOR

FAX 401-732-5208

To: Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent

From: Richard Crenca, Director of Public Works %

Date: April 19, 2018
Re: Bid2018-313 Precast Items for Mianholes and Catch Basins

We have reviewed the oniy bid submitted and recommend award to Anchor Concrete Products. The
recommended cap is $9,000.00 for one year.
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