Francis M. Gomez Frank J. Picozzi

Purchasing Agent Mayor
City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364
Bid Minutes Tuesday, February 28, 2023
Bid2023-356 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts, and Materials
Bid2023-357 Power Wash Plus Cleaner & Degreaser
Bid2023-358 Grass Seed Mixtures
Bid2023-359 On-Call Electrical Maintenance & Repairs (WSA)
Bid2023-371 Purchase Migma Flashing Pedestrian Crossing Signals
Location: The meeting was held at in Meeting Room 2
Present: Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent

Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist

Representatives: Bo Ling, Migma Systems
Wayne Burkholder, Eberl Iron Works
Ryan Doyle, Arden Engineering
Orlando DiFusco,

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid
or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go
to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are March 20, 2023 and April 3, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The City Council
meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00 P.M.
meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent



’ Bi62023-356 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts, and Materials

e 4 Bids Received

Lightle Enterprises of Ohio
PO Box 329
Frankfort, OH 45628

Garden State Highway Products, Inc.
301 Riverside Dr.
Millville, NJ 08332

Traffic Signs & Safety, Inc.
70 Ballou Blvd.
Bristol, RI 02809
Ebert Iron Works, Inc.

128 Sycamore St.
Buffalo, NY 14204

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page



Bid2023-356 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts, and Materials

BID RESULTS

Garden Taffic Eberl

Item # Description Lightle State Signs & Iron
Highway | Safety | Works

Finished with Standard i
Message
1 12" x 24" $12.88 $16.36 $19.00 | No Bid
2 12" x 18" $9.66 $12.41 $18.00 | NoBid
3 18"x 24" $19.32 $24.54 $28.50 | No Bid
4 18" x 24" No Thru Trucking $19.32 $24.54 $28.50 | No Bid
5 18" x 24" No Thru Traffic $19.32 $24.54 $28.50 | No Bid
6 24" x 30" $32.20 $40.89 $47.50 | No Bid
7 30"x 18" $24.15 $30.68 $35.63 | No Bid
8 24" square, diamond, or pentago | $25.76 $32.72 $38.00 | NoBid
9 24" octagon $25.60 $31.41 $38.00 | No Bid
36" square or diamond or
10 fluorescent yellow/green ASTM |  $66.60 $73.61 $108.00 | No Bid
Type IX or XI

30" square, diamond, or pentagon )
11 1 ASTM Type IX orpXI 811 ¢4625 | $51.12 | $75.00 | NoBid

36" square, diamond, or pentagon .
12 1 ASTM Typo IX orpXI 8N ¢66.60 | $73.61 | $108.00 | No Bid

48" square, diamond, or pentagon .
13 q ASTM Typo IX OIPXI 8011 11840 | $130.86 | $192.00 | No Bid
14 30" octagon $39.50 $49.08 $75.00 | No Bid
15 36" x 12" printed 1 side $19.32 $24.54 $36.00 | No Bid
16 36" x 12" printed both sides $23.82 $32.65 $54.00 | No Bid
17 30" triangle $21.57 $28.98 $65.00 | No Bid
18 36" triangle $28.98 $37.26 $95.00 | No Bid

Continued Next Page




Bid2023-356 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts, and Materials

BID RESULTS

Garden Taffic Eberl

Item # Description Lightle State Signs & Iron
Highway | Safety | Works

Finished Sign - No Message
19 12" x 24" $12.88 $15.54 $16.00 | No Bid
20 12" x 18" $9.66 $11.27 $12.00 | NoBid
21 18" x 24" $19.32 $23.31 $24.00 | No Bid
22 24" x 30" $32.26 $38.86 $40.00 | NoBid
23 30" x 18" $24.15 $28.15 $30.00 | No Bid
24 24" square, diamond, or pentago | $25.76 $31.08 $32.00 | NoBid
25 24" octagon $25.60 $29.84 $32.00 | No Bid
36" square or diamond or
26 fluorescent yellow/green ASTM | $66.60 $69.93 $90.00 | No Bid
Type IX or XI

30" square, diamond, or pentagon .
27 ASTM Type IX or XI $46.25 $48.56 $62.50 | No Bid

36" square, diamond, or pentagon .
28 ASTM Type IX or XI $66.60 £69.93 $90.00 | No Bid

48" square, diamond, or pentagon .
29 ASTM Type IX or XI $118.40 | $124.31 | $144.00 | NoBid
30 30" octagon $39.50 $46.63 $62.50 | No Bid
31 36" x 12" printed 1 side $19.32 $23.31 $24.00 | NoBid
32 36" x 12" printed both sides $23.82 $27.53 $24.00 | No Bid
33 30" triangle $21.57 $27.53 $45.00 | NoBid
34 36" triangle $28.98 $35.40 $62.00 | No Bid

Marking Tape

35 | AZ70ES White Stamark Brand | 50, 5 | §504.74 | $395.00 | No Bid

Tape 12" x 30 yds.

Continued Next Page




Bid2023-356 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts, and Materials

BID RESULTS
Garden Taffic Eberl
- Item # Description Lightle State Signs & Iron
Highway | Safety | Works
Reflective Sheeting
36 ASTM TypelSheeting -all | ) )9 | go01/5F | $1.02 | NoBid
colors/sqg. ft.
Hi-Intensity Prismatic Sheeting .
37 ASTM Type IV - All Colors $1.31 $1.28/SF $142 | NoBid
EC Film (E.C. transparent
38 overlay on paper liner) $1.18 $0.94/SF $1.05 | NoBid
unpunched, all colors/sq. ft.
39 ASTM XI reflective sheeting, all $2.62 $2.61/SF $2.93 No Bid
colors/sq. ft.
Anti-Graffiti Overlay Film
40 36" x 50 yd $765 '10 O/roll g62775 | $702.00 | No Bid
41 48" x 50 yd $1,0i:)1.00/r $837.00 |} $936.00 | No Bid
Opaque Film
2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film .
42 - black & white sq. ft. $1.10 $0.94/SF $1.45 | NoBid
g3 |*Mil CastHP Vinyl Opague Film) ¢ 17 615567 | $1.60 | NoBid
- all colors/sq. ft.
Prespacing Tape
44 6> X 100 yards/price per roll $40.50 $28.16 $2.90 | NoBid
45 12” x 100 yards/price per roll $81.00 $48.77 $48.30 | No Bid
46 24” X 100 yards/price per roll $162.00 $96.55 $155.00 | No Bid
47 36” X 100 yards/price per roll $243.00 | $144.82 | $229.97 | NoBid

Continued Next Page




Bid2023-356 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts, and Materials

BID RESULTS
Garden Taffic Eberl
Item # Description Lightle State Signs & Iron
Highway | Safety | Works
Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum
Radius Corners No Hole

48 14”7 X 6” $2.50 $2.78 $2.75 No Bid
49 16”7 X 6” $2.80 $3.18 $3.16 No Bid
50 187X 67 $3.10 $3.57 $3.54 No Bid
51 207X 67 $3.50 $3.98 $3.94 No Bid
52 247 X 67 $4.10 $4.77 $4.29 No Bid
53 30" X 6” $5.13 $5.96 $5.90 No Bid
54 36" X 6” $6.15 $7.16 $7.07 No Bid
55 107X §8” $2.40 $2.47 $2.61 No Bid
56 127X 8” $2.80 $2.96 $3.15 No Bid
57 147X 8” $3.30 $3.46 $3.58 No Bid
58 16” X 8~ $3.70 $3.95 $3.68 No Bid
59 187X 8” $4.10 $4.45 $5.14 No Bid
60 207X 8~ $4.56 $4.94 $5.25 No Bid
61 24" X 8” $5.47 $5.49 $6.29 No Bid
62 30" X 8” $6.84 $6.86 $9.10 No Bid
63 36" X 8” $8.20 $8.24 $9.45 No Bid
64 10" X 10” $2.90 $3.68 $3.09 No Bid
65 127X 10~ $3.50 $4.42 $3.29 No Bid
66 147X 107 $4.10 $5.16 $4.58 No Bid
67 16”7 X 10” $4.60 $5.89 $5.15 No Bid
68 187X 107 $5.13 $6.62 $5.25 No Bid
69 20" X 107 $5.70 $7.36 $5.90 No Bid
70 24”7 X 107 $6.83 $8.83 $7.88 No Bid
71 30" X 107 $8.54 $11.04 $£9.84 No Bid
72 36” X 10” $10.25 $13.26 $9.95 No Bid
73 42” X 10” $11.96 $15.46 $13.78 | NoBid
74 48" X 107 $13.67 $17.67 $15.75 | No Bid
75 547X 107 $15.38 $15.89 $17.69 | No Bid

Continued Next Page




Bid2023-356 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts, and Materials

BID RESULTS
Garden Taffic Eberl
Item # Description Lightle State Signs & Iron
Highway | Safety | Works
Sign Posts
76 10" green 2 Ibs. per ft. with | ¢3¢ | §3670 | $29.95 | $24.00
tapered end
Brackets
77 #8 Metro Wing w/set screws $8.50 $8.40 $9.00 $18.00
78 VS-800 24” cantilever bracket $13.80 $18.80 $19.95 | $24.00
79 VS-B36 36” cantilever bracket $48.50 $54.60 $75.00 | NoBid
Side Mount for Wood Post, Pine .
80 & U-Channel Post Style #731F $4.80 $19.97 $8.50 | NoBid
gy | Springloaded ;;tgy“ post—heavy | 5000 | $280.60 | $178.00 | No Bid
Delivery in working days ARO |30-45 days |45-60 days| 7-10 days | 20 Days




Bid2023-357 Power Wash Plus Cleaner & Degreaser

e 6 Bids received

Shur-Az Inc.
871 High St.
Central Falls, R1 02863

Banner Systems
135 Elliot St.
Brockton, MA 02302

Superior Industrial Products Corporation
155 New Bridge St.
West Springfield, MA 01089

Likarr, Inc.
6 Perry Dr.
Foxboro, MA 02035

Acuity Specialty Products, Inc.
Dba Zep Sales & Service
600 Galleria Parkway

C.W. Nowlin Enterprises, LLC
336 Riverview Road
Madison Heights, VA 24572

Banner Superior Acuity
Shur-Az . Likarr, Inc. Specialty CW Nowlin
Systems Industrial
Products
Price per 55-
gallon drum $265.00 $278.57 $310.00 $445.68 $555.00 $648.65
Brand Shur-Az Simonize Superior Savi Zep 01385- Am
Power Wash | Film Fyter | Industrial P 5”‘;[ ZEPXT- | "I‘iag o
Plus F1140055 | Force Plus roducts | 3600 55GL | OmC
Delivery/Calendar
Days ARO > 10 7 5-10 10-15 5.7




Bid2023-358 Grass Seed Mixtures

o 2 Bids received
SiteOne Landscape Supply
1385 East 36™ Street
Cleveland, OH 44114
Seeton Turf Warehouse, LLC.
Dba Noble Turf
25 Roland Ave.
Mt. Laurel, ND 08054
Item Description SiteOne Landscape Seeton Turf
Supply
1 Mixture #1
Kentucky Blue Grass/Perennial
Ryegrass
#20-13-250 Lesco 50/50 Landmark Seed
a Blend & Grade Select 50 Ib. Blue/Rye Mixture 50/50
b. Unit Price/lb. Delivered $2.97 $3.96
C. Unit Price/lb. Pick Up $2.97 $3.96
2 Mixture #2
30-62-950 Lesco Double | Landmark See Tri-Rye
Blend & Grade Eagle Blend 50 Ib. Mixture
b. Unit Price/lb. Delivered $2.67 $2.78
C. Unit Price/lb. Pick Up $2.67 $2.78
Delivery in Calendar Days 3-7 Days ARO 7 Days




Bid2023-359 On-Call Electrical Maintenance & Repairs (WSA)

¢ 2 Bids received

Kent County Electrical Services
1081 West Shore Rd.
Warwick, RI 02889

East Bay Power, LLC
43 Lamson Rd.
Barrington, R1 02806

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page



KENT COUNTY ELECTRICAL

Part B — Financial Considerations (25 points)

Labor Rates

The Iabor rates shall be in US Funds and are all fnclusive without lmitation, wages, ben
mobilization and demobilization, supervision, insurance, all licenses, permits, overhead

requirements necessary for the commencement, perfonmance and completion of the Work.

Materials will be itemized and charged separately.

All Work performed is to be in accordance with all governing regulatory authorities within the

vehicle, fuel, tools,
d profit and all other

City of Warwick

and the State of Rhode Island and will abide by local and state building and electrical codes influding the NEC

National Electrical Code WSA
Electrical Ioumeyman ' Price per Honr

Regular Time: 8:00 am to 5:00 pm )

Monday to Friday 105.00 PER HOUR

Overtime 155.00 PER HOUR

Sat/Suon/Statutory Holidays 155.00 PER HOUR

Minimum Call Out Hours 295.00 REG HOURS - 395.00 AFTER HOURS
- General Foreman . - _Pxioepérﬁdhr_-- -

Regular Time: 8:00 am to 5:00 pm

Monday to Fridzy 105.00 PER HOUR

Overtime 155.00 PER HOUR

Sat/Sun/Statutory Holidays 155.00 PER HOUR

Minimum Call Qut Hours 205.00 REG HOURS - 395.00 AFTER HOURS
Eleclncal Appredtice . : Bnccpa Hour

Regular Time: 8:00 am to 5:00 pm.

Monday to Friday 105.00 PER HOUR

Overtime 155.00 PER HOUR

SWS‘_WSW"W Holidays 155.00 PER HOUR

Minimum Call Out Hours 205,00 REG. HOURS - 395.00 AFTER HOURS

24




KENT COUNTY ELECTRICAL

Mark-up: Materials / Rental equipment / Sub-contracior

Mark-up rate on:

Materials = 10 %
Rental Equipment = 0 %
Sub-Contractor Costs = 0 %

Travel Time:
Please indicate Yes/No if travel time is charged. If yes, state how travel time is calculated.
NO

Charge for Vehicle

$ NO CHARGE Jhr. or




EAST BAY POWER

Part B — Financial Considerations (25 points)

Labor Rates

The labor rates shall be in US Funds and are all inclusive without limitation. wages, benefits. vehicle, fuel, tools
mobilization and demobilization, supervigion, insurance, all licenses, permits, overhead and profit and all othe
requirements necessary for the commencement. performance and completion of the Work.

Materials will be itemized and charged separately.

All Work performed is to be in accordance with all governing regulatory authorities within the City of Warwick
and the State of Rhode Island and will abide by local and state building and electrical codes including the NEC
National Electrical Code WSA

Regutar Time: 8:00 am to 5:00 pm
Monday to Friday

Overtime

Sat/Sun/Statutory Holidays

Minimum Call Out Hours

Monday to Friday

Overtime

| Sat/Sun/Statutory Holidays

Minimum Call Out Hours

R

Monday to Friday j’ | 6 -8
Overtime j 9 éh

Sat/Sun/Stattory Holidays j’ f / (7/

Minimum Call Out Hours 3 hrs.

74



EAST BAY POWER

Mark-up: Materials / Renfal equipment / Sub-contractoer

Mark-up rate on:

Materials = 1O %
Rental Equipment = o %
Sub-Contractor Costs = |0 S
Travel Time:

Please indicate Yes/No if travel time is charged. If yes, state how travel ime is calculated.
We O’omn“}' C/‘mr<9 Clh mll/n’-“ccwj_e . Once o seérvece

‘ 7 4 v .
CC‘«H is r (-"Cll(-’ufcj "f"L? J"‘Mé’ c[\aﬂferj J\J‘ Eos"Prj
,z ' 4 -\
BN YIACR ch” WS f‘(’(‘at"\JFf/ = WA‘F"M service is '
COﬁ‘P}F?LF . TZ,‘; (s Or\/i)/ 74:/“ emery r’ﬂf/\y Ca//s .

!
AU g Pm:ra/ (no fimie r@shia/nd) Serulee CQU! are

)’)i‘}/?f fnf Hmp 6A 5':'119 .

Charge for Vehicle

$ '__ fhr. or — Trip

el



LY

e 5 Bids received

Continued next page

Bid2023-371 Purchase Migma Flashing Pedestrian Crossing Signals

Migma Systems, Inc.
1600 Providence Highway
Walpole, MA 02081

Arden Engineering Constructors, LLC
505 Narragansett Park Dr.
Pawtucket, RI 02861

Technology International, Inc.
1331 South International Parkway, Suite 2251
Lake Mary, FL 32746

Garden State Highway Products, Inc.
301 Riverside Dr.
Millville, NJ 08332

ANJ Electric Eye, LLC

81 Western Industrial Dr., Unit D
Cranston, RI 02921

Pricing as Follows




Bid2023-371 Purchase Migma Flashing Pedestrian Crossing Signals
BID RESULTS

Migma Systems

Arden Englneering

Technology International

Garden State Highway

AN Electric Eye

Description Qty. Price Per Unit | Total Amount |Price Per Unit|{ Total Amount] Price Per Unit | Total Amount | Price Per Unit | Total Amount| Price Per Unit| Total Amount
Flashing
Pedestrian
Crossing Sign 8 $1,540.00 $12,320.00 $1,860.00 | $14,880.00 $2,125.00 $17,000.00 $2,419.48 | $19,355.84 | 5$3,100.00 $24,800.00
Fully Assembled
Square Posts 8 $120.00 $960.00 $140.00 $1,120.00 $185.00 $1,480.00 $122.45 $979.60 $375.00 $3,000,00
Dellvery & Froo ot | Fresomsre
Instaltation $0.00 50.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 Included Included $9,600.00 $9,600.00
installation | installation
Asslstance
support support




FRANK J. PICOZZI
MAYOR

FRANCIS M. GOMEZ
PURCHASING AGENT

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 PosT ROAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
TEL(401)738-2013
FAX (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To: Peder Schaefer, Finance Director
From: Francis M. Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Date:  February 3, 2023

Re: Agenda for Tuesday, February 28, 2023

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2 starting
at 11:00 am.
Bid2023-356 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts, and Materials
Bid2023-357 Power Wash Plus Cleaner & Degreaser
Bid2023-358 Grass Seed Mixtures
Bid2023-359 On-Call Electrical Maintenance & Repairs

Bid2023-371 Purchase Migma Flashing Pedestrian Crossing Signals



Date: February 28, 2023

Bid2023-356 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts, and Materials
Bid2023-357 Power Wash Plus Cleaner & Degreaser
Bid2023-358 Grass Seed Mixtures
Bid2023-359 On-Call Electrical Maintenance & Repairs

Bid2023-371 Purchase Migma Flashing Pedestrian Crossing Signals

Name (please print neatly) Companv/Email Address
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