

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent



Frank J. Picozzi
Mayor

City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364

Bid Minutes Tuesday, March 14, 2023

Bid2024-007 **Spring Repairs & Related Work**

Bid2024-008 **Hydraulic Parts & Repairs**

Bid2024-010 **HVAC Services for Thayer/Warburton Arenas**

Location: The meeting was held at in Meeting Room 2

Present: Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent
 Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist

Representatives: Doug Palmer, Palmer Spring
 Erwin Ashenbrenner, Northstar Mechanical

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are March 20, 2023 and April 3, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The City Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00 P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent

Bid2024-007 Spring Repairs & Related Work

- 2 Bids Received

Palmer Spring Co.
1 Althea Street
Providence, RI 02907

Woodward Spring Shop
9 Cutting Ave.
Cranston, RI 02920

<u>Description</u>	Palmer Spring		Woodward Spring Shop	
	<u>Year 1</u>	<u>Year 2</u>	<u>Year 1</u>	<u>Year 2</u>
Hourly Labor Rate	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
Percentage over Industry Replacement Parts Cost	25%	25%	28%	28%

See Attached Sample Parts Sheets

Bid2024-008 Hydraulic Parts & Repairs

- 1 Bid received

Tri-Power Sales & Service Inc.
 64 Minnesota Ave.
 Warwick, RI 02888

Item #	Description	Part No.	List price	Percentage off	Net price
1.	Hydraulic pump, Muncie or equivalent	YMPH-100-H4-KSB	\$268.75	0	\$268.75
2.	Hydraulic or Air Valves, Muncie, Hydrastar, Parker or equivalent	191480	See note		
3.	Hydraulic Hoses and Fittings, Gates brand	G34165-1010	\$60.60	50%	\$30.30
		6G-8MFFOR	\$49.20	50%	\$24.60
4.	Hydraulic Adapters, Gates or equivalent	G60289-0808	\$24.38	50%	\$12.19
		G60520-0606	\$12.38	50%	\$6.19
5.	Cables and controls, Gates or equivalent	VC GTX-10	\$78.92	25%	\$59.19
6.	Electric/Hydraulic Pump, Monarch	8111-A	\$280.00	29%	\$199.00
7.	Absorbent pads	DP12WHP	N/A		
8.	Absorbent booms	SKB-U	N/A		
9.	Replacement parts for:				
	a. Muncie	TGGSKC	See Note		
	b. Greson	K-6027	See Note		
	c. Commercial	H2136101	See Note		
	d. Hydrastar	HS85-1020	See Note		
	e. Vickers	PVE-19	See Note		
		PVE-21	See Note		
	f. Sundstrand	HPX-95103540001	See Note		
10.	Central Grease/Auto Grease System Replacement Parts, Lincoln brand	644-46173-5	See Note		

Note: Vendor does not have published list price for these items. All discounts are between 0 – 50% depending on the manufacturer.

	<u>YEAR 1</u>	<u>YEAR 2</u>
Labor rate per hour for repairs	\$80.00	\$80.00
Percentage off parts not listed above	<u>Dependent on Manufacturer</u>	

Bid2024-010 HVAC Services for Thayer/Warburton Arenas

- 3 Bids received

Environmental Systems, Inc.
 2980 West Shore Rd. Unit #4
 Warwick, RI 02886

Northstar Refrigeration, Inc.
 95 Camelot Drive Unit 1
 Plymouth, MA 02360

ARC Mechanical
 500 Research Drive
 Wilmington, MA 01887

		Environmental Systems	Northstar Refrigeration	ARC Mechanical
A.	Repair Service			
1.	Hourly Labor Rate Mechanical Contractor Master “A” or Refrigeration Contractor Master Class I or Pipefitter Contractor Master Class I			
	Normal Hours	\$125.00/hour	\$128.00/hour	\$178.00/hour
	Overtime Hours	\$187.50/hour	\$184.00/hour	\$267.00/hour
	Weekend & Holiday Hours	\$187.50/hour	\$184.00/hour	\$267.00/hour
2.	Hourly Labor Rate Refrigeration – Journeyman Class I			
	Normal Hours	\$125.00/hour	\$128.00/hour	\$178.00/hour
	Overtime Hours	\$187.50/hour	\$184.00/hour	\$267.00/hour
	Weekend & Holiday Hours	\$187.50/hour	\$184.00/hour	\$267.00/hour
3.	Hourly Labor Rate – Other (if needed)			
	Normal Hours	No Bid	\$104.00/hour	No Bid
	Overtime Hours	No Bid	\$150.00/hour	No Bid
	Weekend & Holiday Hours	No Bid	\$150.00/hour	No Bid
B.	Parts			
1.	Cost Plus %	20%	15%	20%