

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION 3275 POST ROAD WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886 TEL (401) 738-2013 FAX (401) 737-2364

Bid Minutes Tuesday, March 19, 2024

Bid2024-399 Design, Print & Mail 2023 Consumer Confidence Report

Bid2024-400 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts & Materials

Bid2025-001 Maintenance & Repairs at Thayer Warburton Ice Plant

Bid2025-018 Veterinary Services for Shelter Animals

Location: The meeting was held at in Meeting Room 2

Present: Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent

Frances Gray, Bid Specialist

Representatives:

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are April 22, 2024 and May 6, 2024 at Warwick City Hall. The City Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00 P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

The Finance Committee meeting and City Council meeting can also be viewed LIVE on the City of Warwick's YouTube Channel by searching <u>@City of Warwick 1931</u>.

Respectfully Submitted,

Original Signature on File

Francis M. Gomez Purchasing Agent

Bid2024-399 Design, Print & Mail 2023 Consumer Confidence Report

• 2 Bids Received

Talient Action Group 105 Faltin Dr. Manchester, NH 03101

Graphic Image, Inc. 561 Boston Post Rd. Milford, CT 06460

Pricing as Follows

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

(PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL)

PRICING SHEET

Vendor Name:

Talient Action Group

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RELATED TO DESIGN, PRINTING AND MAILING OF CONSUMER CONFIDENCE REPORTS

Item No.	Estimated Quantity	Size and : Description	Unit Price Bid	Total Amount
1)	Total Cost	All labor, materials and services necessary to produce the ready for printing, final photo proof Warwick Water Division Consumer Confidence Report in accordance with the Bid	12 hrs. @ \$80/hour	
		Specifications, Instructions and Directions given by the Warwick Water Division including all design, layout artwork and text.		
		·		
v			tal Cost \$ <u>960.00</u>	
,	*Assun	To nes we will receive the native files for the	· ·	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

(PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL)

Item No.	Estimated Quantity	Size and Description	Unit Price Bid	Total Amount
		•	·	
3)	27,500 Pric	e per copy to fold, label, sort,		
		and deliver to the U.S. Postal		
	,	Service for bulk mailing of the		
		Warwick Water Division		
		Consumer Confidence Report		
		In accordance with the Bid		•
	•	Specifications, Instructions		÷.
		and Directions given by the		
		Warwick Water Division	\$ <u>.066</u>	\$ <u>1,815.00</u> *
		Lump sum Price in Word	s One thousand eight h	undred fifteen dollars and no c
		Samp Bank Files III (1 of the	DIO HOGOLIO CIGIREI	andred intest) dollars and ho o
	*This price show	dd not include the cost of postage.	Postage will be paid	d separately.
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
	_			
	-			
	Total Bid Price	\$ 6.599.00		
	Total Bid Price	\$ <u>6,599.00</u>		_
	Total Bid Price	\$ 6,599.00		_
	Total Bid Price	\$ <u>6,599.00</u>	ν	
	Total Bid Price	\$ 6,599.00	v	
	Total Bid Price	\$ 6,599.00	ν	
4)			·	<u>.</u>
4)	Total Bid Price	Price increase per printed		<u>. </u>
4)		Price increase per printed copy for each additional		
4)		Price increase per printed copy for each additional color selection requested	V	<u>. </u>
4)		Price increase per printed copy for each additional color selection requested in the final report beyond	V	<u>. </u>
4)		Price increase per printed copy for each additional color selection requested		
4)		Price increase per printed copy for each additional color selection requested in the final report beyond the two colors indicated in	\$.0056	
4)		Price increase per printed copy for each additional color selection requested in the final report beyond the two colors indicated in Bid item #2.	\$0056	

NOTE: Any company which intends to submit a bid for this project should view and inspect a copy of the prior year report at the Water Division office at 935 Sandy Lane, Warwick, RI 02889 or request a copy to be mailed if available.

TITLE OF SPECIFICATION: <u>Bid 2024-399 Design, Print, & Mail 2023 Consumer Confidence Report</u>

Vendor Name:	Talient Action Group		

Pricing Summary

E.	Total Lump Sum A-D	\$ 6,599.00*
D.	Item #4 Each Additional Color Added	\$0056
C.	Item #3 Copy/Fold/Label/Sort	\$ <u>1,815.00</u>
B.	Item #2 Color Print	\$ 3,824.00
A.	Item #1 Labor/Materials/Services	\$ 960.00

*Total Lump Sum does not include cost for additional copies requested over 27,500.

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

(PRICING SHEET MAY \underline{NOT} BE CONFIDENTIAL)

PRICING SHEET

Vendor Name:

Graphic Image, Inc.

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RELATED TO DESIGN, PRINTING AND MAILING OF CONSUMER CONFIDENCE REPORTS

Item No.	Estimated Quantity	Size and Unit Price Total Description Bid Amou	n t
1)	Total Cost	All labor, materials and services necessary to produce the ready for printing, final photo proof Warwick Water Division Consumer Confidence Report in accordance with the Bid Specifications, Instructions and Directions given by the Warwick Water Division including all design, layout artwork and text.	
		Total Cost \$ 658.00	
	·	Six Hundred Fifty Eight + 0/10	O Dollars
2) .	27,500	Price to color print the, Warwick Water Division Consumer Confidence Report In accordance with the Bid Specifications, Instructions and Directions given by the Warwick Water Division and in accordance with Purchase Order Minimum 2 color to be used for bidding purposes. Lump Sum Price \$3,262.00 Three Thousand Two Hundred Sixty Two + 0/100 Dol	

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

(PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL)

Vendor Name: Graphic Image, Inc.

Item. No.	Estimated Quantity	Size and Description	Unit Price Bid	Total Amount
3)	27,500 Pric	se per copy to fold, label, sort, and deliver to the U.S. Postal Service for bulk mailing of the Warwick Water Division Consumer Confidence Report In accordance with the Bid Specifications, Instructions and Directions given by the Warwick Water Division	\$0528727 <u>2/pie</u> ce	\$ <u>1,454.00</u> *
		Lump sum Price in Word	S One Thousand Four Hund	ired Fifty Four + 0/100 Dollars
,	*This price sho	uld not include the cost of postage.	Postage will be paid se	parately.
	Total Bid Price	· 	Hundred Seventy Four + 0/100 D	ollars
4)	27,500	Price increase per printed copy for each additional color selection requested in the final report beyond the two colors indicated in Bid item #2.		
•		Each Color Per Printed Copy	\$ No Charge	

NOTE: Any company which intends to submit a bid for this project should view and inspect a copy of the prior year report at the Water Division office at 935 Sandy Lane, Warwick, RI 02889 or request a copy to be mailed if available.

TITLE OF SPECIFICATION: <u>Bid 2024-399 Design, Print, & Mail 2023 Consumer Confidence Report</u>

Vendor Name: Graphic Image, Inc.

Pricing Summary

A.	Item #1 Labor/Materials/Services	\$ <u>658.00</u>
B.	Item #2 Color Print	\$3,262.00
C.	Item #3 Copy/Fold/Label/Sort	\$ 1,454.00
D.	Item #4 Each Additional Color Added	\$ No Charge
E.	Total Lump Sum A-D	\$ 5,374.00

Bid2024-400 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts & Materials

• 7 Bids Received

Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC. P.O. Box 329 Frankfort, OH 45628

> Vulcan, Inc. d/b/a Vulcan Signs P.O. Box 1850 Foley, AL 36536

American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc. P.O. Box 1449 Orange Park, FL 32067

> Sign Solutions USA, LLC. 2501 8th Ave. NW West Fargo, ND 58078

National Highway Products, Inc. 301 Riverside Drive Millville, NJ 08332

> Osburn Associates, Inc. P.O. Box 912 Logan, OH 43138

Eberl Iron Works, Inc. 128 Sycamore St. Buffalo, NY 14204

Pricing as Follows

Vendor Name: Lightle Enterprises of Ming LLC

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

	Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS			
Itiani. ::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::	Description	Eild -		
# # #	The second secon			
-	Finished with Standard Message			
1	12" X 24"	13.10		
2	12" X 18"	9,83		
3	18" X 24"	19.65		
4	18" X 24" No thru trucking	19,65		
5	18" X 24" No thru traffic	19.65		
6	24" X 30"	3275		
7	30" X 18"	24.56		
8	24" square, diamond or pentagon	26.20		
9	24" octagon	2620		
10	36" square or diamond or fluorescent yellow/green -			
10	ASTM Type IX or XI	71,73		
11	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	49,56		
12	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	7173		
13	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	12688		
14	30" octagon	40,00		
15	36" X 12" printed 1 side	19:65		
16	36" X 12" printed both sides	23,65		
17	30" triangle	23.58		
18	36" triangle	29.5%		
	Finished sign - No message			
19	12" X 24"	12.80		
20	12" X 18"	9,60		
21	18" X.24"	19.20		
22	24" X 30"	3200		
23	30" X 18"	24.00		
24	24" square, diamond or pentagon	25,60		
25	24" octagon	2960		
65	36" square or diamond - fluorescent yellow/green -			
26	ASTM Type IX or XI	70.02		
27	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	48,63		
28	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	10,02		
29	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	150,20		
30	30" octagon	39,50		
31	36" X 12"	19.20		
32	36" X 12"	19,20		
33	30" triangle	21/12		
34	36" triangle	2880		
	·			

Continued next page

Vendor Name:	•	
	 	$\overline{}$

Property and Parks	1 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MA	
Item		
#		
	Marking Tape	
25	ACCORD WILLS Character David Tone 122 V 20 and	20000
35	A270ES White Stamark Brand Tape 12" X 30 yds.	369.25
	Deflective Chesting	
	Reflective Sheeting	
- 36	ASTM Type I sheeting – all colors/sq. ft.	1,20
30	Hi-Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	1120
37	ASTM Type IV – all colors	1,35
	EC Film (E.C. transparent overlay on paper liner),	1
38	unpunched, all colors/sq.ft.	128
		+
39	ASTM XI reflective sheeting, all colors/sq.ft.	2.72
	22	
	Anti-graffiti overlay film	
40	36" x 50 yd	738,000
41	48" x 50 yd	984,00
	Opaque Film	•
42	2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film -black & white/sq. ft.	1113
43	2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film - all colors/sq. ft.	100
	Prespacing Tape	
44	6" X 100 yards/price per roll	40,50
45	12" x 100 yards/price per roll	8400
46	24" X 100 yards/price per roll	162.00
47	36" X 100 yards/price per roll	243.00
	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	<u> </u>
	1000000	1 000
48	14" X 6"	222
49	16" X 6"	253
50	18" X 6"	1 2.8.5 2.5.
51	20" X 6"	3,11
52	24" X 6"	3,80
53	30" X 6"	<u> </u>
54	36" X 6"	5170

Vendor Name:

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

	Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL PUSTS & MATERIALS			
lten.	- Description -	and and		
	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole			
55	10" X 8"	2/2		
56	12" X 8"	2.53		
57	14" X 8"	2.96		
58	16" X 8"	339		
59	18" X 8"	330		
60	20" X 8"	423		
61	24" X 8"	5,09		
62	30" X 8"	634		
63	36" X 8"	7.60		
64	10" X 10"	2.64		
65	12" X 10"	3.17		
66	14" X 10"	3.70		
67	16" X 10"	423		
68	18" X 10"	475		
69	20" X 10"	528		
70	24" X 10"	6,33		
71	30" X 10"	7,92		
72	36" X 10"	950		
73	42" X 10"	11,08		
74	48" X 10"	1267		
75	54" X 10"	1425		
	Sign Posts			
7.6	102 man 2 the man B with toward and	17.0		
76 77	10' green 2 lbs. per ft. with tapered end 12' square galvanized posts 2 2 2	C C C C C		
		68785 177710		
78	3' square anchor post 24' y 24'	1.1/ 1//		
	Brackets			
79	#8 Metro Wing w/set screws	9,98		
80	VS-800 24" cantilever bracket	1 1496		
81	VS-B36 36" cantilever bracket	48,90		
82	Side Mount for Wood Post, Pine & U-Channel Post Style #731F	220		
83	Spring loaded sign post – heavy duty	139 60		
62	Dhing tourse sign boot - ment & curt	1 10 11 JU		

Delivery 30-45 working days ARO

Vendor Name: Vulcan Inc dba Vulcan Signs

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

	Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS		
Item #	Description	Bid	
	Finished with Standard Message		
_			
ī	12" X 24"	11.10	
2 -	12" X 18"	8.48	
3	18" X 24"	15.60	
4	18" X 24" No thru trucking	15.60	
5	18" X 24" No thru traffic	15.60	
6	24" X 30"	26.00	
7	30" X 18"	19.50	
8	24" square, diamond or pentagon	20.80	
9	24" octagon	19.29	
10	36" square or diamond or fluorescent yellow/green -		
10	ASTM Type IX or XI	56.25	
11	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	39.06	
12	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	56.25	
13	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	100.00	
14	30" octagon	29.07	
15	36" X 12" printed 1 side	15.60	
16	36" X 12" printed both sides	23.55	
17	30" triangle	16.72	
18	36" triangle	22.49	
	Finished sign - No message		
19	12" X 24"	11.10	
20	12" X 18"	8.48	
21	18" X 24"	15.60	
22	24" X 30"	26.00	
23	30" X 18"	19.50	
24	24" square, diamond or pentagon	20.80	
25	24" octagon	19.29	
26	36" square or diamond - fluorescent yellow/green -		
26	ASTM Type IX or XI	56.25	
27	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	39.06	
28	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	56.25	
29	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	100.00	
30	30" octagon	29.07	
31 ·	36" X 12"	15.60	
32	36" X 12"	15.60	
33	30" triangle	16.72	
34	36" triangle	22.49	

Continued next page

Vendor Name: Vulcan Inc dba Vulcan Signs

Item #	Description	Bid
	Marking Tape	
35	A270ES White Stamark Brand Tape 12" X 30 yds.	650.00
	Reflective Sheeting	
36	ASTM Type I sheeting – all colors/sq. ft.	1.35/sf
37	Hi-Intensity Prismatic Sheeting Quoted DG3 ASTM Type IV – all colors **VIP Discontinued	2.45/sf
38	EC Film (E.C. transparent overlay on paper liner), unpunched, all colors/sq.ft.	1.01/sf
39	ASTM XI reflective sheeting, all colors/sq.ft.	2.45/sf
-	Anti-graffiti overlay film	
40	36" x 50 yd	652.50
41	48" x 50 yd	870.00
	Opaque Film	
42	2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film -black & white/sq. ft.	.81/sf
43	2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film - all colors/sq. ft.	1.53/sf
	Prespacing Tape	
44	6" X 100 yards/price per roll	41,65
45	12" x 100 yards/price per roll	80.14
46	24" X 100 yards/price per roll	160.29
47	36" X 100 yards/price per roll	240.42
	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	
48	14" X 6"	2.05
49	16" X 6"	2.35
50	18" X 6"	2.57
51	20" X 6"	2.93
52	24" X 6"	3.67
53	30" X 6"	4.65
54	36" X 6"	5.22

Vendor Name: Vulcan Inc dba Vulcan Signs

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

Item #	Description	Bid
	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	
55	10" X 8"	1.96
56	12" X 8"	2.35
57	14" X 8"	2.74
58	16" X 8"	3.13
59	18" X 8"	3.51
60	20" X 8"	3.90
61	24" X 8"	4.40
62	30"X 8"	5.52
63	36" X 8"	6.61
64	10" X 10"	2.43
65	12" X 10"	2.93
66	14" X 10"	3.40
67	16" X 10"	3.90
68	18" X 10"	4.39
69	20" X 10"	4.88
70	24" X 10"	5.96
71	30" X 10" .	6.88
72	36" X 10"	8.26
73	42" X 10"	9.65
74	48" X 10"	10.39
75	54" X 10"	11.70
	Sign Posts	
76	10' green 2 lbs. per ft. with tapered end	27.65
77	12' square galvanized posts Quoted 2" SQ 12ga 12' Post	
78	3' square anchor post Quoted 2.25" SQ 12ga 3' Post	17.75
	Brackets	· ·
		(2.22
79	#8 Metro Wing w/set screws	10.60
80	VS-800 24" cantilever bracket	19.62
81	VS-B36 36" cantilever bracket	47.26
82	Side Mount for Wood Post, Pine & U-Channel Post Style #731F	8.31
83	Spring loaded sign post – heavy duty	174.60

Delivery 30 working days ARO

Vendor Name:	AMERICAN TRAFFIC SAFETY MATERIALS, INC.
T CHUOT I THINC.	

<u>Bid</u>	2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MAI	LKIA	<u> </u>
Item	Description		Bid
#	<u> </u>		
	Finished with Standard Message		
1	12" X 24"	NO	BIC
2	12" X 18"		<u> </u>
3	18" X 24"		
4	18" X 24" No thru trucking		<u> </u>
5	18" X 24" No thru traffic		
6	24" X 30"		
7	30" X 18"		
8	24" square, diamond or pentagon		
9	24" octagon		
	36" square or diamond or fluorescent yellow/green -		
10	ASTM Type IX or XI		_
11	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI		
12	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI		
13	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI		
14	30" octagon		
15	36" X 12" printed 1 side		
16	36" X 12" printed both sides		
17	30" triangle		
18	36" triangle		
<u> </u>			
	Finished sign - No message		
19	12" X 24"		
20	12" X 18"		
21	18" X 24"		
22	24" X 30"		
23	30" X 18"		
24	24" square, diamond or pentagon		
25	24" octagon		
	36" square or diamond - fluorescent yellow/green -		
26	ASTM Type IX or XI		
27	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI		
28	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	<u> </u>	
29	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI		
30	30" octagon		
31	36" X 12"		
32	36" X 12"	<u> </u>	
33	30" triangle		
34	36" triangle		\bigvee

Vendor Name:		
--------------	--	--

Item #	Description	Bid
	Marking Tape	
35	A270ES White Stamark Brand Tape 12" X 30 yds.	NOBIO
	Reflective Sheeting	
36	ASTM Type I sheeting – all colors/sq. ft.	1-205F
	Hi-Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	1,
37	ASTM Type IV – all colors	11.155F
_	EC Film (E.C. transparent overlay on paper liner),	
38	unpunched, all colors/sq.ft.	1-06.5
39	ASTM XI reflective sheeting, all colors/sq.ft.	NO Bid
	Anti-graffiti overlay film	
•		
40	36" x 50 yd	151156
41	48" x 50 yd	690.00
	O-come Eiles	
40	Opaque Film 2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Filmblack & white/sq. ft.	2456
42_	2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film - all colors/sq. ft.	9556
43	2 Will Cast HF Vinyi Opaque Finn - an colors sq. 1.	1-1-2-1-2F
	Prespacing Tape	
	1105packing 1450	
44	6" X 100 yards/price per roll	27.00
45	12" x 100 yards/price per roll	54.00
46	24" X 100 yards/price per roll	108-00
47	36" X 100 yards/price per roll	162.00
	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	
		NO Bid
48	14" X 6"	
49	16" X 6"	
50	18" X 6"	
51	20" X 6"	
52	24" X 6"	
53	30" X 6"	
54	36" X 6"	<u> </u>

Vendor Name:	·
Vendor Mame.	

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CI	HANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS_
--------------------------------	---------------------------

Item	2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNELL I OSTS & MAXI	Bid
#	Description	Bid
"		
	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	7
55	10" X 8"	NOBIC
56	12" X 8"	
57	14" X 8"	
58	16" X 8"	
-59	18" X 8"	
60	20" X 8"	<u></u>
61	24" X 8"	
62	30" X 8"	
63	36" X 8"	
64	10" X 10"	
65	12" X 10"	
66	14" X 10"	
67	16" X 10"	
68	18" X 10"	
69	20" X 10"	
70	24" X 10"	
71	30" X 10"	
72	36" X 10"	
73	42" X 10"	
74	48" X 10"	
75	54" X 10"	
	Sign Posts	
76	10' green 2 lbs. per ft. with tapered end	1
77	12' square galvanized posts	
78	3' square anchor post	-
	· _ · · _ · · _ · · _ · · _ · · _ · · _ · · _ ·	
	Brackets	
		
79	#8 Metro Wing w/set screws	<u> </u>
80	VS-800 24" cantilever bracket	
81	VS-B36 36" cantilever bracket	<u> </u>
93	Side Mount for Wood Post, Pine & U-Channel Post Style	
82	#731F	
83	Spring loaded sign post – heavy duty	\ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \

Delivery 5 working days ARO

Vendor Name: Sign Solutions USA, LLC

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

Item	2024-100 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL TOSTS & MATERIALS		
#	Description	- Bid	
	Finished with Standard Message		
1	12" X 24"	\$15.12	
2	12" X 18"	\$11.34	
3	18" X 24"	\$22.68	
4	18" X 24" No thru trucking	\$22.68	
5	18" X 24" No thru traffic	\$22.68	
6	24" X 30"	\$37.81	
7	30" X 18"	\$28.35	
8	24" square, diamond or pentagon	\$30.25	
9	24" octagon	\$28.13	
10	36" square or diamond or fluorescent yellow/green -	#02.04	
10	ASTM Type IX or XI	\$83.34	
11	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	\$55.71	
12	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	\$80.22	
13	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	\$139.05	
14	30" octagon	\$39.81	
15	36" X 12" printed 1 side	\$22.68	
16	36" X 12" printed both sides	\$38.64	
17	30" triangle	\$22.11	
18	36" triangle	\$31.83	
	Finished sign – No message		
19	12" X 24"	\$15.12	
20	12" X 18"	\$11.34	
21	18" X 24"	\$22.68	
22	24" X 30"	\$37.81	
23	30" X 18"	\$28.35	
24	24" square, diamond or pentagon	\$30.25	
25	24" octagon	\$28.13	
26	36" square or diamond - fluorescent yellow/green -	#02.04	
20	ASTM Type IX or XI	\$83.34	
27	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	\$55.71	
28	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	\$80.22	
29	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	\$139.05	
30	30" octagon	\$39.81	
31	36" X 12"	\$22.68	
32	36" X 12"	\$38.64	
33	30" triangle	\$22.11	
34	36" triangle	\$31.83	

Continued next page

Vendor Name: Sign Solutions USA, LLC

Item #	Description	Bid
	Marking Tape	
35	A270ES White Stamark Brand Tape 12" X 30 yds.	\$540.39
-	Reflective Sheeting	
·	Attacen to brooking	·
36	ASTM Type I sheeting – all colors/sq. ft.	\$0.95
	Hi-Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	
37	ASTM Type IV – all colors	\$1.52
	EC Film (E.C. transparent overlay on paper liner),	04.40
38	unpunched, all colors/sq.ft.	\$1.13
	·	
39	ASTM XI reflective sheeting, all colors/sq.ft.	\$2.89
		<u> </u>
	Anti-graffiti overlay film	
. 40	267 50 4	\$766.28
40	36" x 50 yd 48" x 50 yd	\$1,000.13
41	48	1 91,000.13
	Opaque Film	
42	2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film -black & white/sq. ft.	NO BID
43	2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film - all colors/sq. ft.	NO BID
	Prespacing Tape	
44	6" X 100 yards/price per roll	\$43,15
45	12" x 100 yards/price per roll	\$157.37
. 46	24" X 100 yards/price per roll	\$308.53
47	36" X 100 yards/price per roll	\$459.18
	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	
40	1 427 \$7 622	<u> </u>
48 49	14" X 6"	\$2.33 \$2.66
.50	18" X 6"	\$2.99
51	20" X 6"	\$3.32
52	24" X 6"	\$3.99
53	30" X 6"	\$4.47
54	36" X 6"	\$5.36

Vendor Name: Sign Solutions USA, LLC

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

Item #	Description	Bid
	Ti-4 000 Class Alaska Da Har Canada Na Hala	
55	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole 10" X 8"	\$2.21
56	12" X 8"	
57	14" X 8"	\$2.66
58	16" X 8"	\$3.10
59	18" X 8"	\$3.54 \$3.99
60	20" X 8"	† · ·
61	24" X 8"	\$4.43
62	30" X 8"	\$4.77
63	36" X 8"	\$5.96
64	10" X 10"	\$7.15
65	10 X 10 12" X 10"	\$2.77
	14" X 10"	\$3.32 \$3.88
66 67	16" X 10"	<u> </u>
		\$4.43
68	18" X 10"	\$4.99
69	20" X 10"	\$5.54
70	24" X 10"	\$6.65
71	30" X 10"	\$8.31
72	36" X 10"	\$9.98
73	42" X 10"	\$11.64
74	48" X 10"	\$13.30
75	54" X 10"	\$14.96
·	Sign Posts	
76	10' green 2 lbs. per ft. with tapered end	NO BID
77	12' square galvanized posts	NO BID
78	3' square anchor post	NO BID
	Brackets	
	LA WARDEN	
79	#8 Metro Wing w/set screws	NO BID
80	VS-800 24" cantilever bracket	NO BID
81	VS-B36 36" cantilever bracket	NO BID
82	Side Mount for Wood Post, Pine & U-Channel Post Style #731F	NO BID
83	Spring loaded sign post – heavy duty	NO BID

Delivery 20 working days ARO

Vendor Name: National Highway Products, Inc

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

Item #	Description	Bid
	Finished with Standard Message	
	1	· .
1	12" X 24"	11.59
2	12" X 18"	9.13
3	18" X 24"	17.37
4	18" X 24" No thru trucking	17.37
5	18" X 24" No thru traffic	17.37
6	24" X 30"	28.96
7	30" X 18"	21.72
8	24" square, diamond or pentagon	23.17
9:	24" octagon	22.71
10	36" square or diamond or fluorescent yellow/green -	
10	ASTM Type IX or XI	63.58
11	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	43.46
12	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	62.61
13	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	111.26
14	30" octagon	31.78
15	36" X 12" printed 1 side	17.37
16	36" X 12" printed both sides	23.15
17	30" triangle	21.18
18	36" triangle	23.99
	Finished sign - No message	
19	12" X 24"	11.59
20	12" X 18"	9.13
21	18" X 24"	17.37
22	24" X 30"	28.99
23	30" X 18"	21.72
24	24" square, diamond or pentagon	23.17
· 25	24" octagon	22.71
26	36" square or diamond - fluorescent yellow/green - ASTM Type IX or XI	63.58
27	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	43.46
28	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	62.61
29	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	111.26
30	30" octagon	31.78
31	36" X 12" PRINTED - 1 SIDE	18.03
32	36" X 12" PRINTED - 2 SIDE	22.15
33	30" triangle	21.18
34	36" triangle	23.99

Continued next page

Vendor Name: National Highway Products, Inc

Description .	Bid
Marking Tape	
A270ES White Stamark Brand Tape 12" X 30 yds.	436.19
Reflective Sheeting	
ASTM Type I sheeting – all colors/sq. ft. AVERY T-1500	1.08 SF
Hi-Intensity Prismatic Sheeting	
ASTM Type IV – all colors	1.27 SF .
unpunched, all colors/sq.ft. 3M 1170	0.98 SF .
ASTM XI reflective sheeting, all colors/sq.ff. 3M 4090	2.58 SF
A at a grade and least the control of the control o	_
Anti-graffiti overlay film	
36" x 50 vd 3M 1160 1-A	635.29
150 A 20 Ju	847.06
Opaque Film	
2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film -black & white/sq. ft.	1.08 SF
2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film - all colors/sq. ft.	1.47 SF
Prespacing Tape	
C137 100 1 / 1 - 11	31.44
	53.48 120.69
	145.35
30 A 100 yards/price per for	143.33
Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	
	2.18
	2.46
	2.77
	3.70
	4.62
1.30 A 8	T.UE
	Marking Tape A270ES White Stamark Brand Tape 12" X 30 yds. Reflective Sheeting ASTM Type I sheeting – all colors/sq. ft. AVERY T-1500 Hi-Intensity Prismatic Sheeting ASTM Type IV – all colors EC Film (E.C. transparent overlay on paper liner), unpunched, all colors/sq.ft. 3M 1170 ASTM XI reflective sheeting, all colors/sq.ft. 3M 4090 Anti-graffiti overlay film 36" x 50 yd 3M 1160 1-A 48" x 50 yd 3M 1160 1-A Opaque Film 2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film –black & white/sq. ft. 2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film – all colors/sq. ft. Prespacing Tape 6" X 100 yards/price per roll 12" x 100 yards/price per roll 24" X 100 yards/price per roll 36" X 100 yards/price per roll 36" X 100 yards/price per roll

Vendor Name: National Highway Products, Inc

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

Item #	Description	Bid
	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	
55	10" X 8"	2.00
56	12" X 8"	2.38
_57	14" X 8"	2.77
58	16" X 8"	3.17
59	18" X 8"	3.49
60 .	20" X 8"	3.96
61	24" X 8"	4.64
62	30" X 8"	5.80
63	36" X 8"	7.13
64	10" X 10"	2.42
65	12" X 10"	2.90
66	14" X 10"	3.39
67	16" X 10"	3.87
68	18" X 10"	4.36
69	20" X 10"	4.84
70	24" X 10"	5.81
71	30" X 10"	7.26
72	36" X 10"	8.71
73	42" X 10"	10.16
74	48" X 10"	11.62
75	54" X 10"	13.07
	Sign Posts	
76	10' green 2 lbs. per ft. with tapered end	24.97
77	12' square galvanized posts 2"X2"X12'	48.97
78	3' square anchor post 2.5"X2.5"X36'	21.93
	Brackets	
79	#8 Metro Wing w/set screws	8.10
80	VS-800 24" cantilever bracket	18.29
81	VS-B36 36" cantilever bracket	47.56
82	Side Mount for Wood Post, Pine & U-Channel Post Style #731F 600WDX400	9.63
83	Spring loaded sign post – heavy duty IRS	275.60

Delivery 30 working days ARO

Vendor Name: 056511 Associates Inc

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

	id 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS			
Item #	Description	Bid		
	Finished with Standard Message			
_				
1	12" X 24"	1024		
2	12" X 18"	791		
3	18" X 24"	1581		
4	18" X 24" No thru trucking	1581		
5	18" X 24" No thru traffic	1581		
6	24" X 30"	26 35		
7	30" X 18"	1974		
8	24" square, diamond or pentagon	21 58		
9	24" octagon	2080		
	36" square or diamond or fluorescent yellow/green -			
10	ASTM Type IX or XI	.5724		
11	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	3975		
12	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	5724		
13	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	io1 75		
14	30" octagon	M31/2 28°		
15	36" X 12" printed 1 side	1581		
16	36" X 12" printed both sides	2025		
17	30" triangle	3214		
18	36" triangle	4743		
•	Finished sign - No message			
19	12" X 24"	980		
20	12" X 18"	735		
21	18" X 24"	1470		
22	24" X 30"	2450		
23	30" X 18"	1838		
24	24" square, diamond or pentagon	[940		
25	24" octagon	1920		
26	36" square or diamond - fluorescent yellow/green -			
26	ASTM Type IX or XI	53 12		
27	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	3/2 88		
28	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	5310		
29	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI	9440		
30	30" octagon	5120		
31	36" X 12"	1470		
32	36" X 12"	1470		
33	30" triangle	1531		
34	36" triangle	2502		

Continued next page

Vendor Name:	Osbsin	Associates	luc	

Item #	Description	Bid
	Marking Tape	
35	A270ES White Stamark Brand Tape 12" X 30 yds.	No Bill
	Reflective Sheeting	
36	ASTM Type I sheeting — all colors/sq. ft.	
37	Hi-Intensity Prismatic Sheeting ASTM Type IV — all colors	
38	EC Film (E.C. transparent overlay on paper liner), unpunched, all colors/sq.ft.	
39	ASTM XI reflective sheeting, all colors/sq.ft.	
	Anti-graffiti overlay film	
40	36" x 50 yd	
41	48" x 50 yd	
	Opaque Film	
42	2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film -black & white/sq. ft.	
43	2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film - all colors/sq. ft.	
	Prespacing Tape	
44	6" X 100 yards/price per roll	
45	12" x 100 yards/price per roll	-
46	24" X 100 yards/price per roll	
47	36" X 100 yards/price per roll	
	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	
48	14" X 6"	173
49	16" X 6"	197
50	18" X 6"	2 24
51	20" X 6"	<u></u> ਮੁਤ
52	24" X 6"	2 94
53	30" X 6"	312
54	36" X 6"	441

Vendor Name: Osbum Associates Inc

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

Item #	Description	Bid
<u> </u>	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	
55	10" X 8"	المال
56	12" X 8"	196
57	14" X 8"	232
58_	16" X 8"	263
59	18" X 8"	298
60	20" X 8"	.332
61	24" X 8"	392
62	30" X 8"	490
63	36" X 8"	588
64	10" X 10"	208
65	12" X 10"	249
66	14" X 10"	291
67	16" X 10"	337
68	18" X 10"	374
69	20" X 10"	415
70	24" X 10"	498
71	30" X 10"	621
72	36" X 10"	7 48
. 73	42" X 10"	8 49
74	48" X 10"	997
75	54" X 10"	11 18
	Sign Posts	
76	10' green 2 lbs. per ft. with tapered end	No Bul
77	12' square galvanized posts	No Big
78	3' square anchor post	Mo Bid
	Brackets	
79	#8 Metro Wing w/set screws	No Buil
80	VS-800 24" cantilever bracket	No Bil
81	VS-B36 36" cantilever bracket	No Bri
82	Side Mount for Wood Post, Pine & U-Channel Post Style #731F	40 Bid
83	Spring loaded sign post – heavy duty	No Bid

Delivery 30 working days ARO

Vendor Name: Eber Tron Works, Inc.

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

Item	Description		Bid
#			
	Finished with Standard Message		
1	12" X 24"	No	Bid
2	12" X 18"	<u>'</u>	<u> </u>
3	18" X 24"		
4	18" X 24" No thru trucking		<u> </u>
5	18" X 24" No thru traffic	<u> </u>	
6_	24" X 30"	<u> </u>	
7	30" X 18"	<u> </u>	
8	24" square, diamond or pentagon		
9_	24" octagon		
10	36" square or diamond or fluorescent yellow/green -	} }	
	ASTM Type IX or XI		_
11	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI		
12	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI		
13 -	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI		
14	30" octagon	1	•
15	36" X 12" printed 1 side		
16	36" X 12" printed both sides	- 1	
17	30" triangle	ļ \	
18	36" triangle		
		ļ '	
	Finished sign – No message		
19	12" X 24"		\
20	12" X 18"		<u> </u>
21	18" X 24"	ļ	ļ
22	24" X 30"	<u> </u>	
23	30" X 18"	<u> </u>	-
24	24" square, diamond or pentagon	<u> </u>	1
25	24" octagon	ļ	
26	36" square or diamond - fluorescent yellow/green - ASTM Type IX or XI		
27	30" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI		
28	36" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI		
29	48" square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM Type IX or XI		
30	30" octagon		<u> </u>
31	36" X 12"		
32	36" X 12"		
33	30" triangle		<u> </u>
34	36" triangle	}	1

Continued next page

Vendor Name: Elect Iron Works, Inc.

Item	Id 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL FOSTS & MATERIALS		
#	Description	Bid	
	Marking Tape	Nonid	
	:	, ,	
35	A270ES White Stamark Brand Tape 12" X 30 yds.		
	Reflective Sheeting		
36	ASTM Type I sheeting – all colors/sq. ft.		
	Hi-Intensity Prismatic Sheeting		
37	ASTM Type IV – all colors	ļ. ļ	
	EC Film (E.C. transparent overlay on paper liner),		
38	unpunched, all colors/sq.ft.		
39	ASTM XI reflective sheeting, all colors/sq.ft.		
•	Anti-graffiti overlay film		
40	36" x 50 yd		
41	48" x 50 yd	-	
	Opaque Film		
42	2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film -black & white/sq. ft.		
43	2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film - all colors/sq. ft.		
	Prespacing Tape		
44	6" X 100 yards/price per roll		
45	12" x 100 yards/price per roll	1.	
46	24" X 100 yards/price per roll	1	
47	36" X 100 yards/price per roll	1 1	
			
	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	 	
	O 1000 Compa resource and America Control of Mose	 	
48	14" X 6"	 	
49	16" X 6"	 	
50	18" X 6"		
51	20" X 6"	 	
52	24" X 6"		
53	30" X 6"		
54	36" X 6"	 	
			

Vendor Name: Eberl Fron Works, Inc.

Bid 2024-400 TRAFFIC SIGNS, CHANNEL POSTS & MATERIALS

Item	Description	Bid	
#	Description	<i>D</i> /4	
·			
	Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners No Hole	1 4 4 5 - 4	
55	10" X 8"	Nabid	
56	12" X 8"		
57	14" X 8"	<u> </u>	
58	16" X 8"		
59	18" X 8"		
60	20" X 8"		
61	24" X 8"		
62	30" X 8"		
63	36" X 8"		
64	10" X 10"		
65	12" X 10"	<u> </u>	
66	14" X 10"	 	
67	16" X 10"	ļ <u> </u>	
68	18" X 10"		
69	20" X 10"		
70	24" X 10"		
71	30" X 10"	 	
72_	36" X 10"		
73	42" X 10"		
74	48" X 10"		
75	54" X 10"		
	Sign Posts		
	,	_	
76	10' green 2 lbs. per ft. with tapered end	79,95	
77	12' square galvanized posts	59,98	
78	3' square anchor post	18.59	
	Brackets		
79	#8 Metro Wing w/set screws	Nobid	
80	VS-800 24" cantilever bracket		
81	VS-B36 36" cantilever bracket		
82	Side Mount for Wood Post, Pine & U-Channel Post Style #731F		
83	Spring loaded sign post – heavy duty		
	<u> </u>		

Delivery 30 working days ARO

Bid2025-001 Maintenance & Repairs at Thayer Warburton Ice Plant

• 1 Bids Received

Environmental Systems, Inc. 2980 West Shore Rd. Unit #4 Warwick, RI 02886

Pricing as Follows

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

(PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL)

Bid2024-010 HVAC Maintenance & Repair for Thayer & Warburton Arena

Vendor Name: Engineental Systems Inc.			
•	J		
A. REPAIR SERVICE			
Hourly Labor Rate Mechan Contractor Master "A" Or I Contractor Master Class I Contractor Master Class I	Refrigeration		
Normal Hours:	\$ 135 /hour		
Overtime Hours:	\$ <u>202 Dhour</u>		
Weekend & Holiday Hours	\$ <u>202,50/hour</u>		
2. Hourly Labor Rate Refrige	ration - Journeyman Class I		
Normal Hours:	\$ 135 /hour		
Óvertime Hours:	\$ <u>202,50/hour</u>		
Weekend & Holiday Hours	\$ <u> 202.50/hour</u>		
3. Hourly Labor Rate Other (if needed)		
Normal Hours:	\$/hour		
Overtime Hours:	\$/hour		
Weekend & Holiday Hours	\$		
B. PARTS			
1. Cost Plus	<u></u>		

Bid2025-018 Veterinary Services for Shelter Animals

• 1 Bids Received

Salmon River Veterinary Service 358 Hill St.
Coventry, RI 02816

Pricing as Follows

Vendor Name:	Salmon	Roher Not	·		
--------------	--------	-----------	---	--	--

Vet Care Pricing Page

- O The City of Warwick is currently accepting bids from Veterinarians for Veterinary care at the Warwick Shelter.
- o The shelter has a surgical suite; applicants must be able to respond to the shelter at least every two weeks and complete surgeries and vaccines. Applicants should provide a schedule of fees for the following services or combination of services.
- O Bid prices must be guaranteed for twelve (12) months or twenty four (24) months
- O The shelter purchases snap tests directly from Idexx and run the tests; applicants must be willing to sign a form from Idexx (if necessary) which will allow us to continue to do so.
- O Applicants must submit a copy of a valid license to practice Veterinary medicine in Rhode Island.

Name of Veterinary Hospital/Practice	Solvens Poles W	ata anna Carrolla
The following services are required for sh		e rational designation of the second
The following services are required for sh	eter ammais:	
•		Price per animal
1.Exam		\$ 25
2. canine distemper combo vaccine	\$20	
3. feline distemper combo vaccine	\$ 20	
4. rabies vaccine	`	\$ 15
5. kennel cough vaccine	\$ 20	
6. euthanasia	\$ 30	

Vendor Name: $\frac{\sum_{i} f_{i}}{\sum_{i} f_{i}}$	non Riher Vet	·	
7. Cat sterilization		Price t	er animal
cat spay	•		w/vaccing
pregnant cat spay			w/ vaccines
cat neuters		4	O w/vaccino
**If the age of the cat makes a diffe	erence in cost please ma	ke a note	
8. Dog Sterilization	•	Pric	e per animal
Dog spay (up to 25 lbs)	,	\$	105
Dog spay (26-50 lbs)		\$	145
Dog spay (over 50 lbs)		\$	160
** If you have different size catego	ries then the ones menti	oned shows places	maleo notos
ii you have uniciciii size calego	nes men die ones menn	oned above prease	make notes
** If the age of the dog makes a dif indicate the cost for all size categ	-		
·	size	age	price
•			
Dog neuter (up to 25 lbs)		\$	100
Dog neuter (26-50lbs)	•	\$	180
Dog neuter (over 50 lbs)		\$_	125
** If you have different size catego	ries then the ones menti	oned above please	make notes
	fference please		
* If the age of the dog makes a difficate the cost for all size cates	gories	•	
	gories <u>size</u>	age	price
** If the age of the dog makes a dif indicate the cost for all size cate	•	age	price
indicate the cost for all size categ	•	age	
indicate the cost for all size categorial	•	age	price O
indicate the cost for all size categorial	•	age \$_	
indicate the cost for all size categories. Phone consultation	•	\$ _	

FRANCIS M. GOMEZ PURCHASING AGENT



FRANK J. PICOZZI MAYOR

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 POST ROAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
TEL (401)738-2013
FAX (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To: Peder Schaefer, Finance Director

From: Francis M. Gomez, Purchasing Agent

Date: March 19, 2024

Re: Agenda for Tuesday, March 19, 2024

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2 starting at 11:00 am.

Bid2024-399 Design, Print & Mail 2023 Consumer Confidence Report

Bid2024-400 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts & Materials

Bid2025-001 Maintenance & Repairs at Thayer Warburton Ice Plant

Bid2025-018 Veterinary Services for Shelter Animals

Date: March 19, 2024

Bid2024-399 Design, Print & Mail 2023 Consumer Confidence Report Bid2024-400 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts & Materials Bid2025-001 Maintenance & Repairs at Thayer Warburton Ice Plant Bid2025-018 Veterinary Services for Shelter Animals

Name (please print neatly)	·	Company/Email Address
Francis Gamez	PA	Cow
Frances Gay	PA Bil specialut	Con
, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	·	<u> </u>
	·	
		,