
 

Patricia A. Peshka                                    Frank J. Picozzi 

Purchasing Agent                                     Mayor 

      

 

City of Warwick 

Purchasing Division 

3275 Post Road 

Warwick, Rhode Island 02886 

Tel (401) 738-2013 

Fax (401) 737-2364 

 

Bid Minutes Wednesday, April 6, 2022 

 

 

 Bid2022-385 Design, Print, & Mail Consumer Confidence Report 

 

 Bid2022-379 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts & Materials 

 

 Bid2023-014 Blood Borne Pathogen & Narcotics Remediation 

 

 Bid2022-375 Janitorial & Cleaning Supplies for the Department of Public Works   

 

      Location:   The meeting was held in Lower Level Conference Room 

        

   Present:   Dan Ogilvie, Bid Specialist 

    Patrick Kelley, Purchasing Clerk 

  

   

              

Representatives: None 

  

  

 

All bids have been properly advertised.  A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid 

or the bid will not be accepted.  Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened.  All bids will go 

to the departments for their review and recommendation.   

 

The next council meetings are April 18, 2022 and May 2, 2022 at Warwick City Hall.  The City Council 

meeting begins at 7:00 P.M.  The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M.  The 5:00 P.M. 

meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak. 

 

Respectively submitted, 

 

 

 

 Patricia A. Peshka  

 Purchasing Agent 

 

 

 

 



 

Bid2022-385 Design, Print, & Mail Consumer Confidence Report 

 

 1 Bid Received 

 

 

 

 

Graphic Image, Inc. 

561 Boston Post Road 

Milford, CT 06460 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

A. Item #1 Labor/Materials/Services $________$210.00____ __ 

 

B.  Item #2 Color Print $________$2,732.00  ____ 

 

C.  Item #3 Copy/Fold/Label/Sort $________$1,475.00_____ 

 

D.  Item #4 Each Additional Color Added $________$0.00_ _ _   ___ 

 

E.  Total Lump Sum A-D $________$4,417.00_   _ _  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

                

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid2022-379 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts & Materials 

 

 4 Bids Received 

 

 

 

Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC 

P.O. Box 329 

Frankfort, OH 45628 

 

Garden State Highway Products, Inc. 

301 Riverside Drive 

Millville, NJ 08332 

 

American Traffic Safety Materials, Inc.  

P.O. Box 1449 

Orange Park, FL 32067-1449 

 

Eberl Iron Works, Inc. 

128 Sycamore St. 

Buffalo, NY 14204 

 

Pricing as follows 
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Bid2022-379 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts & Materials 

 

Item 

# 
Description Lightle 

Garden 

State 

American 

Traffic 

Eberl Iron 

Works 

 Finished with Standard Message  Note 1   

      

1 12” X 24” 17.96 21.06 No bid No bid 

2 12” X 18” 13.47 15.43 No bid No bid 

3 18” X 24” 26.94 31.60 No bid No bid 

4 18” X 24” No thru trucking 26.94 31.60 No bid No bid 

5 18” X 24” No thru traffic 26.94 31.60 No bid No bid 

6 24” X 30” 44.90 52.65 No bid No bid 

7 30” X 18” 33.68 39.51 No bid No bid 

8 24” square, diamond or pentagon 35.92 42.13 No bid No bid 

9 24” octagon 35.80 37.93  No bid No bid 

10 
36” square or diamond or fluorescent 

yellow/green – ASTM Type IX or XI 
89.82 115.41  No bid No bid 

11 30” square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM 

Type IX or XI 
62.38 80.12  No bid No bid 

12 36” square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM 

Type IX or XI 
89.82 115.41  No bid No bid 

13 48” square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM 

Type IX or XI 
159.68 205.18  No bid No bid 

14 30” octagon 55.60 59.28  No bid No bid 

15 36” X 12” printed 1 side 26.94 31.60  No bid No bid 

16 36” X 12” printed both sides 32.19 36.99  No bid No bid 

17 30” triangle 31.50 33.43  No bid No bid 

18 36” triangle 40.50 44.51  No bid No bid 

      

 Finished sign – No message     

19 12” X 24” 17.66 21.06  No bid No bid 

20 12” X 18” 13.25 15.43  No bid No bid 

21 18” X 24” 26.49 31.60  No bid No bid 

22 24” X 30” 44.15 52.65  No bid No bid 

23 30” X 18” 33.11 39.51  No bid No bid 

24 24” square, diamond or pentagon 25.32 42.13  No bid No bid 

25 24” octagon 25.20 37.93  No bid No bid 

26 
36” square or diamond - fluorescent 

yellow/green - ASTM Type IX or XI 
88.47 115.41  No bid No bid 

27 30” square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM 

Type IX or XI 
61.44 80.15  No bid No bid 

28 36” square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM 

Type IX or XI 
88.47 115.41  No bid No bid 

29 48” square, diamond or pentagon - ASTM 

Type IX or XI 
157.28 205.18  No bid No bid 

 

Continued next page  



Bid2022-379 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts & Materials 

 

Item 

# 
Description Lightle 

Garden 

State 

American 

Traffic 

Eberl Iron 

Works 

 Finished sign – No message     

30 30” octagon 54.80 59.28 No bid No bid 

31 36” X 12”  26.49 31.60  No bid No bid 

32 36” X 12”  30.99 36.99  No bid No bid 

33 30” triangle 31.00 33.43  No bid No bid 

34 36” triangle 39.80 44.51  No bid No bid 

      

 Marking Tape     

      

35 A270ES White Stamark Brand Tape 12” X 30 

yds. 
480.70 605.34 No bid No bid 

      

 Reflective  Sheeting     

      

36 ASTM Type I sheeting – all colors/sq. ft. 1.33 1.78 1.05 No bid 

 

37 

Hi-Intensity Prismatic Sheeting 

ASTM Type IV –  all colors 
1.33 1.83 1.75 No bid 

 

38 

EC Film (E.C. transparent overlay on paper 

liner), unpunched, all colors/sq.ft. 
1.12 1.78 .95 No bid 

39 ASTM XI reflective sheeting, all colors/sq.ft. 2.84 3.53 No bid No bid 

      

 Anti-graffiti overlay film     

40 36” x 50 yd 756.00 800.00 900.00 No bid 

41 48” x 50 yd 1,008.00 1,066.67 1200.00 No bid 

      

 Opaque Film     

42 2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film –black & 

white/sq. ft.  
.96 1.83 .60 No bid 

43 2 Mil Cast HP Vinyl Opaque Film - all colors/sq. 

ft.   
1.08 2.13 .91 No bid 

 Prespacing Tape      

      

44 6” X 100 yards/price per roll 25.00 33.28 $19.30 No bid 

45 12” x 100 yards/price per roll 44.00 66.56 $37.90 No bid 

46 24” X 100 yards/price per roll 88.00 133.13 $75.10 No bid 

47 36” X 100 yards/price per roll 132.00 199.69 $112.30 No bid 

      

 Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners 

No Hole 

    

48 14” X 6” 3.15 5.41 No bid No bid 

49 16” X 6” 3.60 6.19 No bid No bid 

50 18” X 6” 4.05 6.96 No bid No bid 

51 20” X 6” 4.50 7.74 No bid No bid 

52 24” X 6” 5.40 9.29 No bid No bid 

 

 

Continued next page 



Bid2022-379 Traffic Signs, Channel Posts & Materials 

 

Item 

# 
Description Lightle 

Garden 

State 

American 

Traffic 

Eberl Iron 

Works 

 Flat .080 Gauge Aluminum Radius Corners 

No Hole 

    

53 30” X 6” 6.75 11.60 No bid No bid 

54 36” X 6” 8.10 13.93 No bid No bid 

55 10” X 8” 3.00 5.06 No bid No bid 

56 12” X 8” 3.60 6.06 No bid No bid 

57 14” X 8” 4.20 7.08 No bid No bid 

58 16” X 8” 4.80 8.09 No bid No bid 

59 18” X 8” 5.40 9.10 No bid No bid 

60 20” X 8” 6.00 10.11 No bid No bid 

61 24” X 8” 7.20 12.14 No bid No bid 

62 30” X 8” 9.00 15.18 No bid No bid 

63 36” X 8” 10.80 18.20 No bid No bid 

64 10” X 10” 3.75 6.06 No bid No bid 

65 12” X 10” 4.50 7.28 No bid No bid 

66 14” X 10” 5.25 8.49 No bid No bid 

67 16” X 10” 6.00 9.70 No bid No bid 

68 18” X 10” 6.75 10.91 No bid No bid 

69 20” X 10” 7.50 12.13 No bid No bid 

70 24” X 10” 9.00 14.55 No bid No bid 

71 30” X 10” 11.25 18.19 No bid No bid 

72 36” X 10” 13.50 21.80 No bid No bid 

73 42” X 10” 15.75 25.46 No bid No bid 

74 48” X 10” 18.00 29.10 No bid No bid 

75 54” X 10” 20.25 32.74 No bid No bid 

      

 Sign Posts     

      

76 10’ green 2 lbs. per ft. with tapered end 24.00 34.86 No bid 27.45 

      

      

 Brackets     

77 #8 Metro Wing w/set screws 8.15 11.50 No bid 19.00 

78 VS-800 24” cantilever bracket  15.10 29.75 No bid 28.00 

79 VS-B36 36” cantilever bracket 69.00 70.75 No bid No bid 

80 
Side Mount for Wood Post, Pine & U-Channel 

Post Style #731F 
5.40 18.33 No bid No bid 

81 Spring loaded sign post – heavy duty 320.00 280.63 No bid No bid 

     

Delivery working days ARO 30-60 90-120 15 15 

 

NOTE 1: Garden State Highway Products, Inc., Item#42-43 pricing is for standard roll sizes only, non-

standard roll sizes must purchase full web roll. Delivery in 90-120 days aro depending on market availability 

 

 

 

 



Bid2023-014 Blood Borne Pathogen & Narcotics Remediation 

 

 1 Bids Received 

 

 

 

 

New England Trauma Services 

391 Oakland Street 

Mansfield, MA 02048 

 

 

 

Area 
Price Each 

(Blood) 

Price Each 

(Narcotics) 

   

Single (vehicle/cell block/holding room) See Attachment 1 $595.00 

   

Multiple (vehicle/cell block/holding room) See Attachment 1 $995.00 

   

Common hallways, offices, garage bays, and multi-purpose 

rooms 
See Attachment 1 See Attachment 1 
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Bid2022-375 Janitorial & Cleaning Supplies for the Department of Public Works   

 

 6 Bids Received 

 

 

Banner Systems Inc. 

135 Elliot St. 

Brockton, MA 02302 

 

W.B Mason Co., Inc. 

99 Bald Hill Rd. 

Cranston, RI 02920 

 

Mansfield Paper Co. 

380 Union St. 

West Springfield, MA 01090 

 

Glove Cleaners 

14 High St. 

Plainville, MA 02762 

 

Veterans Business Supply Inc. 

105 Central St. Suite 4100 

Stoneham, MA 02180 

 

Unipak Corp. 

PO Box 332 

West Long Branch, NJ 07764 

 

Pricing as follows 
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