Francis M. Gomez

Purchasing Agent

Bid2024-020
Bid2024-021
Bid2024-022
Bid2024-023
Location:

Present:

Representatives:

City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364

Bid Minutes Tuesday, April 11, 2023

Shredding Services

Blood Borne Pathogen & Narcotics Remediation
BCI Photography & Printing Supplies

BCI Crime Scene Supplies

The meeting was held at in Meeting Room 2
Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist

None

Frank J. Picozzi

Mayor

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid
or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go
to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are May 8, 2023 and May 22, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The City Council
meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00 P.M.
meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,

rancis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent



Bid2024-020 Shredding Services

e 4 Bids Received

ShredFast of Rhode Island LLC
Dba ShredRI
49 Taylor Road
Johnston, R1 02919

InfoShred LL.C
3 Craftsman Road
East Windsor, CT 06088

Redishred Acquisition Inc.
Dba Proshred Security
801 North Main Street Ext.
Wallingford, CT 06492

Al Datashred, LLC
7 Box Car Blvd.
Tewksbury, MA 01876

Vendor Monthly Fee
ShredFast of RI $112.00
InfoShred LLC $230.00

Redishred Acquisition $300.00
Al Datashred $390.00




Bid2024-021 Blood Borne Pathogen & Narcotics Remediation

o ] Bid Received

New England Trauma Services, LLC
391 Oakland Street
Mansfield, MA 02048

Pricing as follows

Continued next page



ATTACHME

ATRAUMA
SERVICES POLICE FACILITY PRICING

Biohazard Remediation

Unfortunately, due to the everwhelming increase in cost of PPE and supplies, Trauma Services must adjust the cost

of our facility cleaning services. As always. we strive to provide you with the same quality service in a timely manner,

as we have done over the years. We look forward to working with you and your communities throughout all of these
current changes.

Emergency calls can be requested 24 hours a day. 7 days a week. The technician/s will respond within roughly 80
minutes. If the responding technician/s will be over the 90-minute ETA, they will call with updates on the response
time. When there is a high volume of calls, multiple technicians will be responding to all calls accordingly.

SCOPE OF SERVICE: STANDARD / ANNUAL CLEANING

@ All work areas will be disinfected prior to work

performed with a hospital grade disinfectant. Technician per man per hour $75.00
@ All areas will be broom swept or Hepa-vacuumed to Each additional {as nheeded) $55 00
rernove debris. technician per man per hour :

Average Cost: One technician at $220.00

@ The structure of the designated work area will be R . C s
one hour, including supplies

cleaned accordingly with the proper procedures for
each sftuation at hand. These situations include but are

not limited to: Blood. feces. biological matter, HIV, HAZMAT CLEANING
Covid-19, MRSA, scabies, bedbugs, sewage, fire (Fentanyl / COVID-19 / Chemicals)

extinguisher dust. fentanyl/funknown powder narcotics,
Single Hazmat Unit $595.00
@ Al debris generated though out this process will be

contained to a Bio-Hazard waste container and

_ Multiple Hazmat Units $995.00
disposed of properly.

EXTENDED HAZMAT CLEANING

CERTIFIED PROFESSIONALS (Over two hours)

The crew will wear protection suits with respiratory gear at Price per man per hourin addition $90 00
each response. All responding crew members are certified to regular rate: '

Bio-Hazard technicians. All hazardous material generated will

be disposed of properly. * Supplies & PPE tracked as used

re
<
T

Request for service can be scheduled / called into our emergency line 24 hours per day, 7 days per week.

TRAUMA SERVICES CALL 2407




Bid2024-022 BCI Photography & Printing Supplies

o 1 Bid Recetved

WB Hunt Co. Inc.
Dba Hunt’s Photo & Video
100 Main St.
Melrose, MA 02176

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page



2024-022 BCl Photograpy Printing Supplies BID RESULTS

Items 'I)escrigﬁon , ‘Unit Cost
A Printers and Ink
Epson SureColor P900} § 1,140.00
B Cameras
Qlympus Tough TG-6] $ 439.00
Canon Power Shot SX540HS| $399.00 Panasonic ZS70
Nikon D610(body only)] $996.95 Nikon D7500
Nikon D500(body only)l Discontnued product
Nikon D5600(body only)]  Discontnued product
C DSLR Accessories :
Nikon EN-EL14A] $ 42.00
Nikon (D7100 / D7200/ D610 /D800)] 3 64.95
EN-EL15
Nikon MH-25A Battery Charger| $ 47.00
Nikon MB-D14 Battery Power Pack] $ 256.95
Nikon MB-D80 (D90)]  Discontinued product
Nikon MB-D15 Multi Battery Pows:r g 249,00
Pack Grip} _
Nikon MC-DC2 (D90 /D610 / $ 29.00
D7100/ D7200)] )
Nikon MC-36 A (D800)] $ 169.00
Vello - FreeWave Wireless Remote $35.00 Promaster 7099
Remote
Vello - FreeWave Wireless N/A
Flash/Shutter Remote ‘
Nikon SB-700 (FX/DX)] $ 326.95
Nikon SB-500] $ 246.95
Custom Brackets Folding-T Flash g 74.00
Bracket
Sigma EM-140 DG Macro Ring Fllash Discontinued product
for Nikon
Nikon SC-28 (for SB700)] $ 68.00
Nikon SC-29 (for|
SB600/800/900/910) 5 79.00
D DX format Lenses
Nikon 85mm Micro AF-S £/3.5] Discontinued Product

Nikon 16-85mm £/3.5-5.6

Discontinued Product

Nikon 18-200mm F3.5-5.6 G ED VR|
|

Discontinued Product

Sigma 50mm /2.8 macro for Nikon

Discontinued Product

Sigma 105mm £/2.8 macro for Nikon

$ 619.00

Sigma 18-200mm £/3.8-5.6 for Nikon

Discontinued Product

Continued next page




2024-022 BCI Photograpy Printing Supplies BID RESULTS

Items | Description  UnitCost
E FX format Lenses
AF-S Micro Nikkor 60mm £2.8] Discontinued Product
AF-S Nikkor 24-120mm /4 Discontinued Product
AF-S Nikkor 28-300mm {/3.5-5.6]  Discontinued Product
F Digital Memory
SDXC Memory cards 16GB $15.00 Sandisk
SDXC Memory cards 32GB $19.00 Delkin
Flash drives 128GB| $16.00 Sandisk Cruzer
Flash Drives 256GB $23.99 Sandisk
G Video
Canon VIXIA HF G50 UHD] $1,200.00 Canon VIXIA
camcorder] HF G70 UHD Camcorder
Canon BP-820 Lithium ion battery] $ 119.00
H Camera Bags/Cases
Tamrac Pasadena camera backpack] $ 139.00
Canon 100-DG bag| $29.99 Canon 200ES
Pelican 1200 Case| $ 69.00
Pelican 1400 Case| $ 115.95
Pelican 1600 Case| $ 249.00
I Miscellaneous
Thermal imaging N/A

monocular(manufacturer availability)|

Duracell Procell AAA $15.00 24 Pack

Duracell Procell AA $20.00 24 Pack
Duracell Procell 9-Volt] $3.00 Single
Duracell Procell C Size $1.09 Single
Duraceli Procell D Size $1.50 Single

Energizer CR 2032 4-Pack

$1.69 Ansmann Single 2032

Energizer 123 1-Pack

$ 3.99




Bid2024-023 BCT Crime Scene Supplies

e 1 Bid Received

Sirchie Acquisition Company, LLC
100 Hunter Place
Youngsville, NC 27596

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page



Bid2024-023 BCI Crime Scene Supplies

BID RESULTS
Item Item Description Unit Qty. Unit Cost Alt. Descrip
A, Latent Fingerprint Development
#1 Chemical Friction Ridge Development
a.{DFO Pump Spray 100 ml Each $ 29.64 DFS300
b.[Silk Black "Hi-Fi" Voleano Latent Powder 128 oz Each 3 85.00 BPP09128
¢.|Midnight Black Magnetic Powder Each 3 20.00 BPMI115L
d.|Silver / Gray Magnetic Powder Each $ 35.00 | BPMSBMI0
e.|Omega Print Cyanocacrylate Fuming Compound 16 oz Each 3 32.00 CNA103
f.|Cyanoacrylate Fume Tray 25 each Pack 3 11.50 CNA106C
g.|Cyanoacrylate Packets 5 each Pack $ 12.00 CNA2000
h.|Fuming Hot Plate 110 volt AC Each 3 17.00 FHP100
i.|Adhesive-Side Developers - Dark 7 oz or larger Each $ 19.00 ASD7D
j.|Adhesive-Side Developers - Light 7 oz or larger Each $ 19.00 ASD7L
k.[Ninhydrin Spray Aerosol 16 0z Each b 13.00 201C
1.|Ninhydrin Spray with Acetone 16 oz Each b 13.00 201ACE
m.|Sirchie Speical Formula Ninhydrin 8 oz Each $ 30.00 NSI609
n.|Sirchie Ninhydrinht Pump Spray 8 oz Each b 45.00 NHT609
o.|Ninhydrin Spray with Acetone 16 oz Each b 13.00 201ACE
p.|Sirchie Speical Formula Ninhydrin 8 oz Each $ 13.00 NSI609
q.|Sirchie Ninhydrinht Pump Spray 8 oz Each $ 45.00 NHT609
r.|Small Particle Reagent - Dark 3 Pack 3 20.00 SPR100
s.|lodine Crystals (Bulk or Ampules - specify) Each $ 25.00 A211C
#2 Cyanowand / CA Fume Wand Kit and Refill
a.|Search Cyanowand Kit (not brand specific) Kit $ 08.25 CW100
b.|Cyanowand Cartriges Standard 10 each 10 Pack $ 38.00 CW200
c.|Cyanowand Cartriges Mega 10 each 10Pack | % 45.00 Cw300
d.|Cyanowand Cartriges Hulk 4 each Each b 9.00 CW4001
e.|Cyvanowand Butane Fuel 1.3 oz Each b 3.25 SCW103
f |Dyanowand Butane Fuel 5.8 oz Each $ 4.50 SWC1035
Continued next page

Page1of8



Bid2024-023 BCI Crime Scene Supplies

BID RESULTS

Ttem Item Description Unit Oty. | Unit Cost | Alt Descrip
#3 Brushes / Applicators
a.|Fiberglass 2 1/4" Filiment Cluster Brush w/ 4 1/4" Plastic Handle Each $ 4.75 122L
b.[Marabou Feather Duster 4 1/4" Feathers Each $ 8.00 123LB
c. [Camel Regular Powder Brush Each b3 2.95 118L
d. |Squirres Hair Brush Each b 13.00 120LS
e.|Camel Long Handle Brush Each b 9.55 LHBO2
f. IMegawand Magnetic Powder Applicator Each 3 24.85 125MD
g.|Standard Aluminum Magnet Powder Applicator Each $ 9.10 125LM
h.j{Melamine Basting Spoon No Bid
i.|Spatula (7") No Bid
j.|DNA Free Fiberglass Fingerprint Brush Each $ 3.75 DNAI122L
#4 Lift Tape / Devices
a.|1 1/2" Lift Tape roll Each b 5.00 144L
b.[2" Lift Tape roll Each $ 5.88 14412
¢.|3" Lift Tape roll Each 3 3.00 144L3
d.[4" Lifi Tape roll Each $ 9.00 14414
e.]1 1/2" x 2" Hinge Lifters White 24 each 24Pack | § 425 130LW
f.|1 1/2" x 2" Hinge Lifters Black 24 each 24Pack | § 4.25 130LB
¢.|2" x 2" Hinge Lifters. White 24 each 24Pack | % 6.00 134LW
h.[2" x 2" Hinge Lifters Black 24 each 24Pack | 3 6.00 134LB
i.|2" x 4" Hinge Lifters White 24 each 24Pack | $ 6.00 131LW
i.|2" x 4" Hinge Lifters Black 24 each 24Pack | % 6.00 131LB
k.}4" x 4" Hinge Lifters White 24 each 24Pack | $ 6.50 131LwW4
1.|4" x 4" Hinge Lifters Black 24 each 24Pack | 3 6.50 1311.B4
m.|Hinge Lifter Labels 100 each 100Pack | § 3.15 TLT20C
n.|Rubber/GEL Footprint Lifters (1-white/1-black) 2 Pack 3 17.00 647C100
o0.|Black Rubber/GEL Palm/Cluster Lifters 7 inch x 9 inch (6 each) 6 Pack $ 32.70 125LB
p.|White Rubber/GEL Palm/Cluster Lifiers 7 inch x 9 inch (6 each) 6 Pack 3 32.70 125LW
#5 Latent Print Backing/Lift Cards
a.|White Glossy 3 X 5" cards - preprinted data on back 100 Pack | § 7.43 LPW100
b.|Black Glossy 3 X 5" cards - preprinted data on back 100 Pack | § 12.82 LPB100
c.|White Glossy 5.5 x 8.5" cards - preprinted data on back 100 Pack | § 16.75 LPW1505
d.|Black Glossy 5.5 x 8.5" cards - preprinted data on back 100Pack | $ 26.85 LPB1505
Continned next page
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Bid2024-023 BCI Crime Scene Supplies

BID RESULTS

Item Item Description Unit Qty. | Unit Cost | Alt. Descrip
B. Fingerprint Recording
#1 Reversible Ridge Counter each No Bid
continued next page

#2 Fingerprint Recording Ink

a.[Finger Print Ink 40z Each $ 6.45 231T

b.|Lanberry's Ridge Builder Pads Jar of 100 100Pack | § 20.50 LRB20T

c.|Major Case Ink Cards S0Pack | § 20.65 FC332
C. Alternate Light Sources
#1 Mega Maxx ALS System 3 - Watt Kit $ 985.00 MMX300
#2 Barrier Filters for BlueMaxx

a.|Mag-lite Rechargable 4-2"x 7.7" No Bid

b.[Mag-lite Rechargable 10.5" x 6.5" No Bid

c.|Barrier Filter Goggles Each $ 18.00 BMS300
#3  |UV Long Wave Forensic Light

a.|UV 9-watt Longwave Forensic Light, 365nm, 110 volt AC Each $ 107.00 UVPI00

b.|9- Watt Replacement bulb, 365 nm Each py 55.00 11954
#4 UV Short Wave Forensic Light

a.|UV Shortwave Forensic Light w/ tripod mount, 6-Watt No Bid

254 nm, 110 volt/220 volt AC No Bid

b.|Replacement Bulb 6-Watt Shortwave, 254 nm No Bid

c.|UV Protective Face Shield with Shroud No Bid

d.|Bluemaxx Barrier Filter Glasses with Side Shield No Bid
D. Kit Storage Boxes
#1 Plastic Copolymer Box - 14.375" x 8" x 7" Each $ 24.00 KCP1400
#2 Plastic Copolymer Box - 12 11/16" x 8 15/16" x 4 3/4" Each $ 36.00 KCP1002
E. Evidence Collection

Continued next page
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Bid2024-023 BC) Crime Scene Supplies

BID RESULTS

Ttem Item Description Unit Oty. Unit Cost Alt. Descrip
#1 Barrier Tape / Flags
a.|"Crime Scene Do Not Cross" 3" wide x 1000’ Long - Boxed Each $ 14.00 BT100
b.["Police Line Do Not Cross" 3" wide x 1000' Long - Boxed Each $ 14.00 BT200
c.[Evidence Marking Flags, Yellow - "Evidence Do not Touch" Setof100 | § 14.60 EVFY100
d.|Crime Scene Stepping Pads (set of 10) Setof 10 [ § 500.00 { CSSP100K
e.|Professional Crime Scene Sketch Kit Kit $ 314.00 SK3000
f.|Master Crime Scene Sketch Kit Kit $ 154.00 SK1000
#3 Impulse Evidence Bag Sealers
a.|12" Evidence Bag Sealer, 110 volt Each £  169.77 696E
b.|20" Evidence Bag Sealer, 110 volt Each $ 322.28 696 E1
c.|12" Evidence Bag Sealer Replacement Kit Each b 25.00 696 E10
d.[20" Evidence Bag Sealer Replacement Kit Each $ 44.00 696 E1l
#4 Evidence Boxes / Ties / Tape
a.|GunBox-143/4"x77/8"x 2 1/4" 25 each 25 Pack $ 33.00 ECB001G
b.|Knife Box - 16" x 3" x 2" 25 each 25 Pack $ 27.00 ECBO0OIK
c.|Rifle Box 25 each 25 Pack 5 69.85 ERB004
d.|Releasable Nylon Evidence Ties 100 each 100 Pack | § 14.50 ET100
e.|Box Sealing Evidence Tape - White - Black Lettering 3"x165' Roll $ 17.00 T04E
#5 Evidence Tubes / Jars - indicate quantity in each package.
a.|Syringe Transport Tube 1" x 8" 12 Pack b 20.00 ECT2
b.|Collection Jar, Polystyrene 1 {l oz - each 15Pack | § 8.25 ECJ1
¢.[Collection Jar, Polystyrene 2 fl 0z - each 15 Pack $ 11.00 ECI2
d.|Collection Jar, Polystyrene 4 fl 0z - each 15Pack | § 12.00 ECJ4
e.|Collection Jar, Polystyrene 8 fl oz - each 15 Pack iy 20.00 ECI8
f.|Collection Jar, Polystyrene 16 fl oz - each 15 Pack $ 25.00 ECJ16
g.|Collection Jar, Polystyrene 2 {l oz WIDE Mouth - each 15Pack | § 15.00 ECIJZWM
h.[Metal Evidence Container, 1/2 fl oz, w/white label - each 25 Pack % 18.50 ECC5L
i.|Metal Evidence Container, 1 fl oz, w/ white label - each 25 Pack % 19.00 ECCI1L
j.|Metal Evidence Container, 2 fl oz, w/ white label - each 25Pack | § 31.00 ECC2L
k.|Sterile Plastic, 4 oz, Speciment Container - each 100Pack | $ 75.00 BUK1006
1.|Solid Metal Collection Can, 1 qt-each 10 Pack $ 49.00 AECO1
m.|Solid Metal Collection Can, 1 qt w/o rubber & labels 10 Pack $ 36.00 AECQT
n.|Solid Metal Collection Can, 1 gallon 10 Pack 3 85.00 AEC02
0.|Solid Metal Coliection Can, 1 gallon w/o rubber & Jabels 10 Pack 3 90.00 AECGALL
p.{Solid Metal Collection Can - w / interior sealing - 1 gt 10Pack | § 60.00 AECQTL
q.|Solid Metal Collection Can - w/ interior sealing - 1 gallon 10 Pack % 80.00 AECGALL

Continued next page
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Bid2024-023 BCI Crime Scene Supplies

BID RESULTS
Item Item Description Unit Qty. | Unit Cost | Alt. Descrip
#6 Applicator Swabs and Accessories
a.|Cap-Shure Sterile Swabs w/ tip protector 100 each 100 Pack | § 93.00 CP100
b.[Vented SwabBox .75" x.75" x 6.25" 100 each 100 Pack | § 42.00 KCP254C
c.|Distilled Water 1 oz Bottle Each 3 2.00 DNA1009
d.j5terile Round Foam Tipped Applicaters 50 each S50Pack | § 24.00 FTS50
#7 Evidence Sealing Tape
a.|Red "BioHazard" Tape, 108 feetroll Roll $ 10.60 BIO3060
b.|Red / White Custom Imprint "Warwick Police Department", 108 ' Roll $ 14.00 SM6002
c.|Red BioHazard Strip Sticker~ 13/8"x 7" 100 count 100Pack | § 8.00 BIC400
d.|Yellow "Do Not Touch - Chemically Processed Evidence" Roll $ 6.00 EIL114R
e.|Evidence Tags for Drying Cabinet - Red - 25 each 25 Pack $ 24.00 ACEVDRT
f.|Evidence Tags for Drying Cabinet - Blue - 25 each 25 Pack % 24.00 ACEVDBT
g.|Box Sealing Tape - w/ black typed "Evidence" Roll p 20.00 704E
h.{3" Box Sealing Tape Dispenser Each $ 17.00 BSETID
1.|Photo Evidence Rule Tape 1"x 500" w/ dispenser Each % 8.00 601ED
#8 Evidence Collection Tools
a.|Evidence Scrape / scriber - 6 1/2" Each b 6.00 KCP141
b.|Nickle Plated Curved Tweezers - 6 1/2" /or equivalent Each $ 6.50 TWCES
c.|Nickle Plated Straight Tweezers - 6 1/2" / or equivalent Each 3 3.00 TWCSS5
d.|Nickle Plated Blunt Tweezers - 6 1/2" / or equivalent Each % 7.61 TWBRS65
e.|Krime Kit includes Carbide Scriber, Diamond Scriber, Kit $ 47.00 KK 100
f.|Evidence Collection Knife, Ridge Counter Each 3 11.00 GL002
¢.|Retractable Ridge Counter, each Each 8 11.00 GLO04
h.[Scene Guard Barrier Each $ 195.00 SCGD20
#9 Lab / Drug Scales
a.|Digital Compact Scale, battery w/ AC Option, g, oz, ct, tl settings Each $ 86.00 SCL200
b.|AC Adapter - 110 volt No Bid
F. Impressicn Evidence
#1 Bio-Foam Impression Kit Each h 6.00 BIF100
#2 Mikrosil Casting Material
a.|Mikrosil - Brown 7 0z Each $ 29.00 | MCMI00B
b.|Mikrosil - Black 7oz Each 3 29.00 | MCMI100BL
¢.|Mikrosil - Gray 70z Each 3 29.00 MCMI100G
d.|Mikrosil - White 7 oz Each 3 29.00 | MCMI100W
e.|Mikrosil - Catalyst 70z Each 3 8.50 ; MCMI00CA
Continued next page
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Bid2024-023 BCI Crime Scene Supplies

BID RESULTS

Item Item Description Unit Qty, | Unit Cost [ Alt Descrip
#5 Impression Casting Tools
a.|Adjustable Casting Frame - 7 1/4 x 12 x 18 Each § 10.00 FCF100
b.|Adjustable Casting Frame - 12 x 18 x 24 Each b 17.00 FCF200
c.|Flexible Mixing Bowls - 4 piece set Set $ 70.00 646C
#6 Siticone Casting Supplies
a.|Liquid Silicone Rubber - 1 1b w/ catalyst Each 3 55.00 634C
b.|Silicone Rubber Release Agent 450z Each 3 9.85 SRAIO
c.|Silicone Rubber Thinner 16 oz Each $ 33.00 636C
d.|Casting Plaster - Base Builder - 9 lbs container Each 3 18.55 639C]1
#7 Electrostatic Dust Print Lifter
a.|Electrostatic Dust Print Lifter Kit Kit 3 68500 ESP900
b.|Lifting Mats - 2'x 3' 10 each 10Pack | § 32.00 ESP90Z
¢.|Roll Lifting Material 12" x 25" Roll Roll $ 18.00 ESP90S
d.|Evidence Box, Lifting Mat - 39" x27"x 1" 10 each 10 Pack $ 52.00 ESP909
G. Optical Enhancement
#1 Professional Fingerprint Magnifier
a.|Professional Aluminum Magnifier Each $ 77.00 PFP100
2 element, 4.5 x,1 1/4" field of view, Model M-1
b.|Henry Disk Each 3 21.75 PFHI10
. Bs"ar.;xjp;r-mde, Field of View Professional Magnifier 2 Lens Optics, Each $  126.00 TR400
d.|Henry Disk, Super-wide Field Each 3 51.00 JC401H
e.|Hand Magnifier Glass, Glass Lens, 2X, 4" Round, Plastic Each 3 14.55 319P
f.|Hand Held Magnifier - Acrylic-Lens - 4" Round- Plastic Molded No Bid
g.|Acrylic Magnifier, 3.5" Round, 4X Magnification, Dome -light Each £ 60.00 JC350M
#2  |Video Boroscope
a.|Video Borescope - 3.5" color screen, 3' probe with LED lighting No Bid
b.|Video Borescope - 3.5" color screen, 16' probe with LED lighting No Bid
#3 Thermometers
a.|Digital Infrared Thermometer - Hand held - powered by 9 volt No Bid
H. Scales and Photography
Continued next page
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Bid2024-023 BCI Crime Scene Supplies

BID RESULTS
Item Item Description Unit Otv. Unit Cost Alt. Descrip
#1 Universal Evidence Photo Stand
a.|Stand with English Scales Kit Kit $  300.00 UPS100
b.[Magnetic English Scales - White Each $ 7.00 UPS101W
c.|Magnetic English Scales - Black Each $ 7.00 UPS101B
) 8 Forensic Evidence Analysis
#1 Gun Powder Testing
a.|Gunpowder "Blue View" Particle Test 10 tests each I0Pack | § 77.00 BVI00
b|Presumptive Gun Powder Test No Bid
#2 Presumptive Seminal Fluid ID
a.|Acid Phosphatase Dischaps 6 pack 6 Pack 3 14.00 PSID100
Acid Phosphatase - Bulk supply - indicate package size - if No Bid
b.|available.
#3 Presumptive Blood ID & Enhancement
a.|Agueous Heuco Crystal Violet Kit - prepares 500 m! working Each $ 31.00 LV509
b.|Amino Black 100 grams Each py 30.00 LV5011
c¢.|Amino Black Spray - 8 oz bottle Each b 8.50 LVS50IL
d.[Coomassie Blue 25 grams Each b 10.00 LV512
e.|Hungarian Red 100 m! 100ML | % 7.00 LV503
f.|Hungarian Red 500 Ml S00ML | § 25.00 LV5031
g.|Luminol Reagent 40z w/ spray Set b 12.00 Lumion014
h.|Luminol Reagent 8 oz w/spray Set 5 20.00 Lumion018
i.|Luminol Reagent 16 oz w/ spray Set $ 18.00 Luminoll6
1.JLuma Vision Master Kit Kit §  140.00 LVL1000
k. |Phenophthalein Dischaps Setof 6 Setof6 | $ 15.00 PBID100
1.|Phenophthalein Reagent - 4 oz bottle or bigger 4 oz $ 16.00 DCB101
m.|Leuco-Malachite Dischaps Setof 6 Set of 6 b 14.00 PBID200
n,|Luminol Dischaps Set of 6 No Bid
o.|HemaStix Blood ID - (50 Count Bottle) 50 Set $ 39.00 HEMS50
p.|Blood Fixative - 8 oz bottle 8oz p 12.00 LV513
q. |Spatter Blood - training - 8 oz bottle 8 oz 3 23.00 SPABS
r.|Synthetic Blood - training - § oz bottle - 8oz $ 18.00 SYNB8
s.|Bluestar Forensic Kit No Bid
I Forensic Evidence Collection
#1 Suspect Evidence Collection Kit No Bid
I |
#2 ISID - 2 Instant Shooter Identification Kit No Bid
#3 Evidence Tote Trays - Polyethylene - Labeled "Evidence"
a.|Small size - 18" x 13" x 11" No Bid
b.|Medium size - 23" x 15" x 16" No Bid
c.|Large Size - 30" x 19" x 12" No Bid
Continued next page | I
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Bid2024-023 BCI Crime Scene Supplies

BID RESULTS
Item Item Description Unit Oty. | Unit Cost Alt. Descrip
#2 Trace Evidence Vacuum
a.|Micro Evidence Vacuum Kit- 110 volt AC Kit $ 235.00 SV110
b.|Trace Evidence Filter Assembly w/ crevice tool Each $ 17.00 619EI
c.|Trace Evidence Filter Assembly w/ upholstery tool Each 3 13.00 619EZ
d.|Evidence Vacuum Filter Assembly Each 3 73.00 617E
e.|P.E.M. Polyester Monofiliment Microfilters 100 each No Bid
#4 Shooting Investigation
a.|Laser Trajectory Kit Kit 3 360.00 LTF100
b.|Photo Laser Smoke Each b 19.00 LTF1005
c.|Optional Heavy Duty Tri Pod Each 5 68.00 BM6009
d.|22 Cal. Rod Set Set $ 45.00 LTF112RS
e.jReflective Yarn - 275 ft Each § 15.00 LTF113
f.|Laser Pointer with Lock Collar Each 3 90.00 | LTFI00RLZ
g.|Optional Forensic Rod Kit Kit $ 60.00 FRK16
#9 Primer Residue Kits
a.|SEM Primer Residue Kit Kit b 10.00 GRA200
#10 |Latent Print Kits
a.|Master Expert Latent Print Kit Kit $  380.00 MEL500
b.|Consumable Refill Pack - Chemical Pack $ 100.00 | MEL500CPR
c.|Consumable Refill Pack - Lifting Pack 3 17.00 | MELS500FLR
d.|Consumable Refill Pack - Powder Pack $ 20.00 | MELS500PPR
L. Headquarters Forensic Lab - equipment
#1 Lab Equipment
a.|Hotplate 110V 8"x9" Each $  220.00 HP110
#2 Glass Flasks and Cylinders
a.[125 ml Erlenmeyer Flask (12 pack) No Bid
b.|Class B 500 ml Graduated Cylinder (Each) No Bid
c.|Class B 250 ml] Graduated Cylinder (Each) No Bid
d.[Class B 100 ml Graduated Cylinder (Each) No Bid
e.|Class B 50 ml Graduated Cylinder (Each) No Bid
#3 Drug Evidence Warning & Identification labels
a.|Hazard Labels Handle w/ Gloves  250/roll No Bid
b.|Fentanyl Waming Labels  100/pack 100Pack | § 5.00 |NARK300FENL
c.JRed on White Biohazard Labels 100/roll Roll 3 8.00 BIOIG0
Lighting
a.|Portable area/spotlight No Bid
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FRANCIS M. GOMEZ
PURCHASING AGENT

FRANK J. PICOZZI
MAYOR

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 PosT ROAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
TEL (401)738-2013
FAx (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To: Peder Schaefer, Finance Director
From: Francis M. Gomez, Purcilasing Agent
Date: April 7,2023

Re:  Agenda for Tuesday, April 11, 2023

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2 starting
at 11:00 am.

Bid2024-020 Shredding Services
Bid2024-02]1 Blood Bome Pathogen & Narcotics Remediation
Bid2024-022 BCI Photography & Printing Supplies

Bid2024-023 BCI Crime Scene Supplies

May 8%/ May 22



Date: April 11, 2024

Bid2024-020 Shredding Services
Bid2024-021 Blood Borne Pathogen & Narcotics Remediation
Bid2024-022 BCI Photography & Printing Supplies
Bid2024-023 BCI Crime Scene Supplies

Name (please print neatly) Company/Email Address

Jessea Lamorag
v




