Francis M. Gomez

Purchasing Agent

Bid2023-430
Bid2024-029
Bid2024-032
Location:

Present:

Representatives:

Frank J. Picozzi

Mayor

City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364

Bid Minutes Tuesday, May 9, 2023

Purchase New Press Tool Kit

Analytical Laboratory Testing Services
Brass Fittings & Valves

The meeting was held at in Meeting Room 2

Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid
or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go
to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are June 5, 2023 and June 12, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The City Council
meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00 P.M.
meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,

rancis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent



Bid2023-430 Purchase New Press Tool Kit

e 4 Bids Received

Tiles in Style
DBA Taza Supplies
16940 Vincennes Ave.
South Holland, IL 60473

Supply New England
361 Jefferson Blvd.
Warwick, RI 02886

Ferguson Waterworks
2 Whitman Road
Canton, MA 02021

SID Tool Co.

DBA MSC Industrial Supply Co.
515 Broadhollow Rd. Suite 1000

Melville, NY 11747

I Supply New Ferguson
Vendor Tiles in Style England Waterworks SID Tool
Total Price $2,786.00 $3,404.44 $3,481.82 $3,736.59




Bid2024-029 Analytical Laboratory Testing Services

¢ 2 Bidsreceived
Microbac Laboratories, Inc.
61 Louisa Viens Dr.
Dayville, CT 06241
RI Analytical

4] Tllinois Ave.
Warwick, RI 02888

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page



2024-029 Analytical Laboratory Testing Services BID RESULTS

Microbac RI Analytical
Itemn # Test Parameter Total Units Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost
| | Fecal Coliform (A-1 or 210 §  2000]$ 420000 $ 16.00| § 3,360.00
Colilert-18)
Ent i (IDEXX
2 nterococe (1D 210 $ 2000 $ 420000} $ 25.00} $ 5,250.00
Enterolert™)
3 | Male-specific Coliphage 50 $  300.00|$ 15,000.00 | $ 325.00| $ 16,250.00
4 Surfactants (MBAS) 50 $ 50.00| $ 2,500.00| $ 42.00] $ 2,100.00
5 Total Phosphorus 120 $ 25.00| $ 3,000.00| $ 18.00] $ 2,160.00
6 Orthophosphorus 30 $ 22.00] $ 660.00| 11.00] § 330.00
7 Ammonia 138 $ 25.00] § 3,450.00 | S 14.00] $ 1,932.00
8 TKN 90 $ 35.00| $ 3,150.00| $ 31.00] $ 2,790.00
9 Nitrate 90 $ 20.00] § 1,800.00| § 11.00] $ 990.00
10 Nitrite 90 $ 20.00] $ 1,800.00] $ 11.00] § 990.00
11 CBOD; 440 $ 35.00 | § 15,400.00 | $ 24.00] $ 10,560.00
12| Total Suspended Solids 20 $ 20.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 11.00] $ 220.00
13 | Total and Available CN 32 $ 40.00] S 1,280.00| § 41.00] $ 1,312.00
14 Oil & Grease 32 $ 50.00| $ 1,600.00 | $ 45.00| $ 1,440.00
(Gravimetric)
15 Oil & Grease 3 $  5000|$ 1,600.00| $ 2000| 8 640.00
(Non-polar)
16 Chloroform 8 $  125.00] $ 1,000.00] $ 70.00| $ 560.00
17 Weekly Metals: 116 $ 25.00| $ 2,900.00 | $ 12.00] $ 1,392.00
Lead, Total
18 Weekly Metals: 116 $  2500|$ 2,000.00 | $ 12.00] 8 1,392.00
Aluminum, Total
RIPDES Quarterly
Metals (8): Cd, Cu, Pb,
19 | '\ Zu, AL Crand Cr 8 $  100.00] § 800.00{ $ 100.00] $ 800.00
(VD)

Continued next page




2024-029 Analytical Laboratory Testing Services BID RESULTS

Microbac RI Analytical
Test Parameter Total Units Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost
RIPDES Local Limits
Metals (17): Cd, Cr, Cu,
20 Pb, Ni, Ag, Zn, Sb, As, 1 $ 200.00| $ 200.00| $ 165.00] $ 165.00
Be, Hg, Se, Tl, Al, Fe,
Mo and Cr (VI)
Priority Pollutant Scan:
21 see ATTACHMENT D 32 $ 700.00( $ 22,400.00 | 618.00| § 19,776.00
22 Quarterly WET Testing 4 $ 300000 $ 12,000.00 | $ 2,868.00| $ 11,472.00
Emergency Services Fee
23 (Sunday Only-Fecal & 2 $ 250.00| $ 500.00] $ 150.00| $ 300.00
Enterococci)
24 Thickened Sludge TCLP 1 $ 800.00 | §$ 800.00| $ 55000 $ 550.00
Thickened Sludge Total
25 Metals (15) 1 $ 150.00| $ 150.00| $ 135,00 § 135.00
26 | Thickened Siudge PCB's 1 $ 100.00| 3 100.00| $ 75.00( $ 75.00
Thickened Sludge
27 Reactivity : sulfide 1 $ 5000] $ 50.00| % 30.00( $ 30.00
Thickened Sludge
28 Percent Total Sulfur l $ 125.00| $ 125.00| $ 75.00| $ 75.00
g9 | Thickened Sudge Flash 1 $  5000]$ 50.001 $ 2500 $ 25.00
Point
Thickened Sludge '
30 Reactivity: Cyanide 1 3 50.00| % 50.00| $ 30.00| $ 30.00
31 Thickened Sludge 1 3 50.00| $ 50.00| $ 30,00 $ 30.00
Phosphorus
Thickened Sludge
32 Corrosivity/pH 1 $ 25.00( $ 25.00| § 15.001 $ 15.00
Thickened Sludge
33 Percent Total Solids 1 $ 2500 $ 25.001 $ 14.00| $ 14.00

Continued next page




2024-029 Analytical Laboratory Testing Services BID RESULTS

Microbae RI Analytical
Test Parameter Total Units Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost
Thickened Sludge
34 Percent Fixed Solids : S 2500 2300 3 -} 3 ]
Thickened Siudge
35 Percent Volatile Solids 1 $ 25.00| $ 25.00| $ 14.00( $ 14.00
Thickened Sludge O&G
36 (Veg & Non-Polar) 1 3 50.00| $ 50.00| $ 80.00| $ 80.00
Thickened Sludge pH of
37 TCLP Extraction 1 h 15.00| $ 1500 $ -1 8 -
Thickened Sludge
38 Ignitability 1 3 50.00| $ 50.00| $ 25.00( $ 25.00
39 Thickencd Sludge 1 $ 50.00 | § 50.00{ $ 24.00| § 24.00
Ammonia Nitrogen
40 pH 0 $ 20.00] $ -1 8 10.00] § -
41 Alkalinity 0 $ 20.00] § -1 3 14.00| § -
42 Total Hardness 0 $ 40.00| $ -1 3 24.00{ $ -
Total Dissolved Organic
43 Carbon (DOC) 0 $ 50.00| § -1 $ 38.00| $ -
Total Organic Carbon
44 (TOC) 0 $ 50.00| $ -3 28.00| $ -
Volatile Suspended
45 Solids (VSS) 0 $ 3500 $ -19 22.00| $ -
46 Hydrogen sulfide 0 $ 50.00]| $ -1$ 35.00| $ -
47 COD - High Range 0 $ 4000 $ -1 9 23.00] $ -
48 COD - Low Range 0 $ 40.00( $ -18$ 23.00| $ -
49 Total Rt.asxdual Chlorine 0 3 20.00| $ s 2.00| 8 i
High Range
50 Total Residual Chlorine 0 g 20.00| $ s 12.00] s )
Low Range
51 Settleable Solids 0 $ 20.00| $ -1 $ 1200 $ -
52 Aluminum, Total 0 $ 15.00] $ -13 12.00] $ -
53 Iron, Total 0 $ 15.00( $ -18% 12.00| $ -
54 Cadmium, Total 0 $ 15.00| $ -1 $ 12.00| $ -
Continued Next Page




2024-029 Analytical Laboratory Testing Services BID RESULTS

Microbac RI Analytical
Test Parameter Total Units Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost
55 Chromium, Total 0 $ 15.00] § -8 12.00] $ -
56 Copper, Total 0 $ 15.00] § - 8 1200 $ -
57 Mercury, Total 0 $ 25.00| $ -1 $ 18.00] $ -
58 Lead, Total 0 $ 15.00 $ -1 $ 12.00] § -
59 Nickel, Total 0 $ 15.00 $ -1 $ 12.00] $ -
60 Silver, Total 0 $ 15.00| $ -13 12.00] $ -
61 Zinc, Total 0 $ 15.00| $ -1 % 12.00] $ -
62 Hexavalent Chromium 0 $ 25.00| $ -1 8 30.001 $ -
Total Toxic Organics
63 (EPA 624.1/625.1) 0 $ 275.00| $ -13 300.00| $ -
64 All Inclusive Total Cost S 104,380.00 $ 87,303.00




Bid2024-032 Brass Fittings & Valves

e 4 Bidsreceived

Continued next page

EJ Prescott Inc.
38 Albion Road
Lincoln, RI 02865

Stiles Company, Inc.
922 Pleasant Street
Norwood, MA 02062

John Hoadley and Sons, Inc,
672 Union Street
Rockland, MA 02370

Ferguson Waterworks
2 Whitman Road
Canton, MA 02021

Pricing as Follows



2023-009 Brass Fittings and Valves BID RESULTS

ITEM DESCRIPTION _ EJ Prescott Stiles John Hoadley Ferguson
1-1 % Valve S/'W $ 80.00 | $ 80.66 103.00 | § 10422
12 1” Valve S/W $ 120.00 | $ 114.51 | § 155.00 | §  156.63
1-3 1 ¥%” Valve Ball $ 191.00 | $ 160.21 No Bid $ 19241
1-4 1 %” Valve Ball $ 303.00 { $ 24195 | § 35200 | $  356.51
1-5 2 Valve Ball $ 426.00 | $ 340.16 | $ 52500 | $  530.51
2-1 %> Valve Corporation $ 59.00 | § 49.14 | § 73.00 | $ 73.57
2-2 17 Valve Corporation $ 77.00 | $ 64.62 | $ 96.00 | $ 96.79
2-3 1 ¥%” Valve Corporation $ 191.00 | $ 138.26 No Bid $ 21842
2-4 1 % Valve Corporation $ 303.00 | $ 14481 [ $ 262.00 | $ 218.42
2-5 2” Valve Corporation $ 426.00 | $ 239.52 357.00 [ $ 361.21
3-1 AR Cg‘;i;‘;igg;‘pmm’n to $ 23.00 | $ 1854 | $ 28.00 | $ 28.43
3-2 P l” C‘é’;ﬁﬁi&?ﬁ;"re“im to $ 26.00 | $ 2121 | '$ 31.00]$ 3101
33 LWxl %”g:;if:sgsigzmp‘e“imm $ 45.00 | $ 36.63 | 8 88.00 | $  88.80
34 1rxl Vz”g:;gf;iigzmpressmnm $ 87.00 | $ 7098 | $ 108.00 | $  109.34
3-5 27x 2" Coupling Compression to $ 118.00 | $ 95.82 | § 146.00 | $  147.67
Compression
4-1 3/4” x 3/4” Coupling Female $ 20.00 | $ 1601 | $ 25.00 | $ 24.97
42 1”7 x 1” Coupling Female $ 26.00 | $ 21.71 [ $ 35.00 | $ 35.70
4.3 1%” x 1 ¥” Coupling Female $ 49.00 | $ 39.68 [ $ 60.00 | $ 61.10
4-4 1% x 1 %” Coupling Female $ 78.00 | $ 63.18 | $ 96.00 | $ 97.33

Continued next page




2023-009 Brass Fittings and Valves BID RESULTS

ITEM DESCRIPTION EJ Prescott Stiles John Hoadley | Ferguson
4-5 2” x 2” Coupling Female $ 93.00 | § 7524 | § 115.00 | $ 115.99
4-6 % x %" Coupling Male 3 19.00 | $ 1523 | $ 23.00 | § 23.30
4-7 1” x 1” Coupling Male $ 23.00 | $ 18.03 | § 2700 § 27.53
4-8 1 % x 1 % Coupling Male 3 4300 $ 3447 | § 53.00 | $ 53.15
4-9 1 %” x 1 ¥%” Coupling Male $ 61.00 | $ 49.39 | § 75.00 | $ 76.12
4-10 2” x 2” Coupling Male $ 89.00 | $ 7198 | $ 11000 | $ 110.90
5-1 Coupling for 5/8” Meter $ 11.00 | $ 571 $ 1250 | $ 9.12
5-2 Coupling for %” Meter $ 13.00 | $ 7618 14.00 | $ 10.37
5-3 Coupling for 1” Meter $ 1400 | § 10.04 [ $ 21501 % 15.97
5-4 Coupling 1 4" Meter $ 53.00| % 4217 | $ 6300 8% 44.22
5-5 Coupling for 2” Meter $ 7400 | $ 5873 % 92.00 | % 61.58
6-1 Coupling % male iron pipe thread $ 17.00 | $ 13.54 | $ 2050 { § 20.68
6-2 Ell couplings % male iron pipe thread $ 19.00 | $ 1451 | § 21.00 | § 15.22
7-1 %" x ¥4 Brass Tee $ 7751 % 5.53 No Bid $ 5.64
7-2 1” x 1” Brass Tee $ 13751 $ 9.81 No Bid $ 10.03
7-3 1 %" x 1 %47 Brass Tee $ 19501 % 13.76 No Bid $ 14.06
7-4 1 %7 x 1'% Brass Tee $ 26501 $ 18.94 No Bid $ 19.35
7-5 2" x 2” Brass Tee $ 4350 | § 31.04 No Bid $ 31.71
8-1 17 x % Brass Reducer Compressed No Bid $ 7.28 No Bid $ 7.42
8-2 1 ¥ x % Brass Reducer Compressed No Bid $ 11.74 No Bid $ 12.42
8-3 1 ¥ x %” Brass Reducer Compressed No Bid $ 16.70 No Bid $ 17.56
8-4 2” x %" Brass Reducer Compressed No Bid $ 24.83 No Bid $ 26.63

Continued next page




2023-009 Brass Fittings and Valves BID RESULTS

DESCRIPTION

ITEM EJ Prescott Stiles John Hoadley Ferguson
9-1 2” Brass Spud Nuts $ 55001 % 60.41 No Bid $ 19.99
9-2 1 12" Brass Spud Nuts $ 33.00 [ $ 41.71 No Bid $ 19.99
10-1 Brass Steel Elbow '4” Male x Female $ 550189 4.15 No Bid $ 4.24
10-2 Brass Close Nipples ¥%2” x Close $ 400 (% 1.95 No Bid $ 1.68
10-3 Brass Nipples 2” x 1 15” $ 450 $ 2.59 No Bid $ 1.95
10-4 Brass Watts Ball Valves % IPT $ 11.50 | § 9.79 No Bid $ 40.00
11-1 3/4"-5/8" Downsize Adapters $ 1300 | $ 5.13 No Bid $ 44.28
11-2 1"-5/8" Downsize Adapters $ 14.00 | $ 20.73 No Bid $ 43.97
11-3 1"-3/4" Downsize Adapters $ 19.00 | $ 19.37 No Bid $ 20.41
11-4 1 172" - 1" Downsize Adaptors $ 59.00 [ $ 57.96 No Bid 3 311.41
11-5 2" - 1" Downsize Adaptors $ 114.00 | $ 91.10 No Bid 3 318.73
11-6 1 1/2" - 1" Downside (Flange) Adaptors $ 153.00 | $ 146.86 No Bid $ 69.77
11-7 2" - 1" Downside (Flange) Adaptors $ 114.00 [ $ 150.31 No Bid $ 107.29
12-1 27 x 3/4” IPT Brass Bushings $ 53.00 | 3 14.14 No Bid $ 14.86
12-2 2” x 1" IPT Brass Bushings $ 20.00| % 14.14 No Bid $ 15.36
12-3 2”x 1 1/4” IPT Brass Bushings $ 16.00 | $ 11.74 No Bid $ 12.78
12-4 2 1/2" x 1 1/2” IPT Brass Bushings $ 16.00 | $ 11.74 No Bid $ 12.76
13-1 3/4" IPT Brass Plugs $ 3.70 | § 2.63 No Bid $ 2.86
13-2 [" IPT Brass Plugs $ 450 | % 3.46 No Bid $ 3.09
13-3 2" IPT Brass Plugs $ 14.00 | § 10.38 No Bid 3 11.28

Continued next page




2023-009 Brass Fittings and Valves BID RESULTS

ITEM DESCRIPTI'ON‘ ' EJ Prescott Stiles John Hoadley | Ferguson
14-1 ¥ xs X %7 CTS $ 49.00 | $ 41.20 No Bid $ 43.20
14-2 % xxs X 3/4" CTS $ 44.00 | $ 37.16 No Bid $ 38.97
14-3 17 xsX % CTS $ 73.00 | $ 63.87 No Bid $ 66.97
14-4 17 xxs X %" CTS $ 74.00 | $ 62.10 No Bid $ 65.12
14-5 1”xs X 17 CTS $ 78.00 | $ 65.75 No Bid $ 68.95
14-6 17 xxs X 1” CTS $ 55.00 | % 70.11 No Bid $ 63.22
15-1 % Stainless Steel Insert $ 20119 1.68 | $ 3.00 | $ 1.50
15-2 17 Stainless Steel Insert $ 214 | § 177 | $ 325§ 1.53
15-3 1 ¥4” Stainless Steel Insert 3 2638 2.18 | $ 5251 8% 2.05
15-4 1 ¥ Stainless Steel Insert $ 294 | 8 244 | 8 6.50 | $ 1.97
15-5 2” Stainless Steel Insert $ 294 | $ 244 1% 11.00 | § 2.05

16 Philmac Universal Transition Lead $ 42.00 No Bid No Bid $ 43.34
17 Brass Ball Valve 1/2" IPS w/drain $ 42.00 No Bid No Bid $ 23.77




FRANK J. PiICOZZI
MAYOR

FRANCIS M. GOMEZ
PURCHASING AGENT

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 PosT ROAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
TEL (401)738-2013
FAX (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To: Peder Schaefer, Finance Director
From: Francis M. Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Date:  April 26, 2023

Re: Agenda for Tuesday, May 9, 2023

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2 starting
at 11:00 am.

Bid2023-430 Purchase New Press Tool Kit
Bid2024-029 Analytical Laboratory Testing Services

Bid2024-032 Brass Fittings & Valves

June 5%/ June 12



Date: May 9, 2023
Bid2023-430 Purchase New Press Tool Kit

Bid2024-029 Analytical Laboratory Testing Services
Bid2024-032 Brass Fittings & Valves

Name (please print neatly) Company/Email Address

Honers Gomez. PA

Soanioe. Llampios, Bedl Specre i s
- i




