
 

Francis M. Gomez                                    Frank J. Picozzi 

Purchasing Agent                                     Mayor 

      

 

City of Warwick 

Purchasing Division 

3275 Post Road 

Warwick, Rhode Island 02886 

Tel (401) 738-2013 

Fax (401) 737-2364 

 

Bid Minutes Thursday, July 13, 2023 

 

 

 Bid2024-076  Asphalt Concrete, Hot Mixes, and Cold Patch 

 

 Bid2024-078  Tire Repairs & Recapping 

 

 Bid2024-083  Rebuilding or Rebuilt Exchange Transmissions 

 

 Bid2024-084  Infield Mix    

 

      Location:   The meeting was held at in Meeting Room 2 

        

   Present:   Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent 

    Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist 

     

Representatives: Randy Luongo, Material Corp.  

 

All bids have been properly advertised.  A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid 

or the bid will not be accepted.  Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened.  All bids will go 

to the departments for their review and recommendation.   

 

The next council meetings are August 21, 2023 and September 18, 2023 at Warwick City Hall.  The City 

Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M.  The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M.  The 5:00 

P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak. 

 

Respectively submitted, 

 

  

Francis M. Gomez 

 Francis M. Gomez 

 Purchasing Agent 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid2024-076 Asphalt Concrete, Hot Mixes, and Cold Patch 

 

 6 Bids received 

 

D’Ambra Construction Co., Inc.  

80 Centre of NE Blvd.  

Coventry, RI 02816 

 

Cardi Corporation 

400 Lincoln Ave.  

Warwick, RI 02888 

 

Material Sand & Stone Corp. 

618 Greenville Road 

N. Smithfield, RI 02896 

 

Johnston Asphalt, LLC 

100 Allendale Ave.  

Johnston, RI 02919 

 

Narragansett Improvement CO.  

223 Allens Ave.  

Providence, RI 02903 

 

Lynch Corporation 

50 Lynch Place 

Cumberland, RI 02864 

 

   D’Ambra Cardi Material Johnston Narragansett Lynch 

Item 

# 
Description 

 

Price Per 

Ton 

 

Price Per 

Ton 

Price Per 

Ton 

Price Per 

Ton 

Price Per 

Ton 

Price Per 

Ton 

        

1 
Hot Mix Class 

I-1 
$80.00 $80.00 $82.00 $92.00 $95.00 $100.00 

        

2 
Modified 

Binder Mix 
$78.00 $80.00 $82.00 $92.00 $95.00 $100.00 

        

3 
Hot Mix Class 

I-2 
$80.00 $82.00 $82.00 $92.00 $95.00 $100.00 

        

4 Winter Mix No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00 

        

5 Cold Patch No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00 No Bid No Bid 

        

6 

High 

Performance 

(Permanent) 

Cold Patch 

$185.00 No Bid No Bid $148.00 No Bid No Bid 

 



Bid2024-078 Tire Repairs and Recapping 

 

 1 Bid received 

 

Petes Tire Barns 

80 Public Street 

Providence, RI 02903 

 

 

 

Pricing as Follows 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Continued next page 

 



Bid2024-078 Tire Repairs and Recapping  

BID RESULTS 

 

 

Item 

# 

 

Description 
Normal Working 

Hours 

7:00 AM – 4:30 PM 

Weekends and 

Holidays  

4:30 PM – 7:00 AM 

1. PAYLOADERS   

a.  Remove $150.00 No Bid 

b.  Apply $150.00 No Bid 

c.  Tire Repair* $125.00 No Bid 

       d.  Tube Repair* No Bid No Bid 

2. BACKHOES   

a.  Remove $50.00 No Bid 

b.  Apply $50.00 No Bid 

c.  Tire Repair* $125.00 No Bid 

d.  Tube Repair* No Bid No Bid 

3. PACKERS   

a.  Remove $20.00 No Bid 

b.  Apply $20.00 No Bid 

c.  Tire Repair* $70.00 No Bid 

d.  Tube Repair* No Bid No Bid 

4. DUMP TRUCKS   

a.  Remove $20.00 No Bid 

b.  Apply $20.00 No Bid 

c.  Tire Repair* No Bid No Bid 

d.  Tube Repair* No Bid No Bid 

5. PICKUP TRUCKS   

a.  Remove $15.00 No Bid 

b.  Apply $15.00 No Bid 

c.  Tire Repair* $35.00 No Bid 

d.  Tube Repair* No Bid No Bid 

6. FIRE VEHICLES   

a.  Remove $20.00 No Bid 

b.  Apply $20.00 No Bid 

c.  Tire Repair* $70.00 No Bid 

d.  Tube Repair* No Bid No Bid 

7. OTHER VEHICLES   

a.  Remove No Bid No Bid 

b.  Apply No Bid No Bid 

c.  Tire Repair* No Bid No Bid 

d.  Tube Repair* No Bid No Bid 

    

 Charge for road service or service call to 

Department of Public Works for Truck Service 
$150.00 $185.00 

 Charge for road service or service call to 

Department of Public Works for OTR tires 
$200.00 $220.00 

 Charge for calcium chloride, per pound, 

installed in DPW vehicle tires, as needed 
No Bid  No Bid 

 

 

Continued next page 

 



Bid2024-078 Tire Repairs and Recapping 

BID RESULTS 

 

Item 

# 
Description Price 

   

 Sander/Dump Trucks  

   

1 11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive $231.75 

   

2 12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive $238.00 

   

 Sanders, Dump & Fire Trucks  

   

3 11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive (steel belted casings) $231.75 

   

4 12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive (steel belted casings) $238.00 

   

 Dump & Fire Trucks  

   

5 11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive (steel belted casings) $231.75 

   

6 12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive (steel belted casings) $238.00 

   

 Highway/Fire/Water Trucks  

   

7 12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive $238.00 

   

8 11R24.5 Bandag Winter Deep $241.64 

   

 Sanitation/Recycling Truck  

   

9 11R24.5 Bandag Ultra Drive $241.64 

   

10 11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive $231.75 

   

 Repairs in casings for re-treads  

   

 N-hole $10.93 

 Spot $13.57 

 Section $51.00 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid2024-083 Rebuilding or Rebuilt Exchange Transmissions 

 

 2 Bids received 

 

Camerota Truck Parts 

245 Shaker Road 

Enfield, CT 06082 

 

The Peterbilt Store-Rhode Island 

11 Industrial Lane 

Johnston, RI 02919 

 

  Camerota The Peterbilt Store 

Item Description Bid Bid 

Allison World 

Transmission   

 

Must be an 

authorized Allison 

Facility 
  

 

   
 

(Excludes 

Removal & 

Installation) 
  

 

   
 

1 
Model HD4560P for rear packers bolt to 

M11 Cummings  

 

 Rebuilding $6,712.39 No Bid 

 
Rebuilt $6,712.39 $8,428.36 

 
Warranty 

 
2 Year Unlimited Mile 

2 
Model MD3060P for recycle trucks bolt 

to Cat. 3126  

 

 
Rebuilding $4,280.49 No Bid 

 
Rebuilt $4,280.49 $5,400.53 

 
Warranty 

 
2 Year Unlimited Mile 

3 
Model 4500RDS for recycle trucks bolt 

to Cat. C10 & C15  

 

 
Rebuilding $6,712.39 No Bid 

 
Rebuilt $6,712.39 $8,512.64 

 
Warranty 

 
2 Year Unlimited Mile 

4 
Model 4500RDS (P) for recycle trucks 

bolt to Cummings ISL-9 or PX-9  

 

 
Rebuilding $6,712.39 No Bid 

 
Rebuilt $6,712.39 $8,512.64 

 
Warranty 

 
2 Year Unlimited Mile 

5 
Model 4000RDS for recycle trucks bolt 

to MP-7  

 

 
Rebuilding $6,712.39 No Bid 

 
Rebuilt $6,712.39 $8,137.12 

 
Warranty 

 
2 Year Unlimited Mile 

 

Continued next page 



Bid2024-083 Rebuilding or Rebuilt Exchange Transmissions BID RESULTS 

 

  Camerota The Peterbilt Store 

Item Description Bid Bid 

(Includes Removal 

& Installation) 
    

 

1 Model 4R100    

 
Rebuilding No Bid No Bid 

 
Rebuilt No Bid No Bid 

 
Warranty No Bid No Bid 

2 Model E40D 
 

 

 
Rebuilding No Bid No Bid 

 
Rebuilt No Bid No Bid 

 
Warranty No Bid No Bid 

3 
Model 5R110 (N) Torque Shift 

Transmission  

 

 
Rebuilding No Bid No Bid 

 
Rebuilt No Bid No Bid 

 
Warranty No Bid No Bid 

4 
Allison Automatic Transmission 

1000/2000 Series  

 

 
Rebuilding No Bid No Bid 

 
Rebuilt No Bid 

100 Series $3,201.15/ 2000 

Series $3,509.03 

 
Warranty No Bid 2 Year Unlimited Mile 

5 Ford Taurus AX4S 
 

 

 
Rebuilding No Bid No Bid 

 
Rebuilt No Bid No Bid 

 
Warranty No Bid No Bid 

6 Ford Taurus AX4N 
 

 

 Rebuilding No Bid No Bid 

 
Rebuilt No Bid No Bid 

 
Warranty No Bid No Bid 

7 Ford Crown Victoria Model AODE   

 Rebuilding No Bid No Bid 

 Rebuilt No Bid No Bid 

 Warranty No Bid No Bid 

8 Ford Crown Victoria Model 4R70W   

 Rebuilding No Bid No Bid 

 Rebuilt No Bid No Bid 

 Warranty No Bid No Bid 

9 Model 4L60   

 Rebuilding No Bid No Bid 

 Rebuilt No Bid No Bid 

 Warranty No Bid No Bid 

10 Model 4L80/85   

 Rebuilding No Bid No Bid 

 Rebuilt No Bid No Bid 

 Warranty No Bid No Bid 



Bid2024-084 Infield Mix 

 

 0 Bids received 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NO BIDS 

RECEIVED 


