Francis M. Gomez

Purchasing Agent

Bid2024-111
Bid2024-112
Bid2024-113
Bid2024-116
Location:

Present:

Representatives:

Frank J. Picozzi

Mayor

City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364

Bid Minutes Tuesday, July 25, 2023

Police Automotive Graphics Replacement
Miscellaneous Police Gear & Supplies

Car Wash Supplies

Firefighter Occupational Medical Evaluations RE-BID

The meeting was held at in Meeting Room 2

Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist

Tonya Pereira, Surplus Provisions

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid
or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go
to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are August 21, 2023 and September 18, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The City
Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00
P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,

rancis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent



Bid2024-111 Police Automotive Graphics Replacement

e 2 Bids recetved

Paul Tucker
Dba Sign Logic
9 Bonazzoli Ave.
Hudson, MA 01749
MHQ
401 Elm Street
Marlborough, Ma 01752
Ttem Description Sign Logic MHQ
1 WPD Patch Logo 3m Reflective
A 4 inch | $5.00 $15.00
B 6 inch | $12.00 $20.00
C 8 inch | $20.00 $26.00
D 12 inch | $27.00 $32.00
5 WPD Patch with American & RI
State Flag Logo in 3M Reflective
A 4 inch | $9.00 $15.00
B 6 inch | $12.00 $20.00
C 8 inch | $20.00 $26.00
D 12 inch { $27.00 $32.00
3 WPD Unit Numbering
A 2 inch windshield | $4.00 $10.00
B 4 inch side & rear | $15.00 $15.00
Complete Vehicle Graphics Kit for
4 2020 Ford Utility Police Cruiser w/
Hash Marks
A Installed | $950.00 $1,450.00
B Material Only | $750.00 $1,200.00
5 WPD Patch “Non Reflective”
Material
A 1 inch patch logo | $0.50 $5.00
B 2 inch patch logo | $1.00 $8.00
C 4 inch patch logo | $2.00 $10.00
6 WPD Patch with American Flag & RI
State Flag “Non Reflective Material”
A 2 inch Patch/Flag combo | $2.00 $8.00
B 4 inch patch/flag combo | $3.00 $10.00
Driver’s Side door High Reflective
’ Kit
A Lime Green | $50.00 $50.00




Bid2024-112 Miscellaneous Police Gear & Supplies

e 6 Bids recetved

Continued next page

Surplus Provisions
721 Pontiac Ave.
Cranston, R1 02910

Atlantic Tactical
763 Corporate Circle
New Cumberland, PA 17070

Blue Tactical
109 Apremont Way, Suite 11
Westfield, MA 01085

Image First Uniforms
Dba Madim LLC
400 Overpeck Ave.
Englewood, NJ 07631

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.
3810 West Osborne Ave.
Tampa, FL 33614

Courage Tactical LLC
Dba CopsPlus.com
18530 Mack Ave., Suite 499
Gross Pointe Farms, M1 48236

Pricing as follows



Bid2024-112 miscellaneous Police Gear Supplies

BID RESULTS
- . . . Image First Dana Safety Courage Tactical
Surplus Provisions | Atlantic Tactical Blue Tactical Uniforms Supply LLC
Item # Description Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Substitute Jtem
1 Handgun Duty | ¢ 15435 | § 14435 155.05 242.50 No Bid 44N600BK
Holster
$134.95
Handgun .
. Substitute Item
2 . . . .
Pax;_lcake/Belt $ 4539 | % 45.12 63.43 69.50 No Bid 410200BK $48 95
olster
. Substitute Item
3 . . . .
Handcuff Case | § 2865 | % 30.53 39.55 41.00 No Bid 1450PC 528,10
Double Magazine . Substitute Item
4 . . K
Pouch $ 3385 % 36.49 35.07 52.50 No Bid 1432PC $34.80
Duty Belt (Sam - . Substitute Item
5 $ 58.85 63.51 67.54 .
Bowne Style) $ 73 88.30 NoBid 6504-1-X $61.95
0.C. Spray Canister| . Substitute Item
6 28. . . ;
Holder $ 8751 % 30.53 27.25 47.00 No Bid 1458PC $26.05
7 O.C. Spray (Gel) | § 1375 | 8 1&.81 13.88 16.00 No Bid ) 12.00
8 Handcuffs h) 24.45 25.27 24.12 37.50 | $24.49(qty. 1-99) | 3 21.25
. Substitute Item
9 CPR Pouch $ 18.45 19.83 21,07 30.00 No Bid 1482P $18.50
CPR Glove & . . .
10 Mouthpicee Refill $ 16.80 17.54 3.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 Whistle b 17.50 3.78 0.98 7.50 No Bid b3 4.60
12 Whistle Chain $ 1.25 331 5.34 7.00 No Bid $ 3.86
13 Expandable Baton | § 98.50 170.77 198.48 9400 | % 11903 | § 137.42
Expandable Baton
14 Case/Halder 5 48.50 41.74 48.63 48.00 | § 3649 | 3 4236
15 Flashlight $ 128,50 124.35 93.85 12200( § 103.24 | § 115.45
16 One-Handed | ¢ 2850 28.80 26.88 33.00 | § 2424 | 8 26.70
Tourniquet
17 Pistol Tactical Light]| $ 168.50 | § 162.76 175.76 15650 | § 130.74 | § 146.48




Bid2024-113 Car Wash Supplies

2 Bids received

Action Auto Parts
795 N. Main Street
Providence, RI 02904

Auto Wash Supply Co., Inc.
11 Ainsworth Street
Providence, RI 02904

Ttem

4 Description Action Auto Parts Auto Wash Supply Co. -

] | TREES 24 PK ASSORTED $17.52 $27.00
SPRAYWAY GLASS CLEANER =19 oz,

y | SPRAYM $35.88 $43.00

3 | WHITE WALL CLEANER NL 5 GALLON $55.88 $53.00

4 |32 OUNCE PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE $3.29 $1.50

5 | SUPER SHINE DRESSING | GALLON $41.75 $42.00

6 | FOAMDISC 5”—¢” $13.72 $9.00
DECAL/TAR/ADHESIVE REMOVER

T | ot on $30.19 $39.00
ODOR BOMB ODOR ELIMINTAOR 5

8 | OUNCES SINGLE USE CAN $7.65 $7.00

9 | STEEL WOOL SUPER FINE #0000 $5.43 $5.50
3M RUBBING GLAZE & COMPOUND 1

10 | QUART $32.20 $45.00

11 | 5 GALLON STERLING WHEEL CLEANER $114.61 $79.00

12 | SHAMY — ZORBIT 149 JUMBO SX720 $11.56 $15.00

13 | SPRAY N WIPE WAX 5 GALLON $165.56 $26.00/1 gallon

14 | COVERAL 5 GALLON $239.11 $177.00
55 GALLON DRUM CAR SOAP

15 | (OONCENTRATED) $341.00 $397.00

16 | AIR MASTER / ODOR ELIMINATOR $5.90 $8.00/can

$86.00/case




Bid2024-116 Firefighter Occupational Medical Evaluations RE-BID

e 5 Bidsreceived

Continued next page

Atmed Treatment Center
1524 Atwood Ave.
Johnston, RI 02919

Occupational Health Centers of the Southwest, P.A.

Dba Concentra Medical Centers
400 Bald Hill Road
Warwick, RI 02886

SiteMed North America LLC
1634 White Circle, Suite 101
Marietta, GA 30066

Professional Health Services, Inc.
600 Reed Road, Suite 103
Broomall, PA 19008

Caduceus Occupational Medicine
Dba Caduceus Exams Management
535 N Central Ave.
Hapeville, GA 30354

Pricing as Follows



Bid2024-116 Firefighter Occupational Medical Evaluations RE-BID

BID RESULTS
Item | Complete Medical Evaluations Atmed Concentra (See| SiteMed North| Professional Caduceus
# | Required for Medical Certfication Treatment | Attachment 1) America Health Services| Occupational
Complete NFPA 1582 Evaluation and
1 Medical Certification b 315.00( $ 326.00) $ 495.00| $ 416.00] § 155.00
Existing Firefighter
Compilete NFPA 1582 Evaluation and a cissdsil-m})-]
2 Medical Certification $ 353.00| $ 745.50 | \JACUCECS BEP | o 416.00| $ 578.00
. . B Titer and Hep
Firefighter Candidate .
C screening)
Complete NFPA 1582 Evaluation and
3 Medical Certification Existing Haz- | $ 353.00| & 326.00| $ 495.00| $ 16.00] 8 155.00
Mat Technician '
.Complete NFPA-1582 Evaluation and G ff::(:)l 50
4 | Medical Certification New Haz-Mat | §  353.00] § 74550 | oo o $  41600$ 58100
Technician for Heavy
Metals Panel)
Item Procedures & Tests (Priced
# Individually)
Heavy Metal Test (Arsenic,
5 Cadmium, Mercury, B b 120.00| § 115.00| § 150.00| $ 97.00| § 120.00
OncTest Multi-Cancer Test, including| $200.00 (260
the purchase of product, drawing kits) Not $189.00 (see
6 blood sample and processing of the included in $ 769.00 note 1) § 140.00) § 269.00
test items 1-4
Prrsont s eosiel 501
7 . . ‘included in $ 35.00 No Bid 3 140.00| § 84.00
(Product supplied by the Fire items 1-4
Department)
Tuberculosis (TB) screening using
8 Skin Test (PPD) 3 2500 $ 3950| § 30.00| § 6500 § 61.00
Item Additiona] Tests & Vaccines NOT
Required for Completion of
# .
Evaluation
9 | Hepatitis A Vaccine series (2 doses) | §  100.00 310:‘;22 P | $95.00 perdose|  NoBid | $ 84.00
10 | Hepatitis B Vaccine series (3 doses) | $ 65.00 | $78.50 per dose| $85.00 per dose Ne Bid 5 125.00
11 Drug Screen (5-Panel) 3 45.001 § 4550| $ 50.00 No Bid $65.00/50
Notes:

1. $189.00 includes ordering the OneTest. SiteMeds physician is the ordering physician, SiteMed
will draw the blood, send it off for processing and a SiteMed physician will review the results
with the firefighter during their one on one consultation.




Concenira

ATTACHMENT #1

Additional components that may need to be ordered under conditional circumstances

according to clinician discretion

Clinic Fee Schedule

Component Rate per Unit
Prostatic Specific Antigen (P5A) 5363SB $ 60.00
OSHA Physical Medical Opinion Letter $ 13.00
Hemocecult FOBT FIT Test S 65.50

MMR Vaccine $ 133.00

Tdap Vaccine S 72.00
Varicella Vaccine $ 212.00
Influenza {Flu Shot) $ 51.00
Breath Alcohol Test PrePlacement S 36.00
Cardiovascular Stress Test 5 141.50
Respirator Fit Test Quantitative $ 5550

EKG Resting S 48.00
Cardio 1Q{R) MPO 92814 $ 120.00

TB Skin Test $ 39.50
Breath Alcohol Test Periodic S 36.00
Vision Color Ishihara 14 Plates $ 34.50
OSHA respirator questionnaire $ 37.00
On-Site Testing Fee Schedule

Component Type Rate per Unit
Non-Regulated UDS 5 Panel 27215 S 25.00
Hep B Recombivax (3 shots) #3 S 70.00
Hepatitis A Vaccine-1st Injection S 120.00




Concenira’

ATTACHMENT #1

Nurse

MMR Vaccine S 85.00
Tdap Vaccine S 50.00
Varicella Vaccine S 140.00
Heavy Metals {As/Cd/Hg/Pb/Zpp)-Bld 307632 | S 105.00
Hepatitis B Surface Antigen 4985B S 25.00
Hepatitis C Antibody 8472 w refiex RNA S 25.00
Prostatic Specific Antigen (PSA) 53635B S 50.00
T Spot TB Test 37737 Quest 5 100.00
U/A Dipstick S 20.00
U/A Manual Microscopic 8563 S 25.00
Firefighter Exam [ 45,00
EKG Resting S 40.00
Pulmonary Function Test S 40.00
Vision Acuity Complete (Titmus) S 10.00
Audiogram S 35.00
HIV Test S 40.00
0S-Onsite Labor Fee per Hour Medical S 85.00
Assistant

0S-Onsite Labor Fee per Hour Medical Doctor | $ 270.00
0S-Onsite Labor Fee per Hour Registered S 160.00




FRANK .J. PICOZZI
MAYOR

FRANCIS M. GOMEZ
PURCHASING AGENT

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 PosT ROAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
TEL (401)738-2013
FAxX (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To: Peder Schaefer, Finance Director
From: Francis M. Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Date: July 12,2023

Re: Agenda for Tuesday, July 25, 2023

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2 starting
at 11:00 am.

Bid2024-111 Police Automotive Graphics Replacement
Bid2024-112 Misc. Police Gear & Supplies
Bid2024-113 Car Wash Supplies

Bid2024-116 Firefighter Occupational Medical Evaluations RE-BID

August 21% / September 18%



Date: July 25, 2023

Bid2024-111 Police Automotive Graphics Replacement
Bid2024-112 Misc. Police Gear & Supplies
Bid2024-113 Car Wash Supplies
Bid2024-116 Firefighter Occupational Medical Evaluations RE-BID

Name (please print neatly) Company/Email Address

escte Lamprey Blfecalist-

‘%‘J’Lctﬁ Gored (A&

“Tonya_ Parerre. — Surplus fovsions




