Francis M. Gomez Frank J. Picozzi

Purchasing Agent Mayor
City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364
Bid Minutes Wednesday, August 2, 2023
Bid2024-124 Traffic, Street, and Pole Light Maintenance
Bid2024-125 Purchase Bulk Road Salt
Bid2024-126 Purchase 8°,9°,10°,11°, and 12’ Snow Plows
Bid2024-127 Food Concessionaire Services & Vending Machine Provider at Various
City Locations
Location: The meeting was held at in Meeting Room 2
Present: Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist
Representatives: Jeremy Warren, Eastern Salt

Orlando DiFusco, ANJ Electric Eye
Ryan Doyle, Arden Engineering

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid
or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go
to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are August 21, 2023 and September 6, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The City
Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00
P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,
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Fr;{ncis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent




Bid2024-124 Traffic, Street, and Pole Light Maintenance

¢ 3 Bids recetved

Continued next page

Arden Engineering Constructors, LLC
505 Narragansett Park Drive
Pawtucket, RI 02861

ANIJ Electric Eye LLC
81 Western Industrial Drive, Unit D
Cranston, R] 02921

K Electric, Inc.

2646 Warwick Ave.
Warwick, RI 02889

Pricing as Follows



2024-124 Traffic, Street, and Pole Light Maintenance BID RESULTS

Arden Engineefing ANJ Electric Eye K Electric, Inc.
Item Description Price Price Price
I Journeyman $95.00 $105.00 $121.00
I Apprentice $50.00 $55.00 $72.00
I Bucket Trueck or Crane $20.00 $£20.00 $56.00
v Pick-Up Truck $20.00 $15.00 N/C
100" Minimum Lift Truck for Field
V  |Maintenance Services Cost for $1,150.00 $950.00 $2,500.00
8 Hour Day
Supplies - Mark Up % from
5% - 10% 59
VI Receipted Bill ° 0 15%
Item Description Per Hour Overtime Per Per Hour Overtime Per Per Hour Overtime Per
Hour Hour Hour
1 Joumneyman Electrician/Lineman 3 95.00 No Bid $ 105.00] $ 155.00 | § 121.00 | § 181.00
2 Journeyman Electrician/Lineman $ 95.00 No Bid $ 105.00| $ 159.00 | § 121.00 | § 181.00
3 Apprentice Electrician/Lineman $ 60.00 No Bid $ 59.00|s8 80008 72008 107.00
4 Apprentice Electrician/Lineman 5 60.00 No Bid $ 59008 80.00|§ 72008 107.00
5 Lamp and Photocell Service Person | $ 40.00 No Bid 5 5500|3% 65.00| $ 121.00( § 181.00
6 Laborer $ 40.00 No Bid 5 60.00 | & 7000 | $§ 10000 § 150.00
7 Laborer $ 40.00 No Bid $ 60.00 | $ 7000 | § 10000 | 3 150.00
Ttem Description Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit
1 Truck (35 10 40 foot bucket truck) | § 15.00 Per Call $ 125.00 Per Call $ 56.00 Per Call
2 Dump Truck (2 to 3 yard) $ 15.00 Per Call $ 100.00 Per Call $ 40,00 Per Call
3 Crane (5 to 10 ton) $ 15.00 Per Call $ 150.00 Per Call $ 75.00 Per Call
4 Pole truck with pole auger g 15.00 Per Call $ 150.00 Per Call $  56.00 Per Call
Group relamp (including bulb and
5 photocell cleaning and tree trimming, | $ 400,00 Per Fixture $ 15500 | PerFixture | § 65.00 Per Fixture
five or more per request) )
6 Cobra lens (dish or flat lens-glass) 45.00 Each $ 9500 Each $ 2200 Each
7 3 foat mast arm W/ hardware wio 150.00 Each 20000 | Each [$ 3500 Each
g | 4Pormastamwihadwaewlo | g 150,00 Each $ 22500 Each |$ 60.00 Each
g | ©foormastamwhaiwarewlo |5 250,00 Each $ 25000 Each |$ 250.00 Each
1o | ®footmastam Whardwarewlo | 300,00 Each § 27500 FEach | $ 300.00 Each
1 | 10foormastamn Whadwarewlo | g 350,00 Each $ 30000 Each | $ 425.00 Each
1p | [RfoctmastamwWhadwmewlo | g 350,00 Each $ 35000 Each |$ 475.00 Each
Relocate existing lamp and bracket
13 from old pole to new pole (associated| § 250,00 Each $ 575.00 Each § 200.00 Each
with utility replacements)
14 Pole — wood $ 1,100.00 Each $  600.00 Each $ 750.00 Each
15 Pole — fiber (<25 feet) $ 500.00 Each $  750.00 Each $3,750.00 Each
16 Pole — Metal (>25 feet) $ 2,800.00 Each $ 475.00 Each $3,750.00 Each
17 Standard material markup % 5% 10% 15%




ATTACHMENT #1 ARDEN ENGINEERING

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE AND SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID
PRICING MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL
Bid2024-124 Traffic, Street, and Pole Light Maintenance

A list of 2 minimum of 20 replacement parts that could potentially require replacement must be
provided in a format similar to the following to allow for accurate bid award:

Description = |  -Listprice Percentage off Net Price
Solid State Load Switch $35.00 59 $3325
Solid State Flasher $35.00 5% §33.25
i—g;:;ion 12" Signel Head W/ $295.00 59 $280.25
12" Red LED $55.00 5% _ $52.25
12" Yellow LED $50.00 5% $47.50
12" Green LED $55.00 5% $5225
12" Red Arrow LED $60.00 5% $57.00
12" Yellow Arrow LED $60.00 5% $57.00
12" Green Arrow LED $60.00 % $57.00
2-Channel Loop Amplifier $100.00 5% $95.00
TS-2 Buss Interface Uni $265.00 5% $251.75
TS-2 MMU $850.00 5% $807.50
Flash Transfer Relay $40.00 5% $38.00
TS-2 Type 2 Controller $3,500.00 5% $3,325.00
ADA Pushbutton W/ 9" X 12} Sign ~ $615.00 5% $584.25
TS-2 Cabinet Power Supply $450.00 5% $427.50
12" Ped LED $160.00 5% $152.00
1-Way Side of Pole Kit $115.00 5% $109.25
1-Way Post Top Mount $135.00 5% $128.25
1-Way Astro Brac $190.00 5% $180.50
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ATTACHMENT #2

ANJ ELECTRIC EYE

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE AND SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

Bid2024-124 Traffic, Street, and Pole Light Maintenance

PRICING MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

A list of a minimum of 20 replacement parts that could potentially require replacement must be
provided in a format similar to the following to allow for accurate bid award:

Description-- List price Percentage off Net Price
Traffic controller 3500.00 15 2975.00
Load Switch 150.00 15 127.50
12" LED Green 100.00 18 85.00
12" LED Red 100.00 15 85.00
12" LED yellow 100.00 15 85.00
3 sec Traffic Signal 750.00 15 §37.60
4 sec Traffic Signal  |900.00 15 765.00
Astro bracket 355.00 15 301.75
Goose neck Span 155,00 15 131.75
IMSA Traffic cable 200 LF 15 170 LF
LED Cobra Head 175.00 15 148,75
Traffic controller & cabinet | 15,000.00 15 12,750.00
Power supply 350.00 15 297.60
Photocell 75,00 15 63.756
Traffic loop Bx40 1500.00 15 1275.00
Traffic Loop 6x8 1000.00 15 850,00
Decorative Street light |500.00 15 425,00
Decorative Street Polg1500.00 15 1275.00
Pedestrian Signal 750.00 15 637.50
PED.Push button & sign|230.00 15 185.50
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K ELECTRIC INGC
ATTACHMENT #3

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE AND SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID
PRICING MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTTIAL
Bid2024-124 Traffic, Street, and Pole Light Mainterance

A list of a minimum of 20 replacement parts that could potentially require replacement must be
provided in a format similar to the following to allow for accurate bid award:

Description_ List price Percéntage off Net Prige
[eotek CVI Fixture [5191.00 20% $152.00
GCM2 Fixture $236.00 20% 1£189.00
Suntech Dim 4 8612 [$57.47 15% 548.85
Suntech Dim 4 8613 $57.47 15% $48.85
Suntech Dim 4 8610  ($57.47 15% $48.85
Suntech Dim 4 8562 §£57.47 15% 548,85
Fuse Assembly $34.65 15% " 1$29.45
Compression fitting to [$32.53 15% $27.65
secondary
Rewire six foot mast [$17.25 20% $13.30
arm ' '

XTFE Floodlight 250w [$273.15 20% . $218.15

equivalent LED

ATBR Power supply .[$406.40 0% $406.40
~  [EyeBolt5/8inx 18in [$20.20° 0% $20.20

Power supply IMSA  §1.72 0% £1.72

20-3

J 250 Dead end clevis [$25.48 % . 525.48

12” signal module $99.00 0% $95.00

RYG Gelcore LED .

8™ signal module 1$99.00 0% $99.00

Gelcore LED )

12" Hand Man Bi- $£209.00 0% ) $209.00

modal Ped module .

LED .

12” Countdown Ped  $209.00 : (% $209.00

module LED 7

16" Countdown PED  [$264.00 0% $264.00

module LED }

Power supply TS-2106 [$14.68 . 0% 514,68

12°



Bid2024-125 Purchase Bulk Road Salt

¢ 3 Bids received

Mid-American Salt
4528 Hillegas Road
Fort Wayne, IN 46818

Eastern Salt Company, Inc.
134 Middle Street, Suite 210
Lowell, MA 01852

Morton Salt, Inc.
444 West Lake Street, Suite 3000
Chicago, IL 60606

Mid-American Eastern Salt

Morton Salt

Description

Price per ton

Bulk road salt - delivered

$75.77 $78.80

$83.29




Bid2024-126 Purchase 8°,9°, 10°, 11°, and 12’ Snow Plows

2 Bids received

Pathfinder Snow Plows
455 Industrial Drive
Exeter, RI 02822
Cap City of RI
2304 Post Road
Warwick, RI 02886
Pathfinder Cap City
Item #/Description Bid Bid
1) 8’ Reversible Plow
Make/Model Pathfinder TE 55 Fisher 8 HD2 — Fleet Flex
Warranty 2 Years 2 Years
Cost Each $5,045.00 $5,195.00
2) 9” Reversible Plow
Make/Model No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid
Cost Each No Bid No Bid
3) 10’ Reversible Plow
Make/Model No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid
Cost Each No Bid No Bid
4) 11° Reversible Plow
Make/Model No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid
Cost Each No Bid No Bid
5) 12’ Reversible Plow
Make/Model No Bid No Bid
Warranty No Bid No Bid
Cost Each No Bid No Bid
Delivery in calendar days ARO 15 Days 2-3 Days




Bid2024-127 Food Concessionaire Services & Vending Machine Provider at Various City Locations
¢ 1 Bid received
Cagney Food Service
PO Box 103
West Warwick, R1 02893

Thayer & Warburton Arenas & McDermott Pool
Including Vending Machines

Description Bid
November 1, 2023 — October 31, 2024
Contract price without electricity $5,000.00
Electricity fee $2,500.00
Total 1% year bid including electricity $7,500.00

November 1, 2024 — October 31, 2025

Contract price without electricity - $6,000.00
Electricity fee $2,500.00
Total 2 year bid including electricity $8,500.00
TOTAL BID FOR 2 YEARS $16,000.00
November 1, 2023 — October 31, 2024 MINUMUM BID S MACHIRE
Department of Public Works Rear Garage — No Bid
minimum bid $1,000 =
Department of Public Works Sanitation ready No Bid
room — minimum bid $500 0B
Department of Public Works Water Division No Bid
ready room - minimum bid $1,000 or1
Warwick Police Station lobby - minimum bid No Bid
$1,000 o5
MINUMUM BID OF $500 PER MACHINE
November 1, 2024 — October 31, 2025 PER LOCATION
Department of Public Works Rear Garage — No Bid '
minimum bid $1,000
Department of Public Works Sanitation ready No Bid
room — minimum bid $500 !
Department of Public Works Water Division No Bid
ready room - minimum bid $1,000 !
Warwick Police Station lobby - minimum bid No Bid
$1,000 o=
TOTAL BID FOR 2 YEARS No Bid




FRANK J. PIcOZZ]
MAYOR

FRANCIS M. GOMEZ
PURCHASING AGENT

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 PosT ROAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND Q2886
TEL (401)738-2013
FAX (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To: Peder Schaefer, Finance Director
From: Francis M. Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Date: July 14, 2023

Re:  Agenda for Wednesday, August 2, 2023

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2 starting
at 11:00 am.

Bid2024-124 Traffic, Street, and Pole Light Maintenance
Bid2024-125 Purchase Bulk Road Salt
Bid2024-126 Purchase 8°, 9%, 10°, 11°, and 12’ Snow Plows

Bid2024-127 Food Concessionaire Services & Vending Machine Provider at Various City Locations

August 21% / September 18%



Date: August 2, 2023
Bid2024-124 Traffic, Street, and Pole Light Maintenance
Bid2024-125 Purchase Bulk Road Salt
Bid2024-126 Purchase 8°,9°,10°, 11°, and 12’ Snow Plows
Bid2024-127 Food Concessionaire Services & Vending Machine Provider at Various City Locations

Name (please print neatly) Company/Email Address
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