

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent



Frank J. Picozzi
Mayor

City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364

Bid Minutes Tuesday, September 12, 2023

- Bid2024-175** **Police Vehicle Window Tinting**
- Bid2024-176** **Police Motorcycle Repairs**
- Bid2024-179** **Motorola Two-Way Radio Accessories, Replacement Parts, and Vehicle Mounting Hardware**

Location: The meeting was held at in Meeting Room 2

Present: Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist
Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent

Representatives: None

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are October 2, 2023 and October 16, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The City Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00 P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent

Bid2024-175 Police Vehicle Window Tinting

- 1 Bid received

All Mobile Towing & Recovery LLC
PO Box 14544
East Providence, RI 02914

Item #	Description	Bid
1.	Ford Explorer Police Interceptor 2013-2024 model years	
a.	Front door (2) windows only	\$130.00
b.	(2)-Front,(2) rear door windows	\$230.00
2.	Miscellaneous vehicles:	
a.	Complete 2 front, 2 rear doors front and rear back window. Vehicles; Ford Edge, Escapes, Superduty	\$325.00
b.	All (4) door windows rear window and front windshield strip	\$365.00
3.	Front windshield strip 4-6 inch strip	\$60.00

Bid2024-176 Police Vehicle Motorcycle Repairs

- 1 Bid received

Russ' Ocean State Harley-Davidson
35 Albany Road
Warwick, RI 02888

<u>MOTORCYCLE REPAIRS</u>	<u>Bid</u>
RI STATE INSPECTION	\$11.00
LABOR-HOURLY RATE	\$120.00
POLICE MOTORCYCLE LOANER	N/A
PICK UP OR DELIVER MOTORCYCLE TO POLICE DEPARTMENT	\$125.00/trip

Bid2024-179 Motorola Two-Way Radio Accessories, Replacement Parts, and Vehicle Mounting Hardware

- 3 Bids received

SAT Radio Communications LTD.
Dba Industrial Communications
1019 E Euclid Ave.
San Antonio, TX 78212

Cyber Communications, Inc.
90 Colorado Ave.
Warwick, RI 02888

Holzberg Communications, Inc.
PO Box 322
Totowa, NJ 07511

Pricing as Follows

2024-179 Motorola Two Way Radio Accessories, Replacement Parts, & Vehicle Mounting Hardware BID RESULTS

Line	Item	Description	SAT Radio Communications			Cyber Communications			Holzberg Communications		
			MSRP	Unit Price	Price Per 10	MSRP	Unit Price	Price Per 10	MSRP	Unit Price	Price Per 10
16	LPT800900NMO	Larsen Black Low Profile NMO Antenna for 806-960 MHz	\$ 60.49	\$ 51.41	\$ 514.10	\$ 60.49	\$ 54.45	\$ 544.50		\$ 38.00	\$ 380.00
17	HKN6169	Motorola Remote Mount Control Cable	\$ 98.52	\$ 83.74	\$ 837.40	\$ 98.52	\$ 88.65	\$ 886.50		\$ 82.00	\$ 820.00
18	HKN4192	Motorola Power Cable	\$ 47.52	\$ 40.39	\$ 403.90	\$ 47.52	\$ 42.77	\$ 427.70		\$ 40.00	\$ 400.00
19	HKN6188	Motorola Control Head Power, Ignition, Speaker Cable	\$ 53.36	\$ 45.35	\$ 453.50	\$ 53.36	\$ 48.00	\$ 480.00		\$ 48.00	\$ 480.00
20	HMN1090A	Motorola Palm Microphone for XTL/APX	\$ 81.00	\$ 68.85	\$ 688.50	\$ 81.00	\$ 72.90	\$ 729.00		\$ 69.00	\$ 690.00
21	3064078H02	Motorola replacement cord for HMN1090	\$ 50.09	\$ 42.57	\$ 425.70	\$ 50.09	\$ 45.08	\$ 450.80		\$ 47.00	\$ 470.00
22	PMMN4062AL	Motorola Remote Speaker Mic for APX 4000	\$ 127.12	\$ 108.05	\$ 1,080.50	\$ 127.12	\$ 114.41	\$ 1,144.10		\$ 102.00	\$ 1,020.00
23	PMKN4234A	Replacement Cord for PMMN4062AL	\$ 54.00	\$ 45.90	\$ 459.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 48.60	\$ 486.00		\$ 45.00	\$ 450.00
24	V-11019	Otto Audio Adapter for APX	\$ 52.25	\$ 44.41	\$ 444.10	\$ 163.59	\$ 147.25	\$ 1,472.50		\$ 119.00	\$ 1,190.00
25	VI-10335	Otto Audio Adapter for XTS	\$ 52.25	\$ 44.41	\$ 444.10	\$ 66.52	\$ 66.52	\$ 665.20		\$ 50.00	\$ 500.00
26	V4- BA2MA3B	Breeze Pigtail With Remote PTT	\$ 60.95	\$ 51.80	\$ 518.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	PMPN4174A	APX 4000 Desktop Charger	\$ 82.08	\$ 69.76	\$ 697.60	\$ 82.08	\$ 73.85	\$ 738.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

FRANCIS M. GOMEZ
PURCHASING AGENT



FRANK J. PICOZZI
MAYOR

CITY OF WARWICK
PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 POST ROAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
TEL (401)738-2013
FAX (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To: Peder Schaefer, Finance Director
From: Francis M. Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Date: August 28, 2023
Re: Agenda for Tuesday, September 12, 2023

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2 starting at 11:00 am.

Bid2024-175 Police Vehicle Window Tinting

Bid2024-176 Police Motorcycle Repairs

Bid2024-179 Motorola Two Way Radio Accessories, Replacement Parts, & Vehicle Mounting Hardware

October 2nd / October 16th

