Francis M. Gomez Frank J. Picozzi

Purchasing Agent Mayor
City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013 -
. Fax (401) 737-2364
Bid Minutes Wednesday, October 11, 2023
Bid2024-207 Floor Mats, Dry & Wet Mops Rental
Bid2024-208 Purchase Various New Tires
Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping
Bid2024-211 Large Diameter Clamps, Saddles, and Couplings
Location: The meeting was held in Meeting Room 2
Present: Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist
Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Representatives: None

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid
or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go
to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are October 16, 2023 and November 6, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The City
Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00
P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent




" Bid2024-207 Floor Mats, Dry & Wet Mop Rental
s 3 Bids recetved

New England Industrial Uniform Rental Service, Inc.
355 Union Street
West Springfield, MA 01089

Unifirst Corporation

33 Lambert Lind Highway, Suite 3
Warwick, RI 02886
Cintas Corporation

300 Highland Corporate Drive
Cumberland, RI 02864

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page



Bid2024-207 Floor Mats, Dry Wet Mop Rentals

BID RESULTS
YEAR 1 New England Uniform Unifirst Cintas
. Per Week Bi-Weekly Monthly | Per Week | Bi-Weekly | Monthly| Per Week | Bi-Weekly | Monthly
Item Description "~ - " i s o % i s o s iy :

Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing

| Floor Mats
1{3’ x 5" mat-7.5 Ibs. $ 1.79 | $ 2.68 No Bid $ 3251§% 3301 % 335([% 292§ 438 | % 730
2|4’ x 8" mat - 13.5 Ibs. $ 3951 % 5.92 No Bid $ 430] % 4351 9% 440 % 3.60 | $ 5401 % 9.00
3|13’ x 15" mat -20.0 Ibs. | $ 3951 % 5.92 No Bid $ 6.00]$ 610 § 6.15| § 429 | $ 6.43 | $10.72
43’ x 10" mat-14.0lbs. | § 3.64 | % 5.46 No Bid $ 4501 % 455 % 460 % 4291 % 6.43 | $10.72
5|4’ x 6" mat - 11.5 Ibs. $ 2241 8 3.36 No Bid $ 4301] 8§ 4351 9% 440 $ 3.60 | $ 5401 % 9.00

Il Mops
1| Wet Mop $ 0.10 | § 0.15 No Bid $ 080] 8% 083]% 085( % 1.00 | $ 1.50 | $ 2.50
2{Dry Mop — 24" $ 0.10] $ 0.15 No Bid $ 080§ 083|% 085([% 085]8% 1271 % 2.12
3|Dry Mop — 36" $ 0.10] $ 0.15 No Bid $ 080] 9% 083 [ % 085 8% 1.00 | $ .50 [ $ 2.50
YEAR 2 New England Uniform Unifirst Cintas
- Per Week Bi-Weekly Monthly | Per Week | Bi-Weekly | Monthly| Per Week | Bi-Weekly | Monthly
Item Description . . . .. .. . . . - - .

Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing

I Floor Mats
113" x 5" mat - 7.5 lbs. $ 1.79 | § 2.68 No Bid $ 33418 339 8% 345| 8 2921 % 438 % 7.30
214’ x 8" mat - 13.5 Ibs. $ 3951 % 5.92 No Bid $ 4421 % 448 [ § 4531 % 3.60 | % 5401 % 9.00
3[3'x 15" mat-20.0Ibs. | $ 3951 % 592 No Bid $ 618 $ 628 | $ 633§ 4291 % 6.43 | $10.72
43’ x 10" mat-14.0lbs. | § 364 | $ 5.46 No Bid $ 463]% 4688 473§ 4291 % 6.43 | $10.72
5[4 x 6" mat-11.5 Ibs. $ 2241 % 3.36 No Bid $ 44219 448 | $ 453 | $ 3.60 | % 5401 % 9.00

Il Mops

1|Wet Mop $ 0.10| § 0.15 No Bid $§ 082]% 085|9% 087]% 1.00 | § 1.50 [ § 2.50
2|Dry Mop — 24" $ 0.10 | § 0.15 No Bid $ 082[% 085[8% 087 % 0851]% 1271 % 2.12
3|Dry Mop — 36™ $ 0.10 | $ 0.15 No Bid $ 082(% 085[8% 087]% 1.00 | $ 1.50 { $ 2.50




* Bid2024-208 Purchase Various New Tires

e 2 Bids received

Sullivan Tire Co., Inc.
1199 Jefferson Blvd.
Warwick, RI 02886

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company
1157 Tumpike St.
Stoughton, MA 02072

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page



BID2024-208 PURCHASE VARIOUS NEW TIRES
PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

fem Size GZ‘:‘?‘; car Brand (i:'r‘::’:';::;) List Price % Off List Price | Net Price
PUBLIC WORKS
1 425/65R 22.5 BRIDGESTONE R244 20 PLY $1,440.25 55% $647.00
p 265/75R 16 FS Transforce HT2 123R $239.00 39% $147.00
3 235/85R 16 Wrangler duratrack - rear 10 PLY $290.13 52% $142.00
4 315/80R 22.5 Firestone FS860 20 PLY $992.25 50% $498.83
5 1100R 24.5 Firestone FS561A 14-16 PLY $958.80 61% $375.00
6 1100R 20 NO BID 12, 14 OR 16 PLY NO BID NO BID
Ta 1100R 22.5 Firestone FD663 14-16 PLY $882.57 60% $355.00
7o |1100R 22.5 Firestone FS561A 14-16 PLY $857.42 58% $365.00
8 12R 22.5 FIRESTONE FS561A 14-16 PLY $945.01 59% $395.00
9 385-65R 22.5 BRIDGESTONE R244 18 PLY $1,204.13 54% $564.00
10 All other light duty tires
continued next page
Page 1 of 4
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BID2024-208 PURCHASE VARIOUS NEW TIRES

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

Ttem Size Goodyear Brand Thickness List Price % Off List Price | Net Price
# or equalivent (if required) .
PUBLIC WORKS (CONTINUED) :
11 All other meditm duty tires GOODYEAR
12 |All other heavy duty tires GOODYEAR
13 |Auto Radial GOODYEAR
14 |Light Truck Radial GOODYEAR
15 |Unisteel GOOD‘-H_?.AR
16 {All other Off the road GOODYEAR
17 LOADER, TRACTOR AND/OR. SPECIALITY TIRES GOODYEAR
jcontinued next page
L
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BID2024-208 PURCHASE VARIOUS NEW TIRES

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

";“‘ Size Gz:‘:ﬁa;il::::d (i’il: l:lf;::::;) List Price % Off List Price | NetPrice
WARWICK POLICE
18 P225/66R 16 97V S2 EAGLE UG GW2 $192.76 48% $101.00
19 |P235/55R 17 98V 82 EAGLE UG GW3 $231.09 47% $124.00 |
20 [P225/60R 18 99V SL EAGLE UG GW3 Eagle Enforcer AW 100V . $246.93 44% $140.00
21 |P235/55R 17 98W 52 EAGLE RSA RS-A CROWN VIC 98W $220.34 46% $12:1 00
22 |P225/60R 16 97V 52 EAGLE RSA $189.15 43% $109.00
23 |P225/60R 18 99V S2 EAGLE RSA Eaglo Sport A/S 100V $202.31 38% $126.00
24 |P215/60R 16 95V SL EAGLE GT GY Comfort Drive 95V $163.81 39% $100.00 ‘
25 [P215/60R 16 94T S2 ASSUR. TRIPLTRED ASSURANCE A/S 95T $134.28 0% $82.00
26 |P235/75R 15105S 82 WRANGLER RTS OWL _ IWRL Trailrun AT 1058 $119.61 39% $74.00
27 |P265/70R 17 1138 82 WRANGLER HP OWL »188.21 38% $118.00
28 P235/70R 16 104T SL FORTERA OWL ' WORKHORSE AT OWL $194.07 39% $119.00
29 |P245-55-18 GOODYEAR RSA EAGLE RSA $256.43 47% "$138.00
continu_ed next page
Page 3 of 4
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BID2024-208 PURCHASE VARIOUS NEW TIRES

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

I‘;"‘ Size Goodyear Brand Thiekness List Price % Off List Price | Net Price
: or equalivent (If required) ,
WARWICK POLICE (CONTINUED)
30 195-60R15 HANCOOQK Goodyear Assurance $131.31 49% $67.00
31 255-70R-16 Wrl Sr-A 1098 Owl $256.76 . 49% $132.00
32 |25545R19 RSA EAGLE RSA - $294.18 43% $168.00 -
33 1225/65R/18 GOODYEAR l
34 |245/65R/17 GOODYEAR WORKHORSE AT $238.55 39% $146.00 |
35 . 1235/75/R17 BANKOOK Firestone AT2 $227.00 471% '$122.00
36 1245/75/R16 HANKOOK Firestone transforce HT2 $201.00 41% $119.00
37 E;I‘JZFGJQCD;{II{SA(;}OODYEAR WRANGLER $341.29 42% $201.00

Additional costs, if necessary

Delivery in Calendar Days ARQ

Page 4 of 4
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BID2024-208 PURCHASE VARIOUS NEW TIRES
PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

All Goodyear Brand
Ttem Size Goodycar.Brand 'Thlckl}ess List Price % OfT List Price Net Price
i or equalivent (if required)
PUBLIC WORKS
1 425/65R 22.5 L. ARMOR MAXMSA TL G296 - front 20PLY $2,010.34 60% $804.14
Pro Code: 756160897
2 265/75R 16  SL, WRL WORKHORSE HT OWL $243.30 48% $126.52
116072652 :
3 235/85R 16 E WRL DURATRAC TL Wrangler duratrack - rear $273.08 48% $142.00
Pro Code: 312036142
4 315/80R 22.5 [ G289 WHA TL (G289 — All Position $1,308.64 60% $523.46
Pro Code:756141613
5 1100R 24.5 H MARATHONRSA TL Goodyear 14-16 PLY $1,051.57 60% $420.63
Pro Code: 138813737 .
6 1100R 20 H G287 MSA TT Goodyear 12, 14 OR 16 PLY $1,624.30 60% $649.72
Pro Code: 138382667
7a 1100R 22.5 H G622 RSD TL, Pro Code: 138307265 G622 RDS 14-16 PLY $1,309.92 60% $523.97
7b 1100R 22.5 H G751 MSA TL, Pro Code: 13879957( G 296 WHA 14-16 PLY $1,478.25 60% $591.30
8 12R 22.5 H G751 MSA TL G287 — All Position 14-16 PLY $1,714.80 60% $685.92
Pro Code: 138127576
9 385-65R 22.5 158K ARMOR MAX MSA G296 - front 18 PLY $2,129.18 60% $851.67
Pro Code: 756513897
10  |All other light duty tires 2/1/p023 Base Price Book 438%
continued next page
Page 1 of 4
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BID2024-208 PURCHASE VARIOUS NEW TIRES
PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

Item Size Goodyear.B rand .Thickl!ess List Price % Off List Price Net Price
# or equalivent (if required)
PUBLIC WORKS (CONTINUED)
11 All other medium duty tires 2/1/2023 Base Price Book 48%
12 |All other heavy duty tires 2/1/2023 Base Price Book 60%
13 |Auto Radial 2/1{2023 Base Price Boold 48%
14 |Light Truck Radial 2/1/2023 Base Price Book 48%
15 Unisteel 2/1/2023 Base Price Book 60% =
16 |All other Off the road 2/142023 Base Price Book “30%
17 LOADER, TRACTOR AND/OR SPECIALITY TIRES 2/142023 Base Price Book 30%

continued next page
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BID2024-208 PURCHASE VARIOUS NEW TIRES

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

All Goodyear Brand

Ttem Size Goodyear.Brand .Thlclufess - List Price % Off List Price Net Price
# or equalivent (if required)
WARWICK POLICE
18 P225/60R 16 97V S2 EAGLE UG GW2 BCSRPTL Goodyear $214.74 52.5% $102.00
Pro Code: 147354070
19 P235/55R 17 98V 52 EAGLE UG GW3 VSBRPTI (Crown Vic & Impala) $263.16 52.5% $125.00
Pro Code:166579530
20  |P225/60R 18 99V SL EAGLE UG GW3 99W SL EAG RS-A VSBRPTL (Chérger) $265.09 52.5% $125.92
Pro Code: 732312500
21 P235/55R 17 98W S2 EAGLE RSA  98W S2 EA(Q RS-A VSBRPTL (Crown|Vic) $261.05 53.27% $122.00
' Pro Code: 732002500
22 P225/60R 16 97V S2 EAGLE RSA VSBRPTL (Cr¢wn Vic) $231.58 52.5% $110.00
Pro Code: 732354500
23 P225/60R 18 99V 82 EAGLE RSA VSBRPTL {Clarger) $265.09 52.5% $125.92
Pro Code: 732312500
24 P215/60R 16 95V SL-EAGLEGIT.  215/60R16 95V SL ASSURANCE MAXLIFE VSB $176.81 48% $91.94
Pro Code: 110571545
25 P215/60R 16 94T 852 ASSUR. TRIPLTRED 215/60QR16 95T SL ASSURANC]} ALL-SEASON $159.68 48% $83.03
Pro Code: 407562374
26 P235/75R 15 1058 S2 WRANGEER-RTS-OGWEL SL|WRL TRAILRUNR AT BRL $145.16 48% $75.48
Pro Code: 741126681
27 P265/70R 17 1138 S2 WRANGLER HP OWL VSBRPTL $230.65 48% $119.94
Pro Code: 403422171
28 P235/70R 16 104T SEFORTERA-OWIL- 235/70R1{ 106T SL ASSURANCE ALL-SEASON $192.02 48% $99.85
Pro Code: 407866374
29 P245-55-18 GOODYEAR RSA 245/55R18 103V EAGLE RS-A VSB TL (Forg PI Sedan & Utility) $293.77 32.5% $139.54

Pro Code: 732026500

continued next page
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BID2024-208 PURCHASE VARIOUS NEW TIRES

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

All Goodyear Brand
Item Size Goodyear Brand Thickness List Price % Off List Price | Net Price
# or equalivent (if required)
WARWICK POLICE (CONTINUED)
30 195-60R 15 HANGCGOK 195/60R15 88T SL ASSURANCE ALL-SEASON $131.31 48% $68.28
Pro Code: 407740374
31 255-70R-16 P255/70R16 1098 S2 WRL SR-A OWL TL $255.77 48% $133.00
Pro Code: 183601418
32 255-45R19 RSA  255/45R19 100V SL EAG RS-A|VSBRPTL $325.33 48% $169.17
Pro Code: 732016500
33 225/65R/18 GOODYEAR  225/65R16 100T SL ASSURANCE ALL-SEASCON $162.92 48% $84.72
Pro Code: 407786374
34 245/65R/17 GOODYEAR.  245/65R17 107T SL WRL WORKMORSE HT BS[L $209.62 48% $109.00
Pro Code: 116081632
35 235/75/R17 HANKQOX 235/75R17 109T SL WRL WORKHORSE HT BSI1| $256.66 48% $133.4¢6
Pro Code: 116082632
36 [245/75/R16 HANKOOK.- 245/75R16 1118 SL. WRL WORKHORSE AT OW[L $247.43 48% $128.66
Pro Code: 480128856
5/ DYEA L
17 LT265/70R18 GOO R WRANGLER $496.61 52.5% $202.64

ENFORCER AT

Pro Code: 108028861

Additional costs, if necessary

Delivery in Calendar Days ARO

2-7 business days after receipt

of order depending on avpilability of tires.

Page 4 of 4
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Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping

¢ 3 Bids received

Continued next page

Sullivan Tire Co., Inc.
1199 Jefferson Blvd.
Warwick, RI 02886

Pete’s Tire Barns
80 Public Street
Providence, RI 02903

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company

1157 Turnpike Street
Stoughton, MA 02072

Pricing as Follows



Pricing for Tire & Tube Repairs

SULLIVAN TIRE

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

Bid2024-078 Tire Repairs & Recapping

Normal Working Weekends,
Item Description _ Hoaurs . Holidays and
# 7:00 AM—4:30 PM | 4:30 PM—7:00 AM .
I. PAYLOADERS
a.| Remove $25.00 $25.00
b.; Apply $25.00 $25.00
¢.| Tire Repair* $50.00 $50.00
d{ Tube Repair* $10.00 $10.00
-.2. | BACKHOES
a.| Remove ' $20.00 $20.00
b.| Apply $20.00 $20.00
c.| Tire Repair* $40.00 - $40.00
d.| Tube Repair* $20.00 $20.00
3, PACKERS
a.| Remove $15.00 $15.00
"~ b.| Apply $15.00 $15.00
c.| Tire Repair* $30.00 $30.00
d.| Tube Repair* "$10.00 $10.00
4. | DUMP TRUCKS
a.| Remove $15.00 $15.00
b.| Apply “$15.00 $15.00
c.| Tire Repair* $30.00 $30.00
d.{ Tube Repair* $10.00 $10.00
3. PICKUP TRUCKS .
a.]| Remove $10.00 $10.00
b.| Apply $10.00 $10.00
¢.| Tire Repair* $25.00 $25.00
d.| Tube Repair* $10.00 $10.00
6. | FIRE VEHICLES
a.| Remove $15.00 $15.00
b.| Apply $15.00 $15.00
c.| Tire Repair* $30.00 $30.00
d.| Tube Repair* $10.00 - §10.00
7. OTHER VEHICLES
a.! Remove $10.00 $10.00
b.| Apply $10.00 $10.00
c.| Tire Repair* ~ $20.00 $20.00
d.! Tube Repair* $10.00 $10.00

Continned next page



SULLIVAN TIRE

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID
PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL
Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping
Pricing for Tire/Tube Repairs (co;lﬁnued)
Charge for roa(i service or service call to Department of Public Works for Truck Service *

$ 100.00 ner hour

Normal Working Hours 7:00 AM — 4:30 PM
Charge for road service or service call to Department of Public Works for Truck Service *

$ 12500  erhour

‘Weekends, Holidays and 4:30 PM — 7:00 AM

Charge for road service or service call to Department.of Public Works for OTR tires *

$ 110.00 " per hour
Normal Working Hours 7:00 AM - 4:30 PM
Charge for road service or service call to Departinent of Public Works for OTR ftires *

s 140.00 per hour

Weekends, Holidays and 4:30 PM —7:00 AM -
*INCLUDES REMOVE AND APPLY

Charge for calcium chloride, per pourid, installed in DPW vehicle tires, as needcd-

5 - 700 . _per pound

The distance to travel for tire service will be evaluated, in addition to price, to determine the
overall low bidder that would be in the best interest of the City.
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SULLIVAN TIRE

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

Bid2024-078 Tire Repairs & Recapping

' Pricing for Recapping
Item

# Description Bid
Sander/Dump Trucks

1 {11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive $208.80

2 {12R22.5 Bandag Uitra Drive. $215.10
Sanders, Dump & Fire Trucks

S | By T
12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive $215.10

4  i(steel belted casings)
[Dump & Fire Trocks

5 |11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive (steel belted '$208.80
casings)

6 ‘lstli;s;j Bandag Ultra Drive (steel belted : §215.10
Highway/Fire/Water Trucks

7_|12R225 B;mdag Ultra Drive $215.10

8 [11R24.5 Bandag Winter Deep $219.60
Sanitation/Recycling Truck

9 |11R24.5 Bandag Ultra Drive- $212.40

10 {11R22.5 Bandag Ulira Drive $208.80

Continued next page



SULLIVAN TIRE

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping

Repairs in casings for re-treads

N-hole ¢ 6.00
Spot § 14.00
Section § 40.00

Recaps must be returned within seven working days

Tires ta be recapped will be on an as needed basis.

17



PETE'S TIRE BARN

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping

Pricing for Tire & Tube Repairs .

Normal Working Weekends,
Item Description Hours Holidays and
# 7:00 AM —4:30 PM | 4:30 PM —7:00 AM
1. | PAYLOADERS
a.| Remove L T A
b.| Apply [ 50,00
c.| Tire Repair* /RS, OO
d! Tube Repair* '
2. | BACKHOES
a.| Remove 50,00
b.| Apply 50- 00
c.| Tire Repair* LA 5 - OO
d.| Tube Repair*
3. PACKERS
a.| Remove A0 .00
b.| Apply AL S
¢.! Tire Repair* TO 6O
d.| Tube Repair*
4. | DUMP TRUCKS
a.| Remove 20 .00
b.| Apply AC 00
c.| Tire Repair*
d.| Tube Repair*
5. PICKUP TRUCKS
a.| Remove /500
b.| Apply /5. 00
c.| Tire Repair*
d.| Tube Repair*
6. | FIRE VEHICLES
a.| Remove 20,66
b.| Apply AL - OO
c.| Tire Repair* RO o0
d.| Tube Repair*
7. OTHER VEHICLES
a.| Remove
b.| Apply
c.| Tire Repair*
d.| Tube Repair*

Continued next page
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PETE'S TIRE BARN

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL
Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping
Pricing for Tire/Tube Repairs (continued)
Charge for road service or service call to Department of Public Works for Truck Service *

$ /585 0D per hour

Normal Working Hours 7:00 AM — 4:30 PM

Charge for road service or service call to Department of Public Works for Truck Service *

$ /59700 per hour

Weekends, Holidays and 4:30 PM —7:00 AM
Charge for road service or service call to Department of Public Works for OTR ftires *

$ A0L.00 per hour

Normal Working Hours 7:00 AM — 4:30 PM
Charge for road service or service call to Department of Public Works for OTR tires *

$ A 20 - 26 per hour

Weekends, Holidays and 4:30 PM — 7:00.AM

*INCLUDES REMOVE AND APPLY

Charge for caleium chioride, per pound, installed in DPW vehicle tires, as needed

$ per pound

The distance to travel for tire service will be evaluated, in addiﬁon to price, to determine the
overall low bidder that would be in the best interest of the City.
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PETE'S TIRE BARN

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping

Pricing for Recapping
Item

# Description Bid
Sander/Dump Trucks

1 [11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive 3/ 75

2 |12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive R 3L.68
Sanders, Dump & Fire Trucks ‘
11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive

3 |(steel belted casings) 23.75
12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive

4 |(steel belted casings) R2E .00
Dump & Fire Trucks

5 |11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive (steel belted
casings) a3/.75

6 |12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive (steel belted
casings) A 3806
Highway/Fire/Water Trucks

7 |12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive 2 28. O6

8 |11R24.5 Bandag Winter Deep ALl &
Sanitation/Recycling Truck

9 |11R24.5 Bandag Ultra Drive 2Ll

10 [11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive R3/.75

Continued next page
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PETE'S TIRE BARN
PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping

Repairs in casings for re-treads

N-hole $ JO.FT
SpOt $ /.57-' ;7
Section g 5. /e 20

Recaps must be returned within seven working days

Tires to be recapped will be on an as needed basis.

I
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GOODYEAR TIRE

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

- Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping

Pricing for Tire & Tube Repairs

Normal Working Weekends,
Item Description Hours Holidays and
# 7:00 AM —4:30 PM | 4:30 PM —7:00 AM
1. | PAYLOADERS All of these would be
a.] Remove $75.00 included in
b.| Apply $75.00 emergency service
c.| Tire Repair* $50.00 price which would be
d] Tube Repair* $25.00 $220.00

2. BACKHOES All of these would be
a.| Remove $50.00 included in emergency
b.| Apply $50.00 service price which
c.| Tire Repair* $50.00 would be $220.00
d.| Tube Repair* $25.00

3. PACKERS All of these would be
a.| Remove $50.00 included in
b.| Apply $50.00 emergency service
c.| Tire Repair* $50.00 price which would be
d.| Tube Repair* $25.00 $220.00

4. | DUMP TRUCKS All of these would be
a.| Remove $50.00 included in emergency
b.| Apply $50.00 service price which
c.| Tire Repair* $50.00 would be $160.00
d.| Tube Repair* $25.00

5. PICKUP TRUCKS All of these would be
a.| Remove $30.00 included in
b.| Apply $30.00 emergency service
c.| Tire Repair* $25.00 price which would be
d.| Tube Repair* $25.00 $160.00.

6. | FIRE VEHICLES All of these would be
a.| Remove $50.00 included in emergency
b.| Apply $50.00 service price which
c.| Tire Repair* $50.00 would be $160.00
d.| Tube Repair* $25.00

7. OTHER VEHICLES All of these would be
a.| Remove ' $50.00 included in
b.| Apply $50.00 emergency service
c.| Tire Repair* $50.00 price which would
d.| Tube Repair* $25.00 be $160.00.

Continued next page
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GOODYEAR TIRE

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID
PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL
Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping
Pricing for Tire/Tube Repairs (continued)
Charge for road service or service call to Department of Public Works for Truck Service *

$ 140.00 per hour

Normal Working Hours 7:00 AM — 4:30 PM
Charge for road service or service call to Department of Public Works for Truck Service *

$ 160.00 per hour

Weekends, Holidays and 4:30 PM — 7:00 AM
Charge for road service or service call to Department of Public Works for OTR tires *

$  200.00 per hour

Normal Working Hours 7:00 AM — 4:30 PM
Charge for road service or service call to Department of Public Works for OTR tires *

3 220.00 per hour

Weekends, Holidays and 4:30 PM — 7:00 AM
*INCLUDES REMOVE AND APPLY

Charge for calcium chloride, per pound, installed in DPW vehicle tires, as needed

3 3.50 per pound

The distance to travel for tire service will be evaluated, in addition to price, to determine the
overall low bidder that would be in the best interest of the City.
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GOODYEAR TIRE

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping

Pricing for Recapping

Item

Description

Bid

Sander/Dump Trucks

11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive

$173.48

PCT Winter Trac 2, Pro Code: 254086384

12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive

$181.70

PCT Winter Trac 2, Pro Code: 254087384 .

Sanders, Dump & Fire Trucks

11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive
(steel belted casings)

$173.48

PCT Winter Trac 2, Pro Code: 254086384

12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive
(steel belted casings)

$181.70

PCT Winter Trac 2, Pro Code: 254087384

Dump & Fire Trucks

casings)

11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive (steel belted

$173.48

PCT Winter Trac 2, Pro Code: 254086384

casings)

12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive (steel belted

$181.70

PCT Winter Trac 2, Pro Code: 254087384

Highway/Fire/Water Trucks

12R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive

$181.70

PCT Winter Trac 2, Pro Code: 254087384

11R24.5 Bandag Winter Deep

$183.77

PCT Winter Trac 2, Pro Code: 254090384

Sanitation/Recycling Truck

11R24.5 Bandag Ultra Drive

$183.77

IPCT Winter Trac 2, Pro Code; 254090384

10

11R22.5 Bandag Ultra Drive

$173.48

PCT Winter Trac 2, Pro Code: 254086384

Continued next page
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GOODYEAR TIRE

PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE & SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping

Repairs in casings for re-treads

N-hole $ 7.50
Spot $ 8.00
Section $ 42.00

Recaps must be returned within seven working days

Tires to be recapped will be on an as needed basis.
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Bid2024-211 Large Diameter Clamps, Saddles, and Couplings

o 2 Bids received .
Ti-Sales Inc.
36 Hudson Road
Sudbury, MA 01776
John Hoadley and Sons, Inc.

672 Union Street
Rockland, MA 02370

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page



PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

Bid2024-211 Large Diameter Clamps, Saddles Couplings

Ti-Sales John Hoadley
ITEMS 1-9 FULL CIRCLE CLAMPS, DOUBLE, TRIPLE BAND. LARGE
S=es DIAMETER
INCLUDED. NOTE: All clamps must be Smith Blair (double band #227
only/triple band #228 only).
Romac accepted for 127 thru 30 (must be double band #55-2/triple band
#55-3)
Ttem # Size Range Pipe Bid Bid
la 4x12% 4.74-5.14 PVC 3 12444 | § 175.00
1b 4x12% 4.64-5.34 AC 3 225.69 No Bid
2a 6x15 6.84-7.64 PVC 1 27329 | § 212.00
2b 6x20 6.84-7.64 PVC 3 36451 | 8 283.00
2c 6 x30 6.84-7.64 PVC 3 51797 | § 425.00
2d 6x20 7.10-7.40 AC No Bid 3 283.00
3a 8x15 §.99-9.79 PVC 3 301901 % 234.00
3b Bx20 8.99-9.79 PVC $ 403371 % 313.00
3c 8x30 8.99-9.79 PVC 3 605.34 | § 470.00
4a 10x 15 11.04-12.24 PVC No Bid No Bid
4b 10x 20 11.04-12.24 PVC $ 575.29 | § 447.00
4d 10 x 30 11.04-12.24 PVC 3 868.20 { § 672.00
5a 12x 15 13.20-14.00 PVC b 400.79 | § 333.00
5b 12x 15 13.65-14.45 AC $ 406.85 | § 339.00
3¢ 12 x 20 13.20-14.00 PVC b 53587 | % 445.00
5d 12 x 20 13.65-14.45 AC $ 54043 1'% 450.00
6a 16 x 15 16.60-17.80 PVC $ 620.57 No Bid
6b 16x 15 17.80-19.21 AC $ 641.43 No Bid
6¢ 16 x 20 16.60-17.80 PVC b §40.39 No Bid
6d 16 x 20 17.80-19.21 AC $ 869.61 No Bid
7a 20x 15 21.52-22.12 PVC b 704.03 | § 586.00
7b 20x 15 22.12-24.82 AC $ 716.57 No Bid
Tc 20x 20 21.52-22.12 PVC b 954.48 | § 795.00
7d 20x 20 22.12-24.82 AC by 969.77 No Bid
8a 24x 15 24.00-21.60 PVC 3 1,203.49 No Bid
8b 24x 15 21.60-28.75 AC 3 1,283.12 No Bid
8c 24x20 24.00-21.60 PVC 3 1,632.65 No Bid
8d 24 x 20 21.60-28.75 AC by 1,735.89 No Bid
Oa 30x 15 30.00-32.00 PVC 3 951.19 No Bid
9b 30x15 32.00-35.16 AC 3 1,027.68 No Bid
9¢c 30x20 30.00-32.00 PVC ¥ 1,184.29 No Bid
9d 30x20 32.00-35.16 AC 3 1,241.44 No Bid
Continued next page
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PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID
PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

Bid2024-211 Large Diameter Clamps, Saddles Couplings

ITEM #'s 10-18 |FULL CIRCLE CLAMPS, DOUBLE BAND, TRIPLE BAND
(#239) LARGE DIAMETER INCLUDED, TAPPING CLAMFS w/IPT.
Ti-Sales John Hoadley
Item # Size Range Pipe _Bid_ Bid
10a 4"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, Taj 4.74-5.14 PVC 3 150.00 186.00
10b 4"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, Taj 4.64-5.34 AC 3 224.33 No Bid
1la 6"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, Ta 6.84-7.64 PVC $ 244.13 203.00
11b 6"x12 1/2" x 2" Ipt, Tap 6.84-7.64 PVC $ 256.75 213.00
12a 8"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, Ta 8.62-9.42 PVC $ 207.96 No Bid
12b 8"x12 1/2" x 2" Ipt, Tap 8.99-9.79 AC b 291.63 226.00
12¢ 8"x12 1/2" x 2" Ipt, Tap 8.62-9.41 PVC b 314.06 No Bid
12d 8"x12 1/2" x 2" Ipt, Tap 8.99-9.79 AC 3 314.06 226.00
13a 10"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, T 11.04-12.24 PVC $ 304.19 No Bid
13b 10"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, T 11.40-12.24 AC 3 354.71 No Bid
13c 10"x12 1/2" x 2" Ipt, Tap 11.40-12.24 PVC 3 400.23 No Bid
13d 10"x12 1/2" x 2" Ipt, Tap 11.40-12.24 AC 3 400.23 No Bid
14a 12"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, T 13.14-13.50 PVC 3 293.5] No Bid
14b 12"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, T 14.00-14.38 AC 3 300.34 No Bid
l4c 12"x12 1/2" x 2 Ipt, Tap 13.14-13.50 PVC 3 314.48 No Bid
14d 12"x12 1/2" x 2 Ipt, Tap 14.00-14.38 AC $ 325.34 No Bid
15a 16"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, T 16.60-17.8¢ PVC 3 979.20 816.00
15b 16"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, T 17.80-19.21 AC $ 1,006.93 No Bid
15¢ 16"x12 1/2"x2" Ipt, Tap 16.60-17.80 PVC 3 1,012.17 843.00
15d 16"x12 1/2"x2" Ipt, Tap 17.80-19.21 AC 3 1,027.91 No Bid
16a P0"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, Ta 21.52-22.12 PVC 3 1,206.13 1,005.00
16b P0"x12 1/2" x 3/4" Ipt, Ta 22.12-24.82 AC 3 1,221.96 No Bid
16¢c 20"x12 1/2" x 2" Ipt, Tap 21.52-22.12 PVC $ 1,227.20 1,022.00
16d 20"x12 1/2" x 2" Ipt, Tap 22.12-24.82 AC 3 1,243.20 No Bid
17a 24"x12 1/2" x 2" Ipt, Tap 24.00-21.60 PVC 3 1,267.21 No Bid
17b 24"x12 1/2" x 2" Ipt, Tap 21.60-28.75 AC 5 1,225.23 No Bid
18a 30"x12 1/2" x 2 Ipt, Tap 30.00-32.00 PVC 3 1,379.29 No Bid
18b 30"x12 1/2" x 2 Ipt, Tap 32.00-35.16 AC 3 1,515.64 No Bid
Continued next page
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PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

ITEM #19 TAPPING SADDLES, DOUBLE STRAP
IRON W/IPTS,TAP
Ti-Sales John Hoadley
Item # Size Range Pipe _Bid Bid

19a 47°x2” Ipt,Tap 4.74-5.14 PVC 3 5293 | % 41.00
19b 4°x2” Ipt,Tap 4.64-5.34 AC $ 47.76 No Bid

19¢ 6"x3/4" Ipt, Tap 6.90-7.10 PVC ) 44111 % 34.00
19d 6"x3/4" Ipt, Tap 7.10-7.40 AC 5 44111 % 34.00
19%¢ 6"x2” Ipt,Tap 6.90-7.10 AC $ 5440 | $ 42.00
19f 67x2” Ipt,Tap 7.10-7.40 AC $ 54401 % 42.00
19g 8"x3/4" Ipt, Tap 8.99-9.30 PVC b 5892 | % 41.00
19h 8"x3/4" Ipt, Tap 9.05-9.79 AC $ 5892 | % 41.00
191 §7x2” Ipt,Tap £.99-9.30 AC ¥ 66.76 | § 46.00
19 §7x2" Ipt,Tap 9.05-9.79 3 66.76 | $ 46.00
19k 107x2” Ipt, Tap 11.04-12.24 PVC $ 88.06 | § 61.00
191 107x2” Ipt,Tap 11.40-12.24 AC $ 88.06 | § 61.00
19m 127°x2” Ipt,Tap 13.14-13.50 AC 3 10557 | § 73.00
19n 127x2” Ipt,Tap 14.00-14.38 $ 105.57 | § 73.00
190 16™x2” Ipt,Tap 16.60-17.80 PVC 3 169.23 No Bid

19p 16"x2” Ipt,Tap 17.80-19.21 AC No Bid No Bid

19q 20"x2” Ipt,Tap 21.52-22.12 PVC No Bid No Bid

19r 207x2” Ipt, Tap 22.12-24.82 PVC No Bid No Bid

19s 247x2” Ipt,Tap 24.00-28.75 AC No Bid No Bid

19t 30™x2” Ipt,Tap 30.00-32.00 PVC No Bid No Bid

19u 307x2” Ipt, Tap 32.00-35.16 AC No Bid No Bid

ITEM #20 TAPPING SADDLES, DOUBLE STRAP, STAINLESS STEEL W/IPT TAP
ROMAC 202NS OR SMITH & BLAIR 317
Item # Size Range Pipe _Bid_ Bid

20a 4"x2" Ipt, Tap 4.74-5.14 PVC b 86.09| § 62.00
20b 4"x2" Ipt, Tap 4.64-5.34 AC $ 86.09 No Bid

20c 6"x3/4 Ipt, Tap 6.90-7.10 PVC S 82.12] § 59.00
20d 6"x3/4 Ipt, Tap 7.10-7.40 AC 3 8212 § 59.00
20e 6"x2" Ipt, Tap 6.90-7.10 PVC $ 98.43 | § 71.00
20f 6"x2" Ipt, Tap 7.10-7.40 AC $ 98.43 | § 71.00
20g 8"x3/4 Ipt, Tap §.99-5.30 PVC ¥ 97.03 | § 70.00
20h §"x3/4 Ipt, Tap 9.05-9.79 AC 3 97.03 | § 70.00
201 8"x2" Ipt, Tap 8.99-9.30 PVC b 114.55 | $ §2.00
20j 8"x2" Ipt, Tap 9.05-9.79 AC 3 11455} § 82.00
20k 10"x2" Ipt, Tap 11.04-12.24 PVC by 13378 | § 56.00
201 10"x2" Ipt, Tap 11.40-12.24 AC 3 133.78 | § 96.00
20m 12"x2" Ipt, Tap 11.40-12.24 AC No Bid No Bid

20n 16"x2" Ipt, Tap 16.60-17.80 PVC - No Bid No Bid

200 16"x2" Ipt, Tap 17.80-16.21 AC No Bid No Bid

20p 20"x2" Ipt, Tap 21.52-22.12 PVC No Bid No Bid

20q 20"x2" Ipt, Tap 22.12-24.82 AC No Bid No Bid

20r 24"x2" Ipt, Tap 21.60-24.00 PVC ‘No Bid No Bid

20s 24"x2" Ipt, Tap 24.00-28.75 AC No Bid No Bid

20t 30"x2" Ipt, Tap 30.00-32.00 PVC No Bid No Bid

20u 30"x2" Ipt, Tap 32.00-35.16 AC No Bid No Bid

Continued next page
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PLEASE COMPLETE THIS PAGE SUBMI|T WITH YOUR BID

PRICING SHEET MAY NOT BE CONFIDENTIAL

Bid2024-211 Large Diameter Clamps, Saddles Couplings

ITEM #21 BELL JOINT CLAMPS, (DRESSER & SMITH BLAIR ONLY)
Ti-Sales John Hoadley
Item # Size Range _Bid Bid_
2la 6” 6.90-7.10 3 181.86 | '§ 159.00
21b §” 9.05-9.30 $ 268.03 | $ 234.00
21c 107 11.10-11.40 ) 31576 | § 276.00
21d 127 13.20-13.50 5 34151 | § 298.00
2le 16" 17.40-17.80 b 53329 | § 466.00
21f 207 21.60-22.06 3 860.56 | § 753.00
21g 24" 24.00-25.80 3 980.10 No Bid
21h 30”7 30.00-32.00 $ 1,613.28 No Bid
ITEM #22 TRANSITION COUPLINGS (SMITH BLAIR,
OR ROMAC ONLY)
Item # Size Range Bid Bid
22a 6" 7.15-7.45x6.84-7.16 No Bid $ 99.00
22b 6" 6.90-7.22x7.22-7.65 No Bid $ 99.00
22c 8" 9.05-9.45x8.54-9.11 No Bid b 147.00
22d 8" 9.24-9.52x8.99-9.22 No Bid $ 147.00
22e 10" 10.89-11.04x11.90-12.12 No Bid $ 204.00
22f 10" 11.10-11.60x11.90-12.20 No Bid $ 204.00
22g 12° 13.15-13.55x14.20-14.40 No Bid $ 246.00
22h 12" 13.20-13.50x14.21-14.40 No Bid $ 246.00
224 16" 17.40-17.80x18.45-18.97 No Bid No Bid
22j 16"’ 17.40-17.80x18.46-18.90 No Bid 5 551.00
22k 20" 21.35-22.10x21.35-22.10 No Bid No Bid
221 20" 21.35-22.10x22.75-24.84 No Bid No Bid
22m 24" 21.60-24.00x21.60-24.00 No Bid No Bid
22n 24" 21.60-24.00x24.00-28.75 No Bid No Bid
220 30" 30.00-32.00x30.00-32.00 No Bid $ 1,038.00
22p 30" 30.00-32.00x32.00-35.16 No Bid No Bid
ITEM#23 HYMAX OR MACRO COUPLINGS
MIN PRESSURE CLASS 260PSI
Item # Range _Bid Bid
23a 2 Standard ranges No Bid $ 135.00
23b 4" Standard ranges No Bid 3 229.00
23c 6" Standard ranges No Bid $ 304.00
23d g" Standard ranges No Bid ¥ 343.00
23e 10" Standard ranges No Bid b 440.00
23f 12" Standard ranges No Bid $ 504.00
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FRANCIS M. GOMEZ

FRANK J. Plcozzl
PURCHASING AGENT

MAYOR

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 PosT ROAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
TEL (401)7382013
FAx (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To: Peder Schaefer, Finance Director
From: Francis M. Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Date: September 15, 2023

Re: Agenda for Wednesday, October 11, 2023

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2 starting
at 11:00 am.

Bid2024-207 Floor Mats, Dry & Wet Mop Rental

B1d2024-208 Purchase Various New Tires
Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping

Bid2024-211 Large Diameter Clamps, Saddles, and Couplings

November 6t / November 20t



Date: October 11, 2023

Bid2024-207 Floor Mats, Dry & Wet Mop Rental
Bid2024-208 Purchase Various New Tires
Bid2024-209 Tire Repairs & Recapping

Bid2024-211 Large Diameter Clamps, Saddles, and Couplings

Name (please print neatly) Company/Email Address

AT __ T S
QPRI

e

Froncis Gomez D4~ @&
dessica. Lompreny B Speaglist




