Francis M. Gomez Frank J. Picozzi
Purchasing Agent Mayor
City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401)738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364
Bid Minutes Thursday, October 12, 2023
Bid2024-216 Firefighting Tools & Equipment
Bid2024-217 Structural Firefighting Helmets
Bid2024-218 Milwaukee Cordless Power Tools & Accessories
Location: The meeting was held in Meeting Room 2
Present: Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist

Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Representatives: None

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid
or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go
to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are October 16, 2023 and November 6, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The City
Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00
P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,
é’ﬁﬂw . 4"—’& e
/ Z

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent



Bid2024-216 Firefighting Tools & Equipment

o 6 Bids received

Continued next page

Strategic Safety Dynamics LLC
PO Box 1022
Smithtown, NY 11787

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.
3810 West Osborne Ave.
Tampa, FL 33614

TechnicalRescue.com Inc.
4973 SW 105" Way
Cooper City, FL 33328

Firematic Supply Co., Inc.
10 Ramsey Road
East Yaphank, NY 11967

Municipal Emergency Services, Inc.
12 Turnberry Ln. 2™ Fl.
Sandy Hook, CT 06482

Fire Tech & Safety of New England, Inc.

100 Business Park Drive
Tyngsborough, MA 01879

Pricing as Follows



Bid2024-216 Firefighting Tools Equipment

BID RESULTS
Strategic |, 2 Safety| Techmical | Firematic Fire Tech &
Safety Suppl Rescue.com Suppl MES Safe
Dynamics PPy PPl ty
REQUESTED
UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
TTEM# | DESCRIFTION | MFGMODEL#' ppyop | pRicE | PRICE | PRICE | PRICE | PRICE
OR PART #
6 POUND FLAT
HEAD AXE WITH | FIREHOOKS
1 BERGLASS  |UNLIMTED Facg| 56200 $75.00 $62.70 $67.00 $85.00 $69.00
HANDLE
HEAD AXE Wiy | FIREHOOKS
2 - BERGLASS UNLIMTGED FAP-|  $68.00 $80.45 $66.60 $73.00 £89.00 $78.00
HANDLE
# ALLPURPOSE | FIREHOOKS
3 HOOK WITHD- |UNLIMTED APE] s127.00 | s$140.00 | s13680 | $139.00 $160.00 | $146.00
HANDLE 4-W/D
6 ALL PURPOSE | FIREHOOKS
4 HOOK WITHD- |UNLIMTED APH{ $130.00 | $147.00 | S$147.60 | $147.00 $171.00 | $154.00
HANDLE 4-W/D
3'NEW YORK ROOF| FIREHOOKS
5 HOOK i~ $114.00 | $11045 | S$108.00 | $106.00 $120.00 | $118.00
4 NEW YORK ROOF| FIREHOOKS
6 HOOK s $125.00 | S$118.64 | $11880 | $115.00 $141.00 | $128.00
6 NEW YORK ROOF| FIREHOOKS
7 HOOK S $148.00 | S$I3636 | $14040 | $13500 | $161.00 | $154.00
. $165.00 RH
g  |¥NEWYORKROOF| FIREHOOKS | ¢15000 | g4s01 | s15120 | $145.00 | 7.55290.00 | $164.00
HOOK RHS '
RH §'
10' NEW YORK | FIREHOOKS
9 ROOF HOOK RI10 $18800 | $167.76 | S$17820 | $169.00 | $305.00 | $194.00
, FIREROOKS
0 |4 PHSEHI;%‘;LE" TH UneaTeD | s11900 | s1s000 | siseso | si3000 | s170.00 | $144.00
NHFG-4 W/D
, FIREHOOKS
n |8 PHEEHI;%IBEL:HTH UNLIMITED | $142.00 | $157.72 | S15840 | $158.00 | $180.00 | $164.00
NHFG-6 W/D
$195.00
, FIREHOOKS .
2 |8 PH;EHI;%LSL‘;ITH UNLIMITED | $188.00 | $16590 | $169.20 | $167.00 WD"IHSDMZ% )| S178.00
NHFG-8 W/D o
FIREHOOKS
10" PIKE POLE
13 WITHD HANDLE |UNUIMTED APH{  $210.00 | $20545 | 521780 | $20200 | $340.00 | $224.00
10 WD
FIREHOOKS $185.00
14 8 PIKE POLE UNLIMITED | $153.00 | $143.18 | $14580 | $142.00 | NHFG7.5 | $178.00
NHEG-8 $331.00 8"
FIREHOOKS
15 I'PIKEPOLE | UNLIMITED | $193.00 | $174.55 | S183.60 | $177.00 | $389.00 | $216.00
NHEG-10
FIREHOOKS
16 12 PIKE POLE UNLIMITED | $225.00 | $20045 | $21600 | $205.00 | $399.00 | $239.00
NHFG-12
Continued next page




Bid2024-216 Firefighting Tools Equipment

BID RESULTS
Strategic Dapa Safety| Technical | Firematic Fire Tech &
Safety Suppl Rescue.com Suppl MES Safety
Dynamices PR : PRy
REQUESTED
UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM# | DESCRIPTION |MFGMODEL#| oo | poier | ppice PRICE PRICE PRICE
OR PART #
FIREHOOKS
17 14' PIKE POLE UNLIMITED | $256.00 | $223.64 | $243.00 $231.00 $414.00 $274.00
NHFG-14
- FIREHOOKS
18 “‘,’I‘,’r; mE UNLIMITED | $133.00 | $12840 | $126.00 $125.00 $135.00 $145.00
NHFG-40 W/D
FIREHOOKS
19 |30" HALIGAN TOOL|UNLIMTED PRO| $28000 | $27272 | $269.10 $285.00 $310.00 $283.00
BAR
RAM
HYDRA-RAM
FIREHOOKS | $2,160.00 $2,395.00
20 FORCJ%E I}::NTRY oanared | mamm | SH19545 | $2.10900 | 240000 | 52,550.00 s
2,500.00
24" PAIR $122.72 Fire $120.00 Fire
21 INSULATED BOLT | ZAMATICUCCT 105 00 Hooks No Bid Hooks $257.24 $126.00
CUTTERS 24 Unlimited Unlimited NCBC-24
NCBC-24 NCBC24
26" PAIR $156.81 Fire $157.00 Fire
22 INSULATED BOLT | ZAMATICUCC | 100 60 Hooks No Bid Hooks $849.00 $174.00
CUTTERS 36 Unlimited Unlimited NCBC-36
NCRC-36 NCBC36
28" NON- FIREHOOKS
23 CONDUCTIVE UNLIMITED | $112.00 | $129.54 | $112.90 $126.00 $135.00 $127.00
CABLE CUTTERS NCCC-28
SUPERVAC 16"
MILWAUKEE M18
BATTERY . . ) )
24 POWERED FaN w7 | YI6-BL-SP-WH | NoBid No Bid NoBid | $4,687.00 | 520000 | NoBid
120-240V AC
OPTION
SUPERVAC 20”
MILWAUKEE M18
BATTERY , . ) )
25 POWERED FAN wy|  V20-BL-SP No Bid No Bid NoBid | $5660.00 | $6241.00 | WNoBid
120-240V AC
OPTION
RESCUE SAW, 16"
GUIDE BAR, $1759.65
26 | CARBIDETIPPED | TRUCKMANS | o | Team | op | SRRl | SO
BULLET CHAIN, | CHOICE 9000TC Equipment v 4016081 0B TODG-16A
GUARD/DEPTH TS2-57216 )
GAUGE
VENTMASTER $1842.38 Iillsi zﬁi
397K, 6.4HP 14* | VENTMASTER . Team ) $5,695.00
27 | ROTARY CUTOFF 397K NoBid | goipment K;,ii?;“ §2,64500 | NoBid | 1yin7 706
SAW K12FD94 | - 2
Coatinned next page




Bid2024-216 Firefighting Tools Equipment

BID RESULTS
Strategic Dana Safety| Technical | Firematic Fire Tech &
Safety Supply | Rescue.com Supply MES Safety
Dynamics
REQUESTED
., UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM# | DESCRIFTION |MFGMODEL#| ppycp | pRICE | PRICE | PRICE | PRICE | PRICE
ORPART #
HUSQVARNA
Co00X CHARGING $471.81 $467.10
DOCK FOR . Team : $525.00
29 VENTMASTER K | TV497-022 NoBid | b ment Huc.l;]&)a)r{na $728,00 ST51.00 | Lo oo
PACE SAW Co00X
BATTERY
B380X SPARE s,?.z;fll $595.80 $525.00
30 BATTERY FOR K1 TV497-003 No Bid Equinment Husqvarna $940.00 $580.00 Tv. 497'_002
PACE CUTOFF SAW P B330X
B380X
$197.55
CARBIDE TIPPED . Team . $248.00
31 BULLET CHAIN, 16" No Bid Equipment No Bid TV415001 $290.00 $286.00
CB54L
14 DIAMOND TIP $.1r'::i9 S%OS.H g1 81200b}71re
32 ROTARY RESCUE $360.00 : cam 0% $189.00 | $219.00
SAW BLADE Equipment | Equipment | Unlimited
PIRA-14FD | TDI14SC | Husky BL14
14” WOOD $122.05 $126.65 | $180.00 Fire
CARBIDE TIP Team Team Hooks
33 ROTARY RESCUE $104.00 Equipment | Equipment | Unlimited $160.00 $130.00
SAW BLADE TMBI14 TMB14 | Husky BL14
14!! .
STEEL/CONCRETE $19.94 Team| $22.95 Team SZZI?I.O(;:'UB
34 COMPOSITE $360.00 | Equipment | Equipment | o0 g | 1900 $39.00
ROTARY RESCUE T1410 T1410 Fnhmlli
SAW BLADE ang
$156.47
Team §224.10
35 G;;goiiﬁgik GEMTOR-541 $306.00 Equipment | CMC Rescue| $170.00 $189.00 $224.00
TC204016 | ltem #20244
(LG/XL)
$£149.71
Team
Equipment
GEMTOR LADDER TC204014 $£224.10
BELT (MD/LG) |CMC Rescue
36 SMALL/MEDIUM/L GEMTOR-531 $£190.00 $141.98 ltem $170.00 £196.00 $224.00
ARGE Team #202442
Equipment
TC204012
(SM/MD)
$£163.61
Amerex
20 LB. ABC Ad411 ABC
37 PRESSURIZED FIRE $175.00 Aluminum No Bid No Bid £175.00 $197.00
EXTINGUISHER $200.64
Amerex 423
ABC Brass
Continued next page




Rid2024-216 Firefighting Tools Equipment

BID RESULTS
Strategic . . . .
Sy Do St Tl | Tiomule | g Pk
Dynamics
REQUESTED |
UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM# | DESCRIPTION [MFGMODEL#| ,o..p | pRiCE | PRICE | PRICE | PRICE | PRICE
OR PART # )
10 LB CARBON £264.73
DIOXIDE Amerex 330
38 EXTINGUISHER $314.00 cmb No Bid No Bid $299.00 $334.00
WITH 10B:C UL D;’xi‘;‘;
RATING
2.5-GAL $149.30
PRESSURIZED Amerex 240 .
39 WATER $173.00 | o | NoBid $147.00 $149.00 $184.00
EXTINGUISHER Extinguisher
PAC TOOL RESCUE
TOOL AND
EQUIPMENT ) . . 28%off list | 8%offlist | 5% offlist
40 MOUNTING No Bid No Bid No Bid price price price
SYSTEM, % OFF
LIST PRICE
POLY-TECH
RESCUE TOOL AND I . I .
Al BQUIPMENT 16%off st | o o. Nopig | 25%offlist | 8%offlist | 0% offlist
MOUNTING SYTEM, prics price price price
9% OFF LIST PRICE
SURVIVOR LED
42 | WITH 12V DC FAST ;Tgﬁ‘EﬂL‘ﬂ‘#;OGs}ég $160.00 $134.17 No Bid $162.00 $169.00 $184.00
CHARGER
SURVIVOR LED, | STREAMLIGHT . -
43 WIOUT CHARGER | MODEL #90s00 | $130-00 $79.02 No Bid $96.00 $103.00 $115.00
FIRE VULCAN LED, | STREAMLIGHT )
44 W/ CEARGER | MODEL #adaso | $22500 | 516458 No Bid $198.00 $210.00 $215.00
FIRE VULCAN LED, | STREAMLIGHT .
45 W/OUT CHARGER | MODEL #4ass | $215:00 $135.33 No Bid $163.00 $168.00 $195.00
FIRE VULCAN LED, | STREAMLIGHT .
46 LiJON BATTERY | MODEL#44610 | 319500 $32.46 No Bid $39.00 $43.00 $49.00
SURVIVOR LED,
47 | NIMHBATTERY 4.8 STREAMLIGHT | o 0005 | g3270 | NoBid $39.00 $43.00 $49.00
MODEL #90339
VOLT
TFT 3" NPT TASK FORCE
48 | FEMALE MONITOR| TIPSMODEL | NoBid No Bid No Bid $348.00 $325.00 $345.00
TRUCK ADAPTER |  #XFF-APL
TASK FORCE
49 TFTCROSSFIRE | 11ps \MoDEL | NoBid No Bid NoBid | $1,805.00 | $1,640.00 | $1,625.00
MONITOR
#XFT-NJ
TFT QUAD TASK FORCE
50 STACKED TIPS 2.5”| TIPSMODEL | NoBid No Bid No Bid $533.00 $479.00 $480.00
NH #MST-4N]
TFT STREAM TASK FORCE
51 STRAIGHTENER 5%,| TIPS MODEL | No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.00 $183.00 $190.00
2.57 #XF-SS5 '
TFT MASTER
STREAM NOZZLE, | TASK FORCE
52 AUTOMATIC  |TIPS MODEL#M{ No Bid No Bid NoBid | §$1,305.00 | $1,145.00 | $1,174.00
PRESSURE, 150-1250|  R1250SNJ
GPM
Continued nexf page




Bid2024-216 Firefighting Tools Equipment

BID RESULTS
Strategic Dana Safety| Technical | Firematic Fire Tech &
Safety Supply | Rescue.com Supply MES Safety
Dynamics
REQUESTED | yopr UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
TTEM # DESCRIFTION MFG MODEL # PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
OR PART #
TFT MONSOON RC
2000 GPM TASK FORCE
53 MONITOR, 4" ANSI | TIPS MODEL No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,850.00 $8,310.56 $7.965.00
150# FLANGE, 3.5" #Y4-E21A-L
NH OQUTLET
TFT SELF
EDUCTING NOZZLE
WITH FOAM
ORRIFICE PLATES | TASK FORCE
54 AND 10' PICKUP TIPS MODEL No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.095.00 $1,966.20 $1,884.00
TUBE. (MODIFY #ZMF12A
FROM 2.5"
COUPLING TO 3.5"
__NH)
TFT ml}gg UNT TASK FORCE .
55 TIPS MODEL No Bid Ne Bid No Bid $1,026.00 $967.00 $924.00
OPERATOR #YAE-RP
STATION
TI;E,E&IE)EI‘{SS TASK FORCE
56 TIPS MODEL #Y-| No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,260.00 $1,799.00 $1,844.00
STATION, 900 MHZ RF-900-D
W/ DISPLAY
TF:‘M\JV}?I{?&ESS TASK FORCE
57 TIPS MODEL No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,050.00 $1,795.00 $1,844.00
OPERATOR SYE-RF-0
STATION, 900 MHZ
TFT WIRELESS
TASK FORCE
58 Aﬁgmm 19% 0 TiPS MODEL No Bid No Bid No Bid S;gﬁf,gg.ﬁ_ $£215.00 $234.00
#YE-RF-RAD-24
MHZ
$282.00 Kit
Model
TFT 1 172" NMH TASK FORCE Obsolete
59 FLANGE WITH TIPS MODEL No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00 VO- No Bid No Bid
MALE OUTLET |#Al114NFM-KIT 032 $3.00
VT10-
24FH500
TFT Metro 1 Fixed
Gallonage Nozzle with| TASK FORCE
60 Grip - 1.5" NHF TIPS MODEL No Bid No Bid No Bid $970.00 $809.00 $872.00
Swivel Rocker, 185 | #MEIVPGI-214
gpm(@ 75psi, K=21.4,
Hgnialzl ;?}L‘;;”th TASK FORCE
61 o TIPS MODEL No Bid No Bid No Bid $442.00 $389.00 $397.00
Swivel Rocker x 1 4™ #7140FP
NHM Rigid
TF-TGI;:‘?]“‘V:,',"‘;;’:[F“'“}‘ TASK FORCE
62 . . | TIPS MODEL #H-| No Bid No Bid No Bid $420.00 $369.00 $377.00
Swivel Rockerx 12 VOI
NHM Rigid
Continued next page




Bid2024-216 Firefighting Tools Equipment

BID RESULTS
Strategic . . . .
Sy Dot Tl | S | g T Tk
Dynamics pply pply
REQUESTED
UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM# | DESCRIPTION |MFGMODEL#| oo PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
OR PART #
TFT Metro 1 Fixed
Gallonage, Tip Only, I| TASK FORCE
63 | NHF Rigid Rocker| TIPSMODEL | NoBid No Bid No Bid $688.00 $598.00 $618.00
Lug, 185 GPM @75 | #MEIT0-214
PSL, K=21.4
Gg T M:t;g zzi’“fﬁ TASK FORCE
64 onage Nozz'e, VPl TIPSMODEL | NoBid No Bid No Bid $754.00 $600.00 $678.00
Ouly, 1 %” NFH Rigid
#ME2T0-289
Rocker Lug
TFT Quadracup Foam
sg: ztzll:l:lGTllG rave, | TASKFORCE
65 ¢ Onage: | TIPSMODEL | NoBid No Bid NoBid | $1,005.00 | $849.00 $903.00
1" NHF Swivel | g1 spePL
Rocker, 30-125 GPM
@75 PSI
TFT BlitzForce
Portable Attack
N;‘;T;‘;gecfﬁb‘;?t‘“"“ TASK FORCE
66 OMOL | TIPS MODEL | NoBid No Bid NoBid | $2,235.00 | $2,264.99 | $2,407.00
Bracket, and 3 Stack HXXLG-42
Tips (I, 1%", 1 %™), 2
14 NHF Swivel
Rocker, 500 GPM
TFT OASIS Hydrant
H 129
SAS.S'SI :a];f’ :/’5,, TASK FORCE
67 wivel handle A, TIPSMODEL | No Bid No Bid NoBid | $3,145.00 | $2725.02 | $2,827.00
Stortz Swivel (3) SARSSR2T2T2T
B/C1/C2, Folding
Carry Handle
TFT Jumbo Low-
Profile Ball Intake
Valve, Pressure Relief| TASK FORCE
68 | Valve, Left Drive with| TIPSMODEL | NoBid No Bid NoBid | $2,570.00 | $2,100.00 |awsssmsssss
Front Crank, 5” Rigid | #AXD1ST-NX-F
Stortz, 67 NHF Swivel
Handle
ELKHART
go  |FLRHARTBOA2000| pp 4 oo vopEL | $8,500.00 | NoBid NoBid | $6,830.00 | $6,91067 | $4,109.00
MONITOR
#7451
SEEBITC | e
70 BRASS MODEL | $1,400.00 | NoBid NoBid | $3,025.00 | $3,198.67 | $5,349.00
FOAMNOZZLE, | o o™
MANUAL TYPE )
i ] e
71 ean N °]e' E;’Z;‘g BRASS MODEL | $5,700.00 | NoBid NoBid | $4,485.00 | $3,882.67 | $1,642.00
oam Nozz, BISCIC | #SM-2000E-HF
Type
ELKHART ELKHART
72 |MONITOR WIRLESS| BRASS MODEL | $1,800.00 | NoBid NoBid | $1,375.00 | $1,390.67 | $4,109.00
CONTROL KIT #7015X2
Continued next page




Bid2024-216 Firefighting Tools Equipment

BID RESULTS
Strategic Dana Safety| Technical | Firematic Fire Tech &
Safety | Gupply | Rescue.c Suppl MES Saf
Dynamics pply escue,com pply ety
REQUESTED
UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
TTEM # DESCRIFTION | MFG MODEL # PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
OR PART #
ELKHART
73 Mi{‘i’:asfrf;t’}sz;e BRASS MODEL | $4,300.00 | NoBid | NoBid | $13,750.00 | $3,613.84 | $2,979.00
#SM-2000BE
Bt |
74 . " E% | BRASS MODEL $3,050.00 No Bid No Bid $2.475.00 $2,497.33 No Bid
Tiller, 3.5" NHT
) #8294-131
Discharge
Williams Fire and
Hazard Control,
75 Ranger 2.0, 12V 10322 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,544.00
Actuator, Elkhart '
actuator plug
2200-WATT 120V $1750.00
PORTABLE . . . . Honda
76 INVERTER HONDA EU2200i| NoBid No Bid No Bid EB2200ITA $3,250.00 $5,879.00
GENERATOR N
FLIR K53 320X240
THERMAL
CAMERA KIT, INCL., ii’lg}f ;(}52
2 BATTERIES, 3205240
CHARGER, HARD . .
77 TRANSPORT CASE, 72203-0511 $4,250.00 No Bid 2enin:] No Bid $3,950.00 $859.00
st i,
RETRACTABLE TFLK53
LANYARD, POWER
SUPPLY
$730.15
FLIR K53 IN TRUCK . FLIRK53In .
78 CHARGER TI198322ACC $550.00 No Bid truck charger No Bid $545.00 $215.00
FFLTC
FLIR K53 Li-ION
79 BATTERY, 44 AH, | TI199368ACC $208.00 No Bid §187.20 No Bid $211.00 No Bid
16 WH
134" Attack Hose — 50
Feet, Mercedes Kraken
80 EXO, 1.75"x50° w/ Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Wayout
Couplings 1.5”NH
134" Attack Hose — 8
Feet, Mercedes Kraken
3 EXO, 1.75"x8" w/ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Wayout
Couplings 1.5"NH
2” Attack Hose - 75
Feet, Mercedes Kraken
82 EXO0, 2°x75" w/ Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wayout Couplings
1.5"NH
Continued next page




Bid2024-216 Firefighting Tools Equipment

BID RESULTS
Strategic Dana Safety| Technical | Firematic Fire Tech &
Safety Suppl Rescue.com Suppl MES Safety
Dyﬂamil‘.ﬁ pp y - pp y
REQUESTED
UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM# | DESCRIPTION ) MFGMODEL#| ppicp | pRicE | PRICE | PRICE | PRICE | PRICE
OR PART #
2 1/2" Attack Hose —
50 Feet, Mercedes
83 Krakep EXO, 2.57x50° No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/ Gold Wayout
Couplings 2.5"NH
2 %" Attack Hose — 8
Feet, Mercedes Kraken
84 EXO, 2.5"x8" w/ Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
Wayout Couplings
2.5"NH
5" Supply Hose — 25
Feet, Mercedes . . . . . .
85 MegaFlo 5"x25" w/ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Stortz Couplings
57 Supply Hose — 100
86 Feet, Mercedes NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MegaFlo 5°x100° w/
Gold Storz Couplings




Bid2024-217 Structural Firefighting Helmets

e 4 Bids received

Continued next page

Strategic Safety Dynamics LLC
PO Box 1022
Smithtown, NY 11787

Firematic- Supply Co., Inc.
10 Ramsey Road
East Yaphank, NY 11967

Fire Tech & Safety of New England, Inc.
100 Business Park Drive
Tyngsborough, MA 01879

Municipal Emergency Services, Inc.
12 Tumberry Ln. 2% Fl,
Sandy Hook, CT 06482

Pricing as Follows



Bid2024-217 Structural Firefighting Helmets

BID RESULTS
Strategic Safety Dynamics Firematic Supply Fire Tech & Safety MES
Item # Description Make & Model Price Make & Model Price Make & Model Price Make & Model Price
Bullard UST-LW
Traditional Series Bullard UST- Bullard
1 Helmet, with. | | fic F-18 Black | $315.00 LWBlack w/ | = ¢3, 59 |BUllerd USTLWi ¢1900 | uULwer3so- | $362.00
retractable internally retrack visor 6 Retract
X . Black
inteprated visor Eagle
COLOR-BLACK
Bullard UST-LW
Traditional Series Bullard UST- Bullard
2 Helmet, with |\, e P18 White | $315.00 LW Whitew/ | o195 g9 |Bullard USTLWI or0900 | ULW6R3so- | $362.00
retractable internally retrack visor 6 Retract .
\ . White
integrated visor Eagle
COLOR-WHITE
Replacement
internally integrated Bullard Inner
visor, (identical to Full Replacement She]l Assembly R350-Bullard
3 Eye/Face protection Hinge Kri)t (Pacific) $52.50 UST Retractable| $162.00 Retract Lens $69.95 | Bullard p/n R926 | $208.00
included with Items 1 & Visor Part Replacement
& 2), with mounting #R926
hardware
1. General requirements C Warranty
E ti t information attached to submission No exceptions to No exceptions to
4 xceptions fo 2. Technical Specifications (5) Sizing P No exceptions to specifications P

Specifications

adjustment 1/4 less Pacific Helmet is
61/2t0 8 3/4

specifications

specifications




Bid2024-218 Milwaukee Cordless Power Tools & Accessories

o 4 Bidsreceived

Continued next page

Salk’s Ace Hardware & Marine
2524 West Shore Road
Warwick, RI 02889

Wurth USA Inc.
93 Grant Street
Ramsey, NJ 07446

Gov Group
330 Rancheros Drive, Suite 138
San Marcos, CA 92069

Ferguson Waterworks
2 Whitman Road
Canton, MA 02021

Pricing as Follows



Bld2024-218 Milwaukee Cordless Power Tools Accessorles
BID RESULTS

Salk's Ace Hardware

Wurth USA Inc.

Gov Group

Ferguson

ITEM

DESCRIFTION

CURRENT

LIST PRICE

DICOUNTED
PRICE FIRST
YEAR

DICOUNTED
PRICE
SECOND
YEAR

CURRENT
LIST
PRICE

DICOUNTED
PRICE FIRST
YEAR

DICOUNTED
PRICE
SECOND
YEAR

CURRENT
LIST
PRICE

DICQUNTED
PRICE FIRST
YEAR

DICOUNTED
PRICE
SECOND
YEAR

CURRENT
LIST
PRICE

DICOUNTED
PRICE FIRST
YEAR

DICOUNTED
FRICE
SECOND
YEAR

Percentoge
Discount ofF
manufacturer's list
price at time of
order

5% ofT list price

5% ofT list price

30% ofT list price

26% off list price

25% ofT list price

25% off list price

47% off list price

45% off list price

Milwaukee M18
Super Sawzall
Reciprocating Saw|
Kit, #2722-21HD

$449.00

$426.55

$426.55

$682.48

$477.74

$505.04

$790.00

$567.38

$567.38

$790.00

$418.70

$434.50

Milwaukee M18
Rocket Dual
Power Tower

Light, #2131-20

$229.99

$218.49

$218.49

$350.77

$245.54

$259.57

$413.00

$281.07

$281.07

$412.00

$218.89

$227.15

Milwaukee M18
Rocket Tower
Ligh¥/Charger Kit,
#2136-21

Item
Discontinued

Item
Discontinued

Item
Discontinued

$1,073.18

$751.23

$7%4.15

$745,00

$509.58

$509.58

§745.00

$394.85

$409.75

Milwaukee M13
Rover Dual Power
Flood Light,
#2366-20

$149.99

§142.49

514249

$226,48

$158.54

$167.60

$256,00

$177.17

$177.17

$236.00

$135.68

$140.80

Milwnukee M18
Fuel 16"
Chainsaw Kit,
#2727-21HD

$499.00

$474.05

$474.05

$682.48

$477.74

$505.04

$879.00

$628.61

$623.61

$879.00

$465.87

$483.45

Milwaukes M18
Packout Six-Bay
Rapid Charger,

* 1148-59-1809

$249.00

$236.55

$236.55

$368.10

$257.67

$272.39

$450.00

$295.86

£295.86

$450.00

$238.50

$247.50

Milwaukee M18

and M12 Rapid

Charge Station,
#48-59-1807

$229.00

$218.49

$218.49

$339.38

$237.57

$251.14

$388.02

$259.59

$259.59

$389.00

$206.17

$213.95

H

Milwaukee M18
Redlithium XC5.0
Baltery Pack, #148-

11-1850

$159.00

815105

$151.05

$241.68

$169.18

5178.84

$273.00

$192.96

$192.96

$273.00

$144.69

$150.15

Milwaukee M18
Redlithium XC6.0
Ballery Pack, #48-

11-1365

$179.00

$170.05

5170.05

$272.08

$190.46

$201.34

$307.00

$216.99

3216.99

$307.00

$162.7

$168.85

Milwaukee MI18
Redlithium
HDI12.0 Battery
Pack, #48-11-1812

$249.00

$236.55

$236.55

$378.48

§$264.94

$280.08

$428.00

$302.51

$302.51

$428.00

$226.84

$235.40




FRANK J. PIcozzi
MAYOR

FRrRANCIS M. GOMEZ
PURCHASING AGENT

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 PosT RoAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
TEL{401)738-2013
FAX (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To: Peder Schaefer, Finance Director
From: Francis M. Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Date:  September 15, 2023

Re:  Agenda for Thursday, October 12, 2023

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2 starting
at 11:00 am.

Bid2024-216 Firefighting Tools & Equipment
Bid2024-217 Structural Firefighting Helmets

Bid2024-218 Milwaukee Cordless Power Tools & Accessories

November 62 / November 20t



Date: October 11, 2023

Bid2024-216 Firefighting Tools & Equipment
Bid2024-217 Structural Firefighting Helmets
Bid2024-218 Milwaukee Cordless Power Tools & Accessories

Name (please print neatly) Company/Email Address
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