Francis M. Gomez Frank J. Picozzi

Purchasing Agent Mayor

City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364

Bid Minutes Wednesday, November 8, 2023

Bid2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Valves
Location: The meeting was held in Meeting Room 2

Present: Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist

Representatives: Jeff Houser, McWane Ductile

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid

or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go

to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are November 20, 2023 and December 4, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The City
Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00
P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,

4@«/57%.)&»\?/'

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent




Bid2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Valves

o 6 Bids received

Ferguson Waterworks
2 Whitman Road
Canton, MA 02021

EJ Prescott Inc.
38 Albion Road
Lincoln, RI 02865

Warwick Winwater Company
62 Wyoming Ave.
Warwick, RI 02888

Lindon Group, Inc.
310 Bourne Ave. Bld. 67F
Rumford, RI 02916

Dana Kepner Co.
d/b/a Putnam Pipe
86 Elm Street
Hopkinton, MA 01748

John Hoadley and Sons, Inc.
672 Union Street
Rockland, MA 02370

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page



2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Valves BID RESULTS

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Ferguson Waterworks | EJ Prescott, Inc. | Warwick Winwater| Lindon Group | Putnam Pipe |John Hoadley
1 VALVE BOX/EA. $136.65 $129.00 $150.00 No Bid $132.00 $140.00
2 VALVE BOX EXTENSIONS/EA.

a 514" X 1" $11.28 $17.90 $12.50 No Bid $20.30 $11.56
b SWX1W” $15.05 $23.40 $16.50 No Bid $26.50 $15.43
c S X2 $18.82 $23.40 $20.50 No Bid $26.50 $19.29
3 VYALVE BOX TOPS (ROAD)/EA. $71.50 $12.00 $75.00 No Bid $72.00 $73.29
4 YALVE BOX COVER/EA.

a Regular Valve Box Cover Only $15.89 $14.00 $18.00 No Bid $15.00 $16.29
b Locking Valve Box Cover Only $30.70 $18.00 $32.00 No Bid $21.00 $31.46
5 SERVICE BOXES/EA. $63.13 $58.00 $65.00 No Bid $34.00 $64.71
6 SERVICE BOX TOP/EA. $26.13 $32.00 $30.00 No Bid $16.00 $26.79
7 CURB BOXES & ACCESSORIES/EA.

a (Rod Box) Curb Box & Accessories $74.33 $71.00 $76.00 No Bid $70.00 $76.19
b Rod Box Extension

i Rod Box 6" $14.09 $11.00 $21.00 No Bid $12.35 $14.44
ii Rod Box .12" $17.22 $15.00 $25.00 No Bid 316.40 $17.65
iii Rod Box 18" $518.78 $16.00 $28.00 No Bid $33.00 $19.25
c Telescopic, with cast iron arch base $74.33 $71.00 $76.00 No Bid $70.00 $76.19
d (Rod Box) Repair Cover w/Set $14.90 $14.50 $18.00 No Bid $18.60 $15.28
e (Rod Box) Repair Cover Threaded $11.50 $11.00 $15.00 No Bid $12.50 $11.79

(continued next page)
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2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Vaives BID RESULTS

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Ferguson Waterworks | EJ Prescott, Inc. | Warwick Winwater| Lindon Group | Putnam Pipe | John Hoadley
3 YALVES GATE/EA.
a Size: 4" §772.73 $735.00 $764.00 $763.94 $722.75 $745.00
b Size: 6" $968.21 $943.00 $974.00 $974.85 $918.50 $954.00
[ Size; 8" $1,520.03 $1,470.00 $1,552.00 $1,152.69 $1,443.35 $1,490.00
d Size: 10" $2,352.23 $2,283.00 $2.420.00 $2,421.11 $2,228.10 $2,318.00
¢ Size: 12" $2,991.08 $2,866.00 $3,063.00 $3,063.60 $2,797.90 $2,911.00
f Size: 16” $8,891.95 $9,370.00 $9,327.00 $9,436.80 $8,582.05 $9,590.00
9 BENDS/EA.
a 4" 45° $130.31 $97.00 $108.79 $97.85 $103.90 $100.00
b 4" 90° $140.83 $125.00 $121.20 $117.80 $114.68 $111.00
c 4" 22 1/2° $127.44 $95.00 $105.40 $95.00 $101.00 $97.00
d 6" 45° $179.68 $210.00 $157.38 $152.00 $145.75 $149.50
e 6" 90° $199.28 $170.00 $180.50 $185.25 $165.00 $170.00
f 6" 22 1/2° $172.02 $140.00 $148.36 $138.70 $148.00 $141.50
g 8" 45° $252.74 $192.00 $209.85 $214.70 $200.00 $195.50
h 8" 90° $280.00 $220.00 $242.00 $268.85 $229.00 $224.00
i 8" 22 1/2¢ $249.87 $190.00 $206.46 $210.90 $199.00 $192.50
i 10" 45° $361.98 $275.00 $274.50 $310.65 $276.00 $282.00
k 10" 90° $422.24 $337.00 $345.59 $467.40 $336.00 $345.00
1 10" 22 1/2° $361.50 $275.00 $273.95 $300,28 $276.00 $281.50
m 12" 45° $513.00 $368.00 $379.49 $536.75 $370.00 $376.00
n 2" 90° $568.00 $425.00 $444.36 $675.45 $424.00 $433.50
0 12" 22 1/2° $480.00 $340.00 $340.56 $456.00 $340.00 $341.50
10 TEES/EA.
a 6x6x4 $272.57 $225.00 $244.50 $237.50 $226.00 $228.50
b 6x6x6 $292.23 $245.00 $262.87 $266.00 $242.00 $248.00
[ 8x8x4 $329.85 $253.00 $5278.35 $315.40 $270.00 $258.00
d Bx8x6 $362.42 $285.00 $311.95 $332.50 $294.00 $291.00
e 8x8x8 $418.08 $327.00 $360.74 $394.25 $341.00 $334.00
f 10x10x4 $469.22 $369.00 $378.76 $428.45 $371.00 $376.00
g 10x10x6 $471.19 $369.00 $376.00 $516.80 $369.00 $377.00

{continued next page)
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2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Valves BID RESULTS

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Ferguson Waterworks | EJ Prescott, Inc. | Warwick Winwater| Lindon Group | Putnam Pipe [John Hoadley
h 10x10x8 $528.76 $415.00 $427.00 $608.00 $418.00 $422.00
i 12x12x4 $588.68 $428.00 $446.29 $563.35 $407.25 $437.00
i 12x12x6 $597.82 $436.00 $452.26 $624.15 $437.00 $445.50
k 12x12x8 $660.18 $485.00 $508.95 $659.30 $491.00 $495.50

i 16x]16x4 $1,621.78 $1,348.00 No Bid No Bid $1,375.00 $1,373.50
m 16x16x6 $1,112.01 $820.00 $1,337.00 $1,420.25 $835.00 $839.50
n 16x16x38 $1,182.50 $880.00 $941.00 $1,540.90 $898.00 $898.00
0 20x20x6 $1,800.09 $1,350.00 $2,345.00 $2,448.15 $1,378.00 $1,383.00
p 20x20x8 $1,840.45 $1,380.00 $2,477.45 $2,505.15 $1.410.00 $1,410.00
11 HYDRANT SWIVEL TEES MJI./EA.

a 6x6x6 $170.74 $236.00 $289.38 $306.85 $235.00 $240.50
b 8x8x6 $213.78 $167.00 $347.49 $456.95 $295.00 $291.50
c 8x8x8 $323.30 $285.00 $480.33 $549.10 $407.00 $406.00
d 10x10x6 $270.70 $373.00 $550.00 $597.55 $375.00 $381.00
e 10x10x8 $359.17 $463.00 $609.00 $722.00 $460.00 $473.50
f 12x12x6 $307.52 $414.00 $513.53 $694.45 $415.00 $422.50
g 12x12x8 $459.61 $569.00 $689.00 $780.90 $570.00 $581.50
h 16x16x6 $546.65 $720.00 $792.00 $1,239.75 $732.00 $736.50
i 16x16x8 $1,423.30 $1,620.00 No Bid No Bid $1,600.00 $1,653.00
i 20x20x6 $971.35 $1,280.00 $1,943.60 $1,850.60 $1,274.00 $1,309.50
k 20x20x8 No Bid $1,565.00 No Bid No Bid $1,410.00 No Bid

(continued next page)
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2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Valves BID RESULTS

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Ferpuson Waterworks | EJ Prescoit, Inc. | Warwick Winwater| Lindon Group | Putnam Pipe | John Hoadley

12 CAPS/EA.

a 4" $62.76 $47.00 $78.23 $56.05 $49.00 $47.50
b 6" $90.08 $74.00 $108.90 $95.00 $73.00 $75.00

c 8" $134.26 $104.00 $173.00 $147.25 $108.00 $106.00
d 10" $179.08 $136.00 $140.00 $169.10 $136.00 $139.00
¢ 12" $253.63 $181.00 $190.00 $214.70 $182.00 $185.00
f 16" $482.51 $345.00 $364.50 $592.80 $350.00 $352.50
g 20" $791.39 $575.00 $773.44 $968.05 $585.00 $875.50
h 24" $1,100.18 $793.00 $625.74 $1,395.55 $785.00 $810.00
13 CAPS/ABOVE COMPLETE W/2"

PIPE/EA.

a 4" $88.11 $73.00 $79.44 $98.80 $85.00 $74.00
b 6" $115.42 $100.00 $108.90 $138.70 $100.50 $101.50
c 8" $159.13 $130.00 $140.00 $190.95 $136.00 $132.00
d 10" $203.95 $162.00 $169.00 $213.75 $164.00 $165.00
e 12" $278.98 $210.00 $220.00 $259.35 $211.00 $211.50
f 16" $521.73 $385.00 $410.00 $684.00 $388.00 $393.50
g 20" $842.56 $627.00 $609.00 $1,055.45 $639.00 $641.00
h 24" $1,150.39 $844.00 $933.00 $1,493.90 $1,061.00 $862.50
14 VALVES, TAPPING/EA.

a 4" $887.66 $893.00 $987.00 $963.71 No Bid $907.50
b 6" $1,258.47 $1,260.00 $1,394.00 $1,361.39 No Bid $1,280.00
¢ 8" $1,850.82 $1,847.00 $2,069.00 $2,020.86 No Bid $1,889.00
d 10" $2,805.05 $2,840.00 $3,120.00 $3,047.28 No Bid $2,847.00
e 12" $4,201.95 $4,205.00 $4,714.00 $4,603.24 No Bid $4,278.00
f 16" $10,929.68 $11,560.00 $10,885.00 $11,985.39 No Bid $9,515.00

(continued nex¢ page)
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2024-275 Pipe Fitlings & Valves BID RESULTS

Putnam Pipe

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Ferguson Waterworks | EJ Prescott, Inc. | Warwick Winwater| Lindon Group John Hoadley
15 SLEEVES,
TAPPING/FABRICATED/FT.

a 6x6x4 $846.77 $650.00 $541.62 $1,625.25 No Bid $960.00
b 6x6x6 $1,034.89 $705.00 $617.20 $1,658.30 No Bid $1,173.00
c 8x8x4 $994.62 $685.00 $579.41 $1,688.75 No Bid $1,128.00
d §x8x6 $1,077.96 $760.00 $614.15 $1,837.80 No Bid $1,222.00
e 8x8x8 $1,586.02 $1,020.00 $822.65 $2,375.20 No Bid $1,798.00
f 10x10x4 $1,123.66 $750.00 $635.44 $1,888.87 No Bid $1,274.00
g 10x10x6 $1,212.37 $835.00 $684.52 $1,935.68 No Bid $1,375.00
h 10x10x8 $1,650.54 $1,070.00 $831.77 $2,386.75 No Bid $1,870.00
i 10x10x 10 $2,223.12 $1,450.00 $1,420.73 $3,364.65 No Bid _ $2,521.34
j 12x12x4 $1,233.87 $800.00 $708.84 $2,176.30 No Bid $1,399.00
k 12 x 12 x6 $1,303.76 $860.00 $897.80 $2,223.88 No Bid $1,478.00
l 12x12x8 $1,690.86 $1,150.00 $1,144.49 $2,874.30 No Bid $3,272.00
m 12x12x10 $2,314.52 $1,500.00 $1,480.00 $3,728.30 No Bid $2,625.00
n 16x16x6 $1,518.82 $1,020.00 $1,284.34 $3,022.87 No Bid $1,722.00
0 l6x16x8 $2,131.72 $1,300.00 $1,533.65 $3,407.45 No Bid $2,417.00
p 20x20x6 $1,597.33 $1,070.00 $1,615.76 $3,179.40 No Bid $1,810.00
q 20x20x8§ $2,278.61 $1,375.00 $1,875.00 $3,470.95 No Bid $2,584.00
16 WATER MAIN (PIPE)/FT.

a 2” No Bid $1.69 No Bid No Bid $2.50 No Bid
b 4" $7.48 $6.60 $7.44 No Bid $9.25 No Bid
c 6" $15.26 $13.50 $15.20 No Bid $18.90 No Bid
d 8" $26.17 $23.00 $26.05 No Bid $32.30 No Bid
e 10" $39.26 $35.00 $39.10 No Bid $48.50 No Bid
f 12" $55.29 $49.00 $55.05 No Bid $68.30 No Bid
g 16" $80.09 $80.00 No Bid No Bid $105.00 No Bid
h 20" $124.21 $120.00 No Bid No Bid $145.47 No Bid

i 24" $179.12 $150.00 No Bid No Bid $209.56 No Bid
i 30" $285.62 $280.00 No Bid No Bid $334.78 No Bid

(continued next page)
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2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Valves BID RESULTS

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Ferguson Waterworks | EJ Prescott, Inc. | Warwick Winwater| Lindon Group | Putnam Pipe [John Hoadley

17 WATER MAIN (PIPE)/FT.

a 4" $37.72 $42.00 $38.25 $41.71 $36.60 No Bid
b 6" $25.79 $29.00 $26.14 $28.52 $24.95 No Bid
c 8" $33.95 $38.00 $34.42 $37.54 $32.95 No Bid
d 10" $40.53 $45.00 $41.08 $44.82 $39.25 No Bid
e 12" $52.04 $58.00 $52.78 $57.55 $50.45 No Bid
f 16" $84.22 $85.00 $85.39 $93.13 $81.65 No Bid
g 20" $116.48 $132.00 $118.44 $129.16 $112.95 No Bid
h 24" $157.71 $178.00 $160.00 $174.40 $152.65 No Bid
i 30" $267.99 $300.00 $190.00 $296.37 $267.15 No Bid
18 MECHANICAL JOINT

ACCESSORIES/EA.

a 4" $21.52 $21.00 No Bid No Bid $25.00 $22.50
b 6" $29.65 $29.00 No Bid No Bid $30.00 $31.00
c g" $32.52 $31.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 $34.00
d 10" $46.87 $46.00 No Bid No Bid $48.00 $49.00
e 12" $48.30 $47.00 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $50.50
f 16" $78.91 $77.00 No Bid No Bid $87.00 $82.50
g 20" $140.61 $137.00 No Bid No Bid $156.00 $147.00
h 24" $196.09 $190.00 No Bid No Bid $216.00 $205.00
i 30" $350.09 $358.00 No Bid No Bid $390.00 $366.00
19 |MECHANICAL JOINTS OFFSETS/EA.

a 4x4x6 $178.13 $205.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid $165.00
b 4x4x12 $207.31 $223.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $198.50
c 4x4x18 $252.27 $325.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $250.00
d 6X6x 6 $266.72 $285.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $264.00
e 6x6x12 $317.89 $338.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $323.00
f 6x6x18 $367.63 $318.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $380.00

(continued next page)
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2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Valves BID RESULTS

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Ferpuson Waterworks | EJ Prescott, Inc. | Warwick Winwater| Lindon Group | Putnam Pipe | John Hoadle
g 8x8x6 $376.13 $318.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $356.00
h §x8x12 $446.43 $390.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $437.00
i 8x8x18 $524.39 $469.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $527.00
i 10x10x6 $537.02 $455.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $511.00
k 10x10x12 $647.02 $568.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $638.00
1 10x 10x 18 $735.50 $658.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $739.00
mn 12x12x6 $745.92 $606.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $680.00
n 12x12x12 $800.92 $662.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $744.00
0 12x12x18 $916.18 $780.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $875.00

20 GRIP RING GLAND PACKS/EA.
a 4” for PVC $70.59 $69.00 No Bid No Bid $96.40 No Bid
b 4” for ductile $61.74 $69.00 No Bid No Bid $96.40 No Bid
c 6” for PVC $85.68 $76.00 No Bid No Bid $111.60 No Bid
d 6> for ductile $71.79 $76.00 No Bid No Bid $111.60 No Bid
e 8” for PVC $120.21 $115.00 No Bid No Bid $159.30 No Bid
f 8 for ductile $102.,33 $115.00 No Bid No Bid $159.30 No Bid
g 10” for PVC $208.69 $165.00 No Bid No Bid $230.60 No Bid
h 10> for ductile $146.61 $165.00 No Bid No Bid $230.60 No Bid
i 12” for PVC $221.38 $225.00 No Bid No Bid $311.60 No Bid
i 12” for ductile $200.29 $225.00 No Bid No Bid $311.60 No Bid
21 MEGA LUG GLAND PACKS /EA.
a 4” for PVC $46.68 $46.00 $59.,00 $69.62 $45.60 $53.50
b 4” for ductile 340.61 $40.00 $52.20 $61.50 $39.80 $47.00
c 6™ for PVC $58.44 $58.00 $66.68 $89.18 $58.40 $68.00
d 6” for ductile $50.17 $50.00 $56.31 $77.53 $49.05 $59.25
e 8 for PVC $78.84 $78.00 $86.30 $119.43 $76.80 $91.25
f 8” for ductile $68.36 $67.00 $74.47 $103.55 $66.90 $79.00

(continued next page)
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2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Valves BID RESULTS

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Ferguson Waterworks | EJ Prescott, Inc, | Warwick Winwater| Lindon Group | Putnam Pipe { John Hoadle
g 10™ for PVC $137.27 $135.00 $127.56 $202.87 $137.00 $155.00
h 10” for ductile $97.22 $86.00 $103.65 $147.90 $95.05 $113.00
i 12” for PVC $144.07 $141.00 $145.74 $213.52 $150.50 $163.25
i 12” for ductile $130.66 $128.00 $133.57 $195.48 $127.75 $149.50
k 16” for PVC $296.83 $291.00 $219.95 $415.55 $299.00 $315.00
1 16” for ductile $234.44 $230.00 $233.66 $331.69 $229.00 $250.00

. m 20” for PVC $441.23 $432.00 $286.70 $611.10 $491.00 $462.00

n 20” for ductile $386.86 $379.00 $442.52 $815.10 $379.00 $407.00
22 MECHANICAL JOINT CROSSES/EA.

a 6"x6"x6"x6" $215.70 $361.00 No Bid $497.80 No Bid $384.00
b 8"x8"x6"x6" $223.83 $376.00 No Bid $512.05 No Bid $400.00
c 8"x8"x8"x8" $235.30 $395.00 No Bid $585.20 No Bid $420.00
d 10"x10"x6"x6" $288.39 $595.00 No Bid $632.70 No Bid $508.00
e 10"x10"x8"x8" $357.26 $558.00 No Bid $709.65 No Bid $594.00
f 10"x10"x10"x10" $376.87 $610.00 No Bid $815.10 No Bid $649.00
23 BUTTERFLY VALVES/EA.

a 12" $3,515.96 $3,400.00 $3,672.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
b 16" $5,071.28 $5,775.00 $5,297.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
c 20" $6,592.55 $8,000.00 $6,886.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
d 24" $8,451.06 $12,400.00 $8,827.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
e 30" $19,269.15 $24,000.00 $20,126.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 REDUCERS/EA.

a ox4 $147.10 $120.00 $123.78 $108.30 $126.00 $116.50
b 8x4 $186.02 $143.00 $149.17 $165.30 $147.00 $142.00
c 8x6 $200.90 $162.00 $165.56 $176.70 $157.00 $156.50
d 10x4 $264.32 $217.00 No Bid $363.85 $208.00 $210.00
e 10x6 $252.89 $203.00 $194.79 $222.30 $192.00 $197.00
f 10x8 $281.77 $219.00 $212.00 $248.90 $212.00 $212.00

{continued next page)
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2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Valves BID RESULTS

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Ferguson Waterworks | EJ Prescott, Inc. | Warwick Winwater| Lindon Group | Putnam Pipe | John Hoadley

25 2" PYC GASKETED/EA.

a Coupling $23.13 $29.00 $45.00 No Bid $34.00 No Bid

b Caps $24.64 $36.00 $32.00 No Bid $36.00 No Bid

c 22 Degree $105.74 $222.00 $85.00 No Bid $44.00 No Bid

d 45 Degree $30.24 $39.00 $32.00 No Bid $44.00 No Bid

e 2x3/4 Tee $33.26 $46.00 $26.00 No Bid $44.50 No Bid

f 2x1 Tee $33.26 $46.00 $26.00 No Bid $44.50 No Bid

g 2x2 Tee $56.88 $71.00 $58.00 No Bid $82.00 No Bid
26 MJ CUT-IN-SLEEVE 6" (RANGE $345.07 $397.00 $1,685.00 No Bid No Bid $428.00

INCH 6.5 - 7.2)

Page 90of 9




FRANK J. Picozzi
MAYOR

FrRANCIS M. GOMEZ
PURCHASING AGENT

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 PosT RoAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLLAND 02886
TEL (401)738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To: Peder Schaefer, Finance Director
From: Francis M. Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Date: November 6, 2023

Re: Agenda for Wednesday, November 8, 2023

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2 starting
at 11:00 am.

Bid2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Valves

December 4% / December 18%



Date: November 8, 2023

Bid2024-275 Pipe Fittings & Valves

Name (please print neatly) Companv/Email Address
S 1 o s
JEEF _Hoyser AR /ﬁjvj 5!;/];1/%%#@%/%@5%@ Col

%/MU Ghen_ / % (o
Jescea Lontrey Rl Speciitit~ Cos




