
 

Francis M. Gomez                                    Frank J. Picozzi 

Purchasing Agent                                     Mayor 

      

 

City of Warwick 

Purchasing Division 

3275 Post Road 

Warwick, Rhode Island 02886 

Tel (401) 738-2013 

Fax (401) 737-2364 

 

Bid Minutes Wednesday, December 6, 2023 

 

Bid2024-305   Frames, Grates, and Covers 
 

Bid2024-306   Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel, and Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel 

 

Bid2024-307  Cement Concrete Mixes & Controlled Low Strength Materials (CLSM) 

“Flowable Fill” 

 

Bid2024-309   Structural Firefighting Particulate Hoods REBID 

  

      Location:   The meeting was held in Meeting Room 2 

        

   Present:   Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent 

    Frances Gray, Accounts Payable  

     

Representatives: None 

 

All bids have been properly advertised.  A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid 

or the bid will not be accepted.  Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened.  All bids will go 

to the departments for their review and recommendation.   

 

The next council meetings are December 4, 2023 and December 18, 2023 at Warwick City Hall.  The City 

Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M.  The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M.  The 5:00 

P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak. 

 

Respectively submitted, 

 

  

Original Signature on File  
 Francis M. Gomez 

 Purchasing Agent 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid2024-305 Frames, Grates, and Covers 

 

 4 Bids received 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EJ Prescott, Inc. 

38 Albion Rd. 

Lincoln, RI 02865 

 

Core & Main LP 

655 Pleasant St. 

Norwood, MA 02026 

 

Ferguson Waterworks 

2 Whitman Rd. 

Canton, MA 02021 

 

Warwick Winwater Company 

62 Wyoming Ave. 

Warwick, RI 02888 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid2024-305 Frames, Grates, and Covers 

 

 

        EJ Prescott, Inc. – 

Item # Description Bid 

   

1 
RI Standard 6.1.0 Square Frame & Round Cover-

Light Duty Catch Basin 
$495.00 

   

2 
RI Standard 6.3.2 Square Frame & Grate, Bicycle 

Safe 
$567.00 

   
3 RI Standard 6.3.4 High Capacity Frame and Grate $603.00 

   
4 RI Standard 6.3.3 High Capacity Frame and Grate $603.00 

   

5 
RI Standard 6.2.0 Round Frame and Cover-Light 

Duty Manhole 
$450.00 

   

6 
RI Standard 6.2.1 Round Frame and Cover-Heavy 

Duty Manhole 
$885.00 

   
7 RI Standard 6.4.0 Round Frame and Grate $630.00 

   
8 RI Standard 5.3.0 CB/MH Step-Prov. Standard NO BID 

   
9 LeBaron Cat No LF244 or equal Frame and Grate $432.00 

   
10 LeBaron Cat No LF246 or equal Frame and Grate $455.00 

   
11 LeBaron Cat No LF248 or equal Frame and Grate $522.00 

   
12 Lebaron Cat. No. LK 253 or equal Frame & Cover $495.00 

   

13 
Percentage off of all other catalog items as required 

by the City 
25% 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Bid2024-305 Frames, Grates, and Covers 

 

 

        Core & Main LP – 

Item # Description Bid 

   

1 
RI Standard 6.1.0 Square Frame & Round Cover-

Light Duty Catch Basin 
$463.16 

   

2 
RI Standard 6.3.2 Square Frame & Grate, Bicycle 

Safe 
$526.07 

   
3 RI Standard 6.3.4 High Capacity Frame and Grate $563.90 

   
4 RI Standard 6.3.3 High Capacity Frame and Grate $589.26 

   

5 
RI Standard 6.2.0 Round Frame and Cover-Light 

Duty Manhole 
$420.48 

   

6 
RI Standard 6.2.1 Round Frame and Cover-Heavy 

Duty Manhole 
$827.27 

   
7 RI Standard 6.4.0 Round Frame and Grate $589.51 

   
8 RI Standard 5.3.0 CB/MH Step-Prov. Standard NO BID 

   
9 LeBaron Cat No LF244 or equal Frame and Grate $403.68 

   
10 LeBaron Cat No LF246 or equal Frame and Grate $425.13 

   
11 LeBaron Cat No LF248 or equal Frame and Grate $488.12 

   
12 Lebaron Cat. No. LK 253 or equal Frame & Cover $712.56 

   

13 
Percentage off of all other catalog items as required 

by the City 
10% 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid2024-305 Frames, Grates, and Covers 

 

 

        Ferguson Waterworks – 

Item # Description Bid 

   

1 
RI Standard 6.1.0 Square Frame & Round Cover-

Light Duty Catch Basin 
$458.12 

   

2 
RI Standard 6.3.2 Square Frame & Grate, Bicycle 

Safe 
$524.70 

   
3 RI Standard 6.3.4 High Capacity Frame and Grate $557.76 

   
4 RI Standard 6.3.3 High Capacity Frame and Grate $582.85 

   

5 
RI Standard 6.2.0 Round Frame and Cover-Light 

Duty Manhole 
$415.90 

   

6 
RI Standard 6.2.1 Round Frame and Cover-Heavy 

Duty Manhole 
$818.27 

   
7 RI Standard 6.4.0 Round Frame and Grate $583.10 

   
8 RI Standard 5.3.0 CB/MH Step-Prov. Standard $14.76 

   
9 LeBaron Cat No LF244 or equal Frame and Grate $399.29 

   
10 LeBaron Cat No LF246 or equal Frame and Grate $482.81 

   
11 LeBaron Cat No LF248 or equal Frame and Grate $420.50 

   
12 Lebaron Cat. No. LK 253 or equal Frame & Cover $458.12 

   

13 
Percentage off of all other catalog items as required 

by the City 
10% 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid2024-305 Frames, Grates, and Covers 

 

 

        Warwick Winwater Company – 

Item # Description Bid 

   

1 
RI Standard 6.1.0 Square Frame & Round Cover-

Light Duty Catch Basin 
$484.45 

   

2 
RI Standard 6.3.2 Square Frame & Grate, Bicycle 

Safe 
$554.85 

   
3 RI Standard 6.3.4 High Capacity Frame and Grate $589.82 

   
4 RI Standard 6.3.3 High Capacity Frame and Grate $616.34 

   

5 
RI Standard 6.2.0 Round Frame and Cover-Light 

Duty Manhole 
$439.80 

   

6 
RI Standard 6.2.1 Round Frame and Cover-Heavy 

Duty Manhole 
$865.30 

   
7 RI Standard 6.4.0 Round Frame and Grate $616.61 

   
8 RI Standard 5.3.0 CB/MH Step-Prov. Standard NO BID 

   
9 LeBaron Cat No LF244 or equal Frame and Grate $422.23 

   
10 LeBaron Cat No LF246 or equal Frame and Grate $510.55 

   
11 LeBaron Cat No LF248 or equal Frame and Grate $444.67 

   
12 Lebaron Cat. No. LK 253 or equal Frame & Cover $484.45 

   

13 
Percentage off of all other catalog items as required 

by the City 
10% 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid2024-306 Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel, and Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel 

 

 5 Bids received 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Global Montello Group Corp. 

800 South Street 

Suite 500 

Waltham, MA 02453 

 

Sprague Operating Resources, LLC 

185 International Dr. 

Portsmouth, NH 03801 

 

Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. 

16654 Gemini Lane 

Huntington Beach, CA 92647 

 

Santa Buckley Energy, Inc. 

154 Admiral St. 

Bridgeport, CT 06605 

 

Dennis K. Burke, Inc. 

555 Constitution Dr. 

Taunton, MA 02780 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid2024-306 Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel, and Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel 
 

 

Global Montcello Group Corp.– 

Item # BRAND FIRE ONLY 
POLICE 

ONLY 
DPW ONLY 

SEWER 

ONLY 

  
INCREMENT 

(+/-) 

INCREMENT 

(+/-) 
INCREMENT (+/-) INCREMENT (+/-) 

      
1 Unleaded N/A N/A 0.2303 0.6503 

      

2 
Plus 

Unleaded 
N/A 0.2486 N/A N/A 

      

3 Winter Diesel N/A N/A 0.1951 N/A 

      

4 
New Ultra 

Diesel 
0.4321 N/A 0.1951 0.6821 

 

 

 

 

 

Sprague Operating Resources, LLC– 

Item # BRAND FIRE ONLY 
POLICE 

ONLY 
DPW ONLY 

SEWER 

ONLY 

  
INCREMENT 

(+/-) 

INCREMENT 

(+/-) 
INCREMENT (+/-) INCREMENT (+/-) 

      
1 Unleaded No Bid No Bid $0.2349 No Bid 

      

2 
Plus 

Unleaded 
No Bid $0.1574 No Bid No Bid 

      

3 Winter Diesel No Bid No Bid $0.1620 No Bid 

      

4 
New Ultra 

Diesel 
No Bid No Bid $0.1526 No Bid 

 

 

 



Bid2024-306 Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel, and Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel 

 

 

Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc.– 

Item # BRAND FIRE ONLY 
POLICE 

ONLY 
DPW ONLY 

SEWER 

ONLY 

  
INCREMENT 

(+/-) 

INCREMENT 

(+/-) 
INCREMENT (+/-) INCREMENT (+/-) 

      
1 Unleaded No Bid No Bid +$0.1069 +$0.4450 

      

2 
Plus 

Unleaded 
No Bid +$0.1113 No Bid No Bid 

      

3 Winter Diesel No Bid No Bid +$0.1512 No Bid 

      

4 
New Ultra 

Diesel 
+$0.4261 No Bid +$0.1013 +$0.3971 

 

 

 

 

 

Santa Buckley Energy, Inc.– 

Item # BRAND FIRE ONLY 
POLICE 

ONLY 
DPW ONLY 

SEWER 

ONLY 

  
INCREMENT 

(+/-) 

INCREMENT 

(+/-) 
INCREMENT (+/-) INCREMENT (+/-) 

      
1 Unleaded   

 
+.21 

 

      

2 
Plus 

Unleaded  
+.11 

  

      

3 Winter Diesel 
  

+.085 
 

      

4 
New Ultra 

Diesel 
+.60 

 
+.085 

 
 

 

 



Bid2024-306 Gasoline, Low Sulfur Diesel, and Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel 

 

 

Dennis K. Burke, Inc.– 

Item # BRAND FIRE ONLY 
POLICE 

ONLY 
DPW ONLY 

SEWER 

ONLY 

  
INCREMENT 

(+/-) 

INCREMENT 

(+/-) 
INCREMENT (+/-) INCREMENT (+/-) 

      
1 Unleaded   

 
+.0842 +.2092 

      

2 
Plus 

Unleaded  
+.0442 

  

      

3 Winter Diesel 
  

+.0592 
 

      

4 
New Ultra 

Diesel 
+.49 

 
+.0442 +.49 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

Bid2024-307 Cement Concrete Mixes & Controlled Low Strength Materials (CLSM) “Flowable Fill” 

 

 1 Bid Received 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Cardi Materials LLC 

400 Lincoln Ave 

Warwick, RI 02888 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid2024-307 Cement Concrete Mixes & Controlled Low Strength Materials (CLSM) “Flowable Fill” 

 

 Bids received 1 

 

      Cardi Materials LLC 

Item Description Cost per cubic yard 

1 
Class A cement concrete for general use, 3/4” max. 

size aggregate, (3,000 psi) with air entrainment 
$161.75 

2 
Class XX cement concrete for sidewalks, 3/4” max 

size aggregate, (4000 psi) with air entrainment 
$167.75 

3 

Class HP cement concrete for reinforced slab sections, 

3/4” max size aggregate, (5,000 psi)  with air 

entrainment $196.75 

4 
Class A cement concrete for general use, 3/8” max. 

size aggregate, (3,000 psi) with air entrainment 
$161.75 

5 

Class XX cement concrete for sidewalks, (pea stone) 

3/8” max size aggregate, (4000 psi)  with air 

entrainment $167.75 

6 

Class HP (5,000 psi) cement concrete for reinforced 

slab sections, 3/8” max size aggregate  with air 

entrainment $196.75 

7 
Additional cost for providing re-enforced fiber to 

items 3 and 6 $10.00 

8 

CLSM Flowable Fill concrete, EXCAVATABLE 

Class I FLOWABLE as per RIDOT Spec, Edition of 

2016, Section 603 $109.00 

9 

CLSM  Flowable Fill concrete, EXCAVATABLE 

Class II FLOWABLE as per RIDOT Spec, Edition of 

2016, Section 603 $135.00 

 

 

Any fees requested by the awarded vendor will not be honored unless they appear on the bid form.   

List any prospective additional costs (delivery, chemical additives, etc.): 

 

Item Cost per Measurement 

Winter Conditions $7.00 CU. YD. 

Min. Load 2- 4.5 CU.YD. $300.00 Load 

Min. Load 5-7 CU. YD. $200.00 Load 

   

   



Bid 2024-309 Structural Firefighting Particulate Hoods RE-BID 

 

 3 Bid Received 

 

 

 

C&S Specialty Inc 

1181 Old Smithfield Rd. 

North Smithfield, RI 02896 

 

 

Wisecom Technologies 

3341 75th Ave 

STE GG  

Landover, MD 20785-1516 

 

 

Fire Tech & Safety 

100 Business Park Drive 

Tyngsborough, MA 01879 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid 2024-309 Structural Firefighting Particulate Hoods RE-BID 
 

 

C&S Speciality Inc 

Item 

# 
Description Make and Model Price 

1 

Lion RedZone Particulate-

Blocking Hood, Color Black 

Model# HD395142 

 

NFPA 1971, 2018 Edition 

Compliant 

 

Lion HD395142=10+4 

Black 

 

 

$108.25 

 

 

Wisecom Technologies 

Item 

# 
Description Make and Model Price 

1 

Lion RedZone Particulate-

Blocking Hood, Color Black 

Model# HD395142 

 

NFPA 1971, 2018 Edition 

Compliant 

 

 

Lion Model HD-395142 Red Zone 

Black Particulate Bib 

 

$150 

 

Fire Tech & Safety 

Item 

# 
Description Make and Model Price 

1 

Lion RedZone Particulate-

Blocking Hood, Color Black 

Model# HD395142 

 

NFPA 1971, 2018 Edition 

Compliant 

 

 

Lion RedZone 

Model# HD395142  

 

$115.00 

 


