FRANCIS M. GOMEZ
PURCHASING AGENT

FRANK J. Picozzl
MAYOR

Citryo

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 PosT ROAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
TEL{401) 7382013
FAx (401) 737-2364

Bid Minutes Tuesday, February 27, 2024

Bid2025-012 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals (Formerly Bid2024-396)

Location: The meeting was held at in Meeting Room 2

Present: Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Frances Gray, Bid Specialist

Representatives:

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in
each bid or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened.
All bids will go to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are March 18, 2024 and April 1, 2024 at Warwick City Hall. The
City Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00
P.M. The 5:00 P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

The Finance Commitiee meeting and City Council meeting can also be viewed LIVE on the
City of Warwick’s YouTube Channel by searching @City of Warwick 1931.

Respectfully Submitted,

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent



Bid2025-012 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals (Formerly Bid2024-396)

¢ 6 Bids Received

PVS Chemical Solutions, Inc.
10900 Harper Avenue
Detroit, MI 48213

Holland Company
153 Howland Avenue
Adams, MA 01220

Univar Solutions USA, LLC
200 Dean Stevers Place
Morrisville, PA 19067

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.
40 Railroad Ave
Merrimack, NH 03054

Evoqua Water Technologies LLC
2650 Tallevast Road
Sarasota, FL 34243

George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.
3015 State Road
Croydon, PA 19021

*Pricing as Follows*



Bid2025-012 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals (Formerly Bid2024-396)

PVS Chemical Solutions, Inc.

A. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID SODIUM BISULFITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shall govern.

$ 3.50 gallon
Three Dollars and Fifty Cents gallon

$ 0.31 pound
Zero point Three One pound

B. BASE BID - The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID CALCIUM NITRATE DOUBLE
SALT SOLUTION as described in the specifications for price per gallon and per pound as
listed below. Amount shall be shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the
amount in words shall govern.

$ No Bid gallon

No Bid gallon
$__No Bid pound

No Bid _ pound

C. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID SODIUM CHLORITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shall govern.

$ No Bid gallon

No Bid gallon
$ No Bid pound

No Bid 7 pound

$ No Bid per tote (275 gal. tote)




Bid2025-012 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals (Formerly Bid2024-396)

Holland Company

A. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID SODIUM BISULFITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shail govern.

$ 3.50 gallon

Three Dollars and Fifty Cents gallon
$ 0.3153 pound

thirty-one and fifty-three hundredths cents pound

B. BASE BID - The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID CALCIUM NITRATE DOUBLE
SALT SOLUTION as described in the specifications for price per gallon and per pound as
listed below. Amount shall be shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the
amount in words shall govern.

$ No Bid gallon

gallon

$ pound

pound

C. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID SODIUM CHLORITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shall govern.

$ No Bid gallon

gallon

$ pound

pound

$ per tote (275 gal. tote)




Bid2025-012 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals (Formerly Bid2024-396) ’

Univar Solutions USA, LLC

A. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID SODIUM BISULFITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shall govern.

$ 3.395%* gallon  **min 2,000 gallon deliveries**
Three Dollars and three hundred and ninety-five thousandths cents gallon
$_0.3061 pound
Zero dollars and three thousand sixty-ne ten-thousandths cents pound

B. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID CALCIUM NITRATE DOUBLE
SALT SOLUTION as described in the specifications for price per gallon and per pound as
listed below. Amount shall be shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the
amount in words shall govern.

$ NoBid gallon

gallon

$ No Bid pound

pound

C. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID SODIUM CHLORITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shall govem.

$ No Bid gallon

gallon

$_No Bid pound

pound

$ No Bid per tote (275 gal. tote)




Bid2025-012 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals (Formerly Bid2024-396)

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.

A. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID SODIUM BISULFITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shall govern.

$§ 2.58% gallon *see attached bid note

Two Dollars and fifty-eight cents gallon
$ 0.2358* pound *see attached bid note

point two three five eight cents * pound

B. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID CALCIUM NITRATE DOUBLE
SALT SOLUTION as described in the specifications for price per gallon and per pound as
listed below. Amount shall be shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the
amount in words shall govern.

$ gallon

gallon

$ ___pound

pound

C. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furish LIQUID SODIUM CHLORITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shall govern.

$ gallon

gallon

$ pound

pound

$ per tote (275 gal. tote)




ICI

JonesChemicals Inc.

*Bid Note

*Price is subject to change upon 30 days written notice.

Corporate Offices » 1765 Ringling Blvd. = Sarasota, Florida 34236  felephone: 941.330.1537 o facsimile: 941.330.9657 « 800.477.1078
Branch Locations « Warwick, NY e Caledonia, NY « Barberton, CH e Riverview, Ml # Merrimack, NH = Charlotte, NC
Jacksonville, FL. e Beech Grove, IN « Milford, VA » Tacoma, WA  Torrance, CA
www.jcichemicals.com



Bid2025-012 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals (Formerly Bid2024-396)

Evoqua Water Technologies LLC

A. BASE BID - The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID SODIUM BISULFITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shall govern.

$ No Bid gallon
gallon

$ NoBid , pound
point two three five eight cents * pound

B. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID CALCIUM NITRATE DOUBLE
SALT SOLUTION as described in the specifications for price per gallon and per pound as
listed below. Amount shall be shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the
amount in words shall govern.

$ 3.67* gallon

__Three dollars and sixty-seven cents per gallon
1.049* pound
One dollar and point zero four nine cents per pound

C. BASE BID — The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID SODIUM CHLORITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shall govern.

$ 12.49 gallon

Twelve dollars and forty-nine cents per gallon
$ 1.167 pound

One dollar and point one six seven cents per pound

$ 3.434.75 per tote (275 gal. tote)




Bid2025-012 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals (Formerly Bid2024-396)

George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc,

A. BASE BID - The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID SODIUM BISULFITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shall govern.

$ No Bid gallon

No Bid . gallon
$ No Bid pound

No Bid pound

B. BASE BID - The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID CALCIUM NITRATE DOUBLE
SALT SOLUTION as described in the specifications for price per gallon and per pound as
listed below. Amount shall be shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the
amount in words shall govern.

§ No Bid gallon

No Bid gallon
$ _No Bid pound

No Bid pound

C. BASE BID - The bidder agrees to furnish LIQUID SODIUM CHLORITE as described
in the specifications for the price per gallon and per pound as listed below. Amount shall be
shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount in words shall govern.

$ 12.91 gallon
Twelve Dollars and Ninety-One Center per gallon
$ 1.2194 pound

One Dollar and Two Thousand One Hundred Ninety-Four Ten-Thousandths Cents per pound

$ 3.551.04 per tote (275 gal. tote)

Three Thousand Five Hundred Fifty-One Dollars and Four Cents

Please see attached amendment letier



FRANCIS M. GOMEZ
PURCHASING AGENT

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 PosT ROAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
TEL (401)738-2013
FAX (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To:  Peder Schaefer, Finance Director

From: Francis M. Gomez, Purchasing Agent

Date: February 27, 2024

Re:  Agenda for Tuesday, February 27, 2024

FRANK J. PICOZZI
MAYOR

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2

starting at 11:00 am.

Bid2025-012 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals

(Formerly Bid2024-396)

March 18%/April 1st



Any questions, please feel 1e at extension 921-9702.

Date: February 27, 2024

Bid2025-012 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals
(Formerly Bid2024-396)

Name (please print neatly)

Company/Email Address

Francis (\"r;cvmel YA Qo
Erances quo\tw] Aids prQCzaﬁ,oﬂL cn




