

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent



Frank J. Picozzi
Mayor

City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364

Bid Minutes Tuesday, March 21, 2023

Bid2023-380 **Fire Apparatus Repairs**

Bid2023-381 **Janitorial & Cleaning Supplies for DPW**

Bid2023-382 **Purchase BCI Weapon Storage Lockers**

Bid2023-398 **Acoustic Wall & Ceiling Panels for Interview Room**

Bid2024-011 **Wastewater Treatment Chemicals**

Location: The meeting was held at in Meeting Room 2

Present: Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent
 Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist

Representatives: Melissa Devine, Land-Tek Maintenance
 Todd Gagnat, Evoqua Water Technologies

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are April 3, 2023 and April 17, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The City Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The 5:00 P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent

Bid2023-380 Fire Apparatus Repairs

- 2 Bids Received

On Scene, LLC
5600 Post Road. Suite 114-324
East Greenwich, RI 02818

C&S Specialty Inc.
1181 Old Smithfield Rd.
North Smithfield, RI 02896

		On Scene, LLC (See Note 1)	C&S Specialty (See Attachment #1)
Type	Description	Hourly Labor Rate	Hourly Labor Rate
Pumper Truck Repairs	All repairs including pump and pump components	\$165.00	\$138.00
Aerial Ladder Truck	All vehicle except aerial and hydraulic components	\$165.00	\$138.00
Aerial Ladder Truck	Aerial ladder and hydraulic components repairs	\$165.00	\$185.00
Special Haz/Heavy Rescue	All Systems	\$165.00	\$138.00
Rescue Vehicles	All Systems	\$165.00	\$138.00
All above equipment	Engine & Transmission Repair	No Bid	No Bid
Parts % off list price		10%	5%

Notes:

1. Travel Labor Rate : \$100.00/hour

Continued next page

Bid2023-381 Janitorial & Cleaning Supplies for DPW

- 11 bids received

Next-Gen Supply Group, LLC
11 Norfolk St.
Mansfield, MA 02048

WB Mason Co., Inc.
99 Bald Hill Rd.
Cranston, RI 02920

Likarr, Inc
6 Perry Drive
Foxboro, MA 02035

Banner Systems Inc.
135 Elliot St.
Brockton, MA 02302

Healthy School Supply, LLC
235 Peachtree St., NE STE 406
Atlanta, GA 30303

United Sales USA Corp.
5902 14th Ave. Unit 107
Brooklyn, NY 11219

Land-Tek Maintenance Inc.
477 Winthrop Street
Rehoboth, MA 02769

Plastic Express Inc.
667 Lehigh Ave.
Union, NJ 07083

Central Poly-Bag Corp.
2400 Bedle Place
Linden, NJ 07036

Unipak Corp.
PO Box 332
West Long Branch, NJ 07764

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th St.
Tampa, FL 33610

Pricing as follows

**NO BIDS
RECEIVED**

**No Bids
Received**

Bid2024-011 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals

- 14 Bids Received

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.	4321 W 6 th St.	Lawrence, KS 66049
Marubeni America Corporation	500 Mamaroneck Avenue, Suite 504	Harrison, NY 10528
PVS Chemical Solutions, Inc.	10900 Harper Avenue	Detroit, MI 48213
Shannon Chemical Corporation	P.O Box 376	Malvern, PA 19355
Holland Company, Inc.	153 Howland Avenue	Adams, MA 01220
Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc.	86 North Hackensack Ave.	Kearny, NJ 07032
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.	3015 State Road	Croydon, PA 19021
Brenntag Northeast LLC	81 W. Huller Lane	Reading, PA 19605
Univar Solutions USA Inc.	200 Dean Sievers Place	Morrisville, PA 19067
Borden & Reminton Corp.	63 Water St. P.O Box 2573	Fall River, MA 02722
Chemrite, Inc.	5202 Belle Wood Ct., Ste 104	Buford, GA 30518
Evoqua Water Technologies LLC	2650 Tallevast Rd.	Sarasota, FL 34243
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.	40 Railroad Ave.	Merrimack, NH 03054
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC	90 East Hasley Rd. Suite 200	Parsippany, NJ 07054

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page

Bid2024-011 Wastewater Treatment Chemicals

BID RESULTS

Items	Borden & Remington	Univar	Shannon	Holland	Coyne	JCI Jones	Chemtrade	Kuehne	Kemira	PVS	Evoqua	Chemrite	Marubeni	Brenntag
						<i>See Note 1</i>	<i>See Note 2</i>							
A. Liquid Sodium Bisulfite														
Price per Gallon	No Bid	\$3.675	No Bid	\$3.50	No Bid	\$2.56	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Price per Pound	No Bid	\$0.3314	No Bid	\$0.3153	No Bid	\$0.2341	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.4865	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
B. Liquid Sodium Hypochlorite														
Price per Gallon	\$2.1789	\$1.795	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Price per Pound	\$0.2179	\$1.4931	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
C. Potassium Permanganate														
Price per Pound	No Bid	\$ 3.48	\$5.37	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.59	\$2.57	\$3.20
D. Liquid Alum														
Price per Gallon @ <5,000 delivered	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.82	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.0466	No Bid	\$2.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Price per Pound @ <5,000 delivered	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.1641	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.379	No Bid	\$0.428	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Price per Gallon @ >5,000 delivered	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.1635	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.43	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Price per Pound @ >5,000 delivered	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.1474	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
E. Liquid Sodium Hydroxide														
Price per Gallon	\$3.1535	\$3.053	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.33
Price per Pound	\$0.2473	\$0.4805	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.261
F. Liquid Calcium Nitrate Solution														
Price per Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.530	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Price per Pound	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.008	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
G. Liquid Sodium Chlorite														
Price per Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Price per Pound	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.1475	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Price Per 275 Gallon Tote	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,341.4250	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Notes:														
1. Price is subject to change upon 30 days written notice														
2. For conversion purposes only. Prices equate as follows: FTL: \$758.00/Dry Ton LTL: \$900.00/Dry Ton														