Francis M. Gomez Frank J. Picozzi

Purchasing Agent Mayor
City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364
Bid Minutes Wednesday, October 18, 2023

Bid2024-219 GeTac F110 Tablets & Vehicle Mounting Hardware
Bid2024-220 Less Lethal Shotgun Ammunition
Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms
Location: The meeting was held in Meeting Room 2
Present: ‘ Jessica Lamprey, Bid Specialist

Francis Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Representatives: Ann Marie Border, UpLinkIT

All bids have been properly advertised. A Certification & Warrant Form must be included in each bid
or the bid will not be accepted. Vendors are free to view all bids once they are opened. All bids will go
to the departments for their review and recommendation.

The next council meetings are November 6, 2023 and November 20, 2023 at Warwick City Hall. The
City Council meeting begins at 7:00 P.M. The Finance Committee meeting will be held at 5:00 P.M. The
5:00 P.M. meeting is when vendors are given the opportunity to speak.

Respectively submitted,

Francis M. Gomez
Purchasing Agent



Bid2024-219 GeTac F110 Tablets & Vehicle Mounting Hardware

e 6 Bids received

Continued next page

Whalley Computer Associates
1 Whalley Way
Southwick, MA 01077

Sunrise Group USA, LLC
85 Commons Drive, Unit 403
Shrewsbury, MA 01545

Island Tech Services, LLC
337 Market Street
Warren, RI 02885

Sunflower Lab LLC
3974 Brown Park Drive, Suite G
Hilliard, OH 43026

Energy Electronics LLC
252 Depot Road, Unit A
Milford, CT 06460

UplinkIT, Inc.

976 Main Street
Warren, RI 02885

Pricing as Follows



Bid2024-219 GeTac F110 Tablets Vehicle Mounting Hardware
BID RESULTS

Whalley Computer Associates Sunrise Group Island Tech Services
Ttem # Model Deseription MSRp | FricePer |p e per 10| MsRP |F7° FOT | price per 10| Msre [P Perl price per 10
Unit Unit Unit
Getac F110 G6 Tablet with Intel
Core i5 processor, 8GB RAM,
256 GB SSD Storage, RF pass $2,713.42 $2,580.00
| Fl10 through option for WWAN, $3,188.00 | $2,713.42 each $3,188.00|$3,188.00| $31,880.00 |$3,188.00|%2,580.00 each
WLAN & GPS Compatible with
Verizon 4g LTE network
Getac F110 G6 Tablet with Intel
Core i5 processor, 16GB RAM,
256 GB SSD Storage, RF pass $2,966.74 $2,805.00
2 F110 through option for WWAN, $3,488.00 | $2,968.74 each $3,488.001$3,488.00| $34,880.00 |$3,488.00($2,805.00 cach
WLAN & GPS Compatible with
Verizon 4g LTE network
3 500-0008 Westin Police interceptor Utllity | - ge7 09 | $65.23 | $65.23 each |$1,299.99($1,209.99| $12,990.99 | $819.32 | $625.00 [$625.00 each
2020 & up Mounting Kit
AP-MMF-CWG-Q- Included Included Included _
4 SMA-BL Antenna Cell Antenna with item 3 | with item 3 | with jtem 3 $499.99 | $499.99 | $4,990.99 | $235.00 | $200.00 |$200.00 each
s | Mosanr | AwennaPlus Cell Antenna | 523500 | SIT3IS [$I73.15 each| $299.99 | §299.99 | $2,990.99 | $235.00 | $200.00 [$200.00 each
6 AP']‘H‘HBI:?S;A'S”' Antenua Plus Cell Antenna | $235.00 | $173.15 |$173.15each| NoBid | NoBid { NoBid | $175.00 | $150.00 [$150.00 each
7 GAD2X8 Getac Mobile Power Unit $109.99 $97.25 | $97.25 each | $299.99 | $299.99 | $2,990.99 | $125.00 | $110.00 [$110.00 each
8 GADIL1 Lind Mobile Power Unit $125.00 $124.35 |$124.35 each| $299.95 | $299.99 | $2,990.99 | $125.00 | $110.00 |$110.00 each
Continued next page




Bid2024-219 GeTac F110 Tablets Vehicle Mounting Hardware

BID RESULTS
Whalley Computer Associates Sunrise Group Island Tech Services
Item # Model Description msrp | FricePer | e per 10| MSRP |F7° P | price Per 10] MSRP |7 PeT i price Per 10
Unit Unit Unit

9 543391800002 Gambe”"hng‘:;: 110 Vehicle | ¢ 10350 | $475.91 [$475.91 each|$1,299.99($1,299.99| $12,990.99 {$1,123.50] $550.00 |$550.00 each
10 OHG160098703 | Oamber Johnson F110 Vehicle | ¢ 070 06 | ggr7g4 [ $82784 |1 290 00l 51 209.99] $12,990.99 |$1,070.00] $550.00 |$550.00 each

Dock With Tri Pass-Through each
11 OHG160098743  |02mber Johnson F110 In Vehiclel ¢, (70 06 | g897 84 |$827.84 cach|$1,299.99]$1,299.99! $12,990.99 |$1,070.00] §550.00 [$550.00 each

Dock With ‘Tri Pass-Through
12 | KBA-BLT-5RBUVS | 107 R“gg‘,"lftzec:[ﬁzyb"a’d and | 437920 | $203.62 ($203.62 cach| $499.99 | $499.99 | $4,990.99 | $312.20 | $235.00 |$235.00 each
j3 |KBA-BLTX-USNNR-| TG3 Ruggedized Keyboardand | ¢,07 33 | 6139 17 |$129.17 cach| $499.99 | $499.99 | $4,990.99 | $322.20 | $245.00 |$245.00 each

Us Touchpad

TG3 Replacement USB Cable . . .
14 CBA-X3503C-RC o KBABLT.SREUVS $26.00 $7.76 | $7.76 cach | NoBid { NoBid | NoBid | $26.00 | $26.00 |$26.00 cach
15 BP3S1P2160-S F110G5 Replacement Battery |  $89.99 $79.57 | $79.57 cach | $349.99 | $349.99 | $3,490.99 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
16 GBM3x7 F110G6 Replacement Battery |  $89.99 $79.57 | $79.57 cach | $349.99 { $349.99 | $3,490.99 | $89.99 | $89.00 |$89.00 each
17 GDOFUS5 F110 Office Dock $349.99 | $309.47 |$309.47 each| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $309.00 | $309.00 |$309.00 each
18 GDODU? F110G6 - Office Dock $349.99 cach | $349.99 | $349.99 | $3,490.99 | $349.00 | $325.00 [$325.00 each
19 GDKBU1 F110 Detachable Keyboard $449.99 | $397.89 |$397.89 cach| $499.99 | $499.99 | $4.990.99 | $449.00 | $395.00 |$395.00 each
20 GDKBUB F110G6 - Detachable Keyboard | $449.99 | $397.89 |$397.89 each| $499.99 | $499.99 | $4,990.99 | $449.00 | $395.00 [$395.00 each




Bid2024-219 GeTac F110 Tablets Vehicle Mounting Hardware

BID RESULTS

Sunflower Lab Energy Electronics Uplink IT
Ttem # Model Description msrp |PricePer | e per 10| MsRP | P Per price per 10| mMsre [P PO price per 10
Unit Unit Unit
Getac F110 G6 Tablet with Intel
256 GB S50 S, KE nas $2,996.00
1 F110 [DIOTABE, REPASS | \oBid | NoBid | NoBid |$3,129.00]$2,756.08| $27,560.80 |33,188.00|$3,127.00| each for 10
through option for WWAN, units
WLAN & GPS Compatible with
Verizon 4g LTE network
Getac F110 G6 Tablet with Intel
Core s 1603
2 F110 . oTage, pass NoBid | NoBid No Bid $3,429.001$3,020.26| $30,202.60 | $3,488.00|%3,421.00} each for 10
through option for WWAN, . units
WLAN & GPS Compatible with
Verizon 4g LTE network
Westin Police Interceptor Utility . . . . . . $900.00 each
3 200-0008 2020 & up Mounting Kit | N0 Bid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid |31,09243) $939.00 |'p 1.yt
4 | APMME-CWG-Q- Antenna Cell Antenna NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $315.00 | $315.00 [$31400 cach
SMA-BL for 10 units
$197.00 each
s AP-MME-CWG- | ) onna Plus Cell Antenna | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $235.00 | $189.18 | $1,891.80 | $235.00 | $197.00 | . '@
QS222-BL minimum of
12 units
6 |APMME-CCAS2Z| o na plus Cell Antenna | $235.00 | $171.09 | $1,71090 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $315.00 | s221.00 |$21200 each
BL-15 for 10 units
. . $102.00 each
7 GAD2X8 Getac Mobile Power Unit $109.99 | $96.03 $960.34 $109.99 | $105.02 | $1,052.00 | $109.99 | $107.00 for 10 units
. , . $124.00 each
8 GADIL1 Lind Mobile Power Unit $125.00 | $122.67 | $1,226.68 | $125.00 | $134.50 | $1,345.00 | $125.00 | $125.00 for 10 units
Continued next page




Bid2024-219 GeTac F110 Tablets Vehicle Mounting Hardware

BID RESULTS

Sunflower Lab Enerpgy Electronics Uplink IT
Ttem # Model Description msre |FricePerp e Per 10| MsRP | T PO (price per 10| msre 7M1 P price per 10
Unit Unit Unit

9 sa3301800002 | Oamber Johnson P10 Vehicle | o 13 5ol 46512 | $4,651.19 |$1,123.53] $514.80 | $5,148.00 |$1,123.50| $790.00 [369°:00 each

Dock for 10 units

Gamber Johnson F110 Vehicle $954.00 each

10 OHGI60098703 | (o e s Thromgh | $17070-00| $812.17 | $8,121.67 |$1,070.00| $895.49 | $8.954.90 |$1,070.00|81,033.00[" 0% M
) Gamber Johnson F110 In Vehicle $954.00 each

11 OHG160098743 | s Through | 317070-00| SB12.17 | $8,121.67 |$1,070.00| $895.49 | $8,954.90 |$1,070.00|81,033.00[" 0" MC
12 | KBA-BLT-5RBUVS | 103 Rusgedized Keyboardand | ¢55) 56 | 9201 17 | $2,011.67 | $32020 | $219.22 | $2,19220 | $322.20 | $257.00 [¥237.90 cach
Touchpad for 10 units

13 |KBA-BLTX-USNNR-| TG3 Ruggedized Keyboardand | ¢ 07 53 | g10763 | $127629 | $347.33 | $139.08 | $139090 | $347.33 | s197.00 |$131.00 cach
us Touchpad for 10 units

TG3 Replacement USB Cable - $9.00 each

14 | CBA-X3503CRC e nrsrmuves | $2600 | $719 | 87186 | s2600 | s7.87 | s7870 | 52600 | s1z00 | Soet
15 BP3S1P2160-S F110G5 Replacement Battery | NoBid | NoBid No Bid $99.95 | $74.14 $741.40 $89.99 | $88.00 f‘ﬁ::)(?::i:
$84.00 each

16 GBM3x7 F110GG Replacement Battery | $89.99 | $77.92 | $779.17 | $89.99 | $86.07 | $860.70 | $89.99 | $88.00 | %
. . . $326.00 each

17 GDOFUS F110 Office Dock NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $349.99 | $334.75 | $3347.50 | $349.99 | §341.00 |°2200) %%
$326.00 each

18 GDODU? F110G6 - Office Dock $349.99 | $305.54 | $3,055.42 | $349.99 | $334.77 | $3,347.70 | $349.99 | $341.00 |20 0 €°8
$420.00 each

19 GDKBUI F110 Detachable Keyboard | $449.99 | $392.92 | $3,929.22 | $449.99 | $430.41 | $4,304.10 | $449.00 | $439.00 |27 1 &
$420.00 each

20 GDKBUB F110G6 - Detachable Keyboard | $449.99 | $392.92 | $3,929.22 | $449.99 | $43041 | $4304.10 | $449.00 | $439.00 [* 7" €28




Bid2024-220 Less Lethal Shotgun Ammunition

* 5 Bids received

Palisades Group LLC
8111 Asbury Hills Drive
Cincinnati, OH 45255

Commonwealth Industries, LLC
PO Box 98
Abington, VA 24212

Atlantic Tactical Inc.
763 Corporate Circle
New Cumberland, PA 17070

Deese Firearms LLC
4103 Kramer Lane, Suite 103
Taxarkana, TX 75501

Lawmen’s & Shooters’ Supply, Inc.
701 Columbia Blvd.
Titusville, FL 32780

Vendor Price Per Round
: $4.00 (Byrna 12 gauge less lethal kinetic
Palisades Group LLC round) Price does not include shipping
Commonwealth Industries $6.14
Atlantic Tactical $6.28
Deese Firearms $8.50

Lawmen’s & Shooter Supply $12.81 (minimum order of 5 rounds)




Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms
e 3 Bids received
Bamey’s Uniforms
922 Cranston Street
Cranston, RI 02920
Jonah’s Enterprises Inc.
652 Lefferts Ave.
Brooklyn, NY 11203
Galls, LI.C

1340 Russell Cave Rd.
Lexington, KY 40505

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page



Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms

PRICING SHEETS
Barney's Uniforms Jonsh's Enterprises Inc. Galls
Item # Description Bid Bid Bid
STANDARD UNIFORM -
© ALéng Slééve Shirt it a7
Brand Blaver Blauer No Bid
Style] 8620 8900 No Bid
Lieutenant & Above £110.50 No Bid
Sergeant $110.50 No Bid
Officer, £110.50 No Bid
Lieutenant & Above XL $110.50 $103.99 No Bid
Serpeant XL $110.50 $103.99 No Bid
Officer XL $110.50 $103.99 No Bid
Licutenant & Above XX $122.77 $111.19 No Bid
Serpeant XX1| $122.77 $111.19 No Bid
OfficerXX1. $122.77 $111.19 No Bid
Lieutenant & Above XXXL $130.00 $119.11 No Bid
Sergeant X3XL $130.00 $118.11 No Bid
Officer 300 $130.00 $£116.11 No Bid
2 Badge Number Boards 1 number $13.00 $295.25 No Bid
Badge Number Boards 2 numbers $28.00 $295.25 No Bid
Badge Number Boards 3 numbers $32.00 $295.25 No Bid
3 Patch and Cross Flag| $3.00 $32.00 No Bid
4 Sgt. Chevrons $8.50 $79.07 $1.56
i 5| Service Bars/Shirts 7 v R
Brand Blakinton No Bid
Style Slanted A3705 No Bid
Basic Design| Black & White & Royal Blue No Bid
Sergeants and Patrol $1.85 $52.70 No Bid
Lieutenant and Above $1.85 $52.70 No Bid
* "\Service Barsfackets. .. - Lo
Brand Blakinton No Bid
Style| Slanted A3705 No Bid
Basic Design|  Black & White & Royal Biue No Bid
Sergeants and Patrol $1.85 $52.70 No Bid
Lieutenant and Above $1.85 $52.70 No Bid
%77 -~ |Short Sleeve Shirt "\ e e
Brand| Blaver Blauer No Bid
Style 8675 8910 No Bid
Basic Design oversize $120.00 $106.24 No Bid
Brand Blauer Blauer No Bid
Style 8675 8010 No Bid
Basic Design $£108.00 No Bid
Size 31 $120.00 $09.49 No Bid
Brand Blaver Blauer No Bid
Style 8650T 8650 No Bid
Basic Design $96.50 $118.39 No Bid
59, ¥ VestCarrier Shirts.= i
Brand| Blauer Blauer No Bid
Style 8371 Dark/Navy 8370 No Bid
Basic Design $68.00 $126.4% No Bid
240 fTacketvath zipoutliner ™ T L.
Brand Blauer Blauer No Bid
Style| 9910X 9910Z No Bid
Lientenant & Above $365.00 $476.59 No Bid
Sergeant & Above $365.00 $476.59 No Bid
Officer, $365.00 $476.59 No Bid




Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms

PRICING SHEETS

Barney's Uniforms Jonah's Enterprises Inc. Galls
Optional Lightwéight:Coat ™ - L
Brand No Bid First Class Qindao Hellena
Style] No Bid WB03PG JA2650
Basic Design No Bid $31.45 $32.67
<3112 "1Optional Winter Leather Coat: ~ :
Brand Tavylor Taylor Taylor's Leatherwear
Style 4476 Leather Boston 4476-Z 44617
Basic Design $550.00 $368.10 $344.87
5713 "|Raincoat - R
Brand Blauer TechLite Blauer-Gortex No Bid
Style 9790 Full Length 9690 No Bid
Basic Design $405.00 $£404.99 No Bid
414 v+|Optional 3/4 Length Raincoat . - o
Brand Blauer Blauer-Gortex No Bid
Style 89621 GTX 8691 No Bid
Basic Design $£420.00 $359.99 No Bid
- .57 " [Raincoat/Inclemént Weather Coat
Brand| No Bid Blauer 1 Spiewak
Style No Bid 9848V S308VR
Basic Desipn No Bid $321.74 $138.98
¢ ai18: - |Traffic Vest. . e
Brand Blauer Blauver No Bid
Style 339 342 No Bid
Basic Design| $74.00 $81.89 No Bid
A7 " [Snowsuit. 5 L
Brand Snap & Wear Snap N' Wear No Bid
Style 1001 10001 No Bid
Basic Design $151.20 No Bid
Color Black Navy Blue $187.00 No Bid
o8, L [V-Neck Sweater /o0 0 T L
Brand Blaver Blauver Tact Squad
Style 225 225 SWe67
Basic Design $108.00 $146.24 $37.70
Color Navy Blue Dark Navy
=19 . [Fleece Lined Quarter Zip:Sweater ©~ " *
Brand Blauer Blauer No Bid
Style] 4605 Quarter Zip 2x2 Rib Knit No Bid
Basic Design $96.00 $157.94 No Bid
Color : Dark Navy| Navy Blue or Black No Bid
| 20 |Turtlerieck ST e s
Brand Blauer Blauer Fechheimer
Style 8110 8100X F157010
Basic Design $45.00 $46.79 $46.55
3421 . {Footwear _ = 7
shoe Thorogood UA Charged Assert 10
Brand Oncford Leather 5.11 Under Armour
Style 8346027 888579332902 3026175004009
Basic Design $145.00 $117.00 $52.50




Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms

PRICING SHEETS

Barney's Uniforms Jonah's Enterprises Inc. Galls
..22. |Footwear _ ... . % 47 ]
boot Jump Boot 10 inch
Brand Denner 5.11 Rotheo
Style Lookout 12391 5692
Basic Design $165.00 $108.00 $86:40
.23 | Footwear ~
. Tactical Sport 2 Mid Size
boot sneaker No Bid Comgosite Toe
Brand No Bid First Tactical Bates
Style No Bid 165062 E03164
Basic Design No Bid $134.99 §106.25
724 . |Footweat” ;
dress shoe Poromeric Academy Oxford
Brand| Thorogood Rotheo Weinbrenner
Style 8316031 5055 831-6031
Basic Design $105.00 $35.03 $67.65
> 25 . |Optional All' Weather Paints °, T
Brand No Bid Blaver No Bid
Style No Bid 9972 No Bid
Basic Design No Bid $328.49 No Bid
26 [Tie - 3
Brand Sam Broome Rothco Samue] Broome
Style 26" Log Polywool 30088 45015
Basic Design $10.50 $5.27 $6.00
a2F . |Optional Baseball Cap ™. .= .
Brand No Bid Flexfit 511
Style No Bid 6277 89260-724
Basic Design No Bid $£22.71 $8.38
0280 v |WinterBat . % Y. w0
Brand Bamney's Rotheo No Bid
Style Round Top 8492 No Bid
Sergeant & Above $85.00 £7.43 No Bid
Officer $85.00 $7.43 No Bid
.29 |Winter Hat with Oak:Léaf Clusters (Major. and Above)
Brand| Barney's Rothco No Bid
Style| Round Top 8492 No Bid
Major and Above $115.00 §77.43 No Bid
;30 » |SupmherHat© 7o« 00 T
Brand Barney's Stratton No Bid
Style Round Top F38 No Bid
Sergeant & Above $85.00 $105.03 No Bid
Officer] $85.00 $105.03 No Bid
31| Summer Hat with-Oak:Leaf Clusters (Major and Above)
Brand| Bamey's Stratton No Bid
Style Round Top F38 No Bid
Major and Above $115.00 $175.03 No Bid
| 432 - |Optional Winter Toke/Knit Cap
Brand No Bid Rothco Condor
Style No Bid 8492 WwC-002
Basic Design NoBid $39.43 $7.77
2133 . jOptiénal Detail Tong:Sleeve . Shirt * . ~ =
Brand Blauer Blaner No Bid
Style 8147 Warwick Police 8147 No Bid
Basic Design $120.00 $143.84 No Bid




Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms

PRICING SHEETS
Barney's Uniforms Jonah's Enterprises Inc. Galls
|~ 34, *|Optional Detail Short Sleeve Shirt. .« ¢
Brand Blauer Blauer No Bid
Style 8137 8137 No Bid
Basic Design $110.00 $132.14 No Bid
'-35 [Optional Detail Pants™ "
Brand Blauer Blauer No Bid
Style| §836-BDU 8835 No Bid
Basic Design $79.50 $£71.95 No Bid
DRESS UNIFORM/LTS. & ABOVE
" 36 .|Long Sléeve Shirt™
Brand Blauer Blaver No Bid
Style 8670 White B600Z No Bid
Basic Design $110.50 $134.36 No Bid
.37 .. ‘|Shoit Sleeve Shirt- =~ .
Brand Blaver Blauer No Bid
Style 8675 White 8675 No Bid
Basic Design $108.00 $116.74 No Bid
TRAFFIC OFFICERS
- ..38. |Breeches . s
Brand Bamey's Tailored Sportsman No Bid
Style State Troopers K1-35567 No Bid
Basic Design $295.00 $179.99 No Bid
3% " 0ptional CycleJacket -
Brand Blauer Blauer No Bid
Style 9970 Wiliner 9970 No Bid
Basic Design $444.00 $405.99 No Bid
. 40 ¢ ] Optional Winier 3/4 Length Leather Coat
Brand Taylor Taylor ‘Taylor's Leatherwear
Style 4497 NYPD HWY NYPD 44972 449727
Basic Design $850.00 $432.10 $425.33
a4l 0l s Motoreyele Helmet
Brand No Bid Seer No Bid
Style No Bid 81602 No Bid
Basic Design No Bid $709.25 No Bid
g2, s Motorcyele Oificers Boots'
Brand Dehner Brothers & Sons No Bid
Style The Providence CJ1320 No Bid
Basic Design $1,500.00 $116.99 No Bid
.43 |RainPants "~ - .
Brand Blaver Blauer No Bid
Style| 134H-1 HiVis Ranpant 9825Z No Bid
Basic Design $120.00 $327.59 No Bid
A4 1Gloves
Brand Gauntlets Raber Glove No Bid
Style RRIP No Bid
Basic Design $96.50 - $86.40 No Bid
.. 45 .|Sam Brown ShoulderStrap .
Brand JayPee Boston Leather Gould & Goodrich
Style 6511 H99-36CL
BRasic Design $62.50 $£62.08 $46.20
i+346" " |Commerzcial Enforcement'Long Siceve Shirt
Brand Blauer Blauer Vertx
Style| 8731 8731 Fi VTX8121
Basic Design $£82.50 $135.74 $64.26




Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms

PRICING SHEETS

Barney's Uniforms Jonah's Enterprises Inc. Galls
.47 " |Commiercial Enforcement Short Sleeve Shirt
Brand| Blauer Blauer Vertx
Style 8741 TENX 8740 FF VTX8101
Basic Design $72.50 $115.49 $58.65
. 48" tCommercisl Enforceinent Pants~
Brand Blauer Blaver Vertx
Style: BDU 8836 8830 F1 VTX8602
Basic Design $70.50 $76.49 £74.82
49,k [ Traffic Wheel Paichi, ) - ¢ - $8.50 $76.49 No Bid
HONOR GUARD
ltem # Descripfion Bid Bid Bid
[ 507 v |Hat” i .
Brand Barney's Rothco No Bid
Style Round Top 52556 No Bid
Basic Design $98.060 $9.08 No Bid
Sl |Trowsers - o< L O
Brand Barney's Blauer No Bid
Style Taylor Made 8561-1 No Bid
Basic Design $145.00 $131.84 No Bid
7352 |Long Sleeve Shirt™. "o s T
Brand Blauer First Class No Bid
Style 8670 White L3100 No Bid
Basic Design $110.00 $118.99 No Bid
753 (Gloves -Dress White:Cotton” _
Brand| Rothco George Glove Company
Style ‘White Cotton 4410 87162
Basic Design $8.50 $3.11 $6.50
54 _|Gloves Black Raber -~ . -
Brand| Raber Raber No Bid
Style Gauntlets 48-0200 No Bid
Basic Design $95.50 $91.80 No Bid
7455 - | Boots cy I -
Brand Thorogood Rocky Rocky
Style Chuker EQOO500 FQOO500-8
Basic Design $148.00 $104.40 $90.14
T T
Brand JayPee JayPee No Bid
Stylel Leather JP-413 No Bid
Basic Design $38.50 $44.96 No Bid
5%~ ShodlderCord - . 5 T« . .
Brand Quartermaster Grip-Fiex
Style JDT-41-003 501
Basic Design $38.50 §13.59 $14.20
/58 |DressCoat™ "5~ Moy L
Brand Barney's Flying Cross Fechheimer
Style] Class A F1 19B9996C F1 38803
Basic Design| $950.00 $720.89 £170.89
289 | TrenchCoat & 7 1w 5 _
Brand| No Bid Anchor Uniform Anchor Uniform
Style No Bid 26IMT 761MT




Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms

PRICING SHEETS

Barney's Uniforms Jonah's Enterprises Ine. Galls
Basic Design No Bid $320.71 $247.26
POLICE RECRUITS
460, 7{1:ong Sleeve Shirt, i
Brand Propper Blauver 5.11
Style| BUD 8731 72054-724-L
Basic Design $56.00 $119.74 $52.52
<61 FTrousers 7" L i T
Brand Propper Blauer 5.11
Style BDU 8830 T4273
Basic Desien| $56.00 $76.49 $46.68
Loy Hal L T et il LT
Brand Marine Propper No Bid
Style 8 Point F5505 No Bid
Basic Design $24.50 §7.19 No Bid
i = I L
Brand JayPee JayPee Perfect Fit
Style Garison 1001 100188
Basic Design $38.50 $45.41 $20.08
foed Boots .o p TP L
Brand Dehner Danner Danner
Style Lookout 43003 26634
Basic Design $165.00 $180.00 $231.27
DETECTIVES
Item # Description Bid Bid Bid
5 Tacket SLightweigh " %0 T T
Brand No Bid 5.11 5.11
Style; No Bid 48372 48372019
Basic Design No Bid $151.00 $121.32
ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
DIVISION/ PROFESSIONAL
DIVISION/ COMMUNITY
DIVISION
266 |Optional Shin e .
Brand No Bid Port Authority Qingdao Hellena
Style No Bid KI100LS SH4426'
Basic Design No Bid $34.21 $i8.78
% 367 | Opfional Pants .- e
Brand No Bid Tru-Spec Atlanco
Style| No Bid 1335 1825005
Basic Design No Bid §22.73 $31.46
DIVE TEAM
5. 687 4{Shirt - T -
Brand| No Bid Blue Generation Blue Generation
Style] No Bid BG7300 7204-GRE-L
Basic Design No Bid $65.32 $18.65
69, |Pants .. P
Brand No Bid Rotheo 5.11
Style No Bid 5775 74003-162
Basic Design No Bid $28.28 $55.15
L5705 Shorts. - T - Frop ot
Brand No Bid 5.11 5.11
Style) No Bid 73308 73308-162
Basic Design No Bid $46.80 $43.87




Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms

PRICING SHEETS

Barney's Uniforms Jonah's Enterprises Inc. Galls
Brand No Bid Black Hawk Vista Qutdoor
Style No Bid 41CQ02 41CQ02BK
Basic Design No Bid $49.49 $42.26
9307 [Optional Jacket <L ol T
Brand No Bid Mustang Catalyst Mustang Survival
Style| No Bid SMI5246 MJI5246
Basic Design No Bid $299.16 $275.68
SWAT TEAM
SRR AShi. PR R e T T T
Brand No Bid Proper Propper
Style| No Bid F5424 F542438001L
Basic Design No Bid $44.99 $42.20
2945 (Pamts - MY L
Brand No Bid Propper Propper
_Style] NoBid F5212 F52123800134R
Basic Design No Bid $44.99 $43.54
G F5 T Nylen Belt. e op TR, e
Brand No Bid Black Hawk Vista
Style] No Bid 41CQ02 41CW02BK
Basic Design No Bid $49.45 $42.26
=176 JJacket 3 Sesson Coatt 0
Brand: No Bid 5.11 5.11
Style| No Bid 48112 48112019
Basic Design No Bid £279.50 §215.62
ANIMAL CONTROL OFFICERS
7073 JLong Sleeve Shart. b e e o
Brand No Bid Port- Authority Qingdao
Style No Bid KI100LS SH4427
Basic Design No Bid $61.81 $23.48
5°98 .+ |Short Sleéve Shirt 7 "7 oY
Brand No Bid Port Authority Qingdao
Style No Bid K100 SH4426
Basic Design| No Bid $57.84 $21.48
79 ATfousers” ~ s M7n L L 0
Brand No Bid Proper Propper
Style No Bid F5250 F520138250L.2
Basic Design No Bid $26.99 $30.29
#2860 %“]Rubber Boots. -+ L
Brand| No Bid Tingley No Bid
Style No Bid 1500 No Bid
Basic Design No Bid $38.16 No Bid
TIR1 7] Spring Tacket: (LightWeight): ™~ " |
Brand Blauer Blauer No Bid
Style 6001 9010Z No Bid
Basic Desion| $210.00 $372.09 No Bid
SEIRR Sy WO ]
Brand Blauver Blaver No Bid
Style 9910Z 5010Z No Bid
Basic Design $365.00 $372.09 No Bid




Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms

PRICING SHEETS
Barney's Uniforms Jonah's Enterprises Inc. Galls
JATLERS
2083, {Shori:Sleeve Shirti i w100 L <
Brand No Bid Port Authority Qingdao
Style| No Bid K100 SH4426
Basic Design No Bid $46.84 $21.48
B4 |Long Slesve Shirt’, JE
Brand No Bid Port Authority Qingdao
Style No Bid KI100LS SH4427
Basic Design No Bid $50.21 $23.48
U85, JTrouseis ~ ... o7 S
' Brand No Bid 5.11 5.11
Style No Bid 74273 74273019
Basic Design No Bid $60.30 $46.68
86" IShoes T . .o Ll i
Type No Bid Rotheo 5055 Merrell-Wolverine JO03915
Brand No Bid $35.03 $95.24
“:87 . |Boots
. Original SWAT Private Label
Type No Bid 5.11 12391 FT3001
Brand No Bid $108.00 $60:18
COMMUNITY POLICE OFFICERS
SH088 0 |Shons, ¢ N R
Brand No Bid Blauer No Bid
Style No Bid 8841 No Bid
Basic Design No Bid $93.5¢ No Bid
.~ |Jacket . C Ptk
Brand No Bid Blauer No Bid
Style No Bid 4670 ° No Bid
Basi¢ Design No Bid $230.79 No Bid
C0. APt T e )
Brand| No Bid Blauer No Bid
Style No Bid 88227 No Bid
Basic Design| No Bid £124.19 No Bid
BTG S R S
Brand No Bid Blauer Mocean
Style No Bid 8132 402
Basic Design No Bid §93.09 $41.67
%3927 < |Optional Skirt,. ~ o PN
Brand No Bid Port Authority Qingdao Hellena Fashion
Style| No Bid K100LS SH4426
Basic Design No Bid $61.81 $21.48




8id2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms

PRICING SHEETS

Galls

Barnpey's Uniforms Jonsah's Enterprises Inc.
K9- OFFICERS
957 " |Long Slegve Shirt. . LS .
Brand No Bid 5.11 5.11
Style No Bid 72002 72002-724
Basic Design No Bid $67.50 $52.52
V047 * [Short Sleeve Shirt . <o 7T T
Brand No Bid 5.11 5.11
Style No Bid 71339 71339-724
Basic Design No Bid $62.10 $50.95
H 85 | Panty - -
Brand No Bid 5.1 5.11
Style] No Bid 74003 74280-724
Basic Design No Bid $67.50 $55.15
96 - |VEST CARRIER. * * .+ "¢ TS
: Brand No Bid Survival Armor Survival Armer
Style No Bid KSURV Foraid
Basic Design No Rid $295.50 $248.00
587" |Hat.. © ae e
Brand No Bid Flexfit 5.11
Style No Bid 6277 89260-724
Basic Desipn| No Bid $25.11 $8.38
L0098 - JWINTER-COAT  »i 0 &~ "~
Brand No Bid 5.1 511
Style No Bid 48360 48378-724
Bagic Design No Bid $202.15 $152,97
EXPLORERS/CADETS
- 90 ¢ 1| Winter Long Sleéve'Shirt, .. =, 7. 3¢
Brand| No Bid Flyingeross Fechheimer
Style No Bid 45W66 F1 45W66
Basic Design No Bid $98.64 $67.33
+.100: | Summer Short Sleeve. Shirt ; -
Brand No Bid Flyingeross Fechheimer
Style No Bid 95R66 F1 95R66
Basic Desipn No Bid $114.19 $60.97
7101 JPants L
Brand No Bid Flyingcross Fechheimer
Style No Bid 3900 F1 3900
Basic Design No Bid $90.36 $80.01
2502, [Belt .. - 0w ]
Brand No Bid Boston Leather Dutyman Inc
Style No Bid 6605 1611-34
Basic Design No Bid $21.14 $23.25
CA03 [Hat T S -
Brand No Bid Blauer No Bid
Style No Bid 183 No Bid
Basic Desipn No Bid $20.64 No Bid




FrRANK J. PiIcOzZZ]
MAYOR

FRANCIS M. GOMEZ
PURCHASING AGENT

CITY OF WARWICK

PURCHASING DIVISION
3275 PosT ROAD
WARWICK, RHODE ISLAND 02886
TEL {(401)738-2013
FAX (401) 737-2364

MEMORANDUM

To: Peder Schaefer, Finance Director
From: Francis M. Gomez, Purchasing Agent
Date:  September 19, 2023

Re:  Agenda for Wednesday, October 18, 2023

The following bid openings will be held on the above-mentioned date in Meeting Room 2 starting
at 11:00 am.

Bid2024-219 GeTac F110 Tablets & Vehicle Mounting Hardware

Bid2024-220 Less Lethal Shotgun Ammunition

Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms.

November 6% / November 20%



Date: October 18, 2023
Bid2024-219 GeTac F110 Tablets & Vehicle Mounting Hardware
Bid2024-220 Less Lethal Shotgun Ammunition
Bid2024-221 Police Personnel Uniforms

Name (please print neatly) Company/Email Address
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