

CITY OF WARWICK

STATE OF RHODE ISLAND AND PROVIDENCE PLANTATIONS

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL

NO: _____

APPROVED: _____ MAYOR

DATE: _____

RESOLVED, That The City Council of the City of Warwick as required by the provisions of Sections 6-11 and 6-12 of the City Charter and the Ordinance relative to competitive bidding on purchase enacted there under hereby and herewith approves the acceptance of the following bid(s):

Bid #	Name	Vendor(s) Name/Address	Contract Award	Contract Period	Note	Code
2018 - 221	Various Portable Radio Batteries	<i>Holzberg Communications, Inc.</i> PO Box 322 Totowa, NJ 07511	\$6,000.00	3/22/18 - 3/21/20		

AND BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That such purchase or contract be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder.

THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE


Patricia A. Peshka
Purchasing Agent



Scott Avedisian
Mayor

City of Warwick
Purchasing Division
3275 Post Road
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886
Tel (401) 738-2013
Fax (401) 737-2364

TO: Members of the Finance Committee

FROM: Patricia A. Peshka, Purchasing Agent 

DATE: January 4, 2018

RE: Bids for the Finance Committee Wednesday, January 21, 2018

TABLE OF CONTENTS

CITY COUNCIL MEETING JANUARY 17, 2018

<u>BID #</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>PAGES</u>
2018-221	Various Portable Radio Batteries	1 - 5

Bid2018-221 Various Portable Radio Batteries

- 3 bids submitted

CODE: 30-271 Police/Parts-Communication

MANNER OF AWARD: \$6,000.00
March 22, 2018 – March 21, 2020

RECOMMEND: Holzberg Communications, Inc.

Holzberg Communications, Inc.
PO Box 322
Totowa, NJ 07511

Connecticut Radio, Inc.
1208 Cromwell Ave.
Rocky Hill, CT 06067

Batteries Plus Bulbs
999 Fall River Ave.
Seekonk, MA 02771

Pricing as Follows

Continued next page

Bid2018-221 Various Portable Radio Batteries

HOLZBERG COMMUNICATIONS, INC.

<u>Item</u>	<u>Qty</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>List</u>	<u>Unit</u>
1	Ea.	Motorola WPNN4013A	\$90.00	\$39.00
2	Ea.	Motorola NTN9857C	\$132.00	\$81.00
3	Ea.	Motorola PMNN442AR	\$117.00	\$83.00
4	Ea.	Other Motorola OEM battery	List minus	10%
5	Ea.	Other manufacturer OEM battery BRAND: Power Products Unltd., Inc.	List minus	5%
Optional		3 rd year at no additional price increase	No bid	No bid

CONNECTICUT RADIO, INC.

<u>Item</u>	<u>Qty</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>List</u>	<u>Unit</u>
1	Ea.	Motorola WPNN4013A	\$90.00	\$49.50
2	Ea.	Motorola NTN9857C	\$132.00	\$95.00
3	Ea.	Motorola PMNN442AR	\$117.00	\$84.20
4	Ea.	Other Motorola OEM battery	List minus	28%
5	Ea.	Other manufacturer OEM battery	List minus	N/A
Optional		3 rd year at no additional price increase	Yes	Yes

BATTERIES PLUS BULBS

<u>Item</u>	<u>Qty</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>List</u>	<u>Unit</u>
1	Ea.	Motorola WPNN4013A		\$44.00
2	Ea.	Motorola NTN9857C		\$92.00
3	Ea.	Motorola PMNN442AR		\$95.00
4	Ea.	Other Motorola OEM battery	List minus	No bid
5	Ea.	Other manufacturer OEM battery	List minus	No bid
Optional		3 rd year at no additional price increase	No	No

Bid2018-221 Various Replacement Batteries for Police Portable Radios					
The following vendors were sent specifications.					
VENDOR	ADDRESS	CITY	STATE	ZIP	
American Communication Systems	PO Box 715	Brooklyn	NY	11230	
Ampergen (formerly Multiplier)	10 State St.	Woburn	MA	01801	
Antenna Plus	9458 E. Sunnyside Dr.	Scottsdale	AZ	85260	
Aramco	PO Box 29	Thorofare	NJ	08086	
Auto Zone, Inc.	2720 Post Rd.	Warwick	RI	02886	
Batteries Plus	999 Fall River Avenue	Seekonk	MA	02771	
Battery Zone, Inc.	PO Box 6435	Bridgewater	NJ	08807	
Business Services	940 Park Blvd. Ste. 428	San Diego	CA	92101	
Challenge Electronics	1208 Cromwell Ave	Rocky Hill	CT	06067	
ComLink Wireless Technologies	1724 Lacy Dr., Ste. 106	Ft. Worth	TX	76177	
Comtronics Corp.	1230 Furnace Brook Pkwy.	Quincy	MA	02169	
Connecticut Radio, Inc.	471 West Shore Road, Unit 2	Warwick	RI	02889	
Continental Wireless	10455 Vista Park Rd.	Dallas	TX	75238	
Cyber Com, Inc.	90 Colorado Ave	Warwick	RI	02888	
D & R Communications	15 Gore Rd.	Webster	MA	01570	
Day Wireless Systems	4700 SE International Way	Milwaukee	OR	97222	
Dbu Industrial Communications	900 Waterman Ave.	E. Providence	RI	02914	
Direct Network Services	20 Taylor St.	Littleton	MA	01460	
Fast Links	PO Box 343	N. Scituate	MA	02060	
Finger Lake Comm. Co., Inc.	305 Clark St.	Auburn	NY	13021	
Frequency Electronics, Inc.	55 Charles Lindbergh Blvd.	Mitchel Field	NY	11553	
Holzberg Communications, Inc.	P.O. Box 322	Totowa	NJ	07511	
Honeywell Batteries	550 Cochituate Rd.	Framingham	MA	01701	
Houston Communication	1105 Industrial	Sugar Land	TX	77478	
Imaging Products Int'l	2205 First St. #105	Simi Valley	CA	93065	

Industrial Communications	40 Lone St.	Marshfield	MA	02050
Interstate Battery	1607 Serenade Lane	Richardson	TX	75081
KCM Marketing, Inc.	1631 S. Sinclair St.	Anaheim	CA	92806
Matronics	PO Box 934519	Margale	FL	33063
Motorola Solutions	Five Paragon Dr.	Montval	NJ	07645
Motorola Solutions, Inc.	12 Walker Way	North Scituate	RI	02857
NY Supply, Inc.	1460 Ridge Rd. East	Rochester	NY	14621
PacketLogix, Inc.	140 Lincoln Ave.	Barrington	RI	02806
Power Products Unltd.	2170 Brandon Tr.	Alpharetta	GA	30004
Radio Express, Inc.	5701 Barrymore Rd.	Centre ville	VA	20120
Radio-Phone Communications	153 James P. Murphy Ind. Hwy.	W. Warwick	RI	02893
ReIm Wireless	7100 Technology Dr.	W. Melbourne,	FL	32904
SAT Radio Communications	1019 E. Euclid St.	San Antonio	TX	78212
Seaport Communications Co	304 Pt. Judith Rd.	Narragansett	RI	02882
SideBand Systems, Inc.	30 Rantoul St.	Beverly	MA	01915
Stanford Research Systems, Inc.	1290-D Reamwood Ave.	Sunnyvale	CA	94089
Techworld Solutions, LLC	119 Wildwood Rd.	Stamford	CT	06903
Tessco	11126 McCormick Rd.	Hunt Valley	MD	21031
Utility Communications, Inc	920 Sherman Ave.	Hamden	CT	06514
Vision Communications	4501 E. Pacific Coast Hwy., Ste. 400	Long Beach	FL	90804
Visions of Video	9030 Balboa Blvd.	Northridge	CA	91325
WW Grainger	78 Jefferson Blvd.	Warwick	RI	02888

CITY OF WARWICK

Colonel Stephen M. McCartney
Chief of Police

Scott Avedisian
Mayor



Police Department
99 Veterans Memorial Drive
Warwick, Rhode Island 02886-4617
Telephone: (401) 468-4200

December 21, 2017

Mrs. Patricia Peshka, Purchasing Agent
Warwick City Hall
3275 Post Road
Warwick, RI 02886

Re: Bid # 2018-221 Portable Radio Batteries/Police

Dear Mrs. Peshka,

The Police Department has reviewed the three (3) bids submitted for bid # 2018-221, Police Portable Radio Batteries.

Bids were received from the following companies:

- Connecticut Radio, Inc. 1208 Cromwell Ave. Rocky Hill, CT 06067
- Batteries Plus Bulbs, 999 Fall River Avenue Seekonk MA 02771
- Holzberg Communications, P.O. Box 322 Totowa NJ 07511

The Police Department recommends that the bid be awarded to the lowest qualified bidder for all three items combined, Holzberg Communications. The department's communication technician has conducted research into this company, has spoken to other customers and feels that they will provide us with quality service.

Prices for individual replacement batteries are as follows:

- Motorola WPNN4013A.....\$39.00
- Motorola NTN9857C.....\$81.00
- Motorola PMNN442AR.....\$83.00

Funding for this award, if approved, would be from the Police Department Operating Budget, Budget Code # 30-271, for a total not to exceed \$6,000.00. This award will be for a two year contract that would be valid from March 22, 2018 thru March 21, 2020.

During the current contract which began in March of 2016 the department expended \$3,984.00 on approximately 86 batteries. Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.

Sincerely,

Bradford E. Connor
Major
Administrative Bureau Commander